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UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT 
FOR THE NORTHERN DISTRICT OF ILLINOIS 

EASTERN DIVISION 
 
NATIONAL RIFLE ASSOCIATION OF      ) 
AMERICA, INC., et al.,        ) 
           ) 
  Plaintiffs,        ) 
           ) 
 v.          )   No. 08 C 3697 
           ) 
CITY OF CHICAGO, et al.,        ) 
           ) 
  Defendant.        ) 

 
MEMORANDUM OF PLAINTIFF NATIONAL RIFLE ASSOCIATION 

PURSUANT TO ORDER AWARDING ATTORNEY’S FEES 
 
 Pursuant to this Court’s Memorandum Opinion and Order (“Order 1”), dated June 25, 

2012, awarding attorney’s fees to Plaintiff National Rifle Association (“NRA”)against the 

Village of Oak Park and the City of Chicago, Plaintiff hereby submits its recalculation of its total 

fees in conformity with the said opinion.  Plaintiff also addresses the issue raised in the Court’s 

supplemental Memorandum and Order dated June 28, 2012 (“Order 2”). 

 As provided by Order 1, “this Court awards NRA the fees it demands,” except that 

Halbrook’s hourly rate is set at $450, and he may not claim fees for August 15, 2009 through 

June 28, 2010; Kolodziej’s hourly rate is set at $300 per hour, and Brenner may not claim fees 

for work performed during the time the cases were consolidated.1

                                                           
1    The cases were consolidated in the Seventh Circuit by Orders dated January 5, 2009 (merits 
appeal), and again on December 30, 2010 (appeal on attorney’s fees.) 

  Order 1 at 20-21.  The Court 

ordered NRA to submit its recalculation of its total fees and to include copies of Halbrook’s and 

Brenner’s billing statements with the stricken time entries crossed-out or otherwise noted.  Id. at 

21.  Those billing statements are attached herewith as Halbrook’s Exhibit B (Revised) and 

Kolodziej’s Exhibit A (Revised). 
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 The above recalculations result in the following totals for Halbrook and for Kolodziej/ 

Brenner: 

Name    Hours    Rate      Total Fees       Expenses       Grand Total 
 
Stephen P. Halbrook          1,201.2      $450     $540,540.00      $5,799.99       $546,339.99 
 
Kolodziej/Brenner  128.9    $300       $38,670.00         $404.50         $39,074.50 
 
 Adding the above recalculations to the other fee totals upheld by the Court, the following 

figures result:  

Chicago and Oak Park 
 
Stephen P. Halbrook           $546,339.99 
Goodwin Procter  207,529.62 
King & Spalding/Bancroft 179,014.60 
Cooper & Kirk    28,576.50 
 
     Total:                               $961,460.71 
 
Chicago only 
 
Kolodziej/Brenner   $39,074.50 
 
Oak Park only 
 
Freeborn & Peters  $326,052.98 
 
 The Court’s decision was based on the information submitted in the joint statement of the 

parties and exhibits originally filed with NRA’s motions for attorney’s fees pursuant to Local 

Rule 54.3(e) & (f).  NRA is entitled to a further fee award for litigating the fee motions and, 

should it be unable to settle the amount with Defendants, reserves the right to file supplemental 

motions for attorney’s fees.  See Robinson v. City of Harvey, Ill., 617 F.3d 915, 917 (7th Cir. 

2010) (“Supplemental awards of legal fees are common.”).  

 On the matter addressed in the Court’s supplemental Memorandum and Order dated June 

28, 2012, the Court noted NRA’s statement that Chicago and Oak Park are jointly and severally 

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 2 of 6 PageID #:1503



3 
 

liable for a portion of the fee award, but stated: “Instead the more fair approach will be to 

allocate the largest part of the fee award -- the portion that NRA ascribes to both lawsuits -- 

ratably between Oak Park and Chicago, so that each will bear (1) a several (and not joint) 

liability for that ratable share plus (2) the amount that NRA has ascribed to that defendant 

alone.”  Order 2 at 2.   

 The reason NRA believes the defendants should be jointly and severally liable is that it 

would have taken exactly the same amount of work to litigate a single case against just one of 

these defendants as it took to litigate the case against both.  If one defendant for whatever reason 

does not or cannot pay the fees, the other defendant should do so.  While these were two separate 

lawsuits that were consolidated, they involved the same constitutional issue, and from the 

beginning Chicago and Oak Park litigated these cases as a team in unison.  “Ordinarily 

tortfeasors are jointly and severally liable, with the plaintiff having the free choice of whom to 

pursue (subject to possible contribution among the tortfeasors at the behest of the defendant 

required to pay in the first instance).”  Strama v. Peterson, 561 F. Supp. 997, 1000 (N.D. 

Ill.1983). 

 “When two or more defendants actively participate in a constitutional violation, they can 

be held jointly and severally responsible for indivisible attorneys' fees.”  Molnar v. Booth, 229 

F.3d 593, 605 (7th Cir. 2000), citing Herbst v. Ryan, 90 F.3d 1300, 1305 (7th Cir. 1996).  Here, 

the constitutional violation by both defendants was identical, and they agreed to defend it jointly.  

Accordingly, they should be held jointly and severally liable. 

CONCLUSION 

 The Court should award Plaintiff NRA attorney’s fees (1) against Chicago and Oak Park 

jointly and severally in the amount of $961,460.71, (2) against Chicago in the amount of 
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$39,074.50, and (3) against Oak Park in the amount of $326,052.98.  In addition, NRA should be 

granted leave to file a supplemental motion for attorney’s fees in each case related to the 

litigation of the motions for attorney’s fees. 

 
      NATIONAL RIFLE ASSOCIATION 

OF AMERICA, INC.,  Dr. KATHRYN TYLER, 
VAN F. WELTON and BRETT BENSON 

      Plaintiffs 
 

BY: s/ Stephen A. Kolodziej   
   One of Their Attorneys 

 
Stephen P. Halbrook 
Attorney at Law 
3925 Chain Bridge Road, Suite 403 
Fairfax, VA 22030 
Tel. (703) 352-7276 
Fax (703) 359-0938 

 
Stephen A. Kolodziej 
Ford & Britton, P.C. 
33 North Dearborn Street, Suite 300 
Chicago, Illinois 60602 
Tel (312) 924-7500 
Fax (312) 924-7516 
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CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE 

 

 I, Stephen A. Kolodziej, an attorney, certify that on this, the 10th day of July, 2012, I 

caused a copy of the foregoing to be served by electronic filing on: 

 
 Michael A. Forti 
 Andrew W. Worseck 
 William Macy Aguiar 
 Rebecca Alfert Hirsch 
 City of Chicago - Department of Law 
 Constitutional and Commercial Litigation Division 
 30 North LaSalle Street, Suite 1230 
 Chicago, Illinois  60602 
 Tel: (312) 744-4342 
 Fax: (312) 742-3925 
 
and that I caused a copy to be served by U.S. Mail on: 
 
 Ranjit Hakim      
 Mayer Brown LLP     
 71 South Wacker Drive    
 Chicago, Illinois 60606    
  
 
       s/ Stephen A. Kolodziej    
       Stephen A. Kolodziej 
       Counsel for Plaintiffs 
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EXHIBIT LIST 

 

A. Stephen A. Kolodziej/Brenner, Ford, Monroe & Scott, Ltd. Redacted Fee Submission for 
 NRA, et al v. City of Chicago (Revised) 
 
 
B. Stephen P. Halbrook – Services Rendered in National Rifle Association v. Chicago and 
 Oak Park Through 11/11/11 (Revised) 
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EXHIBIT A (Revised)

Stephen A. KolodziejBrenner, Ford, Monroe &Scott, Ltd.
Redacted Fee Submission for NRA, et al. v. City of Chicaeo

Pursuant to the Court's June 25, 2Q12 Memorandum Opinion and Order, below are the
total hours redacted by invoice for work done after consolidation on both the merits and fees
appeals. The Brenner, Ford invoices designated below have been crossed out, in whole or in part
as indicated, and the re-calculated total fees and costs for Kolodziej and Brenner, Ford, at the
$300 hourly rate allowed by the Court, are totaled below.

Merits Appeal

Invoice

#2902049, Feb. 17, 2004
#2903020, March 13, 2009
#2904027, April 15, 2009
#2905048, May 20, 2009
#2906018, June 24, 2009
#2907048, July 24, 2009
#2908124, Sept. 10, 2009
#2007043, July 15, 2010
#2409073, Sept. 22, 2010
#2010460, Oct. 14, 2010

TOTAL REDACTIONS, MERITS APPEAL =

Fee Appeal

Invoice

#101161, Feb. 25, 2011
#101280, Apri121, 2011
#101433, June 1, 2011
#141510, June 21, 2QI 1
#101519, July 6, 2011

Total hours redacted

34.8 (entire invoice)
9.6 (entire invoice)
2. ] {entire invoice}
18.0 (entire invoice)
42.4 (entire invoice}
7.1 (entire invoice)
1.9 (entire invoice)
2.2 (entire invoice)
10.7 (entire invoice)
4.5 (entire invoice}

133.3 HOURS

Total hours redacted

13.4 {entire invoice)
11.4 (entire invoice)
3.1 (entire invoice)
3.9 {entire invoice}
43 (partially redacted through issuance

of Court of Appeals mandate, 6/24/2011)

TOTAL REDACTIONS, FEE APPEAL = 36.1 HOURS

TOTAL REDACTIONS FOR BOTH APPEALS =169.4

Kolodziej's original Exhibit A was filed with his Declaration in support of NRA's Motion for
Attorneys Fees as Document # 103-1 on 1/18/12.
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Subtracted from original total houxs claimed (298.3) =NEW TOTAL 128.9 HOURS @ $300/hr

NEW TOTAL SRENNER FEE _ $38,670

In addition, costs of $12.60 were redacted from invoice # 1011 b l on fee appeal
Original costs claimed = 417.1

NEW TOTAL COSTS = $404.50

TOTAL RE-CALCULATED FEES AND COSTS: X39,074.50

2
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INVOICEBRENNER, FORD, MOIVROE ~4c SCOTT, L'I'U. 
ATTORNEYS AT i,AW

33 NUR'TH DEA1iI30RN STREET SUi'fE 30~ CHICAGO, iLI.11VOI5 G06p2-31A2 (312) 781-1970

INVOICE SUMMARY

llATE INVOICE HOURS FEES COSTS TOTAL
NO. 

AMOUNT

o~izsios zsa~oa3 ~s.ao $a,6zo.00 $400.oa $s,ozo.00i0/31/08 2810039 21.40 6,420.00 6,424.001 1 /25/08 28 t 1066 16. 10 4,830.00 4,830.0012/19/08 2812045 0.90 270.00 270.0041/23/09 281 ?086 29.20 8,760.00 9,215.0002/L 7/09 2902049 34.80 10,395.00 ] 0,395.00U3/13/09 2903020 9.60 2,835.QQ 3,240.0004/15/09 2904027 2.10 630.00 630.00OS/2U/09 2905048 1$.00 5,400.00 5,400.0006/24/09 2906018 X12.40 12,720.00 12,720.0007/24/09 2907048 7.10 2, i 30.00 2, l 30.0009/10/09 2908!24 1.90 570.00 570.0007/15/10 2007043 2.20 660.00 660.0009/22/10 2009073 10.70 3,2]0.00 3,210.0010/14/1Q 2010060 4.SU 1,350.00 1,354.0011/23/10 2010072 11.90 3,570.00 3,570.00l2/36/10 2012077 1.20 3b0.00 360.OQ01!14/11 101Ob6 12.80 3,840.00 4,295.0002/25/ 1 I 101161 t 3.40 4,420.00 12.60 4,032.6004/21/1 t 101280 ! 1.40 3,420.00 3,42a.Q006/(lt/11 101433 3.10 930.00 93Q.00O6/21/I L ]01510 3.90 1,170.00 1,]70.0007/U6/ t 1 t Q 3 S 7 9 7.90 2,370.00 4.50 2,374.5007/26/11 ] 6.40 4,920.00 4,920.00

29830 $89,400.00 $ 417.10 $89,817.10

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENIYER, FORD, M~NROE &SCOTT, L'FD.

IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE RET[JI~I THEREMITTANCE PAGE WTI'H YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 36-31020$8
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tNVOlCE

BRENNER, FOKD, MONROE 8t SCO'[T, L'TD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW33 NOR'~'1(DEARBORN STREET 5U(T'E 3Q0 CFIICAGO, ILLINOIS 60602-3102 {312} 78l-1470

Juiy 25, 2008 
Invoice Nv. 2807043

NRA-[LA Ufftce of Legislative Counsel
I l25Q Waples Mill Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Christopher Conte

RE: Uur File No.: PL1~.08CV3697
National Rifle Association of America v. The City of Chicago, ei al.Court No. 0$ CV 3b97

For professional services rendered through June 30, 20Q8

Hrs/Rate ount
6!24/2008 SAK Multiple telephone conferences with attorney W. Howard 0.34 90.Q0

300.00/hr

3AK Receipt and review of draft complaint 0.30 90.00
30Q.00/hr

6J26/20Q8 SAK Review and analyze Supreme Court decision in D.C. v. Heller 4.80 1,440.00
30Q.00/hr

SAK Multiple telephone conferences vyith attorney William Howazd I.00 300.00
300.00lhr

6/27/2008 SAK Review, analysis, and modifications to draft complaints 230 690.00
300.00/hr

SAK Multiple pre-filing e-mail correspondence to and from NRA 0.90 270.00
30Q.00/hr

SAK Review of applicable case law 1.80 540.00
.and local rule requirements 300.00/hr

SAK Multiple pre-filing telephone conferences with attorney Howard 1.7d 510.00
300.00lhr
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INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MUIYROE ~4t SCO'CI', LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEAitBORN STREET SUITE 300 Ct11CAG0, ILLINOIS 60602-3102 (312) 781-1970

NRA-ILA OfTice of Legislative Course! Invoice # 2807043 Page 2

6/27l2U0$ SAK Preparation of cevil action cover sheet

SAK Preparation of appearance

SAK Preparation of LR 3.2 notification of affiliates For inclusion incomplaint

SAK E-Piling of complaint and related documents in federal court

SAK Follow-up telephone conference with attorney Howard

SAK Follow-up e-mail correspondence to NRA

For professional services rendered

Additional Charges

6/27!200$ :,ourt -Cling fee

Court - 61ing fee

Total costs

Total amount of this bill

.~

Hrs/Rate Amount

0.50 150.00
300.00lhr

0.50 150.00
3Q0.00/hr

0.20 60.00
300.a0/tu

0.50 150.00
3 Q0.00/hr

O.SO 150.00
300.00/hr

O.l U 30.00
300.00/hr

15.40 $4,620.40

350.00

SO.dO

$4U0.00

55.020.00
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IM/OICE

BRENNER, FQRD, MONROE 8c SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARBORN STREET SUi'CE 300 CHICAGO,ILL[NOIS 60602-3102 (312) 781-1970

~-

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice ~ 28070x3 Page 3

Attorney Summary
Name Hours Rate AmountSAK Stephen A. Kolodziej - Partner 15.40 300.00 $4,620.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE 8~ SCOTT, LTD.

1N ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOiJNT TS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE RETURNTHE REMITTANCE PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088

~~
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INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE 3~ SC(?TT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW33 IVUR'rtl DEARBORN S'CREE~I' SUi1'E 300 CI-tiCAGO, ILLINOIS 60b02-3 (02 {312) 781-1970i

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel

REMITTANCE COPY

July 25, 2008

NI~iA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel
11250 Waples Mi11 Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Christopher Conte

Invoice ~# 2807043

In Re: Our File No.: PLTF.48CV3697
Nations! Rifle ,Association of America v. "Che City of Chicago, et al.Court No. Q8 CV 3697

Total fees for this invoice: $4,620.00 ~ ~ ~ ~ - - _ .___Total costs For this invoice: $aQ0.00
Tots! amount: $5,020.00 ~ '-= --.._

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.
IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CR~D[TED, PLEASERETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY WITH YOUR PAYMEi~tT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 3 6-3 1 02088

Page 4
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tNVQICE

BRENNER. FORD, MONROE .4~ SCOTT, LTD. AT'COREYEYS A'T LAW
3 NOR"fll DE~lft[30RN STREET SU1"l~f: 300 ('1IfC~1GO, U.LINC)15 60b02-3103 (31?) 731-1974f

~ctobcr 3l, 20Q8 
Invoice ~t~~. ?810039

NR/1-I LA Uftice ot~ Legislative ~.uui~srl
1250 Waples Milt Ruad

Fairfax VA 22030
Christopher Cante

RE: Our File No.: PLTT'.08CV3G97
National Ritle Association ot~n►nerica v. "I'he City ot~Chicagu, ~t al.Court No. U8 CV 3G97

For professional services rendered through September 30, 2Q0$

I [rsJRate Amount
7/l/2U0$ SAK "Cetephone conference with plaintiff'Kathryn '1'yier ~ 0.2U 60.00

300.00/hr

SAK 'Telephone conference with S. Misiora 0.50 l 50.00
300.00/hr

SAK Preparation of engagement letter to NRA 0.80 240.00
30b.OG/]v~

SAK Correspondence to attorney Nalbrook 0.20 b0.~0
300.00/ty

7!2/2008 SAK Additional correspondence to attorney Halbrook 0.24 60.0
300.00/}u

SAK Telephone conference with client Anthony Bur[on 0.30 90.OQ
3 00.00/hr

SAK Telephone conference with client Brett Benson 0.20 6Q.00
300.00/hr

7/7/2048 SAK Receipt and review of original signed authorization from Anthony 0.10 30.00Burton
3QOAO/hr

SAK Receipt and review oForiginal signed authorization from $rett Q.10 3Q.00Benson
J00,00/hr
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i►vvoic~

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE ~'c SCUTT, LTD. ATTnRNEYS r1T LAW
3 NOR fl1 DEARLiORN S"fR~ET tiUl 1'E ]UO CItICAGO, iLLINC)15 6g60?-31t)? ~(3l_)7R1-I )7U

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice ~ 2810439 pa6~ ~

Firs/Rate Amount

7/7/2008 SAK [,otter 4o Sue Misiora U.20 b0.U0
300.00/hr

7/8/2008 SAK Prepuation and filing of pro hac vice application on behalFof l.00 300,00
attorney Stephen 1-Ialbrook 300.00mr

7!10!2008 5AK Receipt and review ofemaii from attorney Halbrook with Judge Q.30 9U.Q0
Shadur order on complaint in McDonald case 300.0 /hr

7/t 1/2008 SAK Telephone conference with attorneys Halbrook, Conte and O.GO ! 80.00
Howard 3UQ_Ot)/h.r

7/15/2008 SAK Receipt and review of defense counsel appearances, notification of 0.70 210.00
affiliates, response to order filed by plaintiff, and court's minute 300.00/hr
order of clarification, tiled in McDonald case and forwarded by C.
Cunte

SAK Receipt and review of correspondence regarding McDonald case 0.10 30.00
filings from attorney Halbrootc 300.00/lir

7/16/2008 SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from C. Conte . 0.30 90.00
300.00/hr

SAK E-mail to C. Conte 0.10 30.00
300.00/hr

7/171200$ SAK Receipt and review of emails from C. Conte 0.50 150.00
300.00~r

SAK Correspondence to attorney Howard 0.10 30.00
300.00/hr
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INVpICE

BRENNER, F'dRD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
f .:

3 Nc>R~rF~ ~EnK~3c)xty S~~REL"C SUfI'E 3UU C1I1C~lGO, ILLINnlS 60602-3 1 02 (.31?) 7R1.197Q

NRn-iL,~\Office of i,cgislative Counsel lnvuice !{ ?810039 Page 3

Hrs/Rate Amount
8/$/2008 SAK Receipt and review of motion to vacate and oppose order E.80 540.00reassigning case, and exhibits and cited case law, filed by 300.00/hrFreeborn and Peters in McDonald case

8/12/200$ SAK Receipt and review of multiple e-mail correspondence between 0.50 t 50.00:ittomeys Howard, Conte and Halbrook 30Q.00/hr

S~~K ~T~lcphone eonferencc with S. Flalbrook, C. Conte, S. Misiora, and 0.90 270.00W. [-toward
~00.00/hr

SAK Review of on-line court file and call Judge Shadu~s clerk 0.50 (50. 0regarding status of motion to admit S. Halbrook pro hac vice 300.00/tu
8/1$/?008 SAK Court r\ppearance - flttendance at status hearing 1.Q0 300.00

300.00/hr
8/20/20Q8 SnK Receipt and review ofmultiple e-mai! correspondence from S. 020 60.00Misiora and counsel .

300.Q0/hr

SAK Correspondence to S. Misiora 0.20 60.00
300.~0/hr

SAK Receipt and review of ~ :aemorandum Forwarded by 0.20 60.00C. Conte
300.00/hr

9/2/2008 SAK Receipt and review ofcorrespondence from C. Conte _ Q.ZO 60.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt, review and analysis of City of Chicago's answer to l.00 3Q0.00complaint, defense and jury demand 300.00/hr
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INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE 3c SCUTT, LTD. r~TTORNEYS A"C LAW

!.
;3 NC~RI'l! UEAItHI)RN S"IRI:E~f 5Ull'G i00 ~FtIG~c;O. ILI.INUIS 6062-3 t02 (31?) 781-1470

NRn-tt,A Oi~fice ut' Legi~la~ive Cou~tsel Invoice ~ Z8IU039 Page 4

Hrs/Rate Amount

9/4/20Q8 SAK Rzceipt and review of defendant's answer, defense quid jury 0.60 180.00
elemand in leak Perk case 300.00/hr

SAK Receipt end review of defendant Pope's motion to dismiss in Uak 0.30 90.00
Park case 3U0.00/ly

SAK Email correspondence to and from attameys Cvnte and t-{albrook 0.20 G0.00
300AO/ly

9/5!2048 SAK Telephone conference with attorneys Halbrook, Conte and 0.70 210.00
E toward 3UO.OU/hr

9/8/2008 SAK Receipt and review ofeorrespondence from City's course! W. 0.20 60.00
Aguiar regarding proposed conference call an discovery 3dd.Q0/hr

SAK Emaii correspondence to W. A6uiar regarding telephone 0.10 30.04
conference 3p0.00Jhr

SAK Receipt and review of email correspondence from C. Conte D.2Q b0.00
300.00/hr

SAK Email correspondence to C. Conte and S. Halbrook 0.20 60.OQ
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of email correspondence From S. Nalbroo~C U.ld 30.00
300.00/hr

SAK Telephone conference with City attorney Aguiar regarding 0.20 60.00
discovery needed and issues as to same 300.00ltu
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INVOICE

BRENIVER, FORD, MONROE Sc SC()'fT, LTD. A'tT4RNEYS A'f LAW
3 NUR"["N DEARUURN STREET SUI"I'F 3U0 CkIICAGO, ILLINOIS 6~6g2.3102 (312) 781-1470

NRA-fLA Office of Legislative Counsel invoice tt 38tOt)39 Page S

Hrs/Rate Amount

9/8/2008 SAK Email correspondence to S. Elalbrook and C. ConEe 0.20 60.00
]OQ.00~r

SAK Receipt and review of email correspondence from C. Conte Q.20 60.Od
300.00/hr

SAK {ieview of applicable case law 2.00 600.00
gar preparation of 300.00/iu-

mution to strike City's jury demand

!9/2008 SAK Review additional applicable case law and begin preparation of 1.20 360.00
motion to strike jury elemand 300,00/hr

9/10/2008 SAK Court Appearance - Attendance at status hearing I.OD 300,00
300.00/hr

SAK Correspondence to C. Conte and S. Halbrook via email 0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from C. Conte 0.10 30.OQ
300.00/hr

SAK Correspondence to C. Conte 0.20 60.00
300.00/lu

SnK Correspondence to S. Halbrook 0.20 60.00
3d0.a0/hr

9/1 d/2~08 SAK Receipt and review of emaits from C_ Conte and S. 1-~albrook 0.30 90.Q0
300.00/hr

For professional services rendered 21.40 $6,420.00
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INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE & SCO'TT, ~,TD. A'T'TORNEYS A'i' LAW
~ 3 NORTH DEAR~ORN S"iRkE'f SUl'tE 3Q0 CItICACO, lLLINC)IS r;U6O?-3102 (313) 78I.1o7A

NR~1-[LA Office of l..cgislative Counsel Invoice ~ ?810039 I'asz V

Attomsy Summary
Name 

f fours hate AmountSAK Stephen A. Kolodziej - Partner 21.~3{l JOO.UO $6,~20.U0

PLEASE REMIT TO: f3RENNER, FO[rD, MONROE & SCOTC, L'TD.

fN ORDER TO ENSUEZE 'THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERI..Y CREDi`i'ED, PLEASE RETURN'THE REMITTANCE PAGE Wi"fH YOUR PAYMENT.

F[RM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 3 6-3 1 020 8 8

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 14 of 113 PageID #:1521



ir~voEC~

l3RENlYEIt, FORD, MONROE 3~ SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
3 iVCIR'i'II 17F.ARl30KN 5'IREF."f SUI~i~E 3DQ l'IIICAGU, ILLIN~)IS6U602-~1UZ (31?) 781-1970i

NRn-I I,A Uftice vi 1_~gisi~tive C:ounsei invoice N ?3 i 0039 I'1ge 7

REMITTANCE COPY

October 3 I, 2008

NRA-(L~~ Office of Legislative Counsel
i 1250 Waples Mill RoaJ
Fairfax VA 22030
Christopher Conte

In Re. Our File No.; PL'C~.U8CV3697
Natiunal Rifle Association oFAmerica v.'fhe City of Chicago, et al.Court Nu. a8 CV 3G97

i

Total fees for this invoice: $6, 20.00 QED ~% ~ 20G8Total costs For this invoice: $O.OU
Total amount: $6,420.00

PLEASE REMiT TO: HRENNER, FOfZD, MONROE &SCOTT, L'I'D.
!N ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASERETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY W(TH YOUR PAYMENT.

FiRNt TALC f.D. NUNiDFR: 36-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 15 of 113 PageID #:1522



IIVVVII.t

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARBORN STREET SUI"fE 300 CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60602-3102 (3 { 2) 781- 1970

November 25, 2008

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel
11250 Waples Mili Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Christopher Conte

RE: Our File No.. PLTF.08CV3697
National Rifle Association of America v. The City of Chicago, et al.
Court No. 08 CV 3697

For professional services rendered through October 31, 2008

10/6/2008 SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from C. Conte

SAK Telephone conference with attorney Howard

Invoice No. 281 IQb6

10/i4/2008 SAK Receipt and review of City's first set of interrogatories to plaintiffs

SAK Receipt and review oP City's Fzst request !'or production of
documents to plaintiff's

SAK Correspondence to attorneys Halbrook, Conte and Howard

5AK Receipt and review of multiple email correspondence from
attorneys Halbrook, Conte and Howard

10/16/2008 SAK Telephone conference with attorney Howazd

SAK Email correspondence to S. Ha(brook, C. Conte, and S. Misiora

Hrs/Rate Amount

0.20 64.00
300.00/hr

0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

0.40 120.00
300.00/hr

0.40 120.00
300.00/hr

0.20 6Q.00
300.00/hr

0.40 12 0.00
300A0/hr

0.20 6Q.00
300.40~hr

a.za 60.00
300.Q0/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 16 of 113 PageID #:1523



INVUII:t

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARBORiV S'fR~E'T SUITE 300 CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60602-3102 (312} 781-1970

NRA-[LA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 281106b Page 2

Hrs/Rate tLnount

10/16/2008 SAK Receipt and review of email correspondence from C. Conte 0.10 30.00
3d0.00/hr

10/17/2008 SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from attorney Halbrook 0.10 30.00
300. QO/hr

SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from S. Misiora 0.10 34.00
300.00Itu

SAK Telephone conference call with S. Halbrook, S. Misiora and C. 0.30 90.00
Conte 300.00/hr

SAK Drafted letter to City's attorney regazding Rule 16 and 26(c) 0.40 124.00
conference, and proposal to stay Qrooeedings pending resolution of 300.00/hr
incorporation issue

SAK Email to 5. Halbrook 0.10 30.00
300.OQ/hr

SAK Receipt and review of email from S. Halbrook 0. I O 34.00
300.OQ/hr

SAK Additional telephone conferences with S. Misiora 0.30 90.00
300.00/hr

10/21 /2008 SAK Telephone conference with S. Misiora 0.40 120.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from S. Halbrook 0.10 30.00
3 00.00/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 17 of 113 PageID #:1524



INVVIC:t

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTI-[ DBARBORN STREET SUITE 300 CHICAGO, tLLINOtS 60602-3102 (312) 78f-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 281 ] 066 Page 3

HrslRate Amount

10/Z1/2008 SAK Correspondence to S. Halbrook 0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of Rule 16 motion filed in McDonald case 0.30 90.00
300.00/hr

SAK Additional corresQondet~ce to S. Nalbrook . 0.20 60.00
~ao.00mr

SAK Preparation of Rule 16 motion for briefing and disposition of I.40 300.00
Second Amendment incorporation issue and to stay discovery 300.00/tir
pending same

10/22/2008 SAK Receipt and review of motion to suikc jury demand filed in Oa3c 0.30 90.00
Park case 300.U0/hr

SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from 5. Halbrook 0.20 b0.fl0
300.00/hr

SAK Telephone conference with S. Halbrook 0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

SAK Email correspondence to S. Halbrook 0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of email correspondence from S. Halbrook 0.10 30.00
300.00/hr

SAK Completed prepazation of motion to strike jury demand 0.30 90.00
300.00/hr

SAK Emailed motion to strike jury demand to 5. Halbrook and C. 0.10 30.00
Conte 300.00/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 18 of 113 PageID #:1525



INVUIC;t

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH 17EAEtBORN STREET SUITE 300 CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 6U6U2-3102 (312) 781-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 2811066 Page 4

Hrs/Rate Amount

10/22/2008 SAK Finaii7ation and e-filing of Rvle 16 motion and exhibits to same, x.50 150.00and notice of motion
300.OQlhr

SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from S HaJbrook and C. 0.20 bd.~0Conte
300.00/hr

10/23/2008 SAK E-filed motion to strike jury demand and notice of motion 0.30 40.Op
300.00/hr

10/24/2008 SAK Receipt and review of Oak Park's counsel's letter regaest for Rule 0.20 50.00l b confere~ice 300,00/hr

SAK Multiple email correspondence to and from attorneys S. Halbrook, a.8o 240.00C. Conte acid W. Howard 300.OQ/hr

SAK Telephone conference with S. Hatbrook 0.30 90.00
300A0/hr

SAK Additional telephone conference with W. Howard and S. Halbrook 0.30 90.00
3 Q0.00/}u

10/27/2008 SAK Telephone conference with attorneys Haibrook and Howard 0.50 150.00
300.00(hr

SAK Participation in defense counsel Rule 16 conference call 1.00 300.00
300.Q0/hr

SAK Receipt and review of documents forwarded by A. Burton 020 60.00
300.00/hr

SAK Telephone conference with A. Burton 0.20 60.00
300.00/4u

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 19 of 113 PageID #:1526



INVUI(;t

BRENNEl2, FORD, M4NROE 8i SCOTT, L'I'D, A"CT(3RNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTN DEAftI~ORN S"GREET 5U1'TE 300 ~ CHICAGO, ILLINOIS G0602-3102 {J 12) 781-197Q

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsr! Invoice ~ 2811066 Page 5

Hr hate Amount
l0/28/2008 SAK Conference at federal courthouse with all counsel of record in 0.30 94.00related cases regarding agreement as to procedure on Rule 16 3QO.OQ/hrmotions and motions to strike jury demand

SAK Court appearance - attendance at federal court hearing on motions 1.Q0 300.00to strike jury demand and Rule I6 motions 300.00/t~r
10/31 /2008 SAK Telephone conference with A. Burton 0.20 61}.00

300.00lhr

SAK fimail correspondence to S. Halbrook, C. Conte, and S. Misiara 0.1 Q 30.00
300.00/hr

SAK [teceipt and review oFemai! correspondence from S. Haibrook 020 60.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of email correspondence from C. Conte Q.10 30.00
300.00/hr

11/3/2008 5AK Meeting with Anthony Burton 1.00 300.00
300.00/hr

l l/7/2008 SAK Review and analysis of 1.00 300.00i document forwarded by attorney Conte 300.00/hr

SAK Telephone conference with City of Chicago's counsel regarding 0.20 60.00City's wiEhdrawa! of jury demand 300.00/hr

SAK Email correspondence to attorneys Halbrook, Conte and Howard 0.14 30.00
300.00/tu•

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 20 of 113 PageID #:1527



fNVUIC:t

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW33 NOIi7H DCARBORN 5TRCET SUITE 300 CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60602-3102 (3l2) 781-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 2811066

11/7/2008 SAK Keceipt and review of email correspandence from attorneyHoward

For professional services rendered

Page 6

Hrs/Rate Amount

0.14 3Q.00
3 DO.00Jhr

l b.10 $4,830.00

Attorney SummaryName 
Honrs Kate AmountSAK Stephen A. Kolodziej - Partner 16.10 300.00 $4,830.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

[N ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT 1S PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE RETURNTHE REMITTANCE PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX T.D. NUMBER: 36-310208

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 21 of 113 PageID #:1528



INVUII;t

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARBORN STREET SUITE 300 CHICAGO, ILLINUiS 6Q602-3102 (3t2) 781-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 28I 1 Q66 Page 7

REMITTANCE COPY

November 25, 2008

NRA-TLA Office of Legislative Counsel
11250 Waples Mill Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Christopher Conte

!n Re: Our File No.: PLTF.08CV3697
National Rifle Association of America v. The City of Chicago, et af.
Court No. O8 CV 3697

Total fees for this invoice: $4,830.00
Total costs for this invoice: $0.00

Total amount: $4,830.0

PLE~.SE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT lS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE
RETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 22 of 113 PageID #:1529



INVOICE

BRENNER, FnRD, MONR4E 8c SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS A'T LAW
33 iVORTI~I DEAR130RiV S'fRLiEl' SU]TE 300 ('FII('AC;O, ILLINOIS bA602-31Q2 ~ (312) 7$i-1970

December 14, 200$

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel
1 1250 Waples Mill Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Christopher Conte

RE: Our file No.: Pl.TF.O8CV3b97
National Rifle Association of America v. The City of Chicago, et at.
Court No. 08 CV 3697

For professional services rendered through November 30, 20Q8

Invoice No. 2812045

Hrs/Rate Amount

l 1/24/2008 SAK Multiple email correspondence to and from S. Halbrook, C. Conte, 0.6Q 180.00
and W. Howard 300.00/hr

SAK Email correspondence to S. Halbrook C. Conte and S. ~lisiora a.20 60.00
340.OU/hr

SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from C. Conte 0.1(1 30.00
300.0 /hr

For professional services rendered 0.90 $270.00

Attomcy Summary
Name Hours Rate AmounE
SAK Stephen A. Kolodziej - Partner 0.90 3Q0.00 $270.00

PLEASE REMIT Td: BREI~fNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT (S PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE RETURN
THE REMITTA(VCE PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 23 of 113 PageID #:1530



INVOICE

BRENNER, FnRD, MONROE &SCOTT, L7'D. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARBORN ~ fREF"1' St}ATE 300 CI I1CAGO, IL.1_INOIS 6~bQ2-3102 - (312) 781.1970

NRA-ILA Office of 1,~6islative Counsel Invoice # 2812045 Pabe 2

REMITTANCE COPY

December 19, 2008

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel
l 1250 Waples Mili Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Christopher Conte

In Re: Our File No.: PL~['F.08CV3697
National Rifle Association of America v. The City of Chicago, et al.
Court No. 08 CV 3697

Total fees for this invoice: $270.00
Total costs for this invoice: X0.00

Total amount: $270.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, M~NROE ~ SCOTT, LTD.

fN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT fS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE
RETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX [.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 24 of 113 PageID #:1531



INVOICE

BRENNER, FaRD, MONROE & SCO"f T, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAVV
33 NORTfi DEARBORN 5'I'REG"]' SUITE 300 CFIICAGO, ILLINOIS 60002-3102 (313) 7R1-1970

January 23, 2009 
lnvuice No. 28120$6

NRA-iLA Office of Lebislative Counsel
1 1250 Waples Mitl Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Christopher Conte

RE: Our Fite No.: Pi.TF.Q8CV3697
National Rifle Association of America v. The City of Cl~icabo, et al.
Court No. 08 CV 3697

For professional services rendered through December 3I, 2008

Hrs/Rate Amount
12/l/20Q8 SAK Review of _ .. brief forwarded by S. }.00 300.00Halbrook

300.00/hr

SAK Review and formatting of revised draft of Rule 16 motion 2.50 750.00and comparison oFsame witF~ Oak Park brieFto ensure 300.00/hridenticality of arguments

SAK Review of email correspondence from attorney Dootey Q.20 60.00
300.00/hr

SAK Corrected and revised Rule 16 brief 0.30 90.00
300.00/hr

SAK Review and final reformatting and preparation of third draft of t.80 540.00Rule lb incorporation brief for filing with court 300.00/hr

SAK Email correspondence to and from S. Misiora, S. Nalbrook and C. 0.30 )Q_00Conte
300.00/hr

12/2/2008 SAK Preparation of Rule 21 motion to drop Burton as party plaintiff 0.20 60.00
3fl0.0U/hr

SAK Correspondence to S. Halbrook and C. Conte 0.1 Q 30.00
300.00Ihr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 25 of 113 PageID #:1532



INVOICE

BREiYNER, FORD, MON120E &SCOTT, LTD. A"i'TORNEYS A'I' LAW33 NOR'PH DEARBORN S~fREFT SUITE 300 CH)CAGO, ILLINOIS bOb02-3102 (112) 781-1970

NRA-ILA Office of L,ebislative Counsel Invoice # 2812086 Pabe 2

Hrs/Rate Amount
12!2/2008 SAK Correspondence to S. Halbrook, C. Conte and W. Noward 0.20 60.00

300.00/hr
SAK Receipt and review of email from W. Howard 0.1 U 30.00

300.00/hr
SAK Telephone conference with attorney Howard D.30 90.00

300,00/hr

SAK Telephone conference with Anthony Burton 4.20 50.00
300.00/hr

! 2/3/2008 SAK Email correspondence to and from S. Hal6raok and C. C'nnr~ 0.2Q 60.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of minute order striking i 2/4/08 status date 0.10 3(}.00
300.00/hr

SAK Email to S. Halbrook, C. Conte and W. Howard O.IQ 30.(}0
3 00.00/h r

SAK Telephone conference with W. Howard
0.50 150.00

300.OQ/hr

l2/5/2Q08 SAK Receipt and review of court memorandum opir►ion denying Rule 0.50 150.0016 incorporation motion
3U0.00/hr

SA[G Email correspondence to and from attorney W. Howard 0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 26 of 113 PageID #:1533



INVOICE

BREIYNER, FORD, MOIYROE &SCOT"1', L'TD. A'TT'ORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORT}I DEARt30RN STREE"i' SUi'fE J00 CHICAGO, ILL{NO15 bpb02-]102 {~12j 781-f970

NRA-ILA Office of Lebislative Counsel [nvoice # 2812086 Pabe 3

Wrs/Rate Amount

12/8/20Q8 SAK Receipt and review of memorandum opinion and Rule l6 order in 0.30 90.00
McDonald case 30A.00/hr

SAK Multiple email correspondence to and from S. Halbrook, C. Conte 4.50 150.00
and W. Howard 300.QU/hr

SAK Review of federal appeals rules regarding options for obtaining 0.6U 180.00
appellate review of Rule 16 ruling. 300.00lhr

12/9!2008 SAK Court Appearance - Attendance at status hearing (case passed for 2.UU 600.OQ
lenbthy counsel discussion regarding further proceedings) 300.00lhr

SAK Telephone conference with S. Halbrook, C. Conte, and W. 0.50 1 50.00
Howard 300.00/hr

SAK Final foRnattinb and e-filing of Rule 21 motion to drop Anthony 0.4U 120.OU
Burton as plaintiff 300.00/hr

21t 6/2008 SAK Receipt and review of proposed orders from City retarding 0.20 60.00
judginent on the pleadings 300.U0/hr

SAK Email corresnondencc to S. Halbrook, C. Conte and W. Howard o.za 6U.OU
_ 300.00/hr

!2/17/2008 SAK Muttiple telephone conferences with attorneys f-Toward and 0.80 240.00
Dooley 3UO.OQ/hr

SAK Telephone conference with S. f{albrook, C. Conte, W. Howard O.SQ I SO.OU
and D. Dooley 300.00/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 27 of 113 PageID #:1534



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONRQE .~c SCOTT, L'~U. A1'7'ORNEYS AT LAW
33 NOKTH DEARB(3RN Sl"REE'T' SUITE J00 Cl ll('A()O, ILLIN(}IS 6U6Q2-3102 {312) 7R I-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Lebislative Counsel Invoice # 2812086 Page 4

Hrs/Rate Amount

1 Z/I7/2008 SAK Preparation of proposed jud~nent order on Counts 11 and 1f1 and 0.50 150.00proposed stipulation of dismissal as to Count 1[f 300.00/hr

SAK Email correspondence to City's counsel regarding proposed Q20 60.00judgment order and stipulation of dismissal 30~.00/hr

SAK Review applicable case law regarding finality and appealability of 1.00 300.00order granting judgment on remaining counts following voluntary 300.00/hrdismissal of other counts

12/18/2008 SAK Court Appearance - Attendance al continued status hearing for 1.20 360.00entry of dismissal and judgment orders and presentment of motion 300.40/hr
to drop Anthony Burton as parry plaintiff

SAK Receipt and review of email correspondence from S. Halbrook and 1.50 450.00C. Conte
300.00/hr

SAK Review of court rules and case law regarding preparation and 1.00 300.Q0filing rec{uirements for notice of appeal 300.00/hr

SAK Preparation of notice of appeal 0.50 l 50.00
300.00/hr

SAK E-filed notice of appeal 0.40 1 20.00
300.OQ/hr

SAK Telephone conference with district court clerk regarding docketing 0.20 60.00of multiple orders on i 2/18 regarding; need to amend notice of 300.00/hr
appeal

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 28 of 113 PageID #:1535



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, M~NROE &SCOTT, I,TD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NDRI'H D~nRt30RN S'fRf~F.7 SUITE )00 C'IiICAGO, ILLINOIS bOb02-31(12 (:ii2) SRI-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 2812086 Page 5

1-Irs/Rate Amount

!2/l8/2008 SAK Telephone conference with attorney W. Howard Q.20 60.00
300.00/hr

SAK Preparation of amended notice of appeal 0.30 90.00
300.00/hr

SAK E-filing of amended notice of appeal, inc{uding telephone 0.30 90.U0
conference with court clerk regarding excusing docketing tee for 300.00/hr
same

12/19/2008 SAK Telephone call to district court clerk regarding docketing of 0.30 90.00
Chicago, Oak Park and McDonald orders from IZ-18-08 300.QQ/hr

SAK Review Seventh Circuit court file regarding notices of appeal filed 0.60 180.OU
in Chicabo, Oak ParEc and McDonald orders 300.00/hr

SAK Email correspondence to S. Haibrook, C. Conte, aid W. Howard 0.30 90.04
300.00/hr

SAK Review of correspondence from S. Misiora U.30 90.00
300.Od/hr

SAK Review of email corresoonclence from C. Conte, S. Halbrook and 0.30 90.00
W. Howard 300.00/hr

12/22/2008 SAK Telephone conference with district court clerk regarding entry of 0.30 90.00
orders from 12-18-08 on Chicago case 300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of ECF notices retarding entry of various 0.30 90.00
orders by Judge Shadur on 12- 18-08 ~OO.00~r

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 29 of 113 PageID #:1536



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOT"T, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 ~ORT}I DEARBOl~N STRE:E"f SUITF, 360 CFI{CAGO, IL1.1NOfS (i0fiO3-31Q2 (312) 7R1-1970

NRA-II.A Officc of Legislative Counsel invoice ~ 28 (2086 Page 6

Hrs/Efate Amount

12122/20{?8 SAK Receipt and review of ECF notices regarding transmittal of record 0.30 90.00
on appeal and notices regarding docketing statement and fee 300.00/hr

12/23/2008 SAK Telephone conference with court of appeals clerk regarding two U.3U 90.00
docket numbers for Chicago case, docketsng fee issues, and 30U.U0lhr
docketing statement procedure

SAK Multiple telephone conferences with W. Howard O.SU ISQ.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of docketing statement, Rule 26.1 disclosure, 0.50 150.00
and certificate regarding transcript forwarded by D. pooley for 300.00/hr
Oak Park case

SAK Preparation of docketing statement for Chicago case 2.00 600.00
300.00/hr

SAK Preparation of Rule 26.1 disclosure 0,50 150.00
300.00/hr

SAK Preparation of certificate regarding transcripts and notice for same 0.60 1$0.00
300.00/hr

For professional services rendered 29.20 $8,760.00

Additional Charges

12/18/2008 Filed Notice of Appeal 455.00

Total costs $455.00

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 30 of 113 PageID #:1537



INVQICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DFARIiORN Sl'REE'f SUITE 300 C'FiICAGQ tLI,INOIS 6Q602-3102 {372) 7R1-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Lebislative Counsel Invoice # 2812086 Page 7

Total amount of this bill

Amount

$9,215.00

Attorney Summary
Name 

Hours Rate AmountSAK Stephen A. Kolodziej - Partner 29.20 300.OQ $8,760.OQ

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

fN ORDER TO ENSURETNAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE RETCIRNTHE REMITTANCE PACE W1TH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 31 of 113 PageID #:1538



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, M~NROE &SCOTT, LTD. a~r'I'ORNEVS A"r Lnw
33 NORTH DEARB(~RN STRF.E'i' SUITE 300 CHICAGO, II.I.INOlS 60h02-31 2 (31?) 7R1-197{1

NRA-[LA Office of Legislative Counsel [nvoice # 2g 12086 Pale 8

REMITTANCE COPY

January 23, 2009

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel
1 1250 Waples Mill Road
Fairfax VA 22U3U
Christopher Conte

In Re: Our File No.: PLTF.08CV3697
National Rit7e Association of America v. The City of Chicago, et al.
Court No. d8 CV 3697

Total fees for this invoice: $8,760.Q0
Total costs for this invoice: $455.U0

Total amount: $9,2 i 5.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: HRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE
RETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 3b-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 32 of 113 PageID #:1539



INVOICE

BRENNER, FQRD, MONRUE &SCOTT, L7'D. ATTORNEYS AT I,AW
33 NORTH DEARBORN STRFC:I~ SUITE 30U CIiIC'AGO, II,l.INOlS 60602-.1 102 (.312) 1X I-1970

February 17, 2Q09 
Invoice No. 2902049

NRA-1LA Office of Legislative Counsel
1 1250 Waples Mifl Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Christopher Conte

RE: Our Filc No.: PLTF.08CV3697
National Ritle Association oFAmerica v. The City of Chicabo, et al.
Court No. OH CV 3697

For professional services n;ndered through January 3I, 2009

Hrs/Rate ount

SAK Preparation of Motion for Voluntary Dismissal of Appeal No. 0.40 1 20.400$-4239
300. /hr

SAK Em ~ orrespondence to City appellate counsel S. Loose 0.30 90.00regarding, urt order on duplicate appeals and Motion for 300.00/hrVoluntary Dis issal (ce: S. Halbrook and C. Conte)

SAK Tclephonc conference ~th City counsel [,Dose regardin T otion 0.20 60.00for Voluntary Dismissal, st s oFappeal and 300.UO/hrconsolidation briefing order en ed on I/S/09

SAK Review of on-line court f le regarding er of 030 90.00consolidation briefing order by court, d an similar orders 300.00/hrentered in McDonald v. City of Ch' ago

SAK Receipt and review of court rder consolidating Chica~ and Oak 0.10 30.UdPark cases and setting b ' find; schedule 300,OQ/hr

SAK Email correspon nee to S. Halbrook, C. Conte, S. Misiora and p.20 60.00W. Howard 300.00/hr

SAK Recei and review of multiple email correspondence from C. .20 66.00C to
300. /hr

S Receipt and review of multiple email correspondence fiom W. 020 60.00Howard 300.00/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 33 of 113 PageID #:1540



INVOICE

BRENIYER, FORD, MONROE &c SCOTT, LTD. A"CTORNEYS A"I' LAW
33 NOR'~EI DEARDORN SCREF,T SUfI'f: X00 CHICAGO, ILl.iN015 GOG02-31U2 (112} 7R1-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice /# 2902049 Pace 2

Hrs/Ra Amount

/6/ 9 LCK Filc Notice of Agreed Motion for Voluntary Dismissal of Appcal 0.30 45.00
No. 08-4239 f Sd.00/hr

1/t 3/2009 SAK eceipt and review of City of Chicago's motion to consolidate 0.50 1 50.00app !s 300.00/hr

SAK Multiple e it correspondence to and from C. Conte, S. albrook, 0.50 ! SO.aO
and W. Howar ~ 30d.00/hr

SAK Telephone conterence 'th S. Halbrook, C. Con , S. Misiora, W. 0.80 240.00
Howard, and D. Dooley 300.00/hr

I/16/20(?9 SAK Multiple telephone conferences with orneys W. 1-toward and D. 1.2Q 360.OU
Dooley 30U.OQ/hr

SAK Review of motion to recon der consolidation an reparation of 130 390.00
additions! arguments for ame 30U.00/hr

SAK Review ofcase {aw ited in consolidation order and additio 1 2.20 660.00
applicable court Ics and case law regarding grounds for 300.00/hr
consoEidation d arguments for denial of same

SAK Multiple ail correspondence to and from attorneys Howard and O.SO 150.00
Dooley 3 O~/hr

1/l9/2049 SAK ltiple email correspondence to and from C. Conte, S. Halbrook, 0.80 244.00
. Howard and D. Dooley 300.00/hr

AK Telephone conference with attorneys Howard and Dooley 0.60 180.0
300.00/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 34 of 113 PageID #:1541



INVOICE

BREIVNER, FOF2D, MUNROE & SCOT'C, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTFI DEARBORN STREET SU17'F. 300 CHICAGO, I~LINp15 (,0102-3102 (312) 7HI-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Lebislative Counsel Invoice f~ 2902049 Pate 3

Hrs/Rate Afnount

l/l9/20 SAK Review of Seventh Circuit court file regarding status of first 0.50 150.00
McDonald appeal filed 12/5/08 300 /hr

SAK 'mail correspondence to attorney Howard 0.20 60.00
300.00/iu

1/20/2009 SAK Telephone onference with W. Howard 0.50 150.00
3 00.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review multiple email corresponde e from S. O.bO 1$0.00
}-lalbrook, C. Conte, W. oward and U. Doole 300.00/hr

1/22/2009 SAK Receipt and review of draft argum t • d summary portions of 1.60 480.00
brief 300.00/hr

SAK Multiple email corresponden~ ith VV. Ho ard, S. Holbrook, and 0.60 180.00
C. Conte 300.00/hr

SAK Review oFcourt file currents 2.30 690.00
30d.OQ/hr

SAK Review of dditional applicable case law regarding jurisdictiona 1.60 480.00
stateme and amicus curiae issues 300.OQ/hr

1/23/2069 SAK C trf inued review and assembly of file documents regarding 2.70 810.00
reparation of statement of facts and jurisdictional statement 3d 0/hr

regarding Chicago case for inclusion in 7th Circuit brief, and
preparation of appendix

SAK Receipt and review of email correspondence from S. Holbrook 0.20 .d0
30U.00/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 35 of 113 PageID #:1542



INVOfCE

BRENNER, FORD, MniVROE &SCO'T'T, l,7'D. A'1'TORNEY5 AT LAW
33 NORl~11 l~[:ARBORN STREET SUITE 3110 CIi1CAG0, ILl.INO[S (~0f~02-3102 X31Z} 7kl-1970

NRA-1LA QFfice of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 2902049 Pabe 4

Hrs/Rate /Amount

1/23/20 SAK Receipt and review ofemait correspondence from ~ttomey 0 30.00
Howard .00/hr

SAK Telephone conference with attorney Howard . U,30 90.U0
300.00/hr

1/27/2009 SAK Revie nd analysis of revised appellants' brief and form ling of 2.80 840.OU
same 3 DO.oamr

SAK Multiple telepho conferences with attomevs w oward and D. 0.60 180.00
Dooley 30U.00/hr

SAK Review of Circuit Court es regarding ing and scrvicc 0.50 150.00
requirements for brief 300.~0/hr

SAK Multiple telephone conferences ► Chicago counsel S. Loose 0.50 150.00
regarding amicus briefs and f ng of a eilants' brief 300.00/hr

SAK Multiple email correspo deuce to and from a orney Loose U.30 90.00
confirming number o and consent to amicus b s 300.OU/hr

SAK Multiple etnail rrespondence to S. Halbrooic. f .Con ,and W. 0.4d 120.00
Noward : ~ - 300.00/hr

1/28/2003 SAK Tele one conference with attorney D. Dooley 0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of our filed brief and appendix 0 E 50.00
300.4 r

AK Emai! correspondence to Chicago counsel S. Loose attaching 0.20 60.OQ
copies o£ fi ted brief and appendix 300.00/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 36 of 113 PageID #:1543



iNVOic~

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ~ A~'"fORNEYS AT LAW

33 NORTH E~FARBnRN S'i~REF;f SUITE 300 C►iiCnCO, ~Li.IN015 r~O~,OZ-3ioz (1fZ) 7RI-197

NRA-1LA Ot~ce of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 2902Q49 Page 5

firs/Rate ount

1/28/2009 K Receipt and review of email correspondence from attorney S. (}.10 30.00
Halbrook 300. r

SAK Ema~ correspondence to McDonald counsel A. Gura attaching 0.20 60.00
filed c ies of brief and appendix (cc: S. i-lalbrook, C. Conte, W. 300.00/hr
Howard, . Dooiey)

SAK Multiple repca d attempts to serve brief and appendix email 0.30 90.00
on attorney A. G {attempts failed due to recipient ai] folder 300.00/hr
Fiill)

1/29/2009 SAK Receipt and review of no ' e of dismissal a issuance of ma~idate 0.20 60.00
from 7th Circuit clerk 300.00lhr

SAK Receipt and review of email come. ndence from S. Halbrook and 0_ZO 60.00
C. Conte 300.00/hr

SAK Telephone call to clerk of Circuit rega ing dismissal order 0.20 60.00
and motion to recall ma ate 300.00/lzr

SAK Review of file mat 'als regarding chronology of a eal, payment 0.4d 120.00
of docketing fee and prior orders for preparation of otion to 300.00fhr
recall mandat

SAK Review Federal and Circuit Court rules regarding no fee 0.40 120.00
filing amended notice of appeal 300.OQ/hr

SAK reparation of motion to recall mandate 1.40 420.04
oa.oan~

S K Multiple email corre~nondence with C. Conte and S. Halbrook 0.30 90.00
' 30d,00/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 37 of 113 PageID #:1544



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. A'f TORNEYS AT LAW
33 NUK~hf DFARBORN STRFF.T SUITE 300 CFltCAGO, lLl_1NOIS 60602-3102 (312) 7Ri-1970

NRA-lt_A Office of Lc~islative Counsel Invoice # 2902049 Page 6

Hrs/Ratc Amaufit

1/2 009 SAK Additional attempts to serve briet'and appendix an McDonald 0.20 60.OU'
counsel A. Gura by email (delsvery failec! due to recipient mai! 300.00
folder full)

SA Receipt and review of McDonald's brief and appendix 2.00 600.Oa
300.00/hr

(/30/2009 SAK Receip nd review of email correspondence from McDo d 0.10 30.00
counsel A. ura regarding service of briefs 300.0~/hr

SAK Receipt and revie of multiple email corresp deuce from S. 0.20 60.00
Halbrook, C. Conte a W. Howard 300.QO/hr

SAK Email correspondence to A. G egardinb multiple efforts to 020 60.00
serve brief on him by emai cc: S. brook, C. Conte, W. 300.00/hr
Howard)

SAK Telephone confe nee with attorney D. Qoaley 0.20 b0.0U
300.00/hr

SAK Telep ne conference with Chicago counsel S. Loose ~onfi ~ng 020 60.Q0
no jection from Chicago to our motion to recall mandate 300.00/hr

SA Iteceip[ and review of email correspondence from attorneys Gura Q.20 60.00
and Loose regarding amicus briefs consent 30 0/hr

For prafessiona!services rendered 34.b0 $10, .00

Attorney Summary
Name ~ Hours Rate Amount
SAK Stephen A.Kolodziej - Partner 34.50 300.00 $10,350.00
LCK Law Clerk 0.30 150.00 X45.00

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 38 of 113 PageID #:1545



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, L"rD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTFI DF..ARk30RN S'fRFl~l SUi"PE )00 CFiICAGQ I[_LINOIS b0642-310? (312) 7A1-1970

NR.A-ILA Office of Lcgislativc Counsel Invoice # 2902049 Page 7

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROAERLY CREDITED, NI~EASE RETURNTHE REM1T7'ANCE PAGE WITN YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX [.D. NUMBER: 3b-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 39 of 113 PageID #:1546



INVOICE

BRENIYER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARBORN SfREf T SUfTf: 300 CHICAGO, II.,I_INOIS 60602-310? (3I2) 7A1-1970

NRA-ILA Office of L.e~;islative Counsel Invoice # 2902049

REMiTTA1YCE COPY

17, 2009

NRA-ILA O~ e of Legislative Counsel
l 1250 Waples Mi oad
Fairfax VA 22030
Christopher Conte

In Re: Our File No.: PLT~.08CV36!
National Rifle Association of
Court No. 08 CV 3697

Total fees for this invoi
Total casts for this it Dice:

Total amount:

v. The City of Chicago, et al.

$10,395.00 \
X0.00

0,395.OQ

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT [S PROPERLY CREDCTED, PLEASE
RETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBE[t: 36-3102088

Page 8
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INVOICE

BRENNER, FQRD, MONROE & SCO"1'T, L"TD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW

33 NORTH DEARBORN STREGT 5111"TF 3U0 (`Il1CAG0, ILf_iNCl1S h0(i02-3102 (312} 7K1-1470

March l3, 2009 Invoice No. 290302U

NRA-[LA Office of Legislative Counsel
(1250 Waples Mill Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Christopher Conte

RE: Our file No.: PLTF.08CV3b97
National Rifle Association of America v. The City of Chicago, et al.
Court No. 08 CV 3697

For professional services rendered through February 28, 2009

Hrs/Rate / Amount

K Receipt and review of draft brief from amicus curiae State .80 240.00
Legislators ' UU.UU/hr

SAK Re w of Court of Appeals web site retarding entry of order o 0.30 90.OQ
our mo ' n to recall mandate 30Q.00/tir

SAK Cmail correspo once to attorneys Halbrook. Conte, ward and 0.20 60.00
Dooley 300.00/hr
procedure

SAK Telephone call to Court of Ap is clerk egarding notice of 0.20 l~0.00
payment of docketin6 fee 300.00/hr

SAK Rcvicw of local rules of Court o Appeals a District Court 0.50 I SO.OQ
regardinb payment of docket' g fee 300.00/hr

SAK Appeared in Distract urt clerk's office to pay docketi fee for t .00 300.00
Appea108-4241 300.0~lhr

SAK Appeared in ourt of Appeals clerk's office for providing 0.80 240.00
notifcati of payment of docketing fee per order of 2/2/08 300.00/hr

SAK Pre aced notice of payment of docketing fee for fiiin~; in Court of 0 60.40
peals 300.0 r

LC File Notsce of Receipt for Payment on Docketing Fee 0.30 ~ 45.00
SO.OQ/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 41 of 113 PageID #:1548



INVOICE

SRENNER, FORD, MONROE 8c SCOTT, LTD. A"TTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DCARDORN S'I'RL;L'T SUITE 300 CHICnGU, ILLINOIS c>o6o2-:~t02 (312) ~x1-1970

NRA-tLA Office of Lebislative Counsel ln~oice # 2903020 Pate 2

hlrslRate mount

2l3 9 SAK Receipt and review ufemail correspondence from attorney C. U.~ 60.00
Conte .00/hr

2/4/2009 SAK eceipt and review of Bnef of Amici CWriae Constitutional I,aw 1.00 3~0.0~
Pro sors 300.00/hr

2/5/2009 SAK Receipt an view of email correspondence from Dav Opel 0.20 60.00
300AO/hr

SAK Receipt and review of b of ILEETA amic- uriae I.00 30b.00
300.Q0/hr

SAK Receipt and review of ILEETA mo 'o for leave to file amicus 0.20 60.00
brief 30Q.00lhr

Z/6I2UU9 SAK Receipt and review of a us curiae brief of In 'cute for Justice 1.00 300.00
300.Q0/hr

SAK Receipt and rev' w of amicus curiae brief of State Legisla rs 1.UU 300.00
300.00/hr

Z/11/2009 SAK Recei and review of three orders of Court of Appeals regarding 0.30 90.00
fill ofamicus briefs 300.04/hr

SAK Email correspondence to S. Halbroolc, C. Conte, W. Howard, and 20 60.00
amici 300. hr

2/I 8/200 SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from Institute for Justice to 0.20 60.00
court enclosing corporate disclosure statement 300.00/hr

For professional secviccs rendered 9.60 $2,83.00

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 42 of 113 PageID #:1549



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOT"f, I,TD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARBORN STRi:ET SUITE 34~ CHICAGO, ILL.fNOIS GOfi02-3lU2 (Z12) 7$1-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 290302(}

AdditionaK~har~;es

2/2/2009 US District Court -

Total costs

Total amount of this bill

SAK St en A. Kolodziej - Partner
LC w Clerk

Fee

Attorney Summary

Page 3

Amount

455.00

$455.00

X3,290,00

Hours Rate Amount
9.30 3U $2,790A0
0.30 150.00 $45.00

PLEASE REM1T TO; BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT tS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE RETURN
THE REMITTANCE PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX i.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 43 of 113 PageID #:1550



~NVaicE

BRENNER, FORD, MONRC3E 8i SCOTT, I,TD. A"Trf ORNEYS A"I' LAW
33 NORTH f3EARBORN STREET SUITG 30D C'filCAGO, ILL1N0l560602-31Q2 (312) 7R1-197p

NRA-ILA Office of Lcgislativ~ Counsel Invoice # 290302Q page ~

REMITTANCE COPY

l3, 2009

NRA-ILA +ce of Legislative Counsel
1250 Waples Road

Fairfax VA 22030
Christopher Contc

[n Re: Our File No.: PLTF.08CV36
National Rifle Association of Ame ' v. The City of Chicago, et al.
Court No. U8 CV 3697

Total fees for this invoi
Total costs for this invr

Total amount: %

~2,835.OU
$455.00

$3,290.OQ

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

iN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE
RETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX f.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 44 of 113 PageID #:1551



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, I,TD. ATT'ORIVEYS AT LAW
33 NOR'T'H DF:ARBQRN STREL'f SUI'ff :~00 CF!lCAGq, ILLJNOIS 60002-3102 (312} 7$I-1970

April 15, 2009 Invoice No. 2404027

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counse4
1250 Wapfcs Mill Road

Fairfax VA 22030
Christopher Conte

RE: Our File No.: PLTF.08CV3697
National Ritle Association of America v. The City of Chicago, et al.
Court No. Oti CV 3697

F'or professional services rendered through March 31, 2009

Hrs/~ Amount

3/1 i/2009 K Telephone conference with Brett Benson ~ 0.30 90.00
300.00/hr

3/12/2009 SAK Rece~ and review ofe-mai! correspondence fro►n Otto C. 03Q 90.OU
Conte 30U.00/hr

5AK Email correspondence C. Conte, W. N and and U. Dooley 0. i0 30.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of fallow- mails from attorneys Howard 0.20 60.00
and Conte 300.00mr

3/25/2Q09 SAK Receipt and review ourt of Appeals orb r grantinb defendants' 0.20 b0.00
motion for extens' nand setting new briefin~ kieduJe 300.04/hr

SAK Receipt an review of Indiana Legislators' motion to ~ in and 0.2Q 60.OU
adopt a icus curiae brief 300.00/hr

3/30/2009 SAK ceipt and review of draft petition for hearing en bane 0.40 t 2Q.00
300.00/hr

AK Receipt and review of correspondence from attorneys D. Dooley, 0.30 90.00
W. Howard, and S. Halbrook 9,0.00/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 45 of 113 PageID #:1552



IfVVOICE

SRENLYER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, L'I'D. ATTORNEYS AT LAW

33 NORTF~ DEARBORN STREET SUIT£ 300 CHlCr1G0, ILLINOIS 1~06d2-3102 (312) 7K1-f9~0

NRA-ILA Office of~Legislative Counsel Invoice # 2904027

K Correspondence to atEorneys Halbro~onte, Dooley :end

For professional

Attorney

SAK Stephen A. Kolociziej - Partner

Page 2

HrslRate Amount

0.10 30.00
3U0.00/hr

2.l0 $630.00

Rate Amount
X00.00 $630.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONRO~ &SCOTT, LTD.

IN TRUER TO ENSURE "CHAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE RETURN

THE REMITTANCE PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 36-3102Q88

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 46 of 113 PageID #:1553



INVOICE

BRENNER, HQRU, MONROE &SCOTT, L'TD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARBORN STREET ~ SUI'fC_:t00 CIIICAGO, ILLINOIS 60b02-3f02 • ~~iz) ~xt-i9~o

NRA-ILA Office of Legisl;stive Cou~lsel Invoice # 2904027

REMiTTAIYCE COPY

April I5, 2Q09

RA-fLA Office of Legislative Counsel
l I Waples Mill Road
Fairfax 22030
Christopher me

In Re: Our File No.: F.08CV3697
National Rifle Asso ' tion of A
Court l~lo. 0$ CV 3697

Total fees for this in
Total costs for thi

Total amou

v. The City of Chicago, et al.

$b3'0,~
X0.00

$63Q.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

IN ORDER TO ENSURE ?HAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE
RETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY WLTH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088

Page 3
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INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONR4E &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS A7' LAW
33 NORTH DEARHORN S1~REE"f SUITE 100 CFIfCAr(), 1LLINUIS b0602-3f02 (31?) 7R1-1970

May 2U, 2009 invoice No. 291)5048

NRA-1LA Office of Legislative Counscl
1 i 25Q Waples Mill Road
Fairfax VA 2203U
Christopher Conte

RE: Our File No.: PLTF.08CV3697
National Rifle Association of America v. The City of Chicago, et al.
Court No. 08 CV 3697

For professional services rendered through April 30, 2009

4/1/2009 K Receipt and review of Rule 26.1 disclosure of amici Indiana ate
Representatives

4/6/2009 SAK Receip d review of Chicabo's motion for leav o file oversize
brief

SAK Receipt and review o orrespondenc rom S. Halbrook and W.
Howard

SAK Correspondence to S. F!a[b ok, t-Toward, and C. Conte

4/8/2009 SAK Receipt and revi of multiple corresponde from S. Halbrook,
C. Conte, W. oward and D. Dooley

4/i

SAK C espondcnce to S. Ha[brook, C. Conte, W. Howard and ~
ooley

S Receipt and review of revised petition for en bane hearing

SAK Receipt and review of multiple correspondence from attorney
Halbrook

rs/Rate Amount

0.10 30.00
300.00/hr

0.20 60.()0
300.00/hr

020 60.00
300.00/hr

0.10 3.00
300.00/hr

0.50 15Q.()0
300.00/hr

0.20 60.00
300.00/fir

030 90.OQ
.00/hr

0.30 90.00
3d0.00/fv

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 48 of 113 PageID #:1555



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MOIYROE Sc SCOTT, GTD. A"fT4RNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTf~ DGARBORN STREET SUI'1'F 300 CHI(:AGU, ILLINOIS l~D6Q2-J lU2 (312) 7R1-1970

NRA-II.A Office of Legislative Counsel (nvoicc 7# 290504$ ?age 2

Hrs/Rate Amount

4/10 09 SAK Receipt and review of multiple correspondence From attorney 0.20 b .OQ
Conte 300.00/hr

SAK Rec ~ t and review of multiple correspondence from attorneys Q 60.00
Howar d Dooley ~ O.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review additional revisions to petition for initia 0.20 60.OU
hearing en bane 300.00/hr

SAK Correspondence to attorneys ~bro~k Conte, Doole and Q.1 D 30.0()
Howard 30Q.00/hr

SAK Telephone call to clerk of Court of Appe s barding web site 0.20 fi0.0()
posting of coup filinbs 300.00/hr

SAK Follow-up correspondence to a omeys Halbrook, Co e, Dooley 0.20 60.QU
and Howard ~ 300.00/hr

4/14/2009 SAK Correspondence to atto ey D. Dooley 0,10 30.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and r iew of correspondence from attorney Dooley ~ ,, 0. I 0 30.00
3d0.00/hr

SAK Revi - ~ prior disclosures and prepare new Rule 26,1 disclosure for 0.20` .. 60.Od
p ion for en bane hearing 300.00/hr

SA Receipt and review of revised draft of en bane petition 0.34 9.00
regarding final formatting and revisions 300.U0/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 49 of 113 PageID #:1556



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, ;YtONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTf I DFARl30RN STREF.'f SUl"t'F 300 CHICAGO, ILL.INQIS 60603-31(?2 (31Z) 7Y1-1970

NRA-ILA office of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 2905048

Hrs/Rate

4/14! 09 SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from Jeff Mappa 0.2
30.0/hr

SAK Correspondence to S. Halbrook and C. Conte 0.20
300.00/hr

SAK Receip d review of correspondence from W. Howard ~ 0.1 Q
300.00/hr

SAK Follow-up comes Bence to S. Halbrook and .Conte 0.20
300.00/hr

4/l 7/2009 SAK Telephone conference with tomey .Dooley (?.24
300.00/hr

SAK Meeting with D. Dooley to gn petite 0.20
~oo.00mr

SAK Receipt and revie of final version of petition en Banc hearing 0.20
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt d review of correspondence from City of Chicag U. ! 0
coup regarding amicus briefs 300.00/hr

SAK orrespondence to S. Halbrook and C. Conte 0.10
00.00/hr

AK Receipt and review of defendants' brief to court of appeals i.7
300.00/hr

4/2 2009 SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from attorney Halbrook 0.20
300.00/hr

Page 3

60.00

60.OU

30.00

60.00

60.Q0

60.00

60.40

30.Q0

30.00

510.00
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INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, L'rD. A7'7'QRiYEYS A"f I,AW

33 NOR~'I I DCAR[3C)RN STREET SUffF. 3O0 CHICAGO, ILLINOIS GU602-J 142 (312) 783-1970

NRA-ILA Office of i.egislative Counsel Invoice # 2905048 Page 4

!{rs/Rate . Amount

4120/20 SAK Receipt and review of correspottden~e from attorney Conte .20 60.00
300.00/P►r

SAK R ipt and review of correspondence from attorney Howard 0,20 60.OQ
300.00/hr

SAK Correspondent o attorneys Hafbrook and Cont O.1Q 30.00
300.00/hr

SAK Correspondence to attorn Howard a Dooley 0.10 30.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of cone ondence m attorney Dooley 0.10 30.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review correspondence from attor Fortescue 6.10 30.00
300.00/hr

SAK 12eccipt aizd eview of correspondence from attorney Gura Q. I 0 30.00
consenti to defendants' amicus briefs 300.00/hr

SAK Rec pt and review of cocresp~ndence from attorney Howard 0.10 30_QO
OO.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from attorneys Halbrook 0. 60.00
and Conte 3Q0.00/h

SAK Correspondence to attorneys Halbrook and Conte 0.10 .00
300.00/hr
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INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONRQE & SCOT'T, L'TD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NOR'T1i D[ARf30RN STREET SUITE 30Q CHICAGO, II.I..tNOIS 6~G02-~ t02 (312) 781-1970

NRA-ILA Office of legislative Counsel Invoice # 29Qjp4$ Page 5

Hrs/Rate mount

4/20/2009 K Review correspondence history regarding prior discussions with 0.2 60.00
Chicago's counsel as to identity of amici 30.4/hr

4/22/2009 SAK Re t and review of multiple correspondence from S. Halbrook, 0.50 I X0.00
C. Con W. Howard, and D. Dooley 300.00/hr

SAK Telephone call to Chic To's counsel regarding motio For Q.20 60.00extension of time to filer ly brief 300.Q0/hr

SAK Correspondence to S. Hafbrook, .Conte, .Howard and D. 0.10 30.00
Dooley 30Q.00/hr

4/24/2009 SAK Receipt and review of notice fr court of • eals setting oral 0.20 60.00
argument 30Q.00/hr

SAK Correspondence to C. nte, S. Halbrook, D. Doole W. Howard 0.20 GO.00
300.OQ/hr

SAK Receipt and rev' w of conesp~ndence from C. Conte and S. 0.20 60.00
Halbrook 300.00mr

SAK Receipt nd review of correspondence from D. Dooley 6,10 30.00
OO.QQ/hr

SAK [ephone conference with D. Dooley 0. b0.00
300.00

S Receipt, review and signature of t`inal form of motion for 0.30 90.00
extension to file reply brief 3QD.OU/hr
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INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE & SCO'TT, LTD. A'T'TORNEYS A'T LAW
31 NORT}I DEARL~ORN S7'RF,ET SUl"fE:~6d CIiIC~GO, ILI.INOIS6U(~02-3102 X313}7R1-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Le6islative Counsel Invoice t~ 29Q5048 Page b

Hrs/Rate Amount

4/27/2009 SA Receipt and review of memorandum opinion denyi~~g City of 0.~ 60.00
vanston's motion to dismiss, forwarded by attorney Howard 3 .d0/hr

SAK Recei nd review of multiple correspondence from C. Conte, S. 0.60 18Q.00
Halhrook, .Howard and D. Dooley 300.OU/hr

SAK Receipt and review o rief of amici curiae Historians nd Legal I.24 36~.U0
Scholars in support of a ance 300.OQ/hr

SAK Correspondence to S. Halbrook d C. Cont 0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of amici curiae rief o U.S. Conference of 1.3U 39Q.00
Mayors in support of affirmance 300.00/hr

SAK Telephone call to court of peals clerk regarding s us of en 0,20 60.00
bane petition and oral a ument notice 300.00/hr

4/28/20Q9 SAK Receipt and revie of amicus brief of Chicago Board of Ed anon 1.20 360.00
300.00/hr

4/29/2009 SAK Receipt a review of court of appeals order granting our motion 0.1 a 30.00
for ext Sion to file reply brief 300.00(hr

SAK rrespondence to S. Halbrook, C. Conte, W. Howard .10 30.00
300. /hr

S K Receipt and review of amicus brief of Illinois Municipal League, l .40 420.00
et al. 300.00/hr

4/30 009 5AK Receipt and review of multiple correspondence from W. Howard 0.30 90.
and S. Iialbrook 300.OQ/hr
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INV~fCE

BRENNER, FORD, MUNRUE & SCO"!'"T, L"TD. A'TT'ORNEYS AT LAW
33 NUk'fH DEARBORN STRFF,T SUITE 300 C}IICAGO, ILI.It~QIS 6ObU2-310? (312) 7R1-1970

NRA-ILA Offce of Legislative Counsel Invoice f# 2905048

4/30/2009 SAK Receipt and revie f Chicago's
leave to file corrected b

For professional sery

SAK hen A. Kolodziej - Partner

brief and motion for

Attorney Summary
Hours
E 8.00

Page 7

Hrs/Rate Amount

U.60 I ~U.00
300.00/hr

18.Q0 X5,400.00

ate Amount
300. X5,400.00

PLEASE FZEMIT TO: BRENNER. FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, E.TD.

IN ORDER TO ENSUCtE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT [S PROPCRLY CREDITED, PLCASC RETURN
THE REMITTANCE PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FlRlvi TAX I.D. NIJMBER: 36-3102088
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INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, ~~IONROE Sc SCU'CT, LTD. A`T'TORNEYS A1' [1AW
33 NOR I~H DEARBORN S'~R~E'f SIJITF, 3()0 - C'tf1CAG0, fLLINniS 60002-3t02 {312) 7n1-197Q

NRA-ILA Office of Lcbisfative Caunsei Invoice # 2905048 Pate 8

REMITTANCE COPY

May 20, 2009

RA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel
1 I2 Wapies Mill Road
Fairfax 22Q30
Christopher to

in Re: Our File No.: P .08CV3697
1~lational Rifle Assoc ion of Ai
Court No. 08 CV 3697

Total fees for this inv e:
Tota! costs for th' invoice:

"total amo

The City of Chicago, et al.

$5,400.019
$0.00

$5,4{?0.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER. FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE
RETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX f.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088
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WVOfCE

BREIYNER, FORD, MONRO~ &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARRQRN STREET surre .ion ('FIICAGO, !I_I.INOIS bU602-3102 (3f2) 781-147D

June 24, 2009 [nvoice No. 29060!$

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel
11250 Waples Mill Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Mary Rose Adkins, Director of Finance

RE: Our File No.: PLTF.ORCV3697
National Rifle Association of America v. The City of Chicago, et al.
Court No. 03 CV 3697

~'or professional services rendered through 05/31 /209 /

Hrs/ to Amount

5/5120 SAK Receipt and review of draft reply brief I.20 364.U0
30Q.00/hr

SAK orrespondence to S. t{albrook 0.20 60.00
300.Od/hr

5!7/2009 SAK Receipt an view of Courl of Appeals order de ink; en bane 0.20 60.00
petition 300.OQ/hr

SAK Correspondence to S. H rook, C. Co e, W. Howard, D. Dooley Q. i 0 30.00
and S. Misiora 300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of multipl corrc ' ondence from S. Holbrook, 0.40 120.00
C. Conte, and W. Howard 300.00/hr

5/8/2009 SAK Receipt and revie of correspondence from S. Ha ook U.20 60.00
300.Q0/hr

SAK Review o court rules and comments regarding disposition o 0.30 90.00
petitio for en bane hearing 300.U(}/hr

SAK T ephone conference with W. Floward 0.30 90.00
3 .QO/hr

K Receipt and review of correspondence from S. Holbrook 0.10 30.00
30Q.00/hr
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INVOICE

BRENNEN, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, L"TD. AT7'~RNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARt30RN STRFF'f SUITE 300 CIiIC'AGO, I1_i.INOIS GOfid2•:il[72 ()12) 7R1-1970

NRA-fLA Office of Legislative Counsel invoice ~ 290b018

Hrs/Rate

5/8 09 SAK Telephone call to Court of Appeals clerk regarding oral argument 0
registration requirements for consolidated cases .00/hr

SA 'I'etephone conference with W. Howard 0,20
300.00/hr

5/1 1/2009 SAK Lett to Clerk of Court regarding oral argument (cc: all ounscl of 0.20
record) 300.00/hr

5/12/2009 SAK Receipt and r iew of correspondence from S. albrook 0.20
300.00/hr

SAK Correspondence to S. albrook d.10
300.00/hr

5/13/2009 SAK Review and analysis of Ilet lock opinion forwarded by 2.30
atcomey Conte 300.U0/hr

5/14/2009 SAK Correspondence to nd from attorney oley 0.20
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt, f a! review, and sibmature of reply bri O.SO
300.00/h r

5/18/2009 SAK 'I' ephone call from Chicago's counsel regarding oral arg ent 0.20
300.00/hr

S Telephone call to W. Howard O.l Q
300.00~r

5/20/2 9 SAK Receipt and review of letter from defense counsel to clerk of court 0.
of appeals regarding Nordyke en bane vote 300.OQ

Page 2

G().QQ

G0.00

60.00

60.00

30.00

C90.OQ

b0.00

1X0.00

b0.t10

30.00

60.00
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INVOICE

BRENNER, FORll, MOIYRQE 8c SCO"fT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NOR"1'H QEARBURN STREET SUI"1'E 1U0 ('HIC.'AGQ, ILLINnlS hU602-310? (Z12) 7R1-197Q

NRA-fLA Offiee of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 2906018 Page 3

Hrs/Race Amount

5124/2 SAK Correspondence to S. Halbrook, C. Conte, W. Howard and D. O.IU .QO
Dooley 300.Q0/hr

SAK egin comprchcnsive review of briefs and cited case Eaw 5.4 1,620.Q0
to prepare for ora! 3 .00/~►r

argum t

5/21/2009 SAK Continued co rehensive review of parties' and amici briefs a 7.50 2,250.OU
cited case law an authorities, 3U0.00/hr

to prep for oral argument

5/22/2009 SAK Continued review of cited S. Supreme Court a Court of 6.80 2,040.00
Appeals case law and cited au rities from parties' briefs; 300.O~/hr

to prepare for oral
argument

x/24/2049 SAK Continued review of Supreme urt and Co, of Appeals case 5.30 I ,590.00
law and preparation of ques ~ ns and issues 300.00/hr

to prepare for 1 argument

5/25/2009 SAK Meeting . -with S. Halbrook, W. Howard D. 4.60 i ,380.00
Dooley 300.00/hr

5/26/2009 SAK Court a earance: attendance at oral argument before U.S. Court 3.00 900.00
of peals 300.00/hr

SAK Meeting with S. Halbrook and W. Howard following oral .50 450.00
argument 300. 0/hr

5/28/20 SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from S. Halbrook 0.20 60.00
300.00/hr
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INVOICE

BRENNER, FpRD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTfi DEARSORIV S"fREC~!" SU!'1'f: }00 (~111(~nGO, ILLINOIS fr0602-3JQ2 (31?) 7R1-1970

NRA-ILA ~ffce of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 290G~1$ Page 4

H ate Amount

5/28/2009 SAK eceipt and review of correspondence tom D. Dooley 0. i 0 30.{l0
300.00lhr

SAK Receipt and revs of correspondence fro . Nalbrook 0.20 60.OU
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of corn one from W. Howard 0.20 fi0.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and view of correspondence from C. Con 0.10 30.00
300.00/hr

For fessiona! services rendered 4 . $12,720.00

Attorney Summary

SAK Stephen A. Kolodziej - Partner
Hours Rate Amount
42.40 300.00 $ t 2,720.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE RETURNTHE REMITTANCE PACE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 36-3]02088
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INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. A"I'T~RNEYS AT LAW13 NnR'f'H UI:ARBUKN S~I~RL;EI' SU1"1~f? 3DU C'IIICnGp, IL.I.lNOIS 60h02-3102 (313) 7X1-1970

NRA-!LA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 29 6013 Page 5

REM1'I"TAiYCE COPY

June 24, 2009

~• -ILA Office of Legislative Counsel
1 1250 ales Mill Road
Fairfax VA 30
Mary Rose Adkin , irector of
Finance

!n Re: Our File No.: PLTF.O8CV 7
National Rifle Association of A 'ca v. The City of Chicago, et al.CouR No. 0$ CV 36~I7~

Total fees fo~r
Total costs tot

Total mount:

Kis invoice: ~ 1 2,720.00
this invoice: $0.00

12,72Q.00

PLEASE REMfT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.
IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASERETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUM$ER: 3 6-3 1 02088
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INVOICE

BRENNER, FQRD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTFl DEAI2BORN STRF,Ei'I' SUII'F. 30f7 C'HICA(iO.ILLINOIS 60(102-t fQ? (312) 781-1970

~~iy Za, zoos

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel
1 1250 Waples Mill Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Mary Rose Adkins, llirector of Finance

RE: Our File No.: PLTF.~8CV3697
Nationa} Rifle Association of Americ:~ v. The City of Chicabo, et al.
Court No. 08 CV 3697

For professional srrvices rendered

AK Receipt and review of judgment of Court of Appeals

[nvaice No. 2907048

Hrs/Rate Amou

0.50 SO.OD

SAK Re ~ t and review of multiple email correspondence from C. 0.30 90.00
Conte, .Howard, and S. Halbrook 300.00lhr

SAK Correspondence to Halbrook, C. Conte, W. Howard a D. 0.10 30.00
Dooley 300.00/hr

6/4/2009 SAK Receipt and review of multiple rresponden from S. Haibrook, 0.3U 90.00
C. Conte, and W. Howard 300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of multiple co spon ce from Chicago 0.20 60.00
counsel S. Loose regarding peti 'on for cenio i 3Q0.00/hr

SAK Correspondence to C. C e and S. Halbrook 0.1 U 30.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and r ew of correspondence from C. Conte with filed 0.l0 30.00
versions o etition for ceritorari and appendix 00.00/hr

SAK Co spondence to Chicago counsel S. Loose forwarding petition 0.1 30.Q0
r certiorari and appendix 300.Od/hr

6/9/2009 S Receipt and review of correspondence from S. Halbrook and D. Q.20 .00
Lehman 3Q0.00/h r
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INVOICE

BREIYNER, FORD, iYIONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARBORN STRI;E"T Si11"I'G 340 CNICAGQ. {1_LINUISGUbQ2-3102 (1f?) SRI-197

NRA-!LA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice t~ 2907048 Page 2

Hrs/Rate Anxbunt

6/9/20Q9 SAK Correspondence to S. Halbrook 0.1 U 30.00
300 /hr

6/10/20x9 SAK Receipt a review of correspondence from 5. Halbrook 0.20 60.Q0
300.00/hr

SAK Correspondence to S. Ha ook 0.10 3Q.00
300.00/h r

SAK Receipt and review of corresponden from . Halbrook 0. f 0 30.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of correspond ce from S. albrook D.20 60.00
300.00/hr

SAK Review and analysis of cDonald petition for writ of ce ~orari 1.20 360.00filed in U.S. Supreme ourt 300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and rev' w of copy of correspondence from S. Elalbrook 0. J 0 30.00to counsel fo hicago and Oak Park regarding letter to U.S. 300.00/hr
Supreme urt consenting to amicus briefs

SAK Rec ' t and review of correspondence from S. Halbrook with 0.2 b0.00
C cago's bill of costs to court of appeals 300.00/h

SA Telephone conference with counsel for Chicabo regarding consent 0.20 Q.00to amicus briefs in U.S. Supreme Court 300.00/hr

SAK Correspondence to S. Halbrook, C. Conte, W. Howard and D. 0.20 6Q.00Dooley 300.00/hr
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INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MOIYROE &SCOTT, L"TD. ATTQRNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTFI DEAR$ORN S'TRtF l' StJ]-fF 300 CHfCAC,O, lLLINf)15 60602-3102 •. (31?} 77i 1-1970

NRA-!LA Office of Lebislative Counsel Invoice # 2907048

6/I 1 /2009 SAK R~ipt and review of correspondence from C. Conte

SAK Receipt and re 'ew of correspondence from D. Dooley

SAK Correspondence to C. C to and D. Dooley

6/17/20Q9 SAIL Receipt and review of'corresponde~ e from S aibrook

SAK Correspondence to S. Halbrook

SAK Telephone conference wit hicago counsel S_ Loose red
City`s plans for filing m ion foc extension of time to respo
ceR. petition

SAK Ac~ditionat co spondence to S. I-Ialbrook

SAK Recei and review of correspondence from 5. Halbrook

SAK Correspondence to Chicago counsel Loose regarding
communicating City's plans for motion for extension to S.
Halbrook via email (cc: S. Halbrook)

SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from attorney Loose
regarding email to Halbroolc re motion for extension

Aage 3

Hrs/Rate

0 3d.0U
0.00/hr

0.10 30.00
300.00/hr

(?.10 30.00
300.00/hr

0.10 30.00
300.00/hr

0.10 30.00
300.00/hr

~jg 0.20 60.00
to 300.00/hr

0.10 30.00
0~.00/hr

0. 30.00
300.00 r

0. [ 0 30.00
300.00/hr

0. ! 0 3 0.00
300.00/hr
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INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORfYEYS A'I' I.AW
33 NUR"1'H I)EARI3URN S'fRE~T SUITE 100 - C'IiICAGO. 1LI.INOIS 6Qh02-3102 lZi2} 781-1970

NR~-ILA Office of~ Legislative Counsel Invoice {t 2907048 Page 4

Hrs/Rate i Amount

b/24/20U9 SA Receipt and review of notice of'change of address for IL .10 30.00unicipal Lea~us, et al. amici counsel Charles F. Smith QO.UO/tir

SAK Recei and review of correspondence from Chicago counsel S. 0. I 0 3U.QULoose re ding filing of motion for extension to respond to 300.00/hrpetition for c iorari

SA K Receipt and revie f Chicago counsel's letter to U .Supreme 0.2Q 60.OUCourt requesting exte ion to respond to petitio or certiorari 300.00lhr

SAK Receipt and review ofeorr ondence fro attorney Neil Fox 0.10 30.00
300.Ob/hr

SAK Receipt and review of notices all ounsel of record of intent to U.20 60.00fsle amicus brief from Alto ey Gene of Texas 300.00/hr

6/3U/2009 5AK Receipt and review o orrespondence from Holbrook _ 0. ! 0 30.Q0
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt an review of correspondence from S. 1-falbrook O.10 30.0
300.00/hr

SAK Co spondence to S. Holbrook ~ 0.1 D 30.Q0
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of additional correspondence from S. I O 30.00
Holbrook ~ 300. hr

AK Correspondence to Chicago counsel S. Loose regarding no 0.20 60.Q0
payment of costs pending ruling on cert. petition (cc: S. Holbrook) 3QO.OQ/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 64 of 113 PageID #:1571



INVOICE

BRENNER, F()RD, MUNRQE 8c SCOT'T, L'TD. A`1'TORNEYS A'C LAW
33 NQR~I'H UEARBURN ST'REFT SUITE 300 CHICAGa, ILLfN01S (0602-3102 (312) 7A1-1970

NR~-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 2907048

6/30/2009 SAK Receipt and review o e of i
mandate and Bill of Costs

For professional

Attorney Summary

Stephen A. Kolodziej - Partner

Page 5

Hrs/Rate Amount

of Appeals' 0.20 bO.U(1
300.00/hr

PLEASE REMIT ̀I'O: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

7. I 0 $2, ] 30.UQ

Hours Rate ~~
7. !.0 300.00 $2,1

1N ORDER TO ENSURE "I`HAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE RETURN
"THE REMITTANCE PAGE W1TH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX [.D. NUMBER; 36-3102088
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INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE & SC4TT, LTD. ATTORNEYS A`C LAW

33 NORTH DEARE3URN 5'T'R6E•T SIJi"I'k: 300 CFIICAC;O. Il,LlNOIS h060?-3102 (:~12) 7R1-1970

NRA-ILA Office of I_ebislative Counsel Invoice # 2907048 Pate 6

REMITTANCE COPY

Ju7~~4, 2009

NRA-ILA O e of Legislative Counsel
11250 Waples Mi Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Mary Rose Adkins, Direc r of
Finance

[n Re: Our File No.: PLTF.O8CV36
National Rifle Association A
Court No. OS CV 3647

Total fees for ~s invoice:
Totai cost or this invoice:

Tota mount:

v. Tl~e City of Chicago, et a1.

$2,130.00
$0.00

X2,130.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT !S PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE
RETURN ENCLQSED REMITTANCE COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX 1.D. NUMB6R: 3b-3102088
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INVOICE

BRENNER, E'ORD, N90NR()E & SCU7'T, L7'D. A'TTn~2NEYS A1' LAW
33 NnR'fH UEAR$ORN STREET 5U17'~ 300 CHICAGO, ILLINOIS fi0(,UZ-3102 (312) 7R1-197U

September i0, 2009 
Invoice No. ?90R124

NR.A-iLA Office of Legislative Counsel
] 1250 Wapies Mill Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Mary Rose Adkins, Director of Finance

RE: Our File No.: PLTF.08CV3697
National Rifle Association of America v. The City of Chicago, et al.
Court No. 08 CV 3697

For professional services rendered

Hrs/Rate Amount

7/31 /2009 SA eceipt and review of correspondence from attorn afbrook 0. i 0 30.00
300.00/hr

$/7/2009 SAK Receipt and review o 'cago Oaic Park's brief en opposition I.20 3b0.00to petition for writ of cert' 300.00/hr

8l14/20d9 SAK Receipt and re ' w of U.S. Supreme Court re rief 0.60 180.00
300.00/hr

F rofessional services rendered I . $570.00

Attorney Summary
1*fame Hours Rate AmountSAK Stephen A. Kolodziej - Partner 1.90 300.00 X570.00

PLEASE REM1T TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

M ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT 1S PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE RETURN
THE REMITTANCE PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

F[RM TAX [.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 67 of 113 PageID #:1574



INVQlCE

SRENNER, FORD, MONRDE &SCOTT, L`CD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTII DEARBORN S"~REGT SUITS 3U0 CIIIC'AGO, ILLINOIS 60602-3102 (3t2) 7R1-1970

NRA-1LA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice if 2908124

REMITTAtYCE COPY

September 10, 2Q09

RA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel
1 l2 aples Miil Road
Fairfax VA 30
Mary Rose Adk~ Director of
Finance

1n Re: Our File No.: PLTF.O$ 3 7
National Rife Associati merica v. The City of Chicago, et al.
Court No. 0$ CV 369

Total fees fort ' invoice:
Total costs f this invoice:

Tota! a unt:

$57Q.00
$0.00

$5 70.00

Pi,EASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

!N ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE
RETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX [.D. NUMBER: 3b-3102088

Pate 2

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 68 of 113 PageID #:1575



I(VVOICE

BRENIYER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NOR1'II DEARE30RN STREET SUl'CE X00 CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 6Qb02-310? ~ (3i2) 781-1970

July 1 S, 2010

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel
l [250 Waples Mill Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Mary Rose Adkins, Director of Finance

RE: Our File No.: PLTF.08CV3697
National Rifle Association of America v. The City of Chicago, et al.
Court No. 08 CV 3697

For professional services rendered

6/28/2010 SAK 'T~}e one call from attorney W. Howard

SAK Review of Supreme Cou 'on in McDonald v. Chicago

For professional se 'ces rendered

Attorney Summary

SAK~ephen A. Kolodziej - Partner

Invoice No. 2007Q43

Hrs/Rate Amount

0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

2.00 600.00
300.00/hr

2.20 $660.00

ours Rate
2.2Q 300.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

[N ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT 1S PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE RETURN
THE REMITTANCE PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX 1.D. NUMBER: 36-3102Q88

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 69 of 113 PageID #:1576



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DGAR130RN S"TR£ET SUITE 300 C1iICA(.~(), ILI_INUIS 60602-3102 (312) 781-197U

NRA-ILA Qffice of Leis{ative Counsel Invoice ti 2007043 Page 2

REMITTANCE COPY

J~iy ~s, Zo~a

-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel
1 l2 aples Mill Road
Fairfax 22030
Mary Rose A ins, Director of
Finance

In Re: Our File No.: PLTF.08~6y
National Rifle Association
Court No. 08 CV 3697

Totat fees for thi ~ voice:
Total costs f his invoice:

Tota[ a ount:

v. The City of Chicago, et al.

$660.60
$(~.0(}

$660.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT 1S PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE
RETURN ENCLOSED [tEMITTANCE COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

F[RM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 36-3102Q88

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 70 of 113 PageID #:1577



irvvoic~

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE & SC~T'T, L'tD. A'CTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEAR80RN STREET SUfTE 300 C'1il('AGQ, ILLIM1!OIS 66b0~-3102 X313) 7R1-1970

September 22, 2010

NRA-1LA Office of Legislative Counsel
! 1250 Waples Mill Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Mary Rose Adkins, Director of Finance

RE: Oat File No.: PLTF.QSCV3697
National Rifle Association of America v. The Cily of Chicago, et al.
Court iVo. U8 CV 3b97

For professional services rendered

7/16/2010 Receipt and review of signed engagement letter from attorney

SAK Receipt review of multiple correspondence from attorneys
Conte and Ha ook

7/1 9120 1 0 SAK Rcccipt and review n ]tiple correspondence from at neys
Conte and F~afbrook

SAK Telephone conference with attorney Doo y and Court of
Appeals Clerk

SAK Review of 7th Circuit co
regarding issuance of jfu
statement upon rem ffd

Invoice No. 2009073

s and Supreme Cou 1es
or mandate and filing o osition

SAK Telephone c ference with attorney Halbrook

Correspondence to attorney Halbrook

Hrs/Rate A ount

0.10 30.QU

030 90.00
300.00/hr

0.30 90.00
300.00/hr

0.30 9UAU
30D.OQ/hr

0.~0 I SO.OU
300.00/hr

0.30 90.00
300A0/hr

0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 71 of 113 PageID #:1578



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, M4NROE &SCOTT, LTD. A'1"I'ORNEYS A'T LAW
33 NORTH DEAR[30RN STREET SUITE 300 CrilCAGO, ILLINOIS hOb02-.3102 - (J►2) 781-t97a

NItA-ILA Ot~ice of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 2009073 Page 2

HrslRate Amount

7119/ 0 SAK Receipt ancE review of correspondence from attorney Halbrook 0.24 60,00
3UU.OQ

8/3/2010 SAK Re t and review of Court of Appeals Circuit Rule 54 Notice .20 60.b0
OQ.00/hr

SAK Receipt and revie f multiple correspondence from attorneys 0.50 150.00
Conte, Halbrook and and 300.00/hr

8/5/2010 SAK Receipt and review of multiple co spondence fro ttorneys Q.40 120.00Halbronk, Howard and Conte 300.00/hr

8/! 0/201 U SAK Receipt and review of correspondence m Mc nald's attorney, 0.10 30.UU
A. Gura, 3d0.00/}u~

SAK Multiple correspondence to a from attorneys Hal6rook, oward 0.30 90.00
and Conte ~ 300.OQ/hr

SAK Correspondence McDonald attorney A. Gura 0.10 30.00
0.00/hr

SAK Receipt nd review of additional correspondence from attorney U. f 30.00
Gur 300.00

SAK Additional correspondence to attorney S. Halbrook O.10 30.00
300.00/hr

8/11/ 0 SAK Correspondence to attorney Gura 0.10 30.0
300.00/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 72 of 113 PageID #:1579



INVOICE

SRENNER, FORD, MONRUE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARBORN STREET SUITE 300 CHICAGO, ll.LfNOIS 60602-3IO2 (312) 781-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 2009073 Page 3

Hrs/Rate ~Cmount

8/1 1/20 SAK Correspondence to attorneys Howard and Conte 0.1 30.00
30 . 0/hr

SAK Correspondence to attorney A. Gura 0.10 30.00
300.00/hr

8/ 16/2010 SAK Receip nd review of correspondence from attorney S. Ha rook 0.20 60.Od
300.00/hr

SAK MulitpJe correspon ce to and ftorn attorne Conte, Halbrook 0.30 90.OQ
and Doolcy 300.00/hr

SAK Multiple telephone discussion it. tt~rnev poolcY 0.30 90.Q0
300.00/hr

8/17/2010 SAK Correspondence to atto eys Ha(brook, Con Floward and 0.10 30.00
Dooley 300.00/hr

SAK Multiple co espondence to and from attorneys Halbrook, onte 0.20 60.00
and Dool 300.00/hr

8/18/20! Q SAK Tel hone conference with counsel for City of Chicago, S. Loose, 0.30 90.00
r arding Rule 54 Statement to Court of Appeals 300.00/hr

SA Correspondence to attorneys Halbrook, Conte, Howard and 0 60.Q0
Dooley 300.0

SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from attorney Conte 0.10 0.00
300.00/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 73 of 113 PageID #:1580



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONRQE 3c SCUTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARRORiv STREET SUITE 30a CFI(CAGU. ILLtNOIS 6U6Q2-3102 - (;112) 7R1-1970

NRA-tLA Oflicc of Legislative Counsel lnvoicc /# 2009073 Pabe 4

HrslRate Ama~t

8/18/20E AK Receipt and review of correspondence from attorney Haibrook 0.10 30.00
300A0/

8/19/2010 SAK reparation of Circuit Rule 54 Statement of Position .50 15Q.OQ
300.Ofl/hr

SAK Corresp dence to attorneys Flalbrook, Conte, Howard and 0.1 Q 30. 0
Dooley 300.00/hr

SAK Additional comes ndence to and from attorneys Hal ook and 0.30 90.00
Conte 300.00/hr

SAK Revisions to Circuit Rule 54 tatement 0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

SAK AddiEional correspondence to d fro attorney Dooley 0.30 90.00
300.00/hr

8/20/20! 0 SAK Preparation of notice f filing, proof of service d final 0.30 90.00
formatting of Cir it Rule 54 Statement for Elting ~th Court of 300.00/hr
Appeals

SAK Corresp dence to attorneys Halbrook, Conte, and Howard \~ 0.10 30.00
300.00/hr

\~5AK ele hone conference with attome Doolep Y Y 0.20 60.00
300':00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from attorney Dooley with 020 60.00
fCle-stamped Rute 54 Statement in NR.A v. Oak Park 300.00(hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 74 of 113 PageID #:1581



wvacE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, I.TD. ATTORNEYS A'T LAW
33 NORTH dEARF3dRiJ STREET SUITE 300 CNICA(;O, ILLINUI5 GOb02-31(IZ (312)781-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counscl lnvoicc t# 2U09U73 Page 5

Hrs/Rate Amou

8/25/2 0 SAK Receipt and review of Rule 54 statement fled by City of Chicago 0.20 60.00
and Village of Oak Park in Court of Appeals 300.00

SAK eceipt and review of Court of Appeals order remanding case to .20 60.00
dis 'ct court 300.00/hr

SAK Correspon nee to attorneys Halhrooic and Conte 0.10 30.00
30Q.OQ/hr

SAK Receipt and review o orrespondence From attorney onte 0. I 0 30.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of correspo ence fro attorney Halbrook 0.20 60.Od
300.00/hr

8/26/2UIU SAK Receipt and reveiw ofcorrespo ence fro attorney Halbrook 0.30 90.00
300.00/hr

SAK Correspondence to a rncy Halbrook 0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt an review of final judgment entered by Court of A eals 0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

SAK ceipt and review of corresvondence from attorney Gonte 0.10 30.00
oo.00mT

8/3Q/2010 AK Receipt and review of correspondence from attorney Halbrook 0. 60.40
300.00/

1/2010 SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from attorney fialbrook 0.30 .00
300.00/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 75 of 113 PageID #:1582



INVpICE

BRENPJER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARBURTV 5"fREE'I' SUITE :i00 CIi1CAG~. ILLINOIS bOb02-3102 ~ (312) 7R1-1970

NR.A-[LA Office of Legislative Counsel ]nvoice # 2009073 ['age 6

Amount

8/31/2010 SAK u ~ e correspondence to and from attorneys Hal , Poss, U.30 90.00Floward, an me 300.00/hr

For professional services rendered 10.70 $3,210.00

Attorney Summary
Name Hou Rate AmountSAK Stephen olodziej - Partner 10.70 .UO $3,210.OU

ASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE RETURN
THE REMITTANCE PACE WETH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 76 of 113 PageID #:1583



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MOfYROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS A"f LAW
33 NOKTH DEARBORN STREET Sl11TE 30G CHICAGO, ILl_1N0lS (>0602-3102 {312} 781-1970

NRA-lLA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice k 2009073 Pale 7

REMITTANCE COPY

September 22, 2410

A-[LA Office of Legislative Counsel
! 12 aples Mill Road
Fairfax 2030
Mary Rose A ~ s, Director of
Finance

In Re: Our Fiie No.: PLTF. CV3697
National Rifle Associatio America v. The City of Chicago, et al.
Court No, OS CV 3697

Total fees for t ~ ~m•oice: $3,210.04
Total costs r this invoice: $0.00

X3,210.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENIYER, FORD, N10NROE &SCOTT, LTD.

1N ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE
RETURN ENCLOSEb REMITTANCE COPY WITN YOUR PAYMENT.

F1RM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 36-3102038

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 77 of 113 PageID #:1584



fNVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MOIYROE & SC07"T, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NOR'T'FI D~AR~ORN STf2CET surrE 300 C'Fl1C:AG0, 1t.L.IN()!ti fi06(12-3102 (312) 7ti1-1970

October 14, 20l U 
[nvoice No. 2010060

NRA-1LA Office of Legislative Counsel
1250 Waples Mill Road

Fairfax VA 22030
Mary Rose Adkins, Director of Finance

RE: Our Filc No.: PLTF.O8CV3647
National Rifle Association of America v. "flee City of Chicago, et al,
Court No. 08 CV 3697

For professional services rendered

Hrs/Rate Am t

/2010 SAK Initial discussion with counsel for City of Chicago regardinb 0.30 90.00attorneys Fees petition issues 300.

S Correspondence to attorneys Halbrook, Howard, Cooley, Posy, 0.30 90.00lement and Conte 300.00/hr

SAK ReccipE and iew of correspondence from attorne albrook 0.2Q 60.00
300.00/hr

9/2/2010 SAK Receipt and review ofcor ondence 0.80 240.00
from attorney Halbrook 300.00/hr

SAK Correspondence to attom , Halbrook, Ho d, Doo(ey and 0.20 60.00Conte ~ 30Q.00/hr

SAK Additional rrespondence to and from attorney Cone Q.20 60.00
300.00/hr

9/3/2010 SAK tiple telephone discussions with attorney Doo(ey .40 120.0
300. hr

SAK Preparation of verified bill of costs for filing in court ofappeals 0.80 24 .
300.00/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 78 of 113 PageID #:1585



INVOICE

BRF.NN~R, FORD, M(?NRQE &SCOTT, LTD. A'T'TORNEYS AT LAW
33 NUR1~H f~I:ARIIQRN 5T'RCET SUfTF. 3p4 {'FII(:~C;(), ILl.1NOIS h0602-31Q2 (31?) 7R1-197

NRA-1LA Office of Legislative Counsel Cnvoice ~ ZU10060 Page 2

Hrs/Rate Amouc

/3/2010 SAK Correspondence to attorneys Halbrook acid Conte U20 60.00
300.00/

9/7/2410 K Receipt and review of correspondence from attorney Halbrook U. I O 30.00
3DO.QO/hr

9/8/2010 SAK Co oncience to attorneys Halbrook, Conte, Howard and 0.10 30.00
Dooley 300.00/hr

9/ 10/2010 SAK Receipt end rev' w of McDonald's bill of costs fi in court of Q.20 b0.00
appeals 300.00/Iv

9/l3/2010 SAK Receipt end review of come ondenc om attorney Halbrook 0.10 3a.UU
300.UO/hr

9/1 G/2010 5AK Receipt and review of Bill Costs an andate issue by Court of U.30 90.00
Appeals in (;hicago, O ark and McDon cases 3UQ.00/hr

9/29/2410 SAK Correspondence and from Chicago counsel S. Lo e and U.20 60.f)0
regarding pa ent of costs on appeal 300.00/hr

SAK Receip nd review of correspondence from attorney Halbrook to 0.10 30.U0
Chi go counsel S. Loose regarding payment of costs on appeal _ Q0.00/tu

For p fessional services rendered 4.50 50.00

Attorney Summary
N e Hours Rate Amount
AK Stephen A. Kolodziej - Partner 4,50 300.00 $1,350.Q0

PLEASE REMIT T0: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE RETURN

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 79 of 113 PageID #:1586



ir,vo~cE

BRENNER, FORD, MONR~E &SCOTT, LTU. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH f)EARBURN S~fRE[ I' SUITE 300 CFIfCAGO, Il_LINUIS 60(,02-:1102 (312) 7Y1-1970

NRA-!LA Office of Lc~islative Counsel Invoice # 2010060 Pale 3

THE REMITTANCE PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX f.D. NUMQER: 36-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 80 of 113 PageID #:1587



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE & SC4"I'T, i,TD. ATT(}RNEYS AT LAW
~) 1~lORl'li DEARQORN STREET SUIl'E 30Q (:f iICAGO. IL[.INOtS (iQ1~02-3102 (312) 7!{I-197U

NR.A-IE,A Office of Legislative Counsel li~vosce # 2010060 Page 4

REMITTANCE COPY

October 14, 2010

N ILA Office of Legislative Counsel
l i250 aples Mil] Road
Fairfax V 2030
Mary Rose A ins, Director of
Finance

Fn Re: Dur File No.: PLT CV3697
National Rifle Associatio f
Court No. 08 CV 3697

Total fees fort invoice:
Total costs this invoice:

Total ount:

rica v. The City of Chicago, et al.

$1,350.00
$d.OU

$1,350.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

[N ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE
RETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY WCTH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX [.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 81 of 113 PageID #:1588



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONItOE &SCOTT, l~'I'D. A"I"I'OF2VEYS A'f L,AW

33 NORTH DEARBORN STREET SUITE :~00 CFItCAGO, I1_L.INOtS 60602-3102 (312} 7R1-1970

November 23, 2010 lnvoicc No. 2010072

NR.A-[LA Office of Legislative Counsel
11250 Waples Mifl Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Mary Rose Adkins, Director of Finance

RE: Our File No.~ PLTF.08CV3697
National Rifle Association of America v. The City of Chicago, et al.
Court No. Q8 CV 3697

For professional services rendered

10/8/2010 5AK Receipt and review of correspondence from Judge Shadur's clerk
regarding entry of dismissal order

SAK Correspondence to client and attorney Halbrook

SAK Receipt and review of correspondence hom attorney Halbrook

SAK Telephone conference with attorney Nalbrook

SAK Receipt and review of correspondence
attorney Halbrook

Pram

SAK Correspondence to Judbe Shadur's clerk regarding response to
inquiry about entry of dismissal order (cc: attorney Halbrook)

SAK 'Telephone conference with attorney Dooley

SAK Receipt and review of copy of correspondence from Freeborn &
Peters to Judge Shadur's clerk regarding entry of dismissal order

SAK Receipt and review of copy of correspondence from Chicago
counsel to Judge Shadur's clerk regarding entry of dismissal order

Hrs/Rate Amount

U.10 30.00
300.00/hr

O.IU 30.0()
300.00/hr

0.10 30.00
300.00/hr

0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

0.50 150.00
300.00/hr

0.1 U 30.00
300.00/hr

0.40 i 20.00
300.00/hr

0. i 0 30.00
300.00mr

U. I 0 30.00
300.00/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 82 of 113 PageID #:1589



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE & SCU'fT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NOR'fN DEARI30RN STREET SUITE 300 ChfICAGO, 1L.1_INOIS 60602-3102 (312) 781-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 201 f)072 Page 2

Flrs/Rte Amount
1 U/R/2010 SAK Correspondence to Judge Shadur's clerk regarding entry of 0.10 30.OQdismissal order

300.00/hr

(0/12/2010 SAK Telephone conference with attorney Dooley 0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of district court order dismissing case as moot 0.10 30.00
300.OQ/tir

! 0/ l 3/20 } 0 SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from attorney Haibrook 0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

Q/14/2010 SAK Telephone ca11 to Chicago counsel M. Ford regarding attorne}/s 0.20 60.00fees conference call; correspondence to attorney Holbrook 30U.~0/hr

10/2U/2010 SAK l~iultiple correspondence to and from Chicago counsel M. Forti Q.30 ~~O.UU.and attorney S. Holbrook regarding LR 54.3 conference call to 300.OU/hrdiscuss attorneys' fees motion issues and scheduling

SAK Multiple co~espondence to and from attorney S. Holbrook 0.30 90.00
30().00/hr

10/21/2010 SAK Multiple correspondence to and from attorney S. HaJbrook 0.30 90.00
300.U0/hr

SAK LR 54.3 telephone conference with counsel for Chicago and Oak 0.50 1 50.00Park
300.00/hr

SAK Multiple correspondence to and from counsel for Chicago and Oak 0.30 90.00Park regarding approval of motion for entry of schedule For 300.00/lymotions for attorneys' fees in Chicago and Oak Park cases

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 83 of 113 PageID #:1590



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 N~RTFi DEnRBORN STItFET SiJI'fl? 300 ('HICAGO. ILLIivOIS GOfi02-3102 (312) 7til -1970

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Course! Invoice f# 2010072 Pabe 3

Hrs/Rate Amount

10/21/2010 SAK Mulitple correspondence to and from attorney F(albrook 0.40 12D.00
300.00/hr

SAK Telephone conference with attorneys Halbrook and Dooley 0.20 60.00
300.00lhr

SAK Preparation and filing of notice and motion for entry of schedule 0.6Q 18Q.OQfar motion for attorneys' fees 300.00/hr

10/25/2010 SAK Correspondence to and from attorneys S. Halbrook and D. Dooley 0.50 1 50.1?0
30Q.00/hr

SAK Receipt and rcvicw of copy of correspondcncc From attorney 0.20 60.00Halbrook to Chicago and Oak Park counsel regarding prevailing 300.00/hrparty issues for attorneys' fees petition

SAK Begin review, redaction and preparation of billing information 3.60 I ,08Q.00pursuant to LR 54.3 for attorneys' fees petition 300.00Ihr

SAfC Telephone conference with attorneys Halbrook and Dooley 0.30 90.00
3QO.00/hr

SAK Preparation of declaration of SAK regarding attorneys' fees 0.50 150.00information 3 U0.00/hr

SAK Correspondence to attorney S. Halbrook 0.10 30.00
3 UO.00~r

10/26/2010 SAK Court appearance for hearing on motion for entry of schedule for 1.20 36x.00motion for attorneys' fees 300.00/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 84 of 113 PageID #:1591



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NOR~f1i DEAR$ORN S"fR~ET SUIT L 3QQ CHICAGO. ILLINOIS 60fi02-3102 ~ (312) 7R1-E970

NRA-ILA Office of i.,egis}ative Counsel Invoice # 2010072 Page 4

Fars/R to Amount

1 0/2 612 0 1 0 SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from attorney S. Halbrook 0.10 30.QU
3UQA0/hr

Fur professional services rendered I I.90 $3,570.00

Attorney Summary
Name Hours Rate Amount
SAK Stephen A. Kolodziej - Partner i i .90 30Q.00 X3,570.00

PLEASE [tEM1T TO: [3RENNER. FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

(N ORDER "~'~ ENSURE "FHAT YOUR ACCOUNT' 15 PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE RETURN
THE REMITTANCE PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.U. NUMBER: 3b-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 85 of 113 PageID #:1592



IfVVOlCE

BRENNER, FORD, NiONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARBnRN STRC-FT SUITL• 300 ('HI('AGt), ILLINOIS 00602-3102 (312) 731-1970

NRA-lLA Office of [_egislative Counsel Invoice # 201 p072 Page 5

REMITTANCE COPY

i~lovember 23, 2010

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel
t 1250 Waples Mill Road
Fairfax VA 22Q30
Mary Rose Adkins, Director of
Finance

]n Re: Our File No.: PL7'F.08CV3697
Nationa] Rifle Associatio►i of America v. The City of Chicago, et al.Court No. Q8 CV 3697

Tots! tees for this invoice: $3,570.00
Total costs for this invoice: $0.~0
Total amount: $3.570.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.
IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT 1S PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASERETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX 1.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 86 of 113 PageID #:1593



Q~►►li7L~T~

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE 8c SCOTT, i,TD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NOR"I'F! DEARl30RN tiTREE~f SUI fC 300 CFIICAGO, IL[.INOIS bOh02-3142 (112) 7R1-1470

December 16, 20 Z 0

NRA-ILA Office of t_e~islative Counsel
1250 Waples Mill Road

Fairfax VA 22030
Mary Rose Adkins, Director of Finance

RE: Our Fi}e No.: PLTF.08CV3697
National Rifle Association of America v. Tl~e City of Chicago, et al,
Court No. 08 CV 3697

For professional services rendered

1 1/1/2010 SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from attorneys Halbrook
anc! Dooley

Invoice No. 2012077

1 1/4/201 SAK Telephone conference with Chicago counsel R. Hirsch regarding
motion to extend briefing on prevailing party status

SAK Telephone conference with attorney Halbrook

1 !!5/2010 SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from Chicabo attorney
Hirsch a.nd attorney Halbrook regarding motion for extension

1 1/10/2010 SAIL Receipt and review of Chicago's notice and motion for extension
of time to file cross briefs regarding prevailing party status

l 1/12/2010 SAK Receipt and review of court order on Chicago's motion For
extension

For professional services rendered

Hrs/Rate Amount

U.2U 60.00
30Q.00/hr

0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

0.2U 60.()0
3 00.00/hr

0.20 6U.U0
3Q0.00/hr

0.20 60.UU
300.00/Iv

0.20 60.00
300.40/hr

(.20 $360.00

Attorney Summary
Name Hours Rate Amount
SAK Stephen A. Kolodziej - Partner I.20 300.Q0 $360.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 87 of 113 PageID #:1594



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MQNROE & SCO'CT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NOR'T'H DEARB(7Rh! 5'i'REF"I~ ~ SUITE 300 CHICAGO. ILLINOIS 60602-3102 (3I2) 781-1970

NRA-1LA Office of Legislative Counscl lnvoicc # 2012077 Page 2

(N ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT {S PROPERLY CCtEDITED, PLEASE RETURN
T~fE REMITTANCE PAGE WITN YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX l.D. NUMBER: 36-3{02088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 88 of 113 PageID #:1595



INVOICE

BI2ENNER, FURD, MONROE &SCO'O'T, LTD. ATTORNEYS A'(' LAW
33 NORTH DEARf30RiV STREGT SUITE 300 C'FiICAGO. II_l.liV015li0bU2-31 2 (312) 7R1-1970

NR.A-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice ~1 2012077 Page 3

REMITTANCE COPY

December 16, 20 I d

NRA-1LA Office of Lepslative Counsel
1 1250 Waples Mill Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Mary Rose Adkins, Director of
Finance

In Re: Our File No.: PLTF.U8CV3697
National Rifle Association of America v. The City of Chicago, et al.
Court No. 08 CV 3697

Total fees for this invoice: X360.00
Tota! costs for this invoice: ~0.0(l

Total amount: $360.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT iS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE
RETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY WITH YOUR PnYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 89 of 113 PageID #:1596



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORll,1~10NROE & SCOT`f, I,TD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW33 tvORTH DEARBORN STREET SUITE 30a ~ CHI(AGQ.11.1JNOIS 60602- 142 (312) 781-1970

January 14, 2U 1 1

NRA-!LA Office of Legislative Counsel
1 1250 Waples Mi}3 Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Mary Rose Adkins, Director of Finance

RE: Our File No.: PLTF.08CV3647
National Rifle Association of America v. The City of Chicago, et al.Court No. 08 CV 3b97

For professional services rendered

12/1/2010 SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from attorney Halbrooic

12/3/2010 SAK Receipt and review of copy of correspondence from attorney D.Lehman

12/8/2010 SAK Receipt and review of correspondence from attorney Halbrook

12/9/2010 SAK Multiple correspondence to and from attorney Halbrook

Invoice No. 101066

SAK Review of defendants' document production in Benson v. City ofChicago case regarding preparation of foundational declaration forappendix to prevailing party memorandum

SAK Preparation of foundational declaration far appendix to prevailingparty memorandum

12/10/2010 SAK Receipt and review of
correspondence to and from attorneyHalbrook

12/15/2010 SAK Multiple correspondence to and from attorney D. Dooley

Hrs/Ratc Amount

0.80 240.00
3UO.001tu~

0.30 90.00
300.00/hr

0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

4.30 90.00
300.00/hr

0.50 1 50.04
300.00/hr

0.50 150.00
300.00/hr

0.80 240.00
300.00/hr

0.3Q 90.00
300.00/hr

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 90 of 113 PageID #:1597



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS A`I' LAW
33 ~IORTH DEARBORN STREET SUITE 100 CFIICAGO, ILLINOIS 60502-3102 (312) 7R1-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel hivoicc # 101066 Page 2

Hrs/Rate Amount

12/15!2010 SAK Final formatting of prevailing party memorandum preparatory to l.20 360.Q0filing; prepared notice and certificate for same, and e-filed same 300.00/hr
with District Court

SAK Correspondence to attomcys Haibrook and Conte 0.10 30.00
3 00.00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of defendants' memorandum contesting 0.60 180.00plaintiffs' prevailing party status 300.00/hr

12/21/2010 SAK Court appearance for status hearing; multiple telephone 2.80 84Q.00discussions with attorneys Halbrook and Conte 300.00/hr
preparation of memorandum to

Christopher Conte .multiple
correspondence to and from attorneys Halbrook and Conte

12/22/2010 SAK Receipt and review of minute order and memorandum opinion 1.00 3UO.QUdenying petition for attorney's fees; multiple correspondence to 300.Q0/hr
and from attorneys Halbrook, Conte and Lehman

12/27/2010 SAK Review of court rules and docket record regarding preparation of 2.80 840.00notice of appeal; multiple telephone discussions with attorney W. 300.p0/hrHoward ~; preparation and filing of notice of appeai
regarding attorney's fees

l 2/28/2010 SAK Receipt and review of McDonald plaintiffs' motion regarding 0.60 180.00attome~s fees; multiple correspondence to and from attorneys 30D.00/hrHalbrook and Conte

For professional services rendered 12.80 $3,840.00

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 91 of 113 PageID #:1598



INVOICE

BRF,NNER, FORD, M~NROE &SCOTT, L'TD. A'T'TQRNEYS A`~' LAW
13 NORTH DEARBORN STREET SUI"~F 300 CHICAGO, II.LINO(S G0602-3102 (31Z) 7Ri-f970

NRA-ILA Offrce of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 101066 Page 3

Additional Charges

Amount
1 2/27/2010 Filing notice of appeal 

455.Q0

Total costs 
$455.00

Total amount of this bill 
$4,295.Od

Attorney Summary
Name 

Hours Rate A►nountSAK Stephen A. Kolodziej - Partner 1 2.80 300.00 $3,840.00

PLEASE REM[T TO: BE~ENNER, FORD, MONROB &SCOTT, I,Tb.

FN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPEitLY CREDITED, PLEASE RETURN'THE REMITTANCE PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX [.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 92 of 113 PageID #:1599



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, L"TD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH D£AR~ORN STREET - SU1TE 300 CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60602-3102 (312) 7$I-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Lebistative Counsel Invoice f~ 101066 Page 4

REMITTANCE COPY

January 14, 20l f

NRA-[LA Office of Legislative Counsel
1 1250 Waples MiII Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Mary Rose Adkins, Director of
Finance

In Re: Our File No.: PLTF.08CV3697
National Ritle Association of America v. "i'he City of Chicago, et ai.
Court No. 08 CV 3697

Total fees for this invoice; $3,840.00
Total costs for this invoice. $455.00

Total amount: X4,295.00

PLEASH REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE
RETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY W[TH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 93 of 113 PageID #:1600



irvvoiCE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE & SC~T'i', LTD. A`fTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTF! DEARBORN STREET' ~ SUITE 300 ChIICAGO, ILLINOIS fiQh02-3102 (1!2} 781-►970

February 25, 2011

NRA-tLA Office of Legislative Counsel
11250 Waples Mill Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Mary Rose Adkins, Director of Finance

RE: Our Fiie No.: PLTF.OSCV3697
National Rifle Association of America v. The City of Chicago, et al.
Court No. 08 CV 3697

For professional services rendered

1/3/2 K Multiple telephone discussion with attorney D. Dooley
review of court

rules applicable case law ;draft
dockering s ent; correspondence to attorney Halbrook

fnvoicc No. 101 Ibl

SAK Receipt and review of eorresp ence from attorney Hal ook
pre e modification docketing

statement , finaliz docke ' g statement
and notices for filing with Court of Appeals

1/4/2011 SAK Receipt and review of memorandum o nion of distn court
denying McDonald's motion for at ey's fees; multiple
correspondence to and from a eys Lehman, Halbrook, Co
and Howard

1/b/201 1 SAK Telephone conferen with attorney Dooley
review of Circuit

Court Rules district court web site ,
preparati of Circuit Rule 26.1 disclosure statement; telephone
call t udge 5hadur's court reporter regarding transcript request
a~ filing; preparation of transcript information sheet and
ranscript order form; receipt and review of correspondence from
court reporter regarding invoice and transcript information

Hrs/Rate ount

3.80 1,140.00
300 /tv

1.60 480.00
300.00/hr

0.60 i 80.00
300.00/hr

70 8 ! 0.00

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 94 of 113 PageID #:1601



INVQICE

BRENNER, FORD, IYIONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARBORN S 1'REt'I' SUI'I't: 3(}D C1-ifCAGO, II~LINOIS 6Qb02-3102 ~ (312) 7H1-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Lebislative Counsel Invoice f~ ~ 01 161 Page 2

Hrs/Rate A nt

1/7/201 I SAK Receipt anc! review of report of proceedings from court reporter; 1.40 420.00
completed transcript inforrrtatio~ sheet and e-filed same with 300.0 r
district court; preparation of required notices and certifcates for
filing of same with Seventh Circuit Court of Appeals

}/t0/20! ] SA Receipt and review of supplemental memorandum opinion issue 0.54 150.00
Judge Shadur regarding attorney's fees; correspondence t nd 300.00/hr

fro attorneys Halbrook and Conte

1/t !/2011 SAK Correspon ce to and from attorney Halbrook 020 60.00
300.00/hr

1/1 2/2011 5AK Receipt and reveiw of ' trict court no ~ e of transmission of long 0.20 60.00
record on appeal to Court o ppea 300.00/hr

1 / 14/201 1 SAK Receipt ancE review of notice rec ~ t of long record by Court of O.I Q 30.00
Appeals 300.00/hr

1/24/201 1 SAK Multiple correspon nce and telephone discussions 'th attorneys 2.00 600.00
Halbrook and D ley ~ 300.00/hr

~; multiple correspondence to Chicag'
counsel re rding same; telephone conference with attorney
Doole nd Chicago and Oak Park counsel regarding same; review
of F eral and Seventh Circuit appeal rules regarding joint

endix and notice regarding same

1/31!201 I S Multiple correspondence to and from attorneys Halbrook and 0.30 0.00
Dooley 300.00/hr

For professional services rendered 13.40 $4,020.00

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 95 of 113 PageID #:1602



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, [STD. ATTORNEYS AT I~AW
33 iVORTH DEARBDRN STREET SUITF. 30U Cl11CAGU. ILLINOIS fi0602-1102 (312} 781-1970

NRA-[LA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice /t 101 161 Page 3

Additional Charges

Amount
1/b! Rosemary Scarpelli Official Court Reporter - Invoice No. 20100204 tra pt of 12.60pro 'ngs before Judge Milton I. Shadur of f 2/21/10

Total costs

Total amount of this bill

AEtorney Summary

SAK S~Sfien A. Kolodziej - Partner

$12.50

$4,Q32.60

13.40 300.fl0 Q20.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

[N ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE RETURNTHE REMITTANCE PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX (.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 96 of 113 PageID #:1603



INVOICE

BRENIYER, FORD, MONROE & SCUTT, LTU. A7'7'ORNEYS A7' LAW
33 NUR"I'H UEARBOItN S~~REET SUITE 3QU C'HIC'AGO, ILLINOIS ~~U602-3102 {312) 7ft1-1970

NRA-ILA Oftice of Legislative Counsel {nvoice N 101 161 Page 4

REMITTANCE COPY

February 25, 201

NRA-fLA Office of Legislative Counsel
25Q Waples Mill Road

Fai x VA 22030
Mary •e Adkins, Director of
Finance

In Re: Our file No,: TF.08CV3b97
National Rifle Ass 'ation of merica v, The City of Chicago, et al.Court No. U8 CV 3b9

Total Fees for
Total cost i

Tota mount:

invoice: $4,020 ZTO~
this invoice: X12.60

$4,032.60

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.
1N ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT 1S PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASERETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 36-31Q2088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 97 of 113 PageID #:1604



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEAR(30RN 5'fRF:ET SUI"fE 30a C.'HICAGU, ILLINOIS fi0h02-3102 (112) 7R1-19 0

April 21, 2011 
Invoice No. 101280

NRA-ILA Office of Legis{alive Counsel
l 1250 Wsples Mill Road
Fairfax VA 22b30
Mary Rose Adkins, Director of Finance

RE: Our File No.: PLTF.08CV3b97
National Rifle Association of America v. The City of Chicago, et al.
Court No. 08 CV 3697

Fflr professional services rendered

Hrs/Rate Amount

201 1 SAK Receipt and review of draft of argument for attorney's fees appeal 1.10 330
brief ~• ;multiple correspondence Eo and from 300.00/hr
attorneys Halbrook and Dooley

2/3/201 1 SAK ultiple correspondence to and From attorneys Halbrook and .30 90.00Do
300.00/hr

2/4/201 l SAK Receipt an view of multipic correspondence from attorne ~.SO 240,04Gera, Halbroo d Dooley 30D.00/hr

2/8/201 ! SAK Receipt and review of itple correspondence ween attorneys 0.40 120.60
Halbrook, Gura, and Chiea nd Dak Park unsel regarding 300.00/hr
consent to amicus briefs

2/!fl/201 1 SAK Review and proofread revised d s of 'ef 2.80 840.00
multiple co ondence to and 300.00/hr

from attorneys Dooley, brook and Lehman
review mul ' e correspondence from attom s Gura and

Dooley .

SAK Receipt review of correspondence from attorney Gura 0.60 180.00
receipt and review of 300.Q0/hr

fiple correspondence from attorneys Holbrook, Lehmand and
ootcy

2/1 1/201 AK Review and markup of drafts of appellate brief 2.30 690.00
;multiple correspondence to and from aitomey 3QQ.00/hr

Dooley

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 98 of 113 PageID #:1605



INVOfCE

BRENNER., FORD, MONR~E ~4i SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARIIORN STREE"I~ SUITE 300 C'I IICAC,O, fLLlNQIS 10602-3102 {312) 751-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 101280

11/201 1 SAK Receipt and review of multiple correspondence from attorneysClark Neily and R. Hakim

2/E3/201 [ Receipt and review of multiple correspondence from attorneyseily and Halbrook

2114/20! 1 SAK Review an ~ nature of final version of joint ap ants' briefpreparatory to fill ultiple telephone dis sions with attorneyDooley

2/18/201 1 SAK Receipt and review of McD d p iffs brief to court ofappeals

2/22/201 R SAK Receipt and r ew ofamicus curiae brief of Jnstitute fo slice

for nro~sional services rendered

Attorney Summary

SAK Stephen A. Kolodziej - Partner

Page 2

Hrs/Rate Amount

0.20 60.00

0.20 60.OQ
3Q0.00/hr

I.20 360.00
3Q0.00/hr

0.90 270,00
300.00/hr

0.60 180.00
300.001hr

11.4Q $3,420.UQ

Sours Rate Amount
11.40 300.00 $3,420.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE RETURNTHE REMITTANCE PAGE WITH YOlJR PAYMENT.

FIRM TfiX I.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 99 of 113 PageID #:1606



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORT}I DLARDORN STREET SUITE 3UQ ('NICAC(), 1LL1N0l5 6062-3102 (312) 7x I-1970

NRA-ILA office of 1_egislative Counsel invoice # 101280 Page 3

REMITTANCE COPY

April 21, 2011

LIRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel
250 Waples Milt Road

Far x VA 22030
Mary R e Adkins, Director of
Finance

In Re: Our Pile No.: P Q8CV3697
National Rifle Associa ' of A.
Court No. 08 CV 3697

Total fees for
Total costs f

Total ount

invoice:

v. The City of Chicago, et al.

$3,42Q.00
$0.00

$3,420.00

PLEASE REMfT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.
1N ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT (S PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASERETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY W[TH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 36-3102Q88

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 100 of 113 PageID #:1607



INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, i1~IONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS A'E' LAW
33 NORTH DEARBORN STREET SUITE lUQ CHIC'A(;O, iLt_INOIS 6U6U2-31!)3 (312) 7N1-1970

June O l, 201 1 
Invoice No. 1 Q 1433

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel
11250 Wa~(es Mill Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Mary Rose Adkins, Director of Finance

RE: Our File No.: PLTF.48CV3697
National Rifle Association of America v. 'The City of Chicabo, ct al.
Court No. OR CV 3697

For professional services rendered

Hrs/Rate Amount

3/l0/ 1 SAK Receipt and review of Chicago's motion to extend briefing 0.30 90.OUdeadline and correspondence from attorneys Howard, Halbrook 300.0 rand Conte

4/8!201 t SAK Rece and review of Chicago's motion for extension to file b
and comes dcnce from attorney Halbrook

4/1 ]/201 1 SAK Multiple correspon ~ e to ancf from attorneys rook, Conte,
and Howard

4/13/20! 1 SAK Receipt and review of Court of A order ?;ranting Chicago's
motion for extension

4/25/201 I SAK Receipt and review o etter From Chicago counsel ourt of
Appeals clerk re ding oral argument scheduling reque

4/29/20! ! SAK Receipt d review of Defendants' brief to Court of Appeals
re Ong attorney fees

F professional services rendered

(}.30 90.00
300.00/hr

0.30 90.OU
3oa.oaihr

0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

0.20 60.OU
300.OU/hr

1.80 540.00
300.00/hr

3.10 $930.00

Attorney Summary
Name 

Hours Rate AmountSAK Stephen A. Kalodziej - Partner 3. I d 30Q.00 $430.00

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 101 of 113 PageID #:1608



INVdICE

BREIYNER, FnRD, MONROE & SCOT'T, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 iVORTff DEAREiORN STREET SUITE ~UQ CfIIC'AGQ, ILLINOIS bt?h02-}102 (312) 7R1-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 101433 Page 2

PLEASE REMlTTO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE & SCUTT, LTD,

IN ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE RETURNTHE REMITTANCE PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX [.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 102 of 113 PageID #:1609



INVQICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE & SCO~'T, LTD. A'TT~RIYEYS AT LAW33 NQRTH UEARB~RN STRGIT SUITE 300 CHICAGO, iI.LiNOIS hOb02-3102 (:i I Z} 781-Ih70

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice tt 101433 Page 3

REMITTANCE COPY

June O1, 201 1

R,A-[LA Office of Lebislative Counsel
1 I 0 Waples Mill Road
Fairfax A 22030
Mary Rose kins, Director of
Finance

In Re: Our File No.: PLTF_ 'V3697
National Rifle Association
Court No. 08 CV 3697

Total fees for
rt'otal cases fo

"Total a unt

invoice:

v. The City of Chicabo, et al.

$930.Q0
$0.00

$930.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MOIVR~E & SCO'TT, LTD.
[N ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASERETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY'WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 36-3102088

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-1 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 103 of 113 PageID #:1610



Ervvoic~

BRENiYER, FORD, M4NROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT I,AW33 iVURTiI DEARIIORN STREF,T SUITE 3(30 CH1CnCO3 II._(_INQfS 60h()2-3102 (312) 7H1-1970

June 21, 201 1 
invoice No, 101510

NItA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel1 1250 Waples Mill Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Mary Rose Adkins, Director of Finance

RE: Our Filc No.: PLTF.08CV3697
National Ritle Association oFAmerica v. The City of Chicago, et al.Court No. 08 CV 3697

For professional services rendered

Hrs/Rate
5/ Ol 1 SAK Multiple correspondence to and from attorney Halbraok 0 180.00review of Circuit 0.00/hrRules and telephone call to Court of Appeals clerk

5/6/201 I SAK R ipt and review of draft reply brief for attorney fees app I.00 300.0()multiple corresponde from 300.00/hrattorneys and and Lehman

5/9/201 1 SAK Receipt and Review ircuit Rule 26.1 d~ osure filed by 0.20 60.00attorney Halbrook
300.OQ/hr

5!1 112011 SAK Receipt and review of correspo e e from attorney Howard to 0.20 60.00attorneys Halbrook and Le an
300.OQ/hr

5/I 2/20l I SAK Receipt and rev of final draft of reply brief prep tory to 0.60 180.00binding and ing
300.00/hr

5/13/20 [ 1 SAK Tele one calls to attorney Howard ~ 020 60.00
300.00/hr

5/16/201 I S Receipt and review of filed copy of reply brief 0.30 90.00
3 00/hr

SAK Receipt and review of McDonald's reply brief to Caurt of Appeals 0.8d 240.04
300.00Ihr
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tNVO~cE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, L'tD. ATTORNEYS AT I,AW
33 NORTH bEARBQRN STREET SUI"fE 344 ~ CHICA(;O. ILLINOIS 60b02-3102 (312} 781-i97Q

NRA-ILA Office oFLegislative Counsel Invoice # 101510 Page 2

Tonal scrviccs rendered

SAK Stephen A. Kolo

B REMIT TO: BRENNER, f~~RD, MONROE & SC07T, LTD.

~~ Amount

3,90 $1,170.00

ours Rate Amount
3.9 '~3.Q~00 $ I ,170.00

[N ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE RETURNTHE REMITTANCE PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBfiR: 36-3102088
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INVOICE

BRENIYER, FORD, MONROE 3c SCOTT, L'I'U. A"fTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NOR7Fi DEAR[30RN STREE'i' SUITE 300 CI~IICAGO, ll_I.INOlS 00602-3102 (312) 781-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel

REMITTANCE COPY

June 2 I , 2011

NRA-!LA Office of Legislative Counsel
1 1250 Waples Mil! Road

x VA 22030
Mary Adkins, Director of
Finance

In Re: Our File No.: PL'{'
National Rifle Assi
Court No. 08 CV 3

Total Fees f this invoice:
Total c for this invoice:

amount:

Invoice t~ I O t 510

(~VjS97
t~i of America v. The City of Chicago, et al.

$ l ,170.00
$0.00

$ l ,170.00

PLEASE REMIT TO: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.

[N ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASERETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 3b-3102088

Page 3
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INVOICE

BRENI~IER, FORD, MONROE ~4c SCO`IT`, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARB012N STREE'3' SUITE 3D0 CHICAGO, ILLINOIS b0602-3102 (312} 781-1970

July 06, 2011

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel
i 1250 Waples Mill Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Mary Rose Adkins, Director of Finance

RE: Our File No.: PLTF.08CV3697
National Rifle Association of America v. The City of Chicago, et al.
Court No. 08 CV 3697

For professional services rendered

6/3 1 I SAK Receipt and review of Court of Appeals judgment regazding
attorney's fees; correspondence to attomeysHalbrook,Conte,
Lehman and Howard

6/b/2011 SAK uJtiple correspondence to and from attorneys Halbmok, Conte

G/8/201 l SAK Receipt and re w of correspondence and memor dum from
attorney Halbrook

6/9/2011 SAK Multiple correspondence and from orney Howard
~; telephone confer c ith W. Howard

receipt and review of ' t of costs

6/] 0/2011 SAK Receipt and review Oak Park bill of c s filed in court of
apQeals

Invoice No. 1 Q 15 19

6!l 312011 SAK Prepa ill of costs for Chicago case and fi!e in co of appeals;
to one conference with court of appeals clerk

• correspondence to attorney Howard

Hrs/Rate Amoun

0.70 10.00
300.00

o.so ~ so.ao
300.00/hr

0.60 180.00
300.00/hr

0.80 240.00
300.00/hr

0.20 60.00
300.00/hr

1.30 390.00
340.00/hr

I SAK Receipt and review of Court of appeals mandate; correspondence 0~ 60.00
from attorney Halbrook 300.00/
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INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARBORN STfLE[T SUITE 30Q CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 60602.3102 (312) 781-1970

MtA-ILA Office of Legislative Counse] Invoice # 101519 Page 2

Hrs/Rate Amount
C~/28/201 1 SAK Receipt and review of district court notice of mandate filed; 0.80 ?40.~~multiple correspondence with attorneys Halbrook, Conte and 300.00/hrHoward

fi/36/20 ] l SAK Telephone conferences with attorneys Halbrook and Howard 2.60 784.00receipt and review of multiple 300.00/ivcorrespondence from attorneys Halbrook, Poss, and Thompson
receipt and review of memorandum

Crom attorney HaEbrook; begin preparation of attorney's feeinformation per local court rules

SAK Telephone conference with opposing counsel regazding attorney's 0.20 60.00fees information exchange required by local court rules 300.00/hr

For professional services rendered 
7.90 $2,370.00

Additional Charges

G/t 3/20l ] Duplication of pleadings (45 pages} 
4.50

Total costs 
$4.50

Total amount of this bill 
$2,374.50

Attorney SummaryName 
Hours Rate AmountSAK Stephen A. Kolodziej - Partner 7.90 300.00 $2,370.40

PLEASE REMIT T0: BRENNER, FORD, MONROE &SCOTT, LTD.
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INVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MQNROE &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW33 NORTH DEAR90RN STREET SCIITE 300 CHICAGO, ILLINOIS 606Q2-3102 (312} 781-T97Q

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel [nvoice # 101519 Page 3

[N ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASE RETURNTHE REMITTANCE PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NiIMBER: 3b-3102088
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fNVOICE

BRENNER, FORD, MOlvR4E &SCOTT, LTD. ATTORNEYS AT LAW
33 NORTH DEARBORN STKEET SU1TE 300 CHICAGO, ILLINOfS 60602-3102 {312) 781-1970

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel Invoice # 101519

REMITTANCE COPY

July 06, 201 l

NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel
1 ] 250 Waptes Mill Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Mary Rose Adkins, Director of
Finance

In Re: Our File No.: PL1'F.08CV3697
National Rifle Association ofAmerica v. The City oFChicago, et al.
Court No. 08 CV 3697

Total Fees for this invoice: $2,370.00
Totzl cosis for this invoice: -$4.50

"Dotal amount: $2,374.50

PLEASE REM[T TO: SRENNER, FORD, MONRO~ &SCOTT, LTD.

1N ORDER TO ENSURE THAT YOUR ACCOUNT IS PROPERLY CREDITED, PLEASERETURN ENCLOSED REMITTANCE COPY WITH YOUR PAYMENT.

FIRM TAX I.D. NUMBER: 3b-3102088

Page 4
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7/26/2011 BRENNER, FORD. MONF20E 8 SGOTT, LTD2:26 PM 
Arbitrations Pre-bill Worksheet 

Page
Nickname
Fufl Name
Address

Telephone 1
Telephone 2
In Ref To

Entered NewFlle
Status
Assigned Alty
Secondary Atty
Client
ClientlD
Our File No.
Attny Refrd 70
Billing Cycle
Claim !Number
Matter Name
Matter ID
Share Percent
Examiner
Date of Loss
State Filed
Case Type
Coverage
Suit Indicator
Client Office
Policy Number
Policyholder
Claimant
Claimant ID
Examiner !Number
Invoice Ssq
Firm Tax ID
Percent Paid
Start Date
End Date
Fees Arrg.
Expense Arrg.
Tax Profile
Last bill
Last charge
Last payment
Rejected Slips
Approved Slips
Pending Slips

PLTF.U8CV3697 ~ NRA v Daley
NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel11250 Waples Mitl Road
Fairfax VA 22030
Mary Rose Adklns, Qlrector of Finance

Facsimile
Telephone 3National Rifle Association of America v

Court No. 08 CV 3897
1/1/2401
ACTJVE-NEWCO
SAK
SAK
PLTF

0
SAK
Cycle M - Monthly

i11/2000

Plaintiff -Other

The City of Chicago, et at.

t 2/1/2008
2/28/20(39
By Billing value on each slip
By billing value on each slip
Exempt
~~s~zoi ~
7!26/2011
7/25/2011 Amount $1,17Q_000
0
9

Date Attorney 
Rate Hours Amount Total

ID Activity 
Markup % DNB Time dNB Amt7/1/2011 Kolodziej 

300.00 020 60.00 Billable585695 ATfY
Correspondence to and from attorney 

PendingHalbrook
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7126/2011 BRENNER, FORD, MONF20E ~ SCOTT, LTD2:26 PM 
Arbitrations Pre-bib Worksheet

PLTF.08CV36S7:NRA-ILA Office of Legislative Counsel (continued}
Date Attorney

Rate Hours AmountId Activity
Markus °la DNB lime DfVB Amt7/5/2011 KotodZiej

300.00 4.80 1,440.00584291 ATTY
Continued preparation of attorney's feesinformation per local court rules7/6/2011 KolodzleJ

30.00 2.20 660.00585694 ATTY
Continued preparation of attorney's feesinformation per local court rules; preparationof declaration regarding same;
correspondence to attorney Hatbrook

7/7/2011 Kolodziej 
300.04585696 ATTY

Multiple telephone discussions with Chicagocounsel regarding attorney's fees
information exchange artd agreed motbnregarding scheduling for same; multiple
correspondence to and from attorneys
Halbrook and Howard

7/8/2011 Koiodziej 
300.005857t0 ATTY

Receipt and review of correspondence fromChicago counsel regarding agreed motionfor attorney's fees schedule and telephone
conference regarding same; telephone callsfo attorneys Gura and Sigale regardingsame; multiple correspondence to and fromattorneys Halbrook and Howard

711 212 0 1 1 Kolodziej 
300.00585786 ATIY

Telephone discussions with attorneys D,
Sigale and R. Hirsch regarding attorney's
fees scheduling motion and telephone
conference; multiple correspondence to andfrom attorneys Holbrook and Floward

7/13!2011 Koioazie~ 
300.00586434 A7lY

Telephone conference with all counsel inOak Park and Chicago cases regarding
attorney's fees; preparation of notice and
agreed motion for entry of schedule for
motion for attorney's fees per agreement ofall counsel; multiple correspondence to andfrom attorneys Holbrook and Howard;
multiple correspondence [o and from
Chicago and Oak Park counsel regarding
agreed motion; e-filed agreed motion withcourt

Page

rota

gillabte

Pending

Billable

Pending

1.30 390.00 Billable

Pending

1.00 300.00 Billable

Pending

1.20 360.00 8i1lable

Pending

2.80 840.00 Billable

Pending
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7!2612011 SRENNER, FORD, MQNROE 8~ SCOTT, LTD2:26 PM Arbitrations Pre-bill Worksheet Page 4
PLTF.OSCV3697:NRA-fLA Office of Legisfalive Counsel (continued)
Date Attorney

Rate Nours Amount Tota!
ID Activity

Markup % DNB Time DNB Amt7/14/2011 Koladziej
300.00 0.60 780.00 Billable586435 A7TY

Receipt and review of court order nn agreed
Pendingmotion regarding attorney's fees schedule;

correspondence to and from attorney
Nalbrook; receipt and review of agreed
motion regarding attorney's fees schedule
filed in Oak Park case

7/26/2011 iColodziej
300.00 2.30 690.00 Billable

58fi438 A7'TY
Multiple correspondence to and from

Pendingaliomey Hatbrook
• preparation of additional

updated fee information for petition

TOTAL Billable Fees

Total of billable expense slips

Total of Fees {Time Charges}

Total of Costs (Expense Charges)

Total new charges

Total Previous Balance

t6.40 34,920.00

$0.00

Amount Totai

$4,920.00

$0.00

$4,920.00

$3, 544.50
Accounts Receivables
DateIID Type Description

7/25/2011 PAY Invoice # -101510 nra. Check No. 58517 ($1,170.00)31788
Total Accounts Receivable 

($1,170.00)

Toia! New Balance 
$7,294.50

Attorney Summary

Attorney Rate Hours Charges Slip Value AdjustmentSAK 300,00 18.40 $4,924.00 $4,920.00 O.OQ
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EXHIBIT B (Revised)'

STEPHEN P. HALBROOK — SERVICES RENDERED IN
NATIONAL RIFLE ASSOCIATION v CHICAGO and OAK PARK

THROUGH 11/11/11

Note: Pursuant to this Court's Memorandum Opinion and Order, June 25, 2012, at 21,
stricken time entries for work performed from August 15, 2009 through June 28, 2010, are
crossed out. The total hours are recalculated at the end to deduct the stricken hours.

Pre-Litigation Work

2/15/08 Preparation of memo- Chicago 0.8

2/22/08 Legal Research, Prepare Memo- Chicago Case 3.6

2/26/08 Review of Incorp. Issue 1.6

3/4/08 Legal Research, Preparation of Memo 3.0

3/5/08 Peparation of Memo- Challenge to Wilmette, Chicago
[4.0 — delete 1 hour] 3.0

3/24/08 Legal Research- Ordinances, Preparation of Memo 1.5

3/25/08 Review of Ordinances, Preparation of Memo, Email- Parties 4.2

3/26/08 Legal Research- Ordinances, Preparation of Memo
[ 1.8 — delete .8 hour] 1.0

4/7/08 Preparation of Litigation Memo, Legal Research 5.8

4/8/08 Preparation of Memo, Email 1.6

4/9/08 Email 0.4

'Halbrook's original Exhibit B was filed with his Declaration in support of NRA's
Motion for Attorneys Fees as Document # 10-1 on 1/18/12.

ZIn some instances, total hours expended in the Chicago and Oak Park cases also reflected
some time expended on cases involving other Cook County-area lawsuits on the same subject.
These hours are shown in brackets and have been reduced to exclude time expended in the other

cases. In addition, in one instance a privileged matter is shown in brackets.

1
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4/10/08 Legal Research, Preparation of Memo - Standing 3.0

4/14/08 Legal Research, Preparation of Memo - Standing 2.2

4/21/08 Legal Research, Preparation of Memo - Standing 4.2

4/22/08 Preparation of Memo - Standing 1.8

4/28/08 Legal Research - Standard of Review 0.8

5/9/08 Conference Strategy; Review Memos; Legal Research 3.5

5/14/08 Preparation of Complaint 2.2

5/16/08 Conference with Counsel 0.6

5/22/08 Review Local Rules; Legal Research 2.5

5/23/08 Preparation of Complaint 1.5

5/27/08 Preparation of Complaint 1.2

5/28/08 Review Memo Incorp.; Preparation of Complaint 2.4

5/31/08 Legal Research 0.4

6/8/08 Preparation of Complaint; Legal Research - Joinder 2.8

6/9/08 Preparation of Complaint 2.8

6/10/08 Preparation of Complaints; Conference Call Counsel 4.2

6/11/08 Conference Call; Preparation of Complaint 5.8

6/16/08 Phone Conference with J. Lott 0.4

6/17/08 Review Plantiffs Issues 0.3

6/18/08 Review Plaintiffs Status; Conference Calls
Preparation of Client Forms 4.8

6/19/08 Review Plaintiffs Issues 1.2

2
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6/23/08 Conference Call Counsel; Preparation of Litigation 2.5

6/26/08 Preparation of Complaints; Legal Research
[4.4 — delete 1 hour] 3.4

Subtotal: 81.0

Litigation in the District Court

6/29/08 Review Suits and Defendant Reactions; Review Filings, Judges
[4.2 — delete 2 hours] 2.2

6/30/08 Review Reports Repeals; Phone Conference with Client
Legal Research - Consolidation; Review Heller
[4.0 — delete 1 hour] 3.0

7/2/08 Legal Research; Preparation of Memo 1.6

7/7/08 E-mail; Review Status; Review Heller; Preparation of Memo 4.5

7/8/08 Phone Conference with Chicago Attorney; Review Winnetka
Ordinance; Preparation of Complaint; Legal Research
[3.8 — delete 3 hours] .8

7/9/08 Review Motion; Review Status Repeals; Legal Research
Preparation of Memo
[4.5 — delete 2 hours] 2.5

7/10/08 Review Order - McDonald; Legal Research; Review
Ordinance Status; Letter to Wilmette; Preparation of
Memos - Heller, Standing
[5.4 — delete 2.4 hours] 3.0

7/11/08 Legal Research; Preparation of Memos - Heller, Standing
Phone Conference with Counsel; Review Recusal Issues
[4.4 — delete 2 hours] 2.4

7/14/08 Preparation of Memo - Incorporation; Phone Conference
with Kathy Tyler; Review Village Agendas
[4.6 — delete 2 hours] 2.6

7/15/08 Review McDonald Documents; Preparation of Heller Memo 2.6

3
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7/16/08 Conference Call 0.4

7/22/08 Review Ordinances Status, draft letter
Review Motions to Consolidate, Recusal
[2.8 — delete 2 hours] .8

8/1/08 Review McDonald Sum. Judg. Motion, etc.
Phone Conference with Counsel; Preparation of Memo
Legal Research 3.8

8/6/08 Preparation of Brief - Incorporation
Review Memo Reassign. -Oak Park 4.5

8/7/08 Review Evanston Status, Oak Park Brief
Phone Conference with C. Michel - Incorporation Cases
Legal Research; Preparation of Brief - Incorporation
[7.4 — delete .4 hours] 7.0

8/8/08 Preparation of Brief - Incorporation; Legal Research 7.8

8/11/08 Preparation of Brief - Incorporation; Review Evanston
Response Recusal, Bill
[7.0 — delete 2 hours] 5.0

8/12/08 Review Evanston Status; Preparation of Brief - Incorporation
Teleconference with Counsel
[4.6 — delete 1.6 hours] 3.0

8/13/08 Review Evanston Status; Preparation of Brief - Merits
Legal Research
[5.8 — delete .8 hours]

8/18/08 Phone Conference with C. Conte; Review Status Chicago
Review Motion to Dismiss - Evanston
[2.4 — delete 2 hours] .4

8/20/08 Conference Call with Counsel - Evanston, Chicago
Review Motion to Dismiss
1.2 — delete 1 hour] .2

8/25/08 Review Opinion - Evanston Recusal; Review Chicago Order
Review Evanston Docket, Morton Grove Motion 0
[3.6 — delete all]
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8/27/08 Review Morton Grove Status; Preparation of Memo
Phone Conference with Oak Park Resident
[3.0 — delete 2.5 hours] .5

9/5/08 Review Oak Park Answer, Motion to Dismiss
Review Chicago Answer
Phone Conference with Counsel - Status, Responses 3.5

9/8/08 Review Request Con£ Call, E-mail; Review Motions 2.5

9/9/08 Review Status, Discovery Issue; Legal Research -Merits 0.8

9/10/08 Legal Research - Incorporation 4.5

9/11/08 Oak Park - Review Order, Motion to Dismiss
Chicago- Review Order
Review Rule 16 Issues; Phone Conference with Counsel 1.2

9/12/08 Review Evanston Brief; Legal Research
Chicago - Review Discovery Issues
[3.2 — delete 2 hours] 1.2

9/16/08 Oak Park: Review Motion to Dismiss; Legal Research 1.0

9/18/08 Review Oak Park Responses 0.2

9/19/08 Oak Park - Review Orders 0.4

9/24/08 Review Docket - Chicago 0.2

10/6/08 Legal Research - Incorporation 1.0

10/10/08 Legal Research - Wasserman Study 0.4

10/13/08 Legal Research - Heller 1.2

10/14/08 Review Chicago Discovery Requests; Preparation of Memo
Review Chicago, Oak Park Drafts - Conference 2.8

10/17/08 Oak Park &Chicago - Review Rule 16 Issues, Discovery
Conference Call Counsel 2.4

10/21/08 Oak Park - Review Draft Motion to Strike Jury Demand 0.4

5
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Chicago - Review Rule 16 Motion - McDonald 0.4

10/22/08 Chicago - Preparation of Rule 16 Motion; Phone
Conference with Counsel 1.2
Oak Park - Review Rule 16 Status 0.6

10/23/08 Oak Park - Review Rule 16 Issues; Preparation of Brief 2.4

10/24/08 Phone Conference with Counsel -Rule 16 Conference
Review Status -All Cases 1.2

10/27/08 Chicago, Oak Park - Review Filings, Discovery,
Preparation for Phone Conference; Legal Research -
Incorp. 3.8

10/28/08 Legal research - Incorporation Cases, Law Reviews
Review Hearing Memo 4.8

10/29/08 Legal Research - ICAV Memo, Incorp. Articles, Cases 3.8

10/30/08 Chicago -Oak Park - Review Brief Schedule
Teleconference Counsel; Legal Research; Preparation
of Memo -Incorporation 4.0

10/31/08 Legal Research; Preparation of Memo - Incorporation 5.2

11/3/08 Legal Research; Preparation of Brief - Incorporation 7.5

11/4/08 Legal Research; Preparation of Brief - Incorporation 6.8

11/5/08 Preparation of Brief - Incorporation; Review Briefs
in Presser, etc. 7.4

11/6/08 Winnetka - Review Status; Preparation of Brief; Legal
Research - Incorporation 0.3

11/7/08 Preparation of Brief - Incorporation; Review Jury Trial Issue
Winnepika - Review Status
[4.6 — delete .6 hour] 4.0

11/10/08 Legal Research - Incorp. 2.5

11/14/08 Chicago -Legal Research - Incorp. 2.8
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11/18/08 Legal Research - Incorp. 1.2

11/19/08 Chicago - Preparation of Incorp. Memo; Legal Research 2.8

11/20/08 Chicago - Review Amicus Brief Heller; Preparation of Memo 2.5

1 1/23/08 Chicago/Oak Park - E-mail on Briefs; Preparation of Brief;
Legal Research 1.4

11/24/08 Oak Park - Conference Call; Preparation of Brief 1.8

11/26/08 Preparation of Incorp. Memo - Chicago and Oak Park 4.5

11/29/08 Preparation of Incorp. Memo - Chicago 2.4

11/30/08 Preparation of Incorp. Memo 1.4

12/1/08 Preparation of Incorp. Memo 3.2

12/2/08 Review Chicago Status; Legal Research -New Heller Cases 1.2

12/3/08 Review Docket 0.2

12/4/08 Legal Research - Incorp.; Review Status; Phone Conference
with Counsel; Review Opinion; Preparation of Memo 2.5

12/8/08 Legal Research - Incorp.; Phone Conference with Counsel 3.8

12/9/08 Phone Conference with Counsel; Review Court Action 1.6

12/10/08 Review Motion to Withdraw Plaintiff 0.2

12/11/08 Review New Heller Cases 1.4

12/15/08 Review Proposed Order - Chicago, Oak Park
Preparation of Memo 1.5

12/16/08 Chicago, Oak Park - Review Proposed Order; Preparation
of Memo 2.5

12/17/08 Chicago -Phone Conference with Counsel -Order
Review Draft Order 0.5

7
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12/18/08 Review Filings - Chicago; Review Filings -Oak Park
E-mail Counsel - Appeals/Mootness 1.2

Subtotal: 178.8

Litigation in the Court of Appeals

12/19/08 Chicago - Review Orders, Transmittals
Oak Park - Review Orders, Transmittals 1.8

12/23/08 Phone Conference with W. Howard -Oak Park
Review Filings 0.5

12/24/08 Review Chicago Filings 0.5

12/26/08 Review Filings, Appeal Documents - Chicago, Oak Park
Legal Research - Incorporation 2.8

1/7/09 Review Appeal Status; Review Consolidation Issues 2.5

1/8/09 Preparation of Brief - Chicago 1.8

1/9/09 Review Mandates; Legal Research; Preparation of Brief - Chicago 4.0

1/11/09 Legal Research - Incorp.; Preparation of Brief - Chicago 3.4

1/13/09 Chicago - Conference Call; Review Motion to Consolidate
Preparation of Brief - Incorp.; Phone Conference with

N. Lund - Amicus 6.0

1/14/09 Chicago -Phone Conference with R. Cottrol - Amicus 0.3

1/16/08 Chicago - Review Appeal Rules; Review Opposition to
Consolidation, Preparation of Comments; Phone Conference

with Amici -CORE 4.2

1/18/09 Chicago -Legal Research 2.6

1/19/09 Chicago - Preparation of Brief; Phone Conference with Counsel

Review Consolidation Order 7.6

1/20/09 Preparation of Brief - Chicago 8.8
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1/21/09 Preparation of Brief; Legal Research - Chicago
Phone Conference with Counsel 9.4

1/22/09 Preparation of Brief; Legal Research - Chicago 7.2

1/23/09 Chicago: Review: MacDonald Brief (Dist. Ct.)
Legal Research 4.6

1/26/09 Legal Research; E-mail Amici Status 1.8

1/27/09 Chicago: Preparation of Brief, Edits; Preparation of Disclosure
Statement; E-mail Amicus, Consents 6.2

1/28/09 Chicago: E-mail Brief Filing, Amicus; Review: Final Brief
Review: MacDonald Brief 3.8

1/29/09 E-mail Amicus Requests; Legal Research; Review: Amicus
Brief - Heller 3.0

1/30/09 Review: Amicus Issues, Filing 0.6

2/1/09 Review: Lund Amicus Brief; Legal Research 0.8

2/2/09 Legal Research - Incorp.; Preparation of Memo
E-mail Amicus Issues 4.5

2/3/09 E-mail Amicus Matters; Legal Research - Incorp.,
Posner on Heller 2.6

2/4/09 Legal Research; Preparation of Memo - 7`h Cir. Judges Opinions

Review: Amicus Briefs 5.0

2/5/09 Review: Amicus Briefs 2.2

2/6/09 Legal Research - Incorp.; Review: Amicus Briefs 3.6

2/18/09 Review: Motion to Reschedule; E-mail 0.3

2/20/09 Review: Scheduling Order 0.2

2/23/09 Legal Research -New Cases 0.4

3/11/09 E-mail - Expedition 0.3
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3/12/09 E-mail - En Banc 0.5

3/17/09 E-mail - En Banc 0.5

3/18/09 Review Rules - En Banc; Preparation of Petition En Banc
Review: Extension Motion 3.6

3/20/09 Preparation of Petition En Banc; Legal Research 2.6

3/24/09 Preparation of En Banc Brief 4.5

3/25/09 Preparation of En Banc Petition; Review Order Extend Time 6.0

3/26/09 Preparation of En Banc Petition 3.2

3/30/09 Legal Research - Incorp.; Legal Research Pet. Cert.
Before Jud. 2.5
Legal Research - Petition Cert. Before Judgment 2.0

4/6/09 Review Motion - Exceed Page Limit; E-mail 0.3

4/7/09 Legal Research - Incorp.; Preparation of Memo 2.5

4/8/09 Legal Research; Preparation of Memo - Incorp. Cases
Preparation of Petition En Banc 3.6

4/9/09 Preparation of Reply Brief; Legal Research 4.2

4/10/09 Preparation of En Banc Petition; E-mail; Legal Research 2.8

4/17/09 Review: Chicago Brief; E-mail - Amicus Consents 2.8

4/18/09 Review: En Banc Filing; E-mail - Chicago Brief 2.2

4/20/09 Preparation of Reply Brief; Phone Conference with D.
Lehman, C. Michel; Legal Research - Nordyke 7.5

4/21/09 Legal Research; Preparation of Brief 2.4

4/22/09 Preparation of Brief; E-mail - En Banc Extension,
Coordination 9.0

4/23/09 Legal Research; Preparation of Brief; Preparation of Motion
For Extension 9.4

10
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4/24/09 Preparation of Brief; Legal Research 6.5

4/26/09 Preparation of Brief 3.2

4/27/09 Review: Hist. Amicus Brief 1.2

4/28/09 Preparation of Brief; Review: Brief Amicus Chicago
Board of Ed. 3.2

4/29/09 Review: Order; Review: Memos - Incorp.
Legal Research 2.4

4/30/09 E-mail -Oral Argument; Review: Orders, Chicago Letter
Legal Research; Preparation of Brief 6.4

5/1/09 Legal Research; Preparation of Brief 8.6

5/3/09 Review: Amicus Briefs; Preparation of Brief 7.5

5/4/09 Review: Amicus Briefs; Preparation of Brief 8.2

5/5/09 Preparation of Brief 6.2

5/6/09 Preparation of Brief 4.8

5/7/09 Preparation of Brief; Legal Research; Review: Order 4.5

5/8/09 E-mail - Argument, Moot Court.; Legal Research 2.5

5/11/09 E-mail -Moot Court; Legal Research 3.4

5/12/09 E-mail -Moot Court, Argument; Legal Research
Preparation of Brief 3.8

5/13/09 Preparation of Brief 2.8

5/14/09 Preparation of Reply Brief; Review: MacDonald Brief
Preparation for Moot Court 6.4

5/17/09 E-mail -Moot Court; Review: Briefs 3.5

5/18/09 Moot Court - MacDonald; Review: Briefs; Legal Research 8.2

11
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5/19/09 E-mail -Moot Court; Review: Briefs; Preparation for

Moot Court 5.6

5/20/09 Legal Research; Preparation for Moot Court; Review Briefs 6.2

5/21/09 Review Briefs; Legal Research; Moot Court 7.2

5/22/09 Preparation for Oral Argument; Legal Research

Review Briefs 6.5

5/24/09 Review Briefs; Legal Research; Preparation for Oral Argument 3.5

Excess Travel Time (reduced) 2.5

5/25/09 Preparation for Oral Argument; Conference with Counsel

Moot Court 12.0

5/26/09 Preparation for Oral Argument; Court - 7`b Cir.; Conference

with Counsel; E-mail Summary; Legal Research 7.5

Excess Travel Time (reduced) 2.0

5/27/09 Review Argument Transcript; Legal Research; Preparation

of Cert. Petition 6.8

5/28/09 Preparation of Cert. Petition 8.4

5/29/09 Preparation of Cert. Petition; Preparation of Appendix 6.8

6/1/09 Preparation of Appendix, Cert. Petition; Review: S.Ct. Rules 2.8

Subtotal: 346.5

Litigation in the Supreme Court

6/2/09 Review: 7`~ Cir. Opinion; Phone Conference with D. Lehman,

C. Conte; Preparation of Cert. Petition, Appendix 13.2

6/3/09 Review: E-mails - Cert. Petition; Phone Conference with D.

Lehman, R. Gardiner 1.4

6/4/09 Review: E-mails - Counsel Issues, Adverse Counsel,

Amicus, etc. 2.6

12
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6/5/09 Letter to [deletion of name, subject — attorney/client &attorney

work product privileged]; E-mail - Amicus Briefs 2.5

6/6/09 E-mail - Amicus Matters 1.0

6/8/09 Letter from Clerk; E-mail Adverse Counsel, Amici; Review

Petition; Legal Research - Cong. Globe; Phone Conference with

S. Jordan 3.5

6/9/09 Legal Research - Incorp.; Letter to Clerk; Review: MacDonald
Petition 3.5

6/10/09 Letter to Clerk; Legal Research - Heller Cases 3.4

6/11/09 Phone Conference with D. Lehman, R. Kozuch - Amicus;

E-mail - Amicus; Legal Research -All Heller Cases;
Preparation of Memo 5.6

6/12/09 Conference Call - Amici 0.4

6/15/09 Review: Amici Issues; Legal Research 1.4

6/16/09 Phone Conference with S. Jordan (AG), R. Kousch;

Legal Research -Fed. &State Heller Cases 3.5

6/17/09 Conference call - Amicus Briefs; Legal Research - Heller

Cases 1.4

6/19/09 E-mail - Amici 0.4

6/22/09 Review: Amicus Br. -Arms Keepers; Legal Research;

Preparation of Memo - Citizenship Cl., P&I 2.4

6/23/09 Legal Research - Incorp. Cases; Preparation of Memo; Review:

Heller Cases; Review: Letter Extension; E-mail 4.2

6/24/09 Review: Amicus Issues 1.2

6/25/09 Review: Amicus Issues; Legal Research - Incorp. Cases 2.6

6/26/09 Legal Research; Preparation of Memo - Protected Arms 1.2

6/29/08 Review: AG Draft; Preparation of Comments 1.8

13
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6/30/09 Review: Order Extension; Review: Rules; Review: Amicus
Issues, Costs; Preparation of Reply Memo 2.0

7/1/09 Legal Research - Heller Cases 0.8

7/2/09 Legal Research - Heller Cases; E-mail - Amicus 1.2

7/5/09 Review: Amicus Briefs; Phone Conference with R. Kousch,

CA AG; Preparation of Reply 6.8

7/6/09 Review: Amicus Briefs, Maloney Petition 7.6

7/8/09 Legal Research - Incorp. Cases; Preparation of Memo 5.5

7/9/09 Legal Research; Preparation of Memo - Incorp. Cases;
Review: Conflict Issue 8.2

7/10/09 Legal Research - Incorp. Cases; Preparation of Reply Brief 3.4

7/16/09 Legal Research - Incorp. Cases 1.5

7/20/09 Preparation of Reply Brief; Review: Incorp. Cases 7.2

7/21/09 Preparation of Reply Brief; Legal Research 4.2

7/22/09 Legal Research; Preparation of Reply Brief; Review: Amicus

Brief 3 • g

7/27/09 Preparation of Reply Brief; Legal Research 5.6

7/28/09 Legal Research; Preparation of Reply 2.2

7/29/09 Legal Research; Preparation of Reply Brief 6.4

7/30/09 Preparation of Reply Brief; Legal Research; Conference with

N. Lund (Amicus) 6.8

7/31/09 Review: Nordyke Materials; Preparation of Reply Brief; Legal

Research; Review: Rules 6.5

8/2/09 Preparation of Reply Brief; Review: Nordyke Impact 1.2

8/10/09 Review: Br. in Opposition; Preparation of Memo 3.4

14
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8/11/09 Preparation of Reply Brief; Legal Research; Review: Br.

in Opposition 7.4

8/12/09 Preparation of Reply Brief 8.2

8/13/09 Preparation of Reply Brief, Cert. Word Ct., Service List;
Phone Conference with Printer 4.2

8/14/09 Review: Filing; E-mail Service - Adverse Counsel 0.6

.. ._ ._ .-~~ - - - - -

C~)/~J~~1-\~h%l~lL•A►%l~J ~l~J~r IH~\t~l!~•

• • • • _ ~ .
IU/AIM' ~1~1~~~\tR~1T Il~J~P~J IR~J l~1 ~l~~l nl i~i~~~~1~93~n1~li~l~i~

• • • • ■

~iiw~~~i~~~~.iii r w~iui.at~.~iins~fw►~:iii i~.w~o~aiu:~.~~~~ .~uiya w~

Y//~y/~~►~~1~1~~~ \t~1.1~~1~J 11~~M~7•~r ~~l~Jll~l~~l~l~l~UJ~l~1~l~UJ~l~16 1

t t - _ ~ . t t - ~ ~ ~

~ •
~~NJ ~l~~1~J~~l~J l~l llR~f•~%~~~~~A ~L~f~1~~r 1~ •

t t

• • • ~ t t _
• f 1 • ~ ~

■~ • • 1

• • • t ~
1 t- t~ 1 • t t

15

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-2 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 16 of 31 PageID #:1636



• • . _ . -
~ ~ ~ ~ -- - ~

:~~i.~n~ianr.~r.~et~naii~i~~i.~ i~.i

~u~i.~r~ir—~1~1~1~\<~h1~~1911~~M~T~RS~I~JII~I~i~~i.~~rnnr~~~R~i~nwii =~i

.. . _
~~~//~l~~I~—R~l~~~\t~ll~ll~l~~~a.~~r.~r•~eiin ~i~~~ni.~

■uii~[i~~ir~R~t{~~►~.f.1:r:~~e~~iai~r.~r:~~ii~~a~~~i~~►.~ i~w

~ ~~/Iij/~i~r— R~l~l• ~ ~ \1~J.1K I1 11 A ~ l~J ~! ~ r.~7l~1I l~l ~ it ~ l'•J ~A~

• • • ~ ~ - ~ ■

~~I/I~ir—~L~l={•~~►1~}.1~Il~l1A ~l'1~r ~r ~~l~Jll~l~il~NJ ~~~

~~Il~1l~I~R~_i•~~~~•lirei~~~iai rr.~ree►in ~i~~iJ~l~l!!lt ~

~ • •
~~lU1l~l~lUOl~J I~l IlR7L'11~1~~1~1!I~Al~I— • •

• • • • ■ _ ~ -
~ • • ~ 1 t ■ •

16

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-2 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 17 of 31 PageID #:1637



.. - . .:
._~~ :. - .: -

~uw~~~r-\t~l%NfL•A~l~l~l~~/r~~R~7~~➢~~f:~~~~ii~r.~r~~~~na~~~~ir.~■ w.

. • . .

~ - -

~uv~ir~raur•~~~R~ri•~~►~.r~.r•.~an~►~:~ii:~.wu~~~u~w~i~n:~e =~i

. .. ._ . ._
■~~i[~~~~r \lA%PI~A~I~M~.7~~1~J~~~~~l~l~~~.7~~1~{.~~►t~fls- ll~Ji_ _ wail

~I/~l~~I~\tti%l~l~/~i\~~IPIlA7~l~l'~f A7~~l~l~T~r~~IU ~IU ~UI~I~~I~ ~~~J

~1/~1~/~~I~-\l~l%l~l~l~3~~~I l~l~A7U~l~J ~.7~~l~J ~I•Ir~~lU lt~l~\%l~J~~UI~R~l~l•.~~\l~hl~~l9~i"i~~l

• • • ~
~ - t . t t 1 - ■ ' ~

■ ■
It J'!l ~

• • • ~ •
•~wiw~~r~~airr.~r.~~i~~~a~~~iia.~~~ir.\~~~►~lAn~l{_q~\tT1R[11~J~ --

• • _ _ • _ _

• t • ~ ~7
t •{.~~\t.I.1KIl~l1A\l~l•Ily4I~Il~1~~R~.7~t~J~~~l f•1l Al ~U

• • • ~ ~ -
• •- t~ t 1 t t~ t 1

~ _
t t 1 ■ ~

17

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-2 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 18 of 31 PageID #:1638



.. .. ._
~~wi~~~~r~i ■ .~rS~lU~l~l~►iiin►i~►~ tR~neie~eiietin~n~in~~►~yi►ti~w~rn~~~

• • . . . .

~ : ~ ~
. _

• • ~ • ~ .

_ • •
~: ~ ~ ~

• • • • ~ - ~

~ i ~ -

• • . - ~

._ - ~

• • • ~ ~ _ ~ .

~~~~1~11~1.7~~1~1{~~\\~ll~~l~l~of: i~\~~I~~~I.7iU~ ~lwJ

• ~ ~ ~ ■ _ Plli7l~i~R~l~-
~ 1 - 

_ _ _ _ _ ~ . t t ■ ~

~ _

• ■ ~ ~~~
~ •{.~~\t~A1T ~l~J1A~l~J ~T lft~l~l~l~l~\%I~JOI~ ~A~

~ • ~ ~ ■
• ~ • ~ t _ - - ~ 1 t

t ~ • • t ~- ~ • • • '\ ■ t

• • ■ ~ • ~~`
III/l~—\t~l%I~ILA~J~IIS R~~I ~l~l~lA ~l~J ~rlr ~~lUl l~l~\\~lU\ ~~II

• • • _ _ • - ■
1 t - t~ t 1 t t ~ 1 t

- ~ ■
'\ ~ - t • •

~ • • • _ ~ .
~ • 1 t ~ 1 1 ■

■
- ~ •

• • ~ • _ t ~
1 1 t~ • • t t •

~ t ~
~L~1L%~l SRS \t~l%l~I~A~I!J~ t 1

• • • _ ~ •
■Ir/I~~—\t~l%I~P~I~~I~J~M~\l~li~l.7~~'D ~~r~~Q~1,~ ~ ~ — ~-~

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-2 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 19 of 31 PageID #:1639



.. ~ - ~ ■- .:

.. _ _ ..- .. -

.:

z
~i~cv~~i~R.i~~~►~:ri~r•~a n~►~yiiti.w►~.~av~ini.~ ~

• . . .- •
~ ~ • i ~ - -

• . ~ ~
t ~ i - - - - - - - -

wwuai~~1~1~~~\t~Al~ll~J~l~~tl~J~l~~1U~~1~11~1~1R~f7%~~1~►wi~i~.~i.~ ~:~

• . . •
r ~ ~ ~ - ~

~~
►w~ ri~~ ~i~ ra ~ ~_r..~ ~ oii i~ti~~R~n ~ ~~ R.~~a ~ ►~.rira i~ ~ o~ii.~~r wiy: w►~

•

19

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-2 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 20 of 31 PageID #:1640



- >

~~~ ~ 
T_'____

Ur~~f'~~'~DQG1CG~i' V.V

Subtotal: 589.7

Litigation on Remand to the District Court: Fee Liability

6/29/10 Review of Opinion; Preparation of Memo 4.2

6/30/10 Review of Opinion, Comments; Email 2.4

7/1/10 Email
Review of Opinion, Bills Proposed 2.2

7/2/10 Review of Chicago Action; Email 1.4

7/7/10 Review of Ordinance; Review of Commentaries
Review of Decision 3.0

7/13/10 Review of Attorney Fee Recovery Issues 1.4

7/17/10 Review of Attorney Fee Issues
Preparation of Memo 3.2

7/19/10 Phone Conference with Counsel - Attorney Fee Issues
Legal Research; Review of Rules - Remand Issues 5.4

7/20/10 Legal Research; Preparation of Memo - Prevailing Party 3.0

7/27/10 Legal Research - Attorney's Fees; Preparation of Memo 3.2

7/28/10 Preparation of Memo - Attorney's Fees 3.4

7/30/10 Preparation of Memo - Attorney's Fees, Review of Judgment 3.0
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8/2/10 Review of 7~' Circuit Rules, Review of Judgment
Review Order Rule 54 1.0

8/3/10 Legal Research, Drafting -Rule 54 Statement
Legal Research - Attorneys Fees 4.2

8/5/10 Email Costs, Statement to 7"' Cir., Legal Research

Preparation of Memo - Attorney Fee Issues 3.2

8/11/10 Email -Rule 54, Legal Research -Fee Issues
Preparation of Memo 2.8

8/12/10 Legal Research, Preparation of Memo -Fees 4.5

8/16/10 Legal Research -Fee Calculation, Email -Rule 54 3.8

8/17/10 Email -Rule 54 Statement, Legal Research -Fees/Rates
Preparation of Brief - Attorney Fee Motion 4.5

8/18/10 Preparation of Brief -Fees
Review of Fee Petition/Cases Re: Chicago &Oak Park 5.0

8/19/10 Email -Rule 54
Legal Research -Oak Park &Chicago § 1983 cases 3.6

8/20/10 Review of Fee Petitions - N. D. Ill. 2.8

8/25/10 Review of Chicago -Rule 54 Statement, Email

Review of Remand Order, Jud. Email 1.4

8/26/10 Review of Local Rules, Preparation of Memo

Review of McD. Rule 54 Statement 2.6

8/30/10 Review of Local Rules, Order, Legal Research
Preparation of Brief -Fees 3.2

8/31/10 Email -Fee issues 3.2

9/1/10 Legal Research, Preparation of Memo -Fee Rates

Email - Scheduling, Confer 2.6

9/2/10 Preparation of Fees Memo, Email 1.2
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9/7/10 Review of Bill of Costs 0.2

9/9/10 Email, Review of Bill of Costs - 7`~ Cir. 0.2

9/13/10 Letter from Chicago -Costs
Legal Research, Preparation of Memo - "prevailing party" 2.5

9/16/10 Review of Mandate, Costs 0.2

9/20/10 Review of Remand documents 0.8

9/27/10 Legal Research, Preparation of Fee Petition, Declaration 4.6

9/28/10 Preparation of Declaration, Brief -Fees, Email
Review of Rules -Fees 3.2

9/29/10 Preparation of Declaration, Petition -Fees
Legal Research -Fee Calculation 7.2

10/8/10 Email, Phone Conference with Counsel -Entry Order
Preparation of Fee Petition 1.2

10/12/10 Email - Clerk, Review of Orders, Rules 0.6

10/13/10 Review of Local Rules - Scheduling, Email -Fees
Phone Conference with D. Dooley, Review of Time Sheets 3.2

10/14/10 Email -Date Conf. Call with Chicago and O.P.
Review of Time Sheets 1.4

10/18/10 Review of Fee issues, coordination, Time Sheets 2.2

10/20/10 Email - Schedule Tel. Con£ 0.3

10/21/10 Prepare for Tel. Conference, Review of Local Rules
Review of Time Sheets, Legal Research - Jurisdiction
Phone Conference with Counsel, Adverse Counsel 6.6

10/22/10 Review of Motions - Scheduling Orders, Email
Legal Research - Jurisdiction, Prevailing Party 0.6

10/25/10 Legal Research-"Judgment" (re Chicago argument none entered),
motions, Preparation of Memo, Con£ Call with Counsel 8.2
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10/26/10 Preparation for Hearing, Court Hearing - Schedule
Legal Research - Prevailing Party, Preparation of Memo 6.4

10/19/10 Review of Local Rules -Draft Agenda, Email -Tel. Con£ 1.2

10/27/10 Legal Research, Preparation of Memo - Prevailing Party
Review of Ordinance 4.8

10/28/10 Review of Ordinance, Legal Research
Preparation of Memo - Prevailing Party 2.2

10/29/10 Preparation of Memo - Prevailing Party 2.4

11/1/10 Review of Chicago Brief, S.Ct. Rule 54 Statements
Preparation of Memo - Prevailing Party 4.8

11/2/10 Legal Research, Preparation of Memo - Prevailing Party 3.5

11/4/10 Phone Conference with Counsel - Extension, Email 0.5

11/5/10 Phone Conference with Counsel, Email - extension
Legal Research, Preparation of Memo 1.0

11/10/10 Review of Motions/Extensions 0.5

11/12/10 Review of Order - Extension 0.2

11/13/10 Conference with Counsel - Council debate, fee issues 0.6

11/18/10 Review of Committee Hearings, Preparation of Brief Fees
Council debate - Repeal ordinance 2.8

11/19/10 Preparation of Brief - Legislative History 0.5

11/29/10 Review of Proceedings -Oak Park &Chicago Repeals
Preparation of Brief 3.6

11/30/10 Preparation of Brief, Review of Rules, Legal Research-new cases 3.2

12/3/10 Review of Comments, Preparation of Brief 2.4

12/7/10 Preparation of Brief -Fees, Preparation of Appendix 1.8
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12/8/10 Preparation of Brief -fees, Legal Research 4.2

12/9/10 Preparation of Brief, Review of Comments
Review of Declarations 2.8

12/10/10 Preparation of Brief, Email, Preparation of App. 2.8

12/15/10 Review of Briefs in Opposition 1.6

12/16/10 Review of Briefs in Opposition, Preparation of Memo
Legal Research 1.5

12/17/10 Legal Research - Chicago case cites, Preparation of Memo 2.8

12/21/10 Preparation for Hearing, Court Hearing,
Legal Research - Chicago cites, Phone Conference with Counsel 2.4

12/22/10 Review of Opinion, Preparation of Memo 1.6

12/23/10 Review of Opinion, Email - Appeal
Phone Conference with Counsel 0.8

12/27/10 Review of Notice of Appeal, Email 1.2

Subtotal: 192.7

Litigation in the Court of Appeals on Fee Liability

12/28/10 Review of McDonald Fee Motion
Review of Docket, Transmittals 1.6

12/30/10 Review of Filings 0.5

1/3/11 Review of Docketing Statement, Review of Brief Schedule
Phone Conference with Counsel 0.8

1/4/11 Preparation of Appeal Brief, Review of Order - McDonald
Review of Docketing Statements 1.5

1/7/11 Review of Appeal Filings 0.6

1/8/11 Review of Order Briefing, Filings, Email
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Review of Supp. to Opinion 0.8

1/10/11 Legal Research, Preparation of Brief 1.4

1/11/11 Review of Disclosure, Preparation of Appeal Brief 4.5

1/12/11 Legal Research, Preparation of Brief 4.2

1/19/11 Review of Filing - Transmittal, Legal Research

Preparation of Appeal Brief 3.2

1/20/11 Legal Research, Prepare Brief 2.8

1/24/11 Legal Research, Prepare Brief

Phone Conference, Email Counsel -App. 8.0

1/31/11 Legal Research -Other Jurisdictions, Remands 2.0

2/3/11 Prepare Brief 0.6

2/4/11 Email - Counsel (App., McDonald), Review McDonald Brief 0.4

2/7/11 Phone Conference with Counsel-App. 0.2

2/8/11 Email - Amici 0.1

2/10/11 Review of Brief Drafts, App., Email 2.2

2/11/11 Prepare Brief 4.2

2/12/11 Prepare Brief 2.4

2/17/11 Review of McDonald Brief, Email 1.0

2/24/11 Legal Research - Vacatur 1.0

3/10/11 Review of Motion to Extend Time, Email 0.2

3/15/11 Review of Scheduling 0.2

4/4/11 Review of Ezell Argument - 7`~ Cir. 1.0

4/8/11 Review of Chicago briefs 1.6
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4/11/11 Review of Motion for Extension, Email 0.2

4/12/11 Review of Order Reschedule 0.2

4/15/11 Legal Research -new cases 1.2

4/22/11 Review of Notice 0.1

4/25/11 Legal Research -new cases 0.5

5/1/11 Review of Chicago Brief 2.2

5/2/11 Review of Chicago Brief, Preparation of Memo 4.6

5/3/11 Preparation of Reply Brief, Legal Research 6.2

5/4/11 Preparation of Brief, Preparation of Disclosure Statements 5.8

5/5/11 Preparation of Brief 6.0

5/6/11 Preparation of Reply Brief 6.4

5/12/11 Preapration of Reply Brief, Email Counsel 3.5

5/13/11 Finalize Reply Brief 1.2

5/16/11 Review of McDonald Brief 0.6

5/27/11 Legal research -new case 1.2

6/2/11 Review of Opinion, Email 1.0

Subtotal: 87.9

Litigation in the District Court on Reasonable Fees

6/6/11 Email - Counsel, Legal Research - deadlines
Review of Rules, Prior Memos, Compile time sheets
Preparation of Memo 5.8

6/7/11 Legal Research - Atty. Fee cases 1.2

6/8/11 Preparation of Memo for Counsel -Legal Research requirements

Case: 1:08-cv-03697 Document #: 137-2 Filed: 07/10/12 Page 27 of 31 PageID #:1647



Preparation of Memo - Caselaw Fees 3.5

6/9/11 Legal Research - Laffey Matrix 1.8

6/13/11 Review of Bill of Costs 0.1

6/14/11 Legal Research -Fee Calculation, Preparation of Memo

Review of N.D.IL Fee Cases 4.2

6/15/11 Legal Research, Preparation of Memo -Fee Calculation
(Cumberland Cases), Email - Compile Records 2.8

6/21/11 Legal Research -Fee Issues 1.4

6/22/11 Legal Research, Preparation of Memo 5.2

6/23/11 Legal Research, Preparation of Memo - Yrs. Calculated 2.5

6/24/11 Review of Mandate, Email 0.3

6/27/11 Legal Research, Preparation of Memo -fees, Review of deadlines 3.2

6/30/11 Review of scheduling, Legal Research, Preparation of memo-fees

Compile Counsel Info., Phone Conference with Counsel -

Plan confer. w/adverse counsel 5.2

7/1/11 Email Comments, Revise fee memo 1.4

7/7/11 Email Scheduling, Review of Counsel Declarations, Billings 1.5

7/8/11 Email Scheduling, Review of Counsel Resumes 0.8

7/12/11 Review of Fee Records, Email -Tel. Con£ 1.2

7/13/11 Review of Declarations, Attorneys Telecon. Counsel-Scheduling

Review of Local Rules, Drafts, Motion 2.2

7/14/11 Review of Orders, Email, Review of Declarations 1.2

7/18/11 Preparation of Declaration 1.2
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7/19/11 Summarize Exhibits - Clement, Email Counsel 3.6

7/20/11 Review of Counsel Documents 1.2

7/22/11 Preparation of Answer - Attorney Summaries 2.5

6/21/11 Legal Research -Fee Issues 1.4

6/22/11 Legal Research, Preparation of Memo 5.2

6/23/11 Legal Research, Preparation of Memo - Yrs. Calculated 2.5

6/24/11 Review of Mandate, Email 0.3

6/27/11 Legal Research, Preparation of Memo -fees, Review of deadlines 3.2

6/30/11 Review of scheduling, Legal Research, Preparation of memo-fees
Compile Counsel Info., Phone Conference with Counsel -
Plan confer. w/adverse counsel 5.2

7/1/11 Email Comments, Revise fee memo 1.4

7/7/11 Email Scheduling, Review of Counsel Declarations, Billings 1.5

7/8/11 Email Scheduling, Review of Counsel Resumes 0.8

7/12/11 Review of Fee Records, Email -Tel. Con£ 1.2

7/13/11 Review of Declarations, Attorneys Telecon. Counsel-Scheduling
Review of Local Rules, Drafts, Motion 2.2

7/14/11 Review of Orders, Email, Review of Declarations 1.2

7/18/11 Preparation of Declaration 1.2

7/19/11 Summarize Exhibits - Clement, Email Counsel 3.6

7/20/11 Review of Counsel Documents 1.2

7/22/ 11 Preparation of Answer - Attorney Summaries 2.5

7/25/11 Summarize Attorney Services 1.6
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7/26/11 Prepare Time Sheets, Email Counsel, Legal Research -new case
Review of Documents, Fee Rates 3.2

7/27/11 Review of Counsel Documents, Preparation of Declaration,
Resume 2.8

7/28/11 Phone Conference with Counsel - Records
Prepare, Review Declarations, Preparation of Exhibits 4.2

8/1/11 Review of Declarations &Exhibits, Preparation of Notice
Review of Costs Issue - Appeal 2.6

8/2/11 Review &Compile Declarations and Exhibits
Email Counsel, Review of Rules 3.0

8/3/11 Review, Compile Exhibits, Declarations
Preparation of Declarations 4.0

8/4/11 Preparation of Declaration, Phone Conference with Counsel
Review, Compile all Documents for Submission 5.2

8/5/11 Phone Conference with Local Counsel
Review of Submissions, Replace File 1.2

8/8/11 Review of Services 0.1

9/8/11 Email - dates, discovery 0.2

9/9/11 Review of Extension Motions 0.3

9/13/11 Review of Minute Entry, Calendar 0.2

9/20/11 Review of McDonald Jt. Stat., Submissions 0.4

9/22/11 Review of McDonald Filings, Email 0.3

9/27/11 Review of Chicago -Oak Park Records
Letter to Counsel -Next Stages 1.8

9/30/11 Review of Chicago -Oak Park Submissions 1.6

10/12/11 Review of Rules, Email - Objections Due 0.6
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10/14/11 Email - Extension 0.2

10/18/11 Review of Motions Extension, Docket, Email 0.3

10/20/11 Review of Filings - Extension 0.2

10/28/11 Review of Fee Objections, Email Counsel 1.2

11/2/11 Review of Objections, Preparation of Memo
Preparation of Joint Statement 7.2

11/3/11 Prepare Joint Statement 8.2

11/4/11 Prepare Joint Statement 2.6

11/8/11 Review of Fees Breakdowns, Prepare Joint Statement 1.8

11/9/11 Prepare Joint Statement 3.2

11/11/11 Prepare Joint Statement -Firms 5.6

Subtotal: 152.4

Grand Total Hours 1,629.0

Less stricken hours - 427.8
(8/15/09 through 6/28/10)

Total Hours Allowed 1,201.2

Hourly Rate Allowed x $450.00

Total Attorney's Fees $540,540.00

Expenses + 5,799.99

Grand Total $546,339.99
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