1	Anna M. Dawin, CDN 269729	E-FILED
2	Anna M. Barvir, SBN 268728 MICHEL & ASSOCIATES, P.C. 180 East Ocean Blvd., Suite 200	3/27/2017 4:42:58 PM
3	Long Beach, CA 90802 Telephone: (562) 216-4444	FRESNO COUNTY SUPERIOR COURT By: C. Cogburn, Deputy
4	Fax: (562) 216-4445 Email: abarvir@michellawyers.com	
5	Attorney for Plaintiffs and Petitioners	
6		
7		
8	IN THE SUPERIOR COURT O	F THE STATE OF CALIFORNIA
9	FOR THE COU	NTY OF FRESNO
10	SHERIFF CLAY PARKER, TEHAMA COUNTY SHERIFF; HERB BAUER	Case No. 10CECG02116
11	SPORTING GOODS; CALIFORNIA RIFLE AND PISTOL ASSOCIATION	DECLARATION OF HAYDEE VILLEGAS IN SUPPORT OF
12	FOUNDATION; ABLE'S SPORTING, INC.; RTG SPORTING COLLECTIBLES, LLC;	PLAINTIFFS' MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES ON APPEAL;
13	AND STEVEN STONECIPHER,	EXHIBIT A
14	Plaintiffs and Petitioners,	Judge: Jeffrey Y. Hamilton Dept.: 402
15	VS.	Date: May 31, 2017 Time: 3:30 PM
16	THE STATE OF CALIFORNIA; KAMALA D.	
17	HARRIS, in her official capacity as Attorney General for the State of California; THE	
18	CALIFORNIA DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE; and DOES 1-25,	
19	Defendants and Respondents.	Action Filed: June 17, 2010
20 21		
22		
23		
24		
25		
26		
27		
28		

DECLARATION OF HAYDEE VILLEGAS

to this matter, and I routed that report to Anna M. Barvir, the Responsible Attorney in this matter,

who together determined which further hours and tasks would not be included as part of Plaintiffs'

27

EXHIBIT A



Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate	Α	mount
5/3/2011	Michel	Multiple meetings with CBM and SAB re litigation strategy re appeal and fee motion.	0.20	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
5/11/2011	Nunez	Receipt, review and analyze Appellants Notice Designating Record on Appeal.	0.40	\$ 125.00	\$	50.00
5/11/2011	Nunez	Start drafting Respondents Notice Designating Record on Appeal.	0.40	\$ 125.00	\$	50.00
		<u> </u>		·		
		Meeting with CA re designation of record on appeal; discuss which documents to designate,				
5/16/2011	Barvir	what forms necessary to file, and whether we should be filing anything at all.	0.30	\$ 225.00	\$	67.50
		Review file; pull docket from court website and determine which documents to prepare for				
5/16/2011	Barvir	designation of the record.	1.00	\$ 225.00	\$	225.00
		Draft email memorandum of findings of legal research re Respondents' designation of record				
		on appeal; send email memorandum to CBM for review; telephone conference with CBM re				
5/16/2011	Barvir	the same.	0.40	\$ 225.00	\$	90.00
		Meeting with CBM re designation of record on appeal; discuss which documents to designate				
5/16/2011	Barvir	and findings of research.	0.30	\$ 225.00	\$	67.50
5/16/2011	Barvir	Conduct legal research re Respondents' designation of record on appeal.	2.50	\$ 225.00	\$	562.50
5/16/2011	Nunez	Meeting with CBM and AB regarding Respondents Record on Appeal Deadline.	0.30	\$ 125.00	\$	37.50
5/18/2011	Barvir	Send/receive email to/from CBM re status of designating record on appeal.	0.10	\$ 225.00	\$	22.50
		Analyze requirements re designation of record on appeal and determine portions of record to		·		
5/19/2011	Monfort	designate.	1.00	\$ 325.00	Ś	325.00
		Review letter from Court of Appeals re State of California's Notice of Appeal; discuss request				
6/6/2011	Monfort	for billing entries with CA and AB.	0.30	\$ 325.00	\$	97.50
6/17/2011	Monfort	Review scheduling stipulation and e-mail opposing counsel and CA re same.		\$ 325.00		65.00
0, 11, 1011		Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding granting opposing counsel extension of time to file		7	T	
6/17/2011	Nunez	Opening Brief.	0.20	\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
7/7/2011	Michel	Review and analyze information from CA re status of case, filing dates and deadlines.	0.80	\$ 450.00	\$	360.00
7/8/2011	Michel	Conference with CBM re appeal of Order on Costs.	0.20	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
7,0,2011		Review appeal of Order on Costs and draft e-mail to opposing counsel re same and discuss	0.20	ψ 150100	Υ	30.00
7/8/2011	Monfort	with CDM.	0.40	\$ 325.00	Ś	130.00
		Meeting with SAB, AMB, and CBM re whether				
7/15/2011	Michel		0.50	\$ 450.00	\$	225.00
				· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		
		Legal research re whether mootness of claims via pending legislation requires dismissal where				
		award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB re				
7/15/2011	Monfort	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB re research applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of	2.70	\$ 325.00	\$	877.50
7/15/2011	Monfort	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB recessors research applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same.	2.70	\$ 325.00	\$	877.50
		award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB received research applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule				
7/15/2011	Monfort Monfort	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB received research applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award.		\$ 325.00 \$ 325.00		877.50 130.00
7/18/2011	Monfort	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB received applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for	0.40	\$ 325.00	\$	130.00
		award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB received research applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award.	0.40		\$	
7/18/2011	Monfort	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB received applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for extension of Time to file Briefs. Print out for CBM to review and sign.	0.40	\$ 325.00	\$	130.00
7/18/2011	Monfort	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB recessarch applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for extension of Time to file Briefs. Print out for CBM to review and sign. Further research re potential mootness of Defendants' claims in light of SB 124 and SB 427;	0.40	\$ 325.00	\$	130.00
7/18/2011	Monfort Nunez	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB recessarch applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for extension of Time to file Briefs. Print out for CBM to review and sign. Further research re potential mootness of Defendants' claims in light of SB 124 and SB 427; determine impact of mootness on merits appeal in light of Defendatnts' intentions to litigate	0.40	\$ 325.00 \$ 125.00	\$	130.00 37.50
7/18/2011	Monfort	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB recessarch applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for extension of Time to file Briefs. Print out for CBM to review and sign. Further research re potential mootness of Defendants' claims in light of SB 124 and SB 427;	0.40	\$ 325.00	\$	130.00
7/18/2011 7/20/2011 7/31/2011	Monfort Nunez Monfort	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB recessarch applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for extension of Time to file Briefs. Print out for CBM to review and sign. Further research re potential mootness of Defendants' claims in light of SB 124 and SB 427; determine impact of mootness on merits appeal in light of Defendatnts' intentions to litigate appeal for purposes of Plaintiffs anticipated award of attorneys fees.	0.40 0.30	\$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 325.00	\$ \$	130.00 37.50 552.50
7/18/2011	Monfort Nunez	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB recessarch applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for extension of Time to file Briefs. Print out for CBM to review and sign. Further research re potential mootness of Defendants' claims in light of SB 124 and SB 427; determine impact of mootness on merits appeal in light of Defendatnts' intentions to litigate appeal for purposes of Plaintiffs anticipated award of attorneys fees. Meeting with CBM regarding possible extension to defendants Opening Brief deadline.	0.40 0.30	\$ 325.00 \$ 125.00	\$ \$	130.00 37.50
7/18/2011 7/20/2011 7/31/2011	Monfort Nunez Monfort	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB recessarch applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for extension of Time to file Briefs. Print out for CBM to review and sign. Further research re potential mootness of Defendants' claims in light of SB 124 and SB 427; determine impact of mootness on merits appeal in light of Defendants' intentions to litigate appeal for purposes of Plaintiffs anticipated award of attorneys fees. Meeting with CBM regarding possible extension to defendants Opening Brief deadline. Receipt, review and analyze Stipulations Re: Second Extension of Time to File Opening Briefs	0.40 0.30	\$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 325.00	\$ \$	130.00 37.50 552.50
7/18/2011 7/20/2011 7/31/2011 9/7/2011	Monfort Monfort Nunez	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB recessarch applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for extension of Time to file Briefs. Print out for CBM to review and sign. Further research re potential mootness of Defendants' claims in light of SB 124 and SB 427; determine impact of mootness on merits appeal in light of Defendants' intentions to litigate appeal for purposes of Plaintiffs anticipated award of attorneys fees. Meeting with CBM regarding possible extension to defendants Opening Brief deadline. Receipt, review and analyze Stipulations Re: Second Extension of Time to File Opening Briefs for both Appeal cases. Print out for CDM signature, scan, save and email to opposing counsel	0.40 0.30 1.70 0.10	\$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 125.00	\$ \$ \$	130.00 37.50 552.50 12.50
7/18/2011 7/20/2011 7/31/2011	Monfort Nunez Monfort	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB recessarch applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for extension of Time to file Briefs. Print out for CBM to review and sign. Further research re potential mootness of Defendants' claims in light of SB 124 and SB 427; determine impact of mootness on merits appeal in light of Defendants' intentions to litigate appeal for purposes of Plaintiffs anticipated award of attorneys fees. Meeting with CBM regarding possible extension to defendants Opening Brief deadline. Receipt, review and analyze Stipulations Re: Second Extension of Time to File Opening Briefs for both Appeal cases. Print out for CDM signature, scan, save and email to opposing counsel for filling.	0.40 0.30 1.70 0.10	\$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 325.00	\$ \$ \$	130.00 37.50 552.50
7/18/2011 7/20/2011 7/31/2011 9/7/2011	Monfort Nunez Monfort Nunez	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB recessarch applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for extension of Time to file Briefs. Print out for CBM to review and sign. Further research re potential mootness of Defendants' claims in light of SB 124 and SB 427; determine impact of mootness on merits appeal in light of Defendants' intentions to litigate appeal for purposes of Plaintiffs anticipated award of attorneys fees. Meeting with CBM regarding possible extension to defendants Opening Brief deadline. Receipt, review and analyze Stipulations Re: Second Extension of Time to File Opening Briefs for both Appeal cases. Print out for CDM signature, scan, save and email to opposing counsel for filing. Meeting with CDM, CBM, SAB, and BR; discuss	0.40 0.30 1.70 0.10	\$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 125.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	130.00 37.50 552.50 12.50
7/18/2011 7/20/2011 7/31/2011 9/7/2011	Monfort Monfort Nunez	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB recessarch applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for extension of Time to file Briefs. Print out for CBM to review and sign. Further research re potential mootness of Defendants' claims in light of SB 124 and SB 427; determine impact of mootness on merits appeal in light of Defendants' intentions to litigate appeal for purposes of Plaintiffs anticipated award of attorneys fees. Meeting with CBM regarding possible extension to defendants Opening Brief deadline. Receipt, review and analyze Stipulations Re: Second Extension of Time to File Opening Briefs for both Appeal cases. Print out for CDM signature, scan, save and email to opposing counsel for filling.	0.40 0.30 1.70 0.10	\$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 125.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	130.00 37.50 552.50 12.50
7/18/2011 7/20/2011 7/31/2011 9/7/2011	Monfort Nunez Monfort Nunez	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB recessarch applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for extension of Time to file Briefs. Print out for CBM to review and sign. Further research re potential mootness of Defendants' claims in light of SB 124 and SB 427; determine impact of mootness on merits appeal in light of Defendatnts' intentions to litigate appeal for purposes of Plaintiffs anticipated award of attorneys fees. Meeting with CBM regarding possible extension to defendants Opening Brief deadline. Receipt, review and analyze Stipulations Re: Second Extension of Time to File Opening Briefs for both Appeal cases. Print out for CDM signature, scan, save and email to opposing counsel for filing. Meeting with CDM, CBM, SAB, and BR; discuss discuss related litigation strategy.	0.40 0.30 1.70 0.10	\$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 125.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	130.00 37.50 552.50 12.50
7/18/2011 7/20/2011 7/31/2011 9/7/2011 9/8/2011 9/12/2011	Monfort Nunez Monfort Nunez Nunez Barvir	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB recessarch applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for extension of Time to file Briefs. Print out for CBM to review and sign. Further research re potential mootness of Defendants' claims in light of SB 124 and SB 427; determine impact of mootness on merits appeal in light of Defendatnts' intentions to litigate appeal for purposes of Plaintiffs anticipated award of attorneys fees. Meeting with CBM regarding possible extension to defendants Opening Brief deadline. Receipt, review and analyze Stipulations Re: Second Extension of Time to File Opening Briefs for both Appeal cases. Print out for CDM signature, scan, save and email to opposing counsel for filing. Meeting with CDM, CBM, SAB, and BR; discuss discuss related litigation strategy. Meeting with CDM, CBM, BR and AB; discussion re:	0.40 0.30 1.70 0.10 0.60	\$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 125.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	130.00 37.50 552.50 12.50 75.00 22.50
7/18/2011 7/20/2011 7/31/2011 9/7/2011	Monfort Nunez Monfort Nunez	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB recessarch applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for extension of Time to file Briefs. Print out for CBM to review and sign. Further research re potential mootness of Defendants' claims in light of SB 124 and SB 427; determine impact of mootness on merits appeal in light of Defendants' intentions to litigate appeal for purposes of Plaintiffs anticipated award of attorneys fees. Meeting with CBM regarding possible extension to defendants Opening Brief deadline. Receipt, review and analyze Stipulations Re: Second Extension of Time to File Opening Briefs for both Appeal cases. Print out for CDM signature, scan, save and email to opposing counsel for filing. Meeting with CDM, CBM, SAB, and BR; discuss discuss related litigation strategy. Meeting with CDM, CBM, BR and AB; discussion re:	0.40 0.30 1.70 0.10 0.60	\$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 125.00	\$ \$ \$ \$	130.00 37.50 552.50 12.50
7/18/2011 7/20/2011 7/31/2011 9/7/2011 9/8/2011 9/12/2011	Monfort Nunez Monfort Nunez Nunez Barvir Brady	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB re research applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for extension of Time to file Briefs. Print out for CBM to review and sign. Further research re potential mootness of Defendants' claims in light of SB 124 and SB 427; determine impact of mootness on merits appeal in light of Defendants' intentions to litigate appeal for purposes of Plaintiffs anticipated award of attorneys fees. Meeting with CBM regarding possible extension to defendants Opening Brief deadline. Receipt, review and analyze Stipulations Re: Second Extension of Time to File Opening Briefs for both Appeal cases. Print out for CDM signature, scan, save and email to opposing counsel for filing. Meeting with CDM, CBM, SAB, and BR; discuss discuss related litigation strategy. Meeting with CDM, CBM, BR and AB; discussion re: and Meeting with AMB, CBM, SAB, and BR; discussion re:	0.40 0.30 1.70 0.10 0.60 0.10	\$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 250.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	130.00 37.50 552.50 12.50 75.00 75.00
7/18/2011 7/20/2011 7/31/2011 9/7/2011 9/8/2011 9/12/2011	Monfort Nunez Monfort Nunez Nunez Barvir	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB re research applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for extension of Time to file Briefs. Print out for CBM to review and sign. Further research re potential mootness of Defendants' claims in light of SB 124 and SB 427; determine impact of mootness on merits appeal in light of Defendants' intentions to litigate appeal for purposes of Plaintiffs anticipated award of attorneys fees. Meeting with CBM regarding possible extension to defendants Opening Brief deadline. Receipt, review and analyze Stipulations Re: Second Extension of Time to File Opening Briefs for both Appeal cases. Print out for CDM signature, scan, save and email to opposing counsel for filing. Meeting with CDM, CBM, SAB, and BR; discuss discuss related litigation strategy. Meeting with AMB, CBM, SAB, and BR; discussion re: and Meeting with AMB, CBM, SAB, and BR; discuss discuss related litigation strategy.	0.40 0.30 1.70 0.10 0.60 0.10	\$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 125.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	130.00 37.50 552.50 12.50 75.00 22.50
7/18/2011 7/20/2011 7/31/2011 9/7/2011 9/8/2011 9/12/2011 9/12/2011	Monfort Nunez Monfort Nunez Nunez Barvir Brady Michel	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB re research applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for extension of Time to file Briefs. Print out for CBM to review and sign. Further research re potential mootness of Defendants' claims in light of SB 124 and SB 427; determine impact of mootness on merits appeal in light of Defendants' intentions to litigate appeal for purposes of Plaintiffs anticipated award of attorneys fees. Meeting with CBM regarding possible extension to defendants Opening Brief deadline. Receipt, review and analyze Stipulations Re: Second Extension of Time to File Opening Briefs for both Appeal cases. Print out for CDM signature, scan, save and email to opposing counsel for filing. Meeting with CDM, CBM, SAB, and BR; discuss discuss related litigation strategy. Meeting with CDM, CBM, SAB, and BR; discuss discuss related litigation strategy. Meeting with CDM, SAB, AB and BR; discuss discuss related litigation strategy.	0.40 0.30 1.70 0.10 0.60 0.10 0.30	\$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 450.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	130.00 37.50 552.50 12.50 75.00 22.50 75.00 45.00
7/18/2011 7/20/2011 7/31/2011 9/7/2011 9/8/2011 9/12/2011	Monfort Nunez Monfort Nunez Nunez Barvir Brady	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB re research applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for extension of Time to file Briefs. Print out for CBM to review and sign. Further research re potential mootness of Defendants' claims in light of SB 124 and SB 427; determine impact of mootness on merits appeal in light of Defendants' intentions to litigate appeal for purposes of Plaintiffs anticipated award of attorneys fees. Meeting with CBM regarding possible extension to defendants Opening Brief deadline. Receipt, review and analyze Stipulations Re: Second Extension of Time to File Opening Briefs for both Appeal cases. Print out for CDM signature, scan, save and email to opposing counsel for filing. Meeting with CDM, CBM, SAB, and BR; discuss discuss related litigation strategy. Meeting with CDM, CBM, SAB, and BR; discuss discuss related litigation strategy. Meeting with CDM, SAB, AB and BR; discuss discuss related litigation strategy.	0.40 0.30 1.70 0.10 0.60 0.10 0.30	\$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 250.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$	130.00 37.50 552.50 12.50 75.00 75.00
7/18/2011 7/20/2011 7/31/2011 9/7/2011 9/8/2011 9/12/2011 9/12/2011	Monfort Nunez Monfort Nunez Nunez Barvir Brady Michel	award of attorneys fees is only remaining dispute; meet with SAB, CDM, and AB re research applicable case law and research relevant authority in the 5th District Court of Appeal; draft multiple e-mails to CDM and GSM regarding strategy on appeal re same. Communications to and from opposition counsel re stipulation to modify briefing schedule and hearing date on appeal of Cost award. Send/receive email to/from CBM regarding newly received Stipulation for second Appeal for extension of Time to file Briefs. Print out for CBM to review and sign. Further research re potential mootness of Defendants' claims in light of SB 124 and SB 427; determine impact of mootness on merits appeal in light of Defendants' intentions to litigate appeal for purposes of Plaintiffs anticipated award of attorneys fees. Meeting with CBM regarding possible extension to defendants Opening Brief deadline. Receipt, review and analyze Stipulations Re: Second Extension of Time to File Opening Briefs for both Appeal cases. Print out for CDM signature, scan, save and email to opposing counsel for filing. Meeting with CDM, CBM, SAB, and BR; discuss discuss related litigation strategy. Meeting with CDM, CBM, SAB, and BR; discuss discuss related litigation strategy. Meeting with CDM, SAB, AB and BR; discuss discuss related litigation strategy.	0.40 0.30 1.70 0.10 0.60 0.10 0.30 0.10	\$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 450.00	\$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$ \$	130.00 37.50 552.50 12.50 75.00 22.50 75.00 45.00

19/13/2011 Numer Conduct research re: Sigulation for extension of time being filled with the court on both appeal cases. 0.20 \$125.00 \$ 20.00	Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate	ļ	Amount
1907/2011 Michel Meeting with SAB and CBM re status of appeal and strategy.		•	<u> </u>				
19(13/2011 Brandy Multiple meetings with KBM and CDM re	9/13/2011	Nunez	appeal cases.	0.20	\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
19/13/2011 Michel Multiple meetings with \$48 and CDM ref 0.20 \$45.00 \$0.00	10/10/2011	Michel	Meeting with SAB and CBM re status of appeal and strategy.	0.10	\$ 450.00	\$	45.00
19/13/2011 Montroft Multiple meetings with SAB and CDM residence 0.2 \$32.50 \$0.650	10/13/2011	Brady	Multiple meetings with CBM and CDM re	0.20	\$ 250.00	\$	50.00
Drift e-mails to ain from opposing coursel and COM re consolidation of appeal and litigation strategy, respectively, evaluate litigation strategy on appeal in light of verb emessage sets 427 (sixed by Gov. Brown, analyze and discuss with clients; review and sign stipulation regarding consolidation of appeals. 0.70 \$325.00 \$225	10/13/2011	Michel	Multiple meetings with SAB and CDM re	0.20	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
Strategy, respectively, evaluate litigation strategy on appeal in light of vet message re SR 427	10/13/2011	Monfort	Multiple meetings with SAB and CDM re	0.20	\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
19/13/2011 Monfort Sissed by Gov. Brown, analyze and discuss with clients; review and sign stipulation regarding 0.70 \$ 325.00 \$ 227.50			Draft e-mails to and from opposing counsel and CDM re consolidation of appeal and litigation				
19(13)2011 Monfort Consolidation of appeal.			strategy, respectively; evaluate litigation strategy on appeal in light of veto message re SB 427				
E-mails to and from opposing counsel re further extension and discuss with CDM; discuss and consider stategy on appeal ingly of 58 427 year and 2012 legislation. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 \$ 325			issued by Gov. Brown; analyze and discuss with clients; review and sign stipulation regarding				
19/24/2011 Monfort Consider stategy on appeal in light of 58-127 veto and 2012 legislation. 0.20 5.325.00 \$ 0.506.00	10/13/2011	Monfort	consolidation of appeal.	0.70	\$ 325.00	\$	227.50
Send/receive email to/from CBM and Ross Moodyr es signatures to Stipulations continuing			E-mails to and from opposing counsel re further extension and discuss with CDM; discuss and				
	10/24/2011	Monfort	consider stategy on appeal in light of SB 427 veto and 2012 legislation.	0.20	\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
			Send/receive email to/from CBM and Ross Moody re: signatures to Stipulations continuing				
1/38/2011 Nunez Appeals. Send/receive email to/from CDM, CBM and Ross Moody re: requesting another extension to file briefs in appeal accesses. Send/receive email to/from CA, CBM and opposing counsel re: continuing briefing schedule in appeal matter again. 0.30 \$125.00 \$37.55	10/25/2011	Nunez	Appeal deadlines.	0.30	\$ 125.00	\$	37.50
Send/receive email tro/from CDM, CBM and Ross Moody re: requesting another extension to file briefs in appellate casess. Send/receive email to/from CA, CBM and opposing counsel re: continuing briefing schedule in appeal matter again. 12/9/2011 Michel Review Stipulation continuing briefing schedule. 0.30 \$ 450.00 \$ 135.00 \$ 135.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 135.00 \$ 12/9/2011 Michel Review Stipulation continuing briefing schedule. 0.30 \$ 450.00 \$ 135.00 \$ 135.00 \$ 12/9/2011 Michel Review Stipulation extending time to file opening brief and e-mails to counsel re same. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 \$ 135.00 \$ 12/9/2011 Nunez			Receipt, review and analyze Stipulations for Extensions of Time to file Opening Briefs for both				
12/9/2011 Michel Send/receive email to/from CA, CBM and opposing counsel re: continuing briefing schedule in appeal matter again. 0.30 \$125.00 \$ 135.00 \$ 12/9/2011 Michel Monfort Review stipulation centending time to file opening brief and e-mails to counsel re same. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 37.50 \$ 37	11/8/2011	Nunez		0.30	\$ 125.00	\$	37.50
Send/receive email to/from CA, CBM and opposing counsel re: continuing briefing schedule in appeal matter again. Send/receive email to/from CA, CBM and opposing counsel re: continuing briefing schedule. 0.30 \$450.00 \$ 135			Send/receive email to/from CDM, CBM and Ross Moody re: requesting another extension to				
12/9/2011 Michel appeal matter again. 0.30 \$ 450.00 \$ 135.00 \$ 135.00 \$ 12/9/2011 Michel Review Stipulation continuing briefing schedule. 0.30 \$ 450.00 \$ 135.00 \$ 135.00 \$ 12/9/2011 Michel Review Stipulation extending time to file opening brief and e-mails to counsel resame. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 \$ 12/9/2011 Nunez Review Stipulation extending time to file opening brief and e-mails to counsel resame. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 \$ 12/9/2011 Nunez In John Park (In John	12/8/2011	Nunez		0.30	\$ 125.00	\$	37.50
12/9/2011 Michel Review Stipulation continuing briefing schedule. 0.30 \$ 450.00 \$ 135.00 12/9/2011 Monfort Review stipulation extending time to file opening brief and e-mails to counsel re same. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 12/9/2011 Nunez in appeal matter again. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 12/9/2011 Nunez in appeal matter again. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 12/9/2011 Nunez Conduct legal research re state appellate process; brainstorm issues on appeal, analyze validity of each argument, and prepare outline of arguments to make on appeal, analyze validity of each argument, and prepare outline of arguments to make on appeal, analyze validity of each argument, and prepare outline of arguments to make on appeal, analyze validity of each argument, and prepare outline of arguments to make on appeal, analyze validity of each argument, and prepare outline of arguments to make on appeal and stay of fee appeal; forward to CDM and GSM. 0.10 \$ 325.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 325.00 1/30/2012 Monfort Park of the propared and state of the propared and state of the propared and propared in the propared outline of an appeal fligg of opening brief and illigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and illigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and illigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and illigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and illigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and illigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and illigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and illigation strategy and discuss discuss timing of merits appeal and the propared of the propared filing opening counses and CBM review and analyze and continuing and counses with sall of review and analyze and continuing appeal an			Send/receive email to/from CA, CBM and opposing counsel re: continuing briefing schedule in				
12/9/2011 Monfort Review stipulation extending time to file opening brief and e-mails to counsel re same.	12/9/2011	Michel	appeal matter again.	0.30	\$ 450.00	\$	135.00
Send/receive email to/from CDM, CBM and opposing counsel re: continuing briefing schedule in appeal matter again.	12/9/2011	Michel	Review Stipulation continuing briefing schedule.	0.30	\$ 450.00	\$	135.00
Send/receive email to/from CDM, CBM and opposing counsel re: continuing briefing schedule in appeal matter again.							
Conduct legal research re state appellate process; brainstorm issues on appeal, analyze validity of each argument, and prepare outline of arguments to make on appeal.	12/9/2011	Monfort	Review stipulation extending time to file opening brief and e-mails to counsel re same.	0.20	\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
Conduct legal research re state appellate process; brainstorm issues on appeal, analyze validity of each argument, and prepare outline of arguments to make on appeal. Review e-mail from R Moody re status of merits and fee appeals, joint appendix, and stay of fee appeal; forward to CDM and GSM. Review research assembled by AB re litigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy and discuss timing of merits appeal filing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy and discuss timing of merits appeal, assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix of determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. 2/1/2012 Monfort Appendix Appendix and discuss further documents			Send/receive email to/from CDM, CBM and opposing counsel re: continuing briefing schedule				
Variable	12/9/2011	Nunez	in appeal matter again.	0.30	\$ 125.00	\$	37.50
Variable							
Review e-mail from R Moody re status of merits and fee appeals, joint appendix, and stay of fee appeal; forward to CDM and GSM. Review research assembled by AB re litigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy re pending and potential legislation. Review and analyze entire trial court record/docket, cross-reference docket with documents referenced in State's proposed joint appendix of appeals; determine whether further proposed joint appendix; request clarifications re certain documents listed; research for and attach conformed copies of all documents referenced. Porfat and send email to opposing counsel and GBM re which documents listed; research for and attach conformed copies of all documents referenced. Meeting with CBM re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Meeting with CBM re preparation of joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Monfort Revise and prepare Joint Appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Monfort Revise and prepare Joint Appendix. Monfort Revise and prepare Joint Appendix and Monter Revise and Joint Appendix and Monter Revise and Joint Appendi							
Review research assembled by AB re litigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy repending and potential eligislation. 0.40 \$ 325.00 \$ 130.00 Review and analyze entire trial court record/docket, cross-reference docket with documents referenced in State's proposed joint appendix for appeal; determine whether further documents are necessary, prepare to discuss with 18M. 1.90 \$ 225.00 \$ 427.50 Draft and send email to opposing counsel and CBM re which documents to be added to proposed joint appendix; request clarifications re certain documents listed; research for and attach conformed copies of all documents referenced. 0.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 180.00 Meeting with CBM re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. 0.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 45.00 Meeting with AB re preparation of joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 45.00 Meeting with AB re preparation of joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 45.00 \$ 127.00 Meeting with AB re preparation of point appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 425.00 \$ 127.00 \$ 12	1/25/2012	Barvir	validity of each argument, and prepare outline of arguments to make on appeal.	2.60	\$ 225.00	\$	585.00
Review research assembled by AB re litigation strategy and discuss; discuss timing of merits appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy re pending and potential legislation. Review and analyze entire trial court record/docket, cross-reference docket with documents referenced in State's proposed joint appendix for appeal; determine whether further documents are necessary; prepare to discuss with CBM. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and CBM re which documents to be added to proposed joint appendix re certain documents listed; research for and attach conformed copies of all documents referenced. Meeting with CBM re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Meeting with AB re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Meeting with AB re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Nonfort Review and analyze and continue gathering documents for Joint Appendix. Junez Receipt, review and analyze and continue gathering documents for Joint Appendix. Receive multiple emails from opposing counsel, R. Moody, re creation of joint appendix and whether to include one or more Errata Notices; send email to R. Moody specifying which Errata Notices should be included; locate copies of those errata and forward to opposing counsel. Meeting with CBM re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. Nounce Conduct research re: documents needed for Joint Appendix and discuss furthe			Review e-mail from R Moody re status of merits and fee appeals, joint appendix, and stay of				
1/30/2012 Monfort appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy re pending and potential legislation. 0.40 \$ 325.00 \$ 130.00	1/30/2012	Monfort	fee appeal; forward to CDM and GSM.	0.10	\$ 325.00	\$	32.50
1/30/2012 Monfort appeal filing of opening brief and litigation strategy re pending and potential legislation. 0.40 \$ 325.00 \$ 130.00							
Review and analyze entire trial court record/docket, cross-reference docket with documents referenced in State's proposed joint appendix for appeal; determine whether further documents are necessary; prepare to discuss with CBM. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and CBM re which documents to be added to proposed joint appendix, request clarifications re certain documents listed; research for and attach conformed copies of all documents referenced. Meeting with CBM re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Meeting with AB re preparation of joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Meeting with AB re preparation of joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Monfort and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Monfort Revise and prepare Joint Appendix. Monfort Revise and prepare Joint Appendix. Monfort Additional research re merits appeal; discuss with AB. Receipt, review and analyze and continue gathering documents for Joint Appendix. Monfort Additional research re merits appeal; discuss with AB. Receive multiple emails from opposing counsel, R. Moody, re creation of joint appendix and whether to include one or more Errata Notices; send email to R. Moody specifying which Errata Notices should be included; locate copies of those errata and forward to opposing 2/6/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: documents needed for Joint Appendix on first two combined appeal. Meeting with CBM re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and di							
referenced in State's proposed joint appendix for appeal; determine whether further documents are necessary; prepare to discuss with CBM. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and CBM re which documents to be added to proposed joint appendix; request clarifications re certain documents listed; research for and attach conformed copies of all documents referenced. Meeting with CBM re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Meeting with AB re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Monfort Monfor	1/30/2012	Monfort		0.40	\$ 325.00	\$	130.00
1/31/2012 Barvir			•				
Draft and send email to opposing counsel and CBM re which documents to be added to proposed joint appendix; request clarifications re certain documents listed; research for and attach conformed copies of all documents referenced. Meeting with CBM re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Meeting with AB re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Meeting with AB re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Meeting with AB re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting with AB receive multiple emails from opposing counsel, R. Moody, re creation of joint appendix and whether to include one or more Errata Notices; send email to R. Moody specifying which Errata Notices should be included; locate copies of those errata and forward to opposing counsel appeal. Meeting with CBM re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. Conduct research re: Fourth Stipulation filed by Appellants, court dock							
proposed joint appendix; request clarifications re certain documents listed; research for and attach conformed copies of all documents referenced. Meeting with CBM re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Meeting with AB re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added 2/1/2012 Monfort and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Monfort Revise and prepare Joint Appendix. Monfort Revise and prepare Joint Appendix. Monfort Additional research re merits appeal; discuss with AB. Receipt, review and analyze and continue gathering documents for Joint Appendix. Receipt merity and analyze and continue gathering documents for Joint Appendix and whether to include one or more Errata Notices; send email to R. Moody, re creation of joint appendix and whether to include one or more Errata Notices; send email to R. Moody specifying which Errata Notices should be included; locate copies of those errata and forward to opposing Meeting with CBM re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conduc	1/31/2012	Barvir		1.90	\$ 225.00	\$	427.50
2/1/2012 Barvir attach conformed copies of all documents referenced. Meeting with CBM re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Meeting with AB re preparation of joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Meeting with AB re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Meeting with AB re preparation of joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Nunez Monfort Recise and prepare Joint Appendix. Additional research re merits appeal; discuss with AB. Receive multiple emails from opposing counsel, R. Moody, re creation of joint appendix and whether to include one or more Errata Notices; send email to R. Moody specifying which Errata Notices should be included; locate copies of those errata and forward to opposing 2/6/2012 Barvir Conduct research re: documents needed for Joint Appendix on first two combined appeal. Send/receive emails to/from AB, CBM and Ross Moody re: deadlines and documents needed for Joint Appendix. Meeting with CBM re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of			· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·				
Meeting with CBM re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Meeting with AB re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. 2/1/2012 Monfort Revise and prepare Joint Appendix. 1.30 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 \$ 422.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 422.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 422.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 422.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 32					4		
reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Meeting with AB re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. O.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Z/1/2012 Monfort Revise and prepare Joint Appendix. 1.30 \$ 325.00 \$ 422.50 Z/1/2012 Nunez Receipt, review and analyze and continue gathering documents for Joint Appendix. 3.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 375.00 Z/3/2012 Monfort Additional research re merits appeal; discuss with AB. Receive multiple emails from opposing counsel, R. Moody, re creation of joint appendix and whether to include one or more Errata Notices; send email to R. Moody specifying which Errata Notices should be included; locate copies of those errata and forward to opposing Z/6/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: documents needed for Joint Appendix on first two combined appeal. Z/6/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: documents needed for Joint Appendix on first two combined appeal. Z/6/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: documents needed for Joint Appendix on first two combined appeal. Z/6/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: documents needed for Joint Appendix on discuss further documents needed for Joint Appendix. Meeting with CBM re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. Conduct research re: Fourth Stipulation filed by Appellants, court docket and confirm missed Conduct research re: Fourth Stipulation filed by Appellants, court docket and confirm missed Conduct research re: Fo	2/1/2012	Barvir		0.80	\$ 225.00	\$	180.00
2/1/2012 Barvir and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. Meeting with AB re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. 2/1/2012 Monfort Revise and prepare Joint Appendix. 2/1/2012 Monfort Revise and prepare Joint Appendix. 2/1/2012 Monfort Revise and analyze and continue gathering documents for Joint Appendix. 3.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 3							
Meeting with AB re preparation of joint appendix in State's merits appeal; assign AB task of reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. 2/1/2012 Monfort Revise and prepare Joint Appendix. 3.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 422.50 \$ 42.50 \$ 422.50 \$ 422.50 \$ 422.50 \$ 422.50 \$ 422.50 \$ 422.50 \$ 422.5	2/4/2042			0.20	A 225 00		45.00
reviewing the State's proposed joint appendix to determine what, if anything, must be added and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. 2/1/2012 Monfort Revise and prepare Joint Appendix. 1.30 \$ 325.00 \$ 422.50	2/1/2012	Barvir		0.20	\$ 225.00	\$	45.00
2/1/2012 Monfort and emailing opposing counsel with said requests. 2/1/2012 Monfort Revise and prepare Joint Appendix. 2/1/2012 Nunez Receipt, review and analyze and continue gathering documents for Joint Appendix. 3.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 375.00							
2/1/2012 Monfort Revise and prepare Joint Appendix. 2/1/2012 Nunez Receipt, review and analyze and continue gathering documents for Joint Appendix. 3.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 375.00 \$	2/4/2042	1.4 F t		0.20	ć 225 00	ć	CE 00
2/1/2012 Nunez Receipt, review and analyze and continue gathering documents for Joint Appendix. 3.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 2/3/2012 Monfort Additional research re merits appeal; discuss with AB. 0.60 \$ 325.00 \$ 195.00 Receive multiple emails from opposing counsel, R. Moody, re creation of joint appendix and whether to include one or more Errata Notices; send email to R. Moody specifying which Errata Notices should be included; locate copies of those errata and forward to opposing 2/6/2012 Barvir Conduct research re: documents needed for Joint Appendix on first two combined appeal. 2.70 \$ 125.00 \$ 337.50 Send/receive emails to/from AB, CBM and Ross Moody re: deadlines and documents needed 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Send/receive emails to/from AB, CBM and Ross Moody re: deadlines and documents needed 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Send/receive emails to/from AB, CBM and Ross Moody re: deadlines and documents needed 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Send/receive emails to/from AB, CBM and Ross Moody re: deadlines and documents needed 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Send/receive emails to/from AB, CBM and Ross Moody re: deadlines and documents needed 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Send/receive emails to/from AB, CBM and Ross Moody re: deadlines and documents needed 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Send/receive emails to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal dead							
2/3/2012 Monfort Additional research re merits appeal; discuss with AB. Receive multiple emails from opposing counsel, R. Moody, re creation of joint appendix and whether to include one or more Errata Notices; send email to R. Moody specifying which Errata Notices should be included; locate copies of those errata and forward to opposing counsel. 2/6/2012 Barvir Conduct research re: documents needed for Joint Appendix on first two combined appeal. Send/receive emails to/from AB, CBM and Ross Moody re: deadlines and documents needed for Joint Appendix. Meeting with CBM re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. Conduct research re: Fourth Stipulation filed by Appellants, court docket and confirm missed deadlines. Research rules on missed filings, email team post card rule. Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint							
Receive multiple emails from opposing counsel, R. Moody, re creation of joint appendix and whether to include one or more Errata Notices; send email to R. Moody specifying which Errata Notices should be included; locate copies of those errata and forward to opposing counsel. 2/6/2012 Barvir counsel. 2/6/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: documents needed for Joint Appendix on first two combined appeal. Send/receive emails to/from AB, CBM and Ross Moody re: deadlines and documents needed for Joint Appendix. Nunez for Joint Appendix. Meeting with CBM re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. Conduct research re: Fourth Stipulation filed by Appellants, court docket and confirm missed deadlines. Research rules on missed filings, email team post card rule. Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint							
whether to include one or more Errata Notices; send email to R. Moody specifying which Errata Notices should be included; locate copies of those errata and forward to opposing 2/6/2012 Barvir counsel. 0.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 45.00 2/6/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: documents needed for Joint Appendix on first two combined appeal. 2.70 \$ 125.00 \$ 337.50 Send/receive emails to/from AB, CBM and Ross Moody re: deadlines and documents needed 2/6/2012 Nunez for Joint Appendix. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Meeting with CBM re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. 0.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 45.00 Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Conduct research re: Fourth Stipulation filed by Appellants, court docket and confirm missed deadlines. Research rules on missed filings, email team post card rule. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint	2/3/2012	Montort		0.60	\$ 325.00	Ş	195.00
Errata Notices should be included; locate copies of those errata and forward to opposing 2/6/2012 Barvir counsel. 0.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 45.00 2/6/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: documents needed for Joint Appendix on first two combined appeal. 2.70 \$ 125.00 \$ 337.50 Send/receive emails to/from AB, CBM and Ross Moody re: deadlines and documents needed 2/6/2012 Nunez for Joint Appendix. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Meeting with CBM re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. 0.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 45.00 Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Conduct research re: Fourth Stipulation filed by Appellants, court docket and confirm missed deadlines. Research rules on missed filings, email team post card rule. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint							
2/6/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: documents needed for Joint Appendix on first two combined appeal. 2.70 \$ 125.00 \$ 337.50 Send/receive emails to/from AB, CBM and Ross Moody re: deadlines and documents needed 2/6/2012 Nunez for Joint Appendix. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Meeting with CBM re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be 2/7/2012 Barvir included. 0.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 45.00 Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review 2/7/2012 Monfort of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Conduct research re: Fourth Stipulation filed by Appellants, court docket and confirm missed 2/7/2012 Nunez deadlines. Research rules on missed filings, email team post card rule. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00							
2/6/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: documents needed for Joint Appendix on first two combined appeal. 2.70 \$ 125.00 \$ 337.50 Send/receive emails to/from AB, CBM and Ross Moody re: deadlines and documents needed 2/6/2012 Nunez for Joint Appendix. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Meeting with CBM re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. 0.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 45.00 Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Conduct research re: Fourth Stipulation filed by Appellants, court docket and confirm missed deadlines. Research rules on missed filings, email team post card rule. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint	2/6/2012	Domin	, , , ,	0.20	¢ 225.00	Ļ	45.00
Send/receive emails to/from AB, CBM and Ross Moody re: deadlines and documents needed 2/6/2012 Nunez for Joint Appendix. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Meeting with CBM re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be 2/7/2012 Barvir included. 0.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 45.00 Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review 2/7/2012 Monfort of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Conduct research re: Fourth Stipulation filed by Appellants, court docket and confirm missed 2/7/2012 Nunez deadlines. Research rules on missed filings, email team post card rule. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint	2/6/2012	parvii	counsei.	0.20	\$ 225.00	Ş	45.00
Send/receive emails to/from AB, CBM and Ross Moody re: deadlines and documents needed 2/6/2012 Nunez for Joint Appendix. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Meeting with CBM re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be 2/7/2012 Barvir included. 0.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 45.00 Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review 2/7/2012 Monfort of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Conduct research re: Fourth Stipulation filed by Appellants, court docket and confirm missed 2/7/2012 Nunez deadlines. Research rules on missed filings, email team post card rule. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint	2/6/2012	Nuncz	Conduct receased you decuments needed for laint Anneadiy on first two combined anneal	2.70	¢ 125 00	ć	227.50
2/6/2012 Nunez for Joint Appendix. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Meeting with CBM re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. 0.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 45.00 Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review 2/7/2012 Monfort of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Conduct research re: Fourth Stipulation filed by Appellants, court docket and confirm missed 2/7/2012 Nunez deadlines. Research rules on missed filings, email team post card rule. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint	2/6/2012	Nullez	• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •	2.70	\$ 125.00	Ş	337.50
Meeting with CBM re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be 2/7/2012 Barvir included. 0.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 45.00 Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review 2/7/2012 Monfort of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Conduct research re: Fourth Stipulation filed by Appellants, court docket and confirm missed 2/7/2012 Nunez deadlines. Research rules on missed filings, email team post card rule. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint	2/6/2012	Nunoz		0.20	¢ 12E 00	ċ	27 50
review of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be 2/7/2012 Barvir included. 0.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 45.00 Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review 2/7/2012 Monfort of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Conduct research re: Fourth Stipulation filed by Appellants, court docket and confirm missed 2/7/2012 Nunez deadlines. Research rules on missed filings, email team post card rule. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint	2/6/2012	Nunez		0.30	\$ 125.00	Ş	37.50
2/7/2012 Barvir included. 0.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 45.00 Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review 2/7/2012 Monfort of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Conduct research re: Fourth Stipulation filed by Appellants, court docket and confirm missed 2/7/2012 Nunez deadlines. Research rules on missed filings, email team post card rule. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint							
Meeting with AB re Joint Appendix re merits appeal; assign AB task of conducting final review 2/7/2012 Monfort of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Conduct research re: Fourth Stipulation filed by Appellants, court docket and confirm missed 2/7/2012 Nunez deadlines. Research rules on missed filings, email team post card rule. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint	2/7/2012	D	**	0.20	ć 225 00	ć	45.00
2/7/2012 Monfort of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Conduct research re: Fourth Stipulation filed by Appellants, court docket and confirm missed deadlines. Research rules on missed filings, email team post card rule. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint	2///2012	Barvir	included.	0.20	\$ 225.00	\$	45.00
2/7/2012 Monfort of opposing counsel's draft Joint Appendix and discuss further documents to be included. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Conduct research re: Fourth Stipulation filed by Appellants, court docket and confirm missed deadlines. Research rules on missed filings, email team post card rule. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint			Marking with AD as Island Amazardia as associate and as I as				
Conduct research re: Fourth Stipulation filed by Appellants, court docket and confirm missed 2/7/2012 Nunez deadlines. Research rules on missed filings, email team post card rule. Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint	2/7/2012	N.4 f	- · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	0.20	ć 225 oc		C= 00
2/7/2012 Nunez deadlines. Research rules on missed filings, email team post card rule. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint	2///2012	Montort		0.20	\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint	0 17 100 -				A	_	,
	2/7/2012	Nunez		0.80	\$ 125.00	Ş	100.00
2///2012 Nunez Appendix. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50	a /= / :			_	A		
	2/7/2012	Nunez	Appendix.	0.30	\$ 125.00	\$	37.50

Review State's draft Joint Appendix; review superior court docted and crosx- reference State's draft Joint Appendix; desirams are risising, pull and review conformed capies of each missing document to determine whether each should have been included; draft email to opposing coursel, it Modor, traguestria addition of several documents and indicating email to opposing coursel, it Modor, traguestria addition of several documents and indicating and the property of the propert	Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate		Amount
draft Joint Appendix, electronine which documents are missing, pull and review conformed copies of each missing document to determine whether each should have been included; draft email to opposing coursel, K. Moody, requesting addition of several documents and indicating other necessary changes to both appendix. 2/8/2012	Date	ППекеерег	·	Hours	Nate	,-	aniount
Copyright of each missing document to determine whether each should have been included, draft email to opposing coursel, it Modor, requesting addition of several documents and included; and several control of the c							
### ### ### ### ### ### ### ### ### ##							
2/8/2012 Servir							
Review notification of appellants failure to timely file opening brief, discuss with CA and AB, 0.20 \$.325.00 \$.65.00	2/9/2012	Parvir		2 00	\$ 225.00	ċ	675.00
2/8/2012 Monfort determine due date pursuant to postacrd rule.	2/8/2012	Daivii	, , ,	3.00	\$ 223.00	۲	073.00
Multiple meetings with All re filing of appellant's opening prief, rough draft of Plaintiffs' fee 30,0 \$ 225,00 \$ 97,5	2/8/2012	Monfort		0.20	\$ 225.00	ċ	65.00
2/8/2012 Monfort appeal, and submission of Joint Appendix. 0.30 \$ 325.00 \$ 9.75.00	2/8/2012	William	·	0.20	\$ 323.00	۲	03.00
Multiple meetings with AB re final revisions to Joint Appendix re morits appeal; review	2/9/2012	Monfort		0.30	\$ 225.00	ċ	97.50
2/8/2012 Monfort Correspondence to opposing counsel and draft email to AB. 0.50 \$325.00 \$125.0	2/8/2012	WIGHTOIL	11 / 11	0.30	\$ 323.00	۲	37.30
Receive multiple emails from opposing counsel requesting conformed copies of documents missing from Sate's filias; elephone conferences and meetings with CA re documents to pull and forward to apposing counsel for inclusion in Joint Appendix. 200 \$125.00 \$67.50	2/8/2012	Monfort		0.50	\$ 325.00	¢	162 50
Page	2/0/2012	WIOTHOLL		0.50	J 323.00	Ţ	102.30
2/9/2012 Barvir and forward to opposing counsel for inclusion in Joint Appendix. 0.30 \$ 225.00 \$ 67.50							
Conduct research re- additional materials needed for Joint Appendix on first Appeal, provide 1/9/2012 Nunez Multiple emails Loffrom opposing counsel're creation of Joint Appendix; search for and forward conformed copies of multiple documents to opposing counsel; other coordinated efforts in creating Joint Appendix 2/10/2012 Nunez Conduct research re- and look for additional materials for Joint Appendix Send/receive mail to/from AB and Opposing Counsel're- Appendix A	2/9/2012	Rarvir	, ,	0.30	\$ 225.00	Ś	67 50
1.0	2/3/2012	Daivii		0.30	7 223.00	Ţ	07.50
Multiple emails to/from opposing counsel re creation of Joint Appendix.	2/9/2012	Nunez		2 00	\$ 125.00	\$	250.00
forward conformed copies of multiple documents to opposing counsel; other coordinated efforts in creating forth Appendix. 2/10/2012 Nunez Multiple meetings with AB re: documents missing from Joint Appendix. 2/10/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: and look for additional materials for Joint Appendix. 2/10/2012 Nunez Appendix. 3-10/2012 Nunez Appendix. 4-10/2012 Nunez Appendix. 5-10/2012 Nunez Appendix. 5-10/2012 Nunez Appendix. 5-10/2012 Nunez Appendix. 6-10/2012 Nunez A	2/3/2012	IVUITEZ		2.00	ÿ 123.00	7	250.00
2/10/2012 Numez Multiple meetings with A Bre: documents missing from Joint Appendix. 0.90 \$ 225.00 \$ 202.50 \$ 202.50 \$ 207.50							
Multiple meetings with Air rei documents missing from Joint Appendix. 0.40 \$ 125.00 \$ 50.00 \$ 125.	2/10/2012	Barvir		0.90	\$ 225.00	\$	202 50
2/10/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: and look for additional materials for Joint Appendix. 2.50 \$ 125.00 \$ 312.50	· ·						
Send/receive email to/from AB and Opposing Counsel re: Appeal deadlines and Joint 2/13/2012 Nunez Appendix. Appendix. Monifort Research re recent authority re vagueness challenges under the due process clause. 1.60 \$ 325.00 \$ 5.20.00 2/12/2012 Monifort Research re recent authority re vagueness challenges under the due process clause. 1.60 \$ 325.00 \$ 5.20.00 2/13/2012 Barvir Orquested documents. 1.60 \$ 325.00 \$ 67.50 2/13/2012 Barvir Orquested documents. 1.60 \$ 325.00 \$ 67.50 2/13/2012 Monifort Meet with SAB re vagueness argument strategies on appeal; draft attorney notes re same. 1.70 \$ 325.00 \$ 227.50 2/13/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: additional documents needed for Joint Appendix. 1.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 125.00 2/13/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: additional documents needed for Joint Appendix. 1.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 125.00 2/13/2012 Monifort Appendix review in a first stipulated joint appendix, discuss with AB. 1.02 \$ 125.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 125.00 2/13/2012 Monifort Appendix review in a first of stipulation re joint appendix to ensure all documents are included; receive email from opposing counsel re joint appendix and final stipulation. 1.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 125.00 2/13/2012 Barvir Stipulation. 1.00 Send/receive emails from opposing counsel re status of reviewing and signing Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix de neural status of reviewing and signing Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix decembers are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix requested from Proposing counsel research researc					•		
2/10/2012 Numez Appendix Appendix 0.60 \$ 125.00 \$ 75.00 2/12/2012 Monfort Research re recent authority re vagueness challenges under the due process clause. 1.60 \$ 325.00 \$ 520.00	_, _0, _012			2.50	7 ==5.00	Ψ	322.30
Send/receive multiple emails to/from opposing counsel re preparation of Joint Appendix (merits appeal), including searching for and forwarding to opposing counsel confirmed copies of requested documents.	2/10/2012	Nunez		0.60	\$ 125.00	\$	75.00
Send/receive multiple emails to/from opposing counsel re preparation of Joint Appendix (merits appeal), including searching for and forwarding to opposing counsel confirmed copies of requested documents. 2/13/2012 Monfort Meet with SAB re vagueness argument strategies on appeal; draft attorney notes re same. 2/13/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: additional documents needed for Joint Appendix. 2/13/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from re: additional documents needed for Joint Appendix. 2/13/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from re: additional documents needed for Joint Appendix. 2/13/2012 Monfort Analyze, review and revise draft stipulated joint appendix; discuss with AB. 2/14/2012 Monfort Analyze, review and revise draft stipulated joint appendix; discuss with AB. 2/15/2012 Barvir Appendix; review final draft of stipulation re joint appendix on ensure all documents are included; receive email from opposing counsel re status of reviewing and signing Senderceive multiple emails to/from opposing counsel re status of reviewing and signing Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix to ensure all necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix to ensure all necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and support staff re necessary changes to Joint Appendix and Support staff re necessary changes to Joint Appendix and Support staff re necessary changes to Joint Appendix and Support staff re necessary changes to Joint Appendix and Support staff re necessary changes to Joint Appendix and confirm that, upon receipt, we will email signed stipulation. 2/16/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to opposing counsel res Joint Appendix to ensure all necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix and Counter Sender Sender Sender Sender Sender Sender Sender Se	· ·				•		
(merits appeal), including searching for and forwarding to opposing counsel confirmed copies of requested documents. On the search of requested documents of requested documents are saguent strategies on appeal; draft attorney notes re same. On the search response of the se				1.00	ψ 525.00	Ψ	520.00
2/13/2012 Monfort Meet with SAB re vagueness argument strategies on appeal; draft attorney notes re same. 2/13/2012 Monfort Meet with SAB re vagueness argument strategies on appeal; draft attorney notes re same. 2/13/2012 Nunez 2 Conduct research re: additional documents needed for Joint Appendix. 2/13/2012 Nunez 2 Conduct research re: additional documents needed for Joint Appendix. 2/13/2012 Nunez 2 Conduct research re: additional documents needed for Joint Appendix. 2/14/2012 Monfort 2/14/2012 Monfort 2/14/2012 Monfort 2/15/2012 Barvir Stipulation 2/15/2012 Barvir Stipulation. 2/15/2012 Barvir Stipulation. 2/15/2012 Barvir Stipulation. 2/16/2012 Barvir Stipulation Re Joint Appendix or source re joint appendix and final stipulation. 2/16/2012 Barvir Stipulation Re Joint Appendix Proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix Resures and Increase and In							
Monfort Meet with SAB re vagueness argument strategies on appeal; draft attorney notes re same. 0.70 \$ 325.00 \$ 227.50	2/13/2012	Barvir		0.30	\$ 225.00	Ś	67.50
2/13/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: additional documents needed for Joint Appendix. 1.00 \$125.00 \$ 125.00	2, 13, 2012	20.7	or requested documental	0.00	Ψ 225.00	Ψ	07.00
2/13/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: additional documents needed for Joint Appendix. 1.00 \$125.00 \$ 125.00	2/13/2012	Monfort	Meet with SAB re vagueness argument strategies on appeal; draft attorney notes re same.	0.70	\$ 325.00	Ś	227.50
2/13/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from re: additional documents needed for Joint Appendix. 0.20 \$ 125.00 \$ 25.00 \$ 2/14/2012 Monfort Analyze, review and revise draft stipulated joint appendix; discuss with AB. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 715.00							
Analyze, review and revise draft stipulated joint appendix, discuss with AB. 2.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 715.00							25.00
Prepare Joint Appendix; review final draft of stipulation re joint appendix to ensure all documents are included; receive email from opposing counsel re joint appendix and final stipulation. Send/receive multiple emails to/from opposing counsel re status of reviewing and signing Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. Review Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix to ensure all necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix to ensure all necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and court docket; determine which documents are missing or incorrect. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and support staff re necessary changes to Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix; pull from IMANAGE and forward to opposing counsel counsel confirmed copies of missing documents to be included in Joint Appendix; request PDF of last 800 pages of Joint Appendix and confirm that, upon receipt, we will email signed stipulation. 2/16/2012 Barvir stipulation. Conduct research re: for additional Joint Appendix documents. Linu Signal S							
documents are included; receive email from opposing counsel re joint appendix and final stipulation. Send/receive multiple emails to/from opposing counsel re status of reviewing and signing 2/16/2012 Barvir Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. Review Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix to ensure all necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and court docket; determine which documents are missing or incorrect. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and support staff re necessary changes to Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix plotting (Incorrect). Draft and send email to opposing counsel and support staff re necessary changes to Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix; pull from IMANAGE and forward to opposing counsel confirmed copies of missing documents to be included in Joint Appendix; request PDF of last 800 pages of Joint Appendix and confirm that, upon receipt, we will email signed 2/16/2012 Barvir stipulation. Conduct research re: for additional Joint Appendix documents. Conduct final review of last 800 pages of Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix to ensure all necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix and court docket. Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and court docket. Joso \$ 225.00 \$ 562.50 Multiple meetings with CA re final review of Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix and signature of Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and staff confirming approval of Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and staff confirming approval of Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. Receipt, review and analyze seven hundred pages of Joint appendix, reference and cross reference with index and court docket. Receipt, review and analyze seven hundred pages of Joint a	, , -				,		
2/15/2012 Barvir stipulation. Send/receive multiple emails to/from opposing counsel re status of reviewing and signing Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix to ensure all necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix to ensure all necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and court docket; determine which documents are missing or incorrect. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and support staff re necessary changes to Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix; pull from IMANAGE and forward to opposing counsel confirmed copies of missing documents to be included in Joint Appendix; request PDF of last 800 pages of Joint Appendix and confirm that, upon receipt, we will email signed stipulation. 2/16/2012 Barvir stipulation. Conduct research re: for additional Joint Appendix documents. 1.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 112.50 \$ 125.00 \$ 62							
Send/receive multiple emails to/from opposing counsel re status of reviewing and signing Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. O.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 22.50	2/15/2012	Barvir		0.90	\$ 225.00	\$	202.50
Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. 0.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00			Send/receive multiple emails to/from opposing counsel re status of reviewing and signing				
and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and court docket; determine which documents are missing or incorrect. 2/16/2012 Barvir Draft and send email to opposing counsel and support staff re necessary changes to Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix; pull from IMANAGE and forward to opposing counsel confirmed copies of missing documents to be included in Joint Appendix; request PDF of last 800 pages of Joint Appendix and confirm that, upon receipt, we will email signed stipulation. 2/16/2012 Barvir Stipulation. 2/16/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: for additional Joint Appendix documents. 2/16/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from CBM, AB and opposing counsel re: Joint Appendix to ensure all necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and court docket. 2/17/2012 Barvir Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix; discuss documents CA did not see included therein; discuss also CDM review and signature of Stipulation Re Joint Appendix ne Boint Appendix; discuss documents CA did not see included therein; discuss also CDM review and signature of Stipulation Re Joint Appendix pending final edits to Stipulation and inclusion of final missing documents; forward signed copy of Stipulation to opposing counsel with instructions to include only in the event requested changes are made. 2/17/2012 Barvir include only in the event requested changes are made. 2/17/2012 Barvir include only in the event requested changes are made. 2/17/2012 Nunez reference with index and court docket sheet. 3.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 112.50 \$ 500.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 125.00	2/16/2012	Barvir		0.10	\$ 225.00	\$	22.50
Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and court docket; determine which documents are missing or incorrect. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and support staff re necessary changes to Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix; pull from IMANAGE and forward to opposing counsel confirmed copies of missing documents to be included in Joint Appendix; request PDF of last 800 pages of Joint Appendix and confirm that, upon receipt, we will email signed stipulation. Stipulation			Review Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix to ensure all necessary documents are included				
2/16/2012 Barvir Incorrect. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and support staff re necessary changes to Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix; pull from IMANAGE and forward to opposing counsel confirmed copies of missing documents to be included in Joint Appendix; request PDF of last 800 pages of Joint Appendix and confirm that, upon receipt, we will email signed 2/16/2012 Sarvir Stipulation. 0.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 112.50			and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix with Defendants' proposed				
Draft and send email to opposing counsel and support staff re necessary changes to Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix; pull from IMANAGE and forward to opposing counsel confirmed copies of missing documents to be included in Joint Appendix; request PDF of last 800 pages of Joint Appendix and confirm that, upon receipt, we will email signed 2/16/2012 Barvir stipulation. 2/16/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: for additional Joint Appendix documents. 2/16/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from CBM, AB and opposing counsel re: Joint Appendix. 2/16/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from CBM, AB and opposing counsel re: Joint Appendix. 2/17/2012 Barvir Appendix with Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix to ensure all necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint 2/17/2012 Barvir Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix; discuss documents CA did not see included therein; discuss also CDM review and signature of 2/17/2012 Barvir Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and staff confirming approval of Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix pending final edits to Stipulation and inclusion of final missing documents; forward signed copy of Stipulation to opposing counsel with instructions to include only in the event requested changes are made. 2/17/2012 Barvir include only in the event requested changes are made. Receipt, review and analyze seven hundred pages of joint appendix, reference and cross reference with index and court docket sheet. Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; conduct			Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and court docket; determine which documents are missing or				
Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix; pull from IMANAGE and forward to opposing counsel confirmed copies of missing documents to be included in Joint Appendix; request PDF of last 800 pages of Joint Appendix and confirm that, upon receipt, we will email signed 2/16/2012 Barvir Stipulation. 2/16/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: for additional Joint Appendix documents. 2/16/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from CBM, AB and opposing counsel re: Joint Appendix. 2/16/2012 Nunez Conduct final review of last 800 pages of Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix to ensure all necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and court docket. 2/17/2012 Barvir Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix; discuss documents CA did not see included therein; discuss also CDM review and signature of 2/17/2012 Barvir Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and staff confirming approval of Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix pending final edits to Stipulation and inclusion of final missing documents; forward signed copy of Stipulation to opposing counsel with instructions to include only in the event requested changes are made. 2/17/2012 Barvir include only in the event requested changes are made. 2/17/2012 Nunez reference with index and court docket sheet. Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; conduct	2/16/2012	Barvir	incorrect.	3.10	\$ 225.00	\$	697.50
counsel confirmed copies of missing documents to be included in Joint Appendix, request PDF of last 800 pages of Joint Appendix and confirm that, upon receipt, we will email signed stipulation. 2/16/2012 Stipulation. Conduct research re: for additional Joint Appendix documents. Conduct final review of last 800 pages of Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix. Conduct final review of last 800 pages of Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix to ensure all necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and court docket. 2/17/2012 Barvir Appendix in the Proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix; discuss documents CA did not see included therein; discuss also CDM review and signature of Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and staff confirming approval of Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix pending final edits to Stipulation and inclusion of final missing documents; forward signed copy of Stipulation to opposing counsel with instructions to include only in the event requested changes are made. 2/17/2012 Barvir include only in the event requested changes are made. Receipt, review and analyze seven hundred pages of joint appendix, reference and cross reference with index and court docket sheet. Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; conduct			Draft and send email to opposing counsel and support staff re necessary changes to Joint				
of last 800 pages of Joint Appendix and confirm that, upon receipt, we will email signed 2/16/2012 Barvir stipulation. 2/16/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: for additional Joint Appendix documents. 2/16/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from CBM, AB and opposing counsel re: Joint Appendix. 2/16/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from CBM, AB and opposing counsel re: Joint Appendix. 2/16/2012 Description of last 800 pages of Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix to ensure all necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint 2/17/2012 Description of Lappendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and court docket. 2/17/2012 Description of Lappendix of Lappendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. 2/17/2012 Description of Lappendix Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. 3/17/2012 Description of Lappendix Description of Lappendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix pending final edits to Stipulation and inclusion of final missing documents; forward signed copy of Stipulation to opposing counsel with instructions to include only in the event requested changes are made. 3/17/2012 Description of Lappendix Description of Lappendix Proposed Joint Appendix Proposed Joint Appendix Description of Lappendix Description of La			Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix; pull from IMANAGE and forward to opposing				
2/16/2012 Barvir stipulation. 0.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 112.50 2/16/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: for additional Joint Appendix documents. 1.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 125.00 2/16/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from CBM, AB and opposing counsel re: Joint Appendix. 0.50 \$ 125.00 \$ 62.50 Conduct final review of last 800 pages of Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix to ensure all necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and court docket. 2.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 562.50 Multiple meetings with CA re final review of Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix; discuss documents CA did not see included therein; discuss also CDM review and signature of Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. 0.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 112.50 Draft and send email to opposing counsel and staff confirming approval of Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix pending final edits to Stipulation and inclusion of final missing documents; forward signed copy of Stipulation to opposing counsel with instructions to include only in the event requested changes are made. 0.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 112.50 Receipt, review and analyze seven hundred pages of joint appendix, reference and cross reference with index and court docket sheet. 4.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents'			counsel confirmed copies of missing documents to be included in Joint Appendix; request PDF				
2/16/2012 Nunez Conduct research re: for additional Joint Appendix documents. 2/16/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from CBM, AB and opposing counsel re: Joint Appendix. Conduct final review of last 800 pages of Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix to ensure all necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and court docket. Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix; discuss documents CA did not see included therein; discuss also CDM review and signature of 2/17/2012 Barvir Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and staff confirming approval of Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix pending final edits to Stipulation and inclusion of final missing documents; forward signed copy of Stipulation to opposing counsel with instructions to include only in the event requested changes are made. Receipt, review and analyze seven hundred pages of joint appendix, reference and cross reference with index and court docket sheet. Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; conduct			of last 800 pages of Joint Appendix and confirm that, upon receipt, we will email signed				
Conduct final review of last 800 pages of Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix to ensure all necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and court docket. Z/17/2012 Barvir Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix; discuss documents CA did not see included therein; discuss also CDM review and signature of Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and staff confirming approval of Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix pending final edits to Stipulation and inclusion of final missing documents; forward signed copy of Stipulation to opposing counsel with instructions to include only in the event requested changes are made. Receipt, review and analyze seven hundred pages of joint appendix, reference and cross reference with index and court docket sheet. Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; conduct	2/16/2012	Barvir	stipulation.	0.50	\$ 225.00	\$	112.50
Conduct final review of last 800 pages of Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix to ensure all necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and court docket. Multiple meetings with CA re final review of Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix; discuss documents CA did not see included therein; discuss also CDM review and signature of Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and staff confirming approval of Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix pending final edits to Stipulation and inclusion of final missing documents; forward signed copy of Stipulation to opposing counsel with instructions to include only in the event requested changes are made. 2/17/2012 Barvir include only in the event requested changes are made. Receipt, review and analyze seven hundred pages of joint appendix, reference and cross reference with index and court docket sheet. Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; conduct	2/16/2012	Nunez	Conduct research re: for additional Joint Appendix documents.	1.00	\$ 125.00	\$	125.00
necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and court docket. Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix; discuss Multiple meetings with CA re final review of Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix; discuss documents CA did not see included therein; discuss also CDM review and signature of Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and staff confirming approval of Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix pending final edits to Stipulation and inclusion of final missing documents; forward signed copy of Stipulation to opposing counsel with instructions to include only in the event requested changes are made. Receipt, review and analyze seven hundred pages of joint appendix, reference and cross reference with index and court docket sheet. Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents'	2/16/2012	Nunez	Send/receive email to/from CBM, AB and opposing counsel re: Joint Appendix.	0.50	\$ 125.00	\$	62.50
necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and court docket. Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix; discuss Multiple meetings with CA re final review of Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix; discuss documents CA did not see included therein; discuss also CDM review and signature of Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and staff confirming approval of Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix pending final edits to Stipulation and inclusion of final missing documents; forward signed copy of Stipulation to opposing counsel with instructions to include only in the event requested changes are made. Receipt, review and analyze seven hundred pages of joint appendix, reference and cross reference with index and court docket sheet. Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents'							
Appendix with Defendants' proposed Stipulation Re Joint Appendix and court docket. Multiple meetings with CA re final review of Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix; discuss documents CA did not see included therein; discuss also CDM review and signature of Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and staff confirming approval of Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix pending final edits to Stipulation and inclusion of final missing documents; forward signed copy of Stipulation to opposing counsel with instructions to include only in the event requested changes are made. Receipt, review and analyze seven hundred pages of joint appendix, reference and cross reference with index and court docket sheet. Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; conduct			Conduct final review of last 800 pages of Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix to ensure all				
Multiple meetings with CA re final review of Defendants' proposed Joint Appendix; discuss documents CA did not see included therein; discuss also CDM review and signature of 2/17/2012 Barvir Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. 0.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 112.50 Draft and send email to opposing counsel and staff confirming approval of Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix pending final edits to Stipulation and inclusion of final missing documents; forward signed copy of Stipulation to opposing counsel with instructions to include only in the event requested changes are made. 0.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 112.50 Receipt, review and analyze seven hundred pages of joint appendix, reference and cross reference with index and court docket sheet. 4.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; conduct			necessary documents are included and in the proper order; cross-reference proposed Joint				
documents CA did not see included therein; discuss also CDM review and signature of 2/17/2012 Barvir Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. 0.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 112.50 Draft and send email to opposing counsel and staff confirming approval of Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix pending final edits to Stipulation and inclusion of final missing documents; forward signed copy of Stipulation to opposing counsel with instructions to include only in the event requested changes are made. 0.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 112.50 Receipt, review and analyze seven hundred pages of joint appendix, reference and cross reference with index and court docket sheet. 4.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents'	2/17/2012	Barvir		2.50	\$ 225.00	\$	562.50
2/17/2012 Barvir Stipulation Re Joint Appendix. Draft and send email to opposing counsel and staff confirming approval of Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix pending final edits to Stipulation and inclusion of final missing documents; forward signed copy of Stipulation to opposing counsel with instructions to include only in the event requested changes are made. Receipt, review and analyze seven hundred pages of joint appendix, reference and cross reference with index and court docket sheet. Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; conduct							
Draft and send email to opposing counsel and staff confirming approval of Joint Appendix and Stipulation Re Joint Appendix pending final edits to Stipulation and inclusion of final missing documents; forward signed copy of Stipulation to opposing counsel with instructions to include only in the event requested changes are made. Receipt, review and analyze seven hundred pages of joint appendix, reference and cross reference with index and court docket sheet. Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents'			documents CA did not see included therein; discuss also CDM review and signature of				
Stipulation Re Joint Appendix pending final edits to Stipulation and inclusion of final missing documents; forward signed copy of Stipulation to opposing counsel with instructions to 2/17/2012 Barvir include only in the event requested changes are made. 0.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 112.50 Receipt, review and analyze seven hundred pages of joint appendix, reference and cross 2/17/2012 Nunez reference with index and court docket sheet. 4.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; conduct	2/17/2012	Barvir		0.50	\$ 225.00	\$	112.50
documents; forward signed copy of Stipulation to opposing counsel with instructions to 2/17/2012 Barvir include only in the event requested changes are made. Receipt, review and analyze seven hundred pages of joint appendix, reference and cross 2/17/2012 Nunez reference with index and court docket sheet. Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; conduct							
2/17/2012 Barvir include only in the event requested changes are made. Receipt, review and analyze seven hundred pages of joint appendix, reference and cross 2/17/2012 Nunez reference with index and court docket sheet. Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; conduct							
Receipt, review and analyze seven hundred pages of joint appendix, reference and cross 2/17/2012 Nunez reference with index and court docket sheet. 4.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; conduct							
2/17/2012 Nunez reference with index and court docket sheet. 4.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 500.00 Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; conduct	2/17/2012	Barvir		0.50	\$ 225.00	\$	112.50
Send email to CA requesting template for Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; conduct							
Opening Brief; draft Stipulation to Extend Time to File Respondents' Opening Brief; conduct	2/17/2012	Nunez		4.00	\$ 125.00	\$	500.00
2/22/2012 Barvir legal research as necessary. 1.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 405.00	l						
	2/22/2012	Barvir	legal research as necessary.	1.80	\$ 225.00	\$	405.00

Meeting with AB ro deadlines on merits appeal; discuss assign AB task of preparing draft stipulation and email to poposing counsel requesting situation for presension; discuss also 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 \$ 37.50 \$	Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate	ļ	Amount
Assign AB task of preparing draft stipulation and email to opposing counsel requesting supulation for extension, discuss also			Mosting with CDM to deadlines on morits appeals discuss				
	2/22/2012	Barvir		0.20	\$ 225.00	\$	45.00
2/22/2012 Monthort Opposing counsel requesting stipulation for extension, discuss also 0.20 \$.325.00 \$.325.00 \$.375.00 \$.325.00			=				
Sendreceive email to/from AB re: Motion to Tax Costs Appeal opposing counsel's brief. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.55.	2/22/2012	Monfort		0.20	\$ 325.00	Ġ	65.00
2/22/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from AB re: Motion to Tax Costs Appeal opposing counsel's brief. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50	2/22/2012				•		37.50
						-	
							37.50
	2/22/2012	Nunez		0.60	\$ 125.00	\$	75.00
Analyze issues re vagueness standard argued by DOJ with CBM to determine how best to 2,23/2012 Monfort Telephone conference with CDM re ADB. Multiple meetings with ABP telligation strategy on appeal and filing of extension of time and 1,040 \$325.00 \$ 32.50 \$	2/22/2012	Barvir		0.30	\$ 225.00	ċ	67 50
2/23/2012 Bardy Counter. 0.20 \$25.00 \$ 5.000 \$ 5.000 \$ 22/20 \$ 2/2	2/23/2012	Daivii		0.30	\$ 223.00	Ą	07.30
	2/23/2012	Brady		0.20	\$ 250.00	\$	50.00
2/23/2012 Monfort Staying fee appoel. Analysis and review of Appellants' opening brief, draft attorney notes re same and draft e-mail 2,40 \$325.00 \$ 130.00		•					32.50
Analysis and review of Appellants' opening brief, fraft attorney notes re same and draft e-mail 2/23/2012 Monfort to CDM and GSM and GSMs and GSMs and GSMs. Meeting with AB re Appellant's Opening Brief, discuss Leview, revise, and finalize proposed stipulation to extend time to file Respondents' Opening Brief, forward document to CBM for approval before sending to opposing counsel for signature. Send/receive email to/from AB and CBM re: Stipulation to Extend Time to file Respondents' Send/receive email to/from AB and CBM re: Stipulation to Extend Time to file Respondents Send email to CBM re proposed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents Send email to CBM re proposed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief, requesting approval of draft language; forward draft stipulation to CA for final formatting; review and revise final draft of proposed stipulation to CA for final formatting; review and revise final draft of proposed stipulation to CA for final formatting; review and revise final draft of proposed stipulation to CA for final formatting; review and revise final draft of proposed stipulation to CA for final formatting; review and revise final draft of proposed stipulation to CA for final formatting; review and revise final draft of proposed stipulation to CA for final formatting; review and revise final draft of proposed stipulation to CA for final formatting; review and revise final draft of proposed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief, route signed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief, route signed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief, route signed stipulation to CA to prepare for filing; meeting with A to discuss filing of stipulation. A to discuss filing of stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. 3///2012 Barvir Meeting with CAr e filing of Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. 3///2012 Barvir Meeting with CAr e filing							
10 2/23/2012 Monfort 10 CDM and GSM and discuss with AB and SAB. 2.40 \$325.00 \$ 780.00	2/23/2012	Monfort	, 0 11	0.40	\$ 325.00	\$	130.00
Meeting with AB re Appellant's Opening Brief, discuss 2/23/2012 Monfort Monfort Degin to formulate arguments to be made in response. 0.30 \$ 325.00 \$ 97.50	2/22/2012	Monfort	, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	2.40	¢ 225.00	ć	700.00
September Sept	2/23/2012	MONIORE		2.40	\$ 325.00	Ş	780.00
Review, revise, and finalize proposed stipulation to extend time to file Respondents' Opening Brief, forward document to CBM for approval before sending to opposing counsel for signature. 2/27/2012 Nunez Brief. Send/receive email to/from AB and CBM re: Stipulation to Extend Time to file Respondents Send were stipulation to Extend Time to file Respondents Send email to CBM re proposed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief, requesting approval of draft language; forward draft stipulation to CA for final formatting; review and revise final draft of proposed stipulation; draft and send email to opposing counsel re proposed stipulation, requesting review, approval, and signature. 2/29/2012 Barvir opposing counsel re signed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents to Receive email from opposing counsel re signed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief, requesting review, approval, and signature. 3/1/2012 Barvir October Sendents' Opening Brief, route signed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief, route signed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief, route signed stipulation to CA to prepare for filing; meeting with CA to discuss filing of stipulation. 3/1/2012 Barvir October Sendents' Opening Brief, route signed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening appellate brief, draft attorney notes for consideration with CBM in preparing a response. 3/1/2012 Brady preparing a response. 3/1/2012 Brady Driss opening appellate brief, draft attorney notes for consideration with CBM in preparing a response. 3/1/2012 Brady Driss opening appellate brief, draft attorney notes for consideration with CBM in preparing a response. 3/1/2012 Brady Driss opening appellate brief opening appellate brief opening specification of the total proper specification opening openi	2/23/2012	Monfort		0.30	\$ 325.00	\$	97.50
Signature Signature Signature Signature Send/receive email to/from AB and CBM re: Stipulation to Extend Time to file Respondents O.20 \$ 125.00 \$ 2			Review, revise, and finalize proposed stipulation to extend time to file Respondents' Opening				
Send/receive email to/from AB and CBM re: Stipulation to Extend Time to file Respondents Send email to CBM re proposed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief, requesting approval of draft language; forward draft stipulation to CA for final formatting; review and revise final draft of proposed stipulation, draft and send email to Opposing course in proposed stipulation, requesting review, approval, and signature. Draft Stipulation to Extend Respondents Time to File Opening Brief, email to AB to forward to opposing counsel re reproposed stipulation, requesting review, approval, and signature. Receive email from Opposing counsel re signed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief, route signed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief, route signed stipulation to CA to prepare for filing; meeting with CA to discuss filing of stipulation. Receive email from Opposing counsel re signed stipulation to CA to prepare for filing; meeting with CA to discuss filing of stipulation. Receive and review Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. Receive and review Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. Receive email to/from AB re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. Receive email to/from AB re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. Receive email to/from AB re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. Receive email to/from AB re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. Receive email to/from team re: Status of Stipulation for Extend Respondents Briefing Schedule. Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. Respondents' Brief in			Brief; forward document to CBM for approval before sending to opposing counsel for				
Send email to CBM re proposed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief, requesting approval of draft language; forward draft stipulation to CA for final formatting; review and revise final draft of proposed stipulation; draft and send email to opposing counsel re proposed stipulation; draft and send email to opposing counsel re proposed stipulation; draft and send email to opposing counsel re proposed stipulation; draft and send email to opposing counsel re proposed stipulation; draft and send email to opposing counsel re signed stipulation for extension of time to file opening Brief, email to AB to forward to opposing counsel. Nunez	2/27/2012	Barvir		0.30	\$ 225.00	\$	67.50
Send email to CBM re proposed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief, requesting approval of draft language; forward draft stipulation to CA for final formatting; review and revise final draft of proposed stipulation; draft and send email to opposing opposing counsel re proposed stipulation, requesting review, approval, and signature. Draft Stipulation to Extend Respondents Time to File Opening Brief, email to AB to forward to opposing counsel. Receive email from opposing counsel re signed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief; route signed stipulation to CA to prepare for filing; meeting with CA to discuss filing of stipulation. CA to discuss filing of stipulation. Receive email row opposing counsel re signed stipulation to CA to prepare for filing; meeting with CA to discuss filing of stipulation. CA to discuss filing of stipulation. Receive and review Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. Nunez Send/receive email to/from AB re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. Analyze DOJ's opening appellate brief, draft attorney notes for consideration with CBM in preparing a response. 2.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 375.00 3/12/2012 Brady Meeting with CA re filing of Stipulation to Extend Time; confirm stipulation signed and filed. 3/12/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation. Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. Send/receive email to/from team re: status of Stipulation for Extension of Time to File Nunez Respondents' Brief. Nunez Respondents' Brief. Respondents' Brief. Analysis and prepare outline of counter arguments ISO of Respondents' Opening Brief. Analysis and prepare outline of counter arguments ISO of Respondents' Opening Meeting with CBM to discuss AOB. Analysis and review of arguments suggested by SAB and incorporate into attorney notes and Summary of argument ISO opening brief/ outline. Non S 325.00 Analysis of veiwer parker Appeal 182 calendar deadline for team to	2/27/2012	Nunoz	·	0.20	ć 12F 00	ć	35.00
Brief, requesting approval of draft language; forward draft stipulation to CA for final formatting; review and revise final draft of proposed stipulation, draft and send email to opposing counsel re proposed stipulation; draft and signature. 2/29/2012 Nunez opposing counsel re proposed stipulation (requesting review, approval, and signature. 3/1/2012 Nunez opposing counsel. Receive email from opposing counsel re signed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief; route signed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief; route signed stipulation to CA to prepare for filing; meeting with A2 to 4 discuss filling of stipulation. 3/1/2012 Michel Receive and review Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. 3/1/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from AB re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. 3/1/2012 Brady preparing a response. 3/1/2012 Brady preparing a response. 3/1/2012 Brady Meeting with CA re filling of Stipulation to Extend Time; confirm stipulation signed and filed. 3/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents Briefing Schedule. 3/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation for Extension of Time to File 3/1/2012 Nunez Respondents' Brief. 3/1/2	2/2//2012	Nunez	Brief.	0.20	\$ 125.00	Ş	25.00
Brief, requesting approval of draft language; forward draft stipulation to CA for final formatting; review and revise final draft of proposed stipulation, draft and send email to opposing counsel re proposed stipulation; draft and signature. 2/29/2012 Nunez opposing counsel re proposed stipulation (requesting review, approval, and signature. 3/1/2012 Nunez opposing counsel. Receive email from opposing counsel re signed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief; route signed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief; route signed stipulation to CA to prepare for filing; meeting with A2 to 4 discuss filling of stipulation. 3/1/2012 Michel Receive and review Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. 3/1/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from AB re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. 3/1/2012 Brady preparing a response. 3/1/2012 Brady preparing a response. 3/1/2012 Brady Meeting with CA re filling of Stipulation to Extend Time; confirm stipulation signed and filed. 3/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents Briefing Schedule. 3/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation for Extension of Time to File 3/1/2012 Nunez Respondents' Brief. 3/1/2			Send email to CBM re proposed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening				
2/29/2012 Barvir opposing counsel re proposed stipulation, requesting review, approval, and signature. Draft Stipulation to Extend Respondents Time to File Opening Brief, email to AB to forward to opposing counsel. Receive email from opposing counsel re signed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief; route signed stipulation to CA to prepare for filing; meeting with Al/2012 Barvir CA to discuss filing of stipulation. 2.02 \$225.00 \$ 45.00 3/1/2012 Michel Receive and review Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. 3/1/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from AB re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. 3/1/2012 Brady preparing a response. 3/1/2012 Brady preparing a response. 3/1/2012 Barvir Meeting with CA re filling of Stipulation to Extend Time; confirm stipulation signed and filed. 3/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents Briefing Schedule. 3/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation. 5/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. 5/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. 5/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. 5/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. 5/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. 5/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. 5/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. 5/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. 5/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. 5/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. 5/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. 5/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. 5/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. 5/1/2012 Nunez Stipulation. 6/1/2012 Nunez Stipulation. 6/							
Draft Stipulation to Extend Respondents Time to File Opening Brief, email to AB to forward to opposing counsel. Receive email from opposing counsel. Receive and Irom opposing Brief; route signed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief; route signed stipulation to CA to prepare for filing; meeting with O.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 45.00 \$ 135.00 \$ 31/2012 Michel Receive and review Stipulation. O.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 135.00 \$ 31/2012 Michel Receive and review Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. O.30 \$ 450.00 \$ 135.00 \$ 31/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from AB re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. O.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50			formatting; review and revise final draft of proposed stipulation; draft and send email to				
2/29/2012 Nunez opposing counsel. Receive email from opposing counsel re signed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief; route signed stipulation to CA to prepare for filing; meeting with 3/1/2012 Barvir CA to discuss filing of stipulation. 3/1/2012 Michel Receive and review Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. 3/1/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from AB re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. 3/1/2012 Brady preparing a response. 3/2/2012 Brady preparing a response. 3/6/2012 Barvir Meeting with CA re filing of Stipulation to Extend Time; confirm stipulation signed and filed. 3/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents Briefing Schedule. 3/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation. 3/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation. 3/1/2012 Nunez Respondents' Brief. 3/1/2012 Monfort Sunday Return Brief. 3/1/2012 Monfort Stipulation Description Brief Providence Analysis and review of arguments suggested by SAB and incorporate into attorney notes and summary of argument Brief. 4/1/20/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. 4/2/2/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. 4/2/2/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. 4/2	2/29/2012	Barvir		0.60	\$ 225.00	\$	135.00
Receive email from opposing counsel re signed stipulation for extension of time to file Respondents' Opening Brief; route signed stipulation to CA to prepare for filing; meeting with 3/1/2012 Barvir CA to discuss filing of stipulation. 0.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 45.00 3/11/2012 Michel Receive and review Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. 0.30 \$ 450.00 \$ 135.00 3/11/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from AB re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Analyze DOJ's opening appellate brief, draft attorney notes for consideration with CBM in 3/2/2012 Brady preparing a response. 2.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 500.00 3/6/2012 Barvir Meeting with CA re filing of Stipulation to Extend Time; confirm stipulation signed and filed. 0.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 22.50 3/6/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents Briefing Schedule. 0.10 \$ 125.00 \$ 12.50 3/7/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. 0.20 \$ 125.00 \$ 25.00 3/8/2012 Brady Meeting with CBM re: Status of Stipulation for Extension of Time to File 3/8/2012 Brady Meeting with CBM to discuss AOB. 0.30 \$ 250.00 \$ 75.00 Discuss AOB with SAB and prepare outline of counter arguments ISO of Respondents' Opening Discuss AOB with SAB and prepare outline of counter arguments ISO of Respondents' Opening Meeting with CBM re: Parker Appeal 1&2 calendar deadline for team to file second 3/15/2012 Monfort Stipulation. 0.30 \$ 325.00 \$ 37.50 Meeting with CBM re: Parker Appeal 1&2 calendar deadline for team to file second 4/3/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 97.50 4/23/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 97.50 Analysis of outline of arguments ISO respondent's opening brief; discuss with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with	2/20/2042		•	0.60	A 425.00		75.00
Respondents' Opening Brief; route signed stipulation to CA to prepare for filing; meeting with 3/1/2012 Barvir CA to discuss filing of stipulation. 3/1/2012 Michel Receive and review Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. 3/1/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from AB re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. 3/1/2012 Brady Send/receive email to/from AB re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. 3/1/2012 Brady preparing a response. 3/1/2012 Brady preparing a response. 3/1/2012 Barvir Meeting with CA re filing of Stipulation to Extend Time; confirm stipulation signed and filed. 3/1/2012 Brady Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents Briefing Schedule. 3/1/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation. 3/1/2012 Nunez Respondents' Brief. 3/1/2012 Nunez Stipulation to Extend Respondents and stipulation for Extension of Time to File 3/1/2012 Nunez Respondents' Brief. 3/1/2012 Nunez Stipulation to File B	2/29/2012	Nunez		0.60	\$ 125.00	\$	/5.00
3/1/2012 Barvir CA to discuss filing of stipulation. 3/1/2012 Michel Receive and review Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. 3/1/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from AB re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. 3/1/2012 Brady Send/receive email to/from AB re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. 3/2/2012 Brady preparing a response. 3/6/2012 Brady preparing a response. 3/6/2012 Barvir Meeting with CA re filing of Stipulation to Extend Time; confirm stipulation signed and filed. 3/6/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents Briefing Schedule. 3/7/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents Briefing Schedule. 3/7/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. 3/8/2012 Nunez Respondents' Brief. 3/7/2012 Nunez Respondents' Brief. 3/7/2012 Nunez Respondents' Brief. 3/8/2012 Brady Meeting with CBM to discuss AOB. Discuss AOB with SAB and prepare outline of counter arguments ISO of Respondents' Opening 3/8/2012 Monfort Brief. 3/8/2012 Monfort Review of arguments suggested by SAB and incorporate into attorney notes and summary of argument ISO Opening brief/outline. 3/8/2012 Monfort Summary of argument ISO Opening brief/outline. 3/8/2012 Monfort Review notes re AOB. 3/8/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. 4/20/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. 4/23/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate strategy with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with							
3/1/2012 Nunez Send/receive email to/from AB re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents' Brief in Second Appeal. 0.30 \$ 450.00 \$ 135.00 \$ 37.50 Analyze DOJ's opening appellate brief, draft attorney notes for consideration with CBM in preparing a response. 2.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 3/6/2012 Bardy preparing a response. 2.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 225.00	3/1/2012	Barvir		0.20	\$ 225.00	\$	45.00
Analyze DOJ's opening appellate brief, draft attorney notes for consideration with CBM in preparing a response. 2.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 3/6/2012 Barvir Meeting with CA re filing of Stipulation to Extend Time; confirm stipulation signed and filed. 3/6/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents Briefing Schedule. 3/7/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. 2.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 1		Michel					135.00
Analyze DOJ's opening appellate brief, draft attorney notes for consideration with CBM in preparing a response. 2.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 500.00 \$ 3/6/2012 Barvir Meeting with CA re filing of Stipulation to Extend Time; confirm stipulation signed and filed. 3/6/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents Briefing Schedule. 3/7/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. 2.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 1							
3/2/2012 Brady preparing a response. 2.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 500.00 3/6/2012 Barvir Meeting with CA re filing of Stipulation to Extend Time; confirm stipulation signed and filed. 0.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 22.50 3/6/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents Briefing Schedule. 0.10 \$ 125.00 \$ 12.50 3/7/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. 0.20 \$ 125.00 \$ 25.00 Send/receive email to/from team re: status of Stipulation for Extension of Time to File 8/7/2012 Nunez Respondents' Brief. 0.20 \$ 125.00 \$ 25.00 3/8/2012 Brady Meeting with CBM to discuss AOB. 0.30 \$ 250.00 \$ 75.00 Discuss AOB with SAB and prepare outline of counter arguments ISO of Respondents' Opening 3/8/2012 Monfort Brief. 1.80 \$ 325.00 \$ 585.00 4/3/2012 Monfort summary of argument ISO opening brief/outline. 1.50 \$ 325.00 \$ 487.50 Meeting with CBM re: Parker Appeal 1&2 calendar deadline for team to file second 4/3/2012 Nunez Stipulation. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Telephone conference with GSM re status of opposition brief and discuss appeal; discuss also 4/20/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. Analysis of outline of arguments ISO respondent's opening brief; discuss with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with	3/1/2012	Nunez		0.30	\$ 125.00	\$	37.50
3/6/2012 Barvir Meeting with CA re filing of Stipulation to Extend Time; confirm stipulation signed and filed. 0.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 22.50 3/6/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents Briefing Schedule. 0.10 \$ 125.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 25.00 3/7/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. Send/receive email to/from team re: status of Stipulation for Extension of Time to File 3/7/2012 Nunez Respondents' Brief. 0.20 \$ 125.00 \$ 25.00 3/8/2012 Brady Meeting with CBM to discuss AOB. Discuss AOB with SAB and prepare outline of counter arguments ISO of Respondents' Opening Brief. 1.80 \$ 325.00 \$ 585.00 Analysis and review of arguments suggested by SAB and incorporate into attorney notes and summary of argument ISO opening brief/outline. 1.50 \$ 325.00 \$ 487.50 Meeting with CBM re: Parker Appeal 1&2 calendar deadline for team to file second 4/3/2012 Nunez Stipulation. Telephone conference with GSM re status of opposition brief and discuss appeal; discuss also with AMB; review notes re AOB. 0.30 \$ 325.00 \$ 97.50 4/23/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. Analysis of outline of arguments ISO respondent's opening brief; discuss with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with	2/2/2012	Dradu		2.00	¢ 250.00	ć	F00 00
3/6/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents Briefing Schedule. 3/7/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. Send/receive email to/from team re: status of Stipulation for Extension of Time to File 3/7/2012 Nunez Respondents' Brief. Neeting with CBM to discuss AOB. Discuss AOB with SAB and prepare outline of counter arguments ISO of Respondents' Opening 3/8/2012 Monfort Brief. Analysis and review of arguments suggested by SAB and incorporate into attorney notes and summary of argument ISO opening brief/outline. Meeting with CBM re: Parker Appeal 1&2 calendar deadline for team to file second 4/3/2012 Nunez Stipulation. Telephone conference with GSM re status of opposition brief and discuss appeal; discuss also with AMB; review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. Analysis of outline of arguments ISO respondent's opening brief; discuss with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with	3/2/2012	вгацу	preparing a response.	2.00	\$ 250.00	Ş	500.00
3/6/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents Briefing Schedule. 3/7/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. Send/receive email to/from team re: status of Stipulation for Extension of Time to File 3/7/2012 Nunez Respondents' Brief. Neeting with CBM to discuss AOB. Discuss AOB with SAB and prepare outline of counter arguments ISO of Respondents' Opening 3/8/2012 Monfort Brief. Analysis and review of arguments suggested by SAB and incorporate into attorney notes and summary of argument ISO opening brief/outline. Meeting with CBM re: Parker Appeal 1&2 calendar deadline for team to file second 4/3/2012 Nunez Stipulation. Telephone conference with GSM re status of opposition brief and discuss appeal; discuss also with AMB; review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. Analysis of outline of arguments ISO respondent's opening brief; discuss with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with	3/6/2012	Barvir	Meeting with CA re filing of Stipulation to Extend Time: confirm stipulation signed and filed.	0.10	\$ 225.00	Ś	22.50
3/7/2012 Nunez Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Stipulation. Send/receive email to/from team re: status of Stipulation for Extension of Time to File 3/7/2012 Nunez Respondents' Brief. 3/8/2012 Brady Meeting with CBM to discuss AOB. Discuss AOB with SAB and prepare outline of counter arguments ISO of Respondents' Opening Brief. Analysis and review of arguments suggested by SAB and incorporate into attorney notes and summary of argument ISO opening brief/outline. Meeting with CBM re: Parker Appeal 1&2 calendar deadline for team to file second Stipulation. Telephone conference with GSM re status of opposition brief and discuss appeal; discuss also with AMB; review notes re AOB. Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. Analysis of outline of arguments ISO respondent's opening brief; discuss with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with		-					
Send/receive email to/from team re: status of Stipulation for Extension of Time to File 3/7/2012 Nunez Respondents' Brief. 0.20 \$ 125.00 \$ 25.00 3/8/2012 Brady Meeting with CBM to discuss AOB. 0.30 \$ 250.00 \$ 75.00 Discuss AOB with SAB and prepare outline of counter arguments ISO of Respondents' Opening 3/8/2012 Monfort Brief. 1.80 \$ 325.00 \$ 585.00 Analysis and review of arguments suggested by SAB and incorporate into attorney notes and 3/15/2012 Monfort Summary of argument ISO opening brief/outline. 1.50 \$ 325.00 \$ 487.50 Meeting with CBM re: Parker Appeal 1&2 calendar deadline for team to file second 4/3/2012 Nunez Stipulation. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Telephone conference with GSM re status of opposition brief and discuss appeal; discuss also 4/20/2012 Monfort With AMB; review notes re AOB. 0.30 \$ 325.00 \$ 97.50 4/23/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Analysis of outline of arguments ISO respondent's opening brief; discuss with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with	3/6/2012	Nunez	Telephone calls to court clerk re: Stipulation to Extend Respondents Briefing Schedule.	0.10			12.50
3/7/2012 Nunez Respondents' Brief. 0.20 \$ 125.00 \$ 25.00 3/8/2012 Brady Meeting with CBM to discuss AOB. 0.30 \$ 250.00 \$ 75.00 Discuss AOB with SAB and prepare outline of counter arguments ISO of Respondents' Opening 3/8/2012 Monfort Brief. 1.80 \$ 325.00 \$ 585.00 Analysis and review of arguments suggested by SAB and incorporate into attorney notes and 3/15/2012 Monfort summary of argument ISO opening brief/outline. 1.50 \$ 325.00 \$ 487.50 Meeting with CBM re: Parker Appeal 1&2 calendar deadline for team to file second 4/3/2012 Nunez Stipulation. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Telephone conference with GSM re status of opposition brief and discuss appeal; discuss also 4/20/2012 Monfort with AMB; review notes re AOB. 0.30 \$ 325.00 \$ 97.50 4/23/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Analysis of outline of arguments ISO respondent's opening brief; discuss with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with	3/7/2012	Nunez	· '	0.20	\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
3/8/2012 Brady Meeting with CBM to discuss AOB. Discuss AOB with SAB and prepare outline of counter arguments ISO of Respondents' Opening 3/8/2012 Monfort Brief. Analysis and review of arguments suggested by SAB and incorporate into attorney notes and 3/15/2012 Monfort summary of argument ISO opening brief/outline. Meeting with CBM re: Parker Appeal 1&2 calendar deadline for team to file second 4/3/2012 Nunez Stipulation. Telephone conference with GSM re status of opposition brief and discuss appeal; discuss also 4/20/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. Analysis of outline of arguments ISO respondent's opening brief; discuss with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with	0/7/0040		•	0.20	A 425.00		25.00
Discuss AOB with SAB and prepare outline of counter arguments ISO of Respondents' Opening 3/8/2012 Monfort Brief. 1.80 \$ 325.00 \$ 585.00 Analysis and review of arguments suggested by SAB and incorporate into attorney notes and 3/15/2012 Monfort summary of argument ISO opening brief/outline. 1.50 \$ 325.00 \$ 487.50 Meeting with CBM re: Parker Appeal 1&2 calendar deadline for team to file second 4/3/2012 Nunez Stipulation. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Telephone conference with GSM re status of opposition brief and discuss appeal; discuss also 4/20/2012 Monfort with AMB; review notes re AOB. 0.30 \$ 325.00 \$ 97.50 4/23/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Analysis of outline of arguments ISO respondent's opening brief; discuss with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with			-				
3/8/2012 Monfort Brief. 1.80 \$ 325.00 \$ 585.00 Analysis and review of arguments suggested by SAB and incorporate into attorney notes and 3/15/2012 Monfort summary of argument ISO opening brief/outline. 1.50 \$ 325.00 \$ 487.50 Meeting with CBM re: Parker Appeal 1&2 calendar deadline for team to file second 4/3/2012 Nunez Stipulation. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Telephone conference with GSM re status of opposition brief and discuss appeal; discuss also 4/20/2012 Monfort with AMB; review notes re AOB. 0.30 \$ 325.00 \$ 97.50 4/23/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Analysis of outline of arguments ISO respondent's opening brief; discuss with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with	3/0/2012	ыацу		0.30	\$ 250.00	Ą	75.00
Analysis and review of arguments suggested by SAB and incorporate into attorney notes and 3/15/2012 Monfort summary of argument ISO opening brief/outline. 1.50 \$ 325.00 \$ 487.50 Meeting with CBM re: Parker Appeal 1&2 calendar deadline for team to file second 4/3/2012 Nunez Stipulation. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Telephone conference with GSM re status of opposition brief and discuss appeal; discuss also 4/20/2012 Monfort with AMB; review notes re AOB. 0.30 \$ 325.00 \$ 97.50 4/23/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Analysis of outline of arguments ISO respondent's opening brief; discuss with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with	3/8/2012	Monfort		1.80	\$ 325.00	\$	585.00
Meeting with CBM re: Parker Appeal 1&2 calendar deadline for team to file second 4/3/2012 Nunez Stipulation. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 Telephone conference with GSM re status of opposition brief and discuss appeal; discuss also 4/20/2012 Monfort with AMB; review notes re AOB. 0.30 \$ 325.00 \$ 97.50 4/23/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Analysis of outline of arguments ISO respondent's opening brief; discuss with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with			Analysis and review of arguments suggested by SAB and incorporate into attorney notes and			-	
4/3/2012NunezStipulation.0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50Telephone conference with GSM re status of opposition brief and discuss appeal; discuss also4/20/2012Monfortwith AMB; review notes re AOB.0.30 \$ 325.00 \$ 97.504/23/2012MonfortReview and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines.0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00Analysis of outline of arguments ISO respondent's opening brief; discuss with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with	3/15/2012	Monfort		1.50	\$ 325.00	\$	487.50
Telephone conference with GSM re status of opposition brief and discuss appeal; discuss also 4/20/2012 Monfort with AMB; review notes re AOB. 4/23/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. Analysis of outline of arguments ISO respondent's opening brief; discuss with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with	.						
4/20/2012 Monfort with AMB; review notes re AOB. 4/23/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. Analysis of outline of arguments ISO respondent's opening brief; discuss with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with	4/3/2012	Nunez	,	0.30	\$ 125.00	\$	37.50
4/23/2012 Monfort Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines. 0.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 65.00 Analysis of outline of arguments ISO respondent's opening brief; discuss with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with	4/20/2012	Monfort		0.20	¢ 225.00	ć	07.50
Analysis of outline of arguments ISO respondent's opening brief; discuss with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with	4/20/2012	IVIOIIIOFT	WILLI AIVID, TEVIEW HOLES TE AUD.	0.30	\$ 325.00	Ş	97.50
Analysis of outline of arguments ISO respondent's opening brief; discuss with GSM documents supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with	4/23/2012	Monfort	Review and revise draft e-mail to opposing counsel re stipulation for appellate filing deadlines.	0.20	\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
supporting arguments and draft e-mail to GSM re same; discuss also appellate strategy with	,					•	
4/23/2012 Monfort CDM. 0.50 \$ 325.00 \$ 162.50							
	4/23/2012	Monfort	CDM.	0.50	\$ 325.00	\$	162.50

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate	,	Amount
		Draft e-mail to CDM re status of merits and fee appeals; discuss procedural requirements and filing of stipulations for an extension time to file Respondent's opening brief and for a stay of				
4/23/2012	Monfort	Plaintiffs' Fee appeal pending the outcome of the State's merits appeal.	0.30	\$ 325.00	Ś	97.50
4/23/2012	WIGHTOTE	Traintins Tee appear pending the outcome of the state 3 ments appear.	0.50	ÿ 323.00	Ų	37.30
		Meet with AB re stipulation for an extension of time to file respondents' opening brief and				
4/23/2012	Monfort	stipulation staying fee appeal; discuss also communications with opposing counsel re same.	0.20	\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
		Draft, review, and revise Application for Second Extension of Time to File Respondents' Brief;				
		draft, review, and revise Declaration of Clinton B. Monfort in Support; send email to CA				
		requesting template for same; receive and review multiple emails from CBM and opposing		4		
4/24/2012	Barvir	counsel re negotiation of same.	3.40	\$ 225.00	Ş	765.00
4/24/2012	Monfort	Continue drafting and revising motions and supporting declarations re stay of merits briefing	0.60	¢ 225.00	ċ	105.00
4/24/2012	Monfort	and fee apppeal. Draft Stipulation for Extension of Time to File Respondents Opening Brief for case no.:	0.60	\$ 325.00	\$	195.00
4/24/2012	Nunez	F064590.	0.60	\$ 125.00	\$	75.00
1/21/2012	Hullez	Meeting with CBM re appellate strategy for fee and merits appeals; review and discuss	0.00	ÿ 123.00	Υ	75.00
		37 11 7				
		discuss				
		assign AMB task of revising both applications and drafting separate stipulations to attach to				
4/25/2012	Barvir	each application.	0.40	\$ 225.00	\$	90.00
4/25/2012	Monfort	Legal research and analysis re AOB; research and review cited authorities.	1.80	\$ 325.00	\$	585.00
		Review and revise Application and Stipulation for Second Extension of Time and Application to				
		Stay Fee Appeal; review and revise Declaration of Clinton B. Monfort in Support; conduct final		4		
4/26/2012	Barvir	proofread and incorporate final revisions.	2.10	\$ 225.00	\$	472.50
		Deview and review attendations for automator of time and mations and declarations in assument				
4/26/2012	Monfort	Review and revise stipulations for extension of time and motions and declarations in support re merits and fee appeal; draft final revisions to supporting declaration re same.	0.60	\$ 325.00	ċ	105.00
4/20/2012	WOITOIL	Review and revise Application and Stipulation for Second Extension of Time and Application to	0.00	\$ 323.00	Ş	195.00
		Stay Fee Appeal; review and revise Declaration of Clinton B. Monfort in Support; conduct final				
4/27/2012	Barvir	proofread and incorporate changes.	2.10	\$ 225.00	Ś	472.50
,, =:,, ====		Meet with CBM re final revisions to extension and stay stipulation and supporting		7	т	
4/27/2012	Barvir	declarations.	0.30	\$ 225.00	\$	67.50
		Telephone conference with GSM and CBM re merits appeal; discuss arguments raised in				
4/27/2012	Barvir	Appellants' Opening Brief and consider initial strategy for Respondents' Brief.	0.30	\$ 225.00	\$	67.50
		Telephone conference with GSM and AMB re merits appeal; discuss arguments raised in				
4/27/2012	Monfort	Appellants' Opening Brief and consider initial strategy for Respondents' Brief.	0.30	\$ 325.00	\$	97.50
4/27/2042			0.00	A 225 00		07.50
4/27/2012	Monfort	Meet with AB re final revisions to extension and stay stipulation and supporting declarations. Research vagueness cases cited by Appellants and correspondence to and from GSM re same;	0.30	\$ 325.00	\$	97.50
4/27/2012	Monfort	begin preparing detailed outline of arguments per GSM.	1 20	\$ 325.00	ċ	422.50
4/2//2012	WOITIOIL	Final review of Motions for extension of time and discuss distribution to counsel and filing	1.30	\$ 323.00	٦	422.30
4/27/2012	Monfort	with AB.	0.20	\$ 325.00	Ś	65.00
,, = , , = = = =				7 020100	т	
		Receive email from opposing counsel re receipt, approval, and signature of Stipulation for				
		Second Extension of Time to File Respondents' Brief; send email to opposing counsel re				
		Stipulation to Stay Fee Motion Appeal; receive email from opposing counsel requesting				
		resubmission of stipulation in PDF format; meeting with CA re formatting Stipulation to Stay				
4/30/2012	Barvir	Fee Motion; draft and send follow up email to opposing counsel re same.		\$ 225.00		45.00
4/30/2012	Monfort	Meet with CDM re status of merits and fee appeal.	0.10	\$ 325.00	\$	32.50
F /4/2012	Manfaut	Continue research ISO respondent's opening brief; analysis and review of record cited by	1 70	ć 22F 00	ċ	FF2 F0
5/4/2012	Monfort	Defendants. Legal research in support of Respondent's opening brief; analysis and review of case law cited	1.70	\$ 325.00	\$	552.50
5/8/2012	Monfort	by Defendants.	2 20	\$ 325.00	\$	715.00
5/9/2012	Monfort	Continue research and analysis of case law ISO Respondent's opening brief.	0.80	\$ 325.00	\$	260.00
0,0,000		Review attorney notes drafted by CDM and SAB IOS plaintiffs' first draft of Respondent's		7	-	
		opening brief; discuss litigation strategy on appeal with SAB; draft attorney notes re initial				
5/11/2012	Monfort	outline considerations.	1.30	\$ 325.00	\$	422.50
		Meeting with SAB re: assignment to type and revise research memo for drafting of				
5/22/2012	Nunez	Respondents Brief.	0.20	\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
		Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief (merits appeal); discuss				
		assign RP task of reviewing important documents in				
		case, including Appellants' Opening Brief and take note of important authority and issues to				_
5/23/2012	Barvir	further research.	0.10	\$ 225.00	\$	22.50
E /22 /2212	D - m in	Meeting with CBM to discuss assignment of research tasks for RP to conduct in initial	0.46	ć 225.00	<u>,</u>	22.50
5/23/2012	Barvir	preparations for drafting Respondents' Brief in merits appeal. Applying pleadings in preparation for responding to appellant's appoint brief		\$ 225.00		22.50
5/23/2012	Poteet	Analyze pleadings in preparation for responding to appellant's opening brief	1.00	\$ 125.00	\$	125.00

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate	Α	mount
		Receipt, review and analyze Appellants' Opening Brief, Superior Court Order Granting				
		Summary Adjudication, and multiple briefs filed re Motion for Summary				
1		Judgment/Adjudication; also review Record on Appeal; take notes and conduct research to				
5/25/2012	Barvir	begin preparing Respondents' Brief.	1.20	\$ 225.00	Ş	270.00
		Receipt, review and analyze Appellants' Opening Brief, Superior Court Order Granting				
		Summary Adjudication, and multiple briefs filed re Motion for Summary				
1		Judgment/Adjudication; also review Record on Appeal; take notes and conduct research to				
5/25/2012	Barvir	begin preparing Respondents' Brief.	3.10	\$ 225.00	\$	697.50
		Meeting with CBM and RP re litigation strategy and preparation of Respondents' Brief; discuss				
_ , ,		discuss				
5/25/2012	Barvir	also	0.20	\$ 225.00	\$	45.00
1	_	Continue research ISO respondents' opening brief; advise AMB re research, outlining, and				
5/25/2012	Monfort	drafting tasks.; discuss appellate litigation strategy and discuss also with SAB.	1.80	\$ 325.00	\$	585.00
		Meeting with AMB and RP re litigation strategy and preparation of Respondents' Brief; discuss				
		and assign research tasks to RP re same; discuss				
5/25/2012	Monfort	also	0.20	\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
		Meeting with RP re Parker Appeal; discussed and strategized				
5/29/2012	Barvir			\$ 225.00	\$	180.00
5/29/2012	Barvir	Analyze record on appeal; draft outline and prepare rough draft of Respondents' Brief.	3.90	\$ 225.00	\$	877.50
		Meeting with RP re research needed for Appellee's Reply Brief in Parker Appeal. Specifically,				
5/29/2012	Barvir	issues re facial/vagueness challenges.		\$ 225.00	\$	112.50
5/29/2012	Monfort	Meeting with RP, HC, AMB, AK, SAB, JAS, CDM discuss status of case.	0.20	\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
		Review of draft summary of argument for respondents' opening brief and issues identified by				
5/29/2012	Monfort	AMB and revise; discuss litigation strategy.	1.40	\$ 325.00	\$	455.00
5/29/2012	Nunez	Meeting with AMB re: preparing Respondents' Brief and locating hard copy of joint appendix.	2.00	\$ 125.00	\$	250.00
		Meeting with AMB re research needed for Appellee's Brief in Parker Appeal. Specifically,				
5/29/2012	Poteet	issues re facial/vagueness challenges.	0.50	\$ 125.00	\$	62.50
		Meeting with AMB re Parker Appeal; discussed and strategized				
5/29/2012	Poteet			\$ 125.00	\$	87.50
5/29/2012	Poteet	Conduct legal research re: Parker Appeal and the applicable standard of review.	1.20	\$ 125.00	\$	150.00
		Draft Respondents' Brief; outline argument and begin drafting brief; conduct legal research as				
5/30/2012	Barvir	necessary re standards applied to facial challenges, vagueness challenges, etc.	3.10	\$ 225.00	\$	697.50
		Draft Respondents' Brief; outline argument and begin drafting brief; conduct legal research as				
5/30/2012	Barvir	necessary re standards applied to facial challenges, vagueness challenges, etc.	1.40	\$ 225.00	\$	315.00
		Meeting with CBM re drafting Respondents' Brief; discuss arguments presented by Appellants,				
		discuss and weigh arguments in response, and discuss				
5/30/2012	Barvir	review rough outline of brief.	1.80	\$ 225.00	\$	405.00
		Conduct legal research re standards to apply in facial vagueness challenges; review RP's				
5/30/2012	Barvir	research and memorandum re same.	1.80	\$ 225.00	\$	405.00
5/30/2012	Brady	Analyze issues in drafting response to DOJ's opening appellate brief with CBM and AMB.	0.40	\$ 250.00	\$	100.00
		Meeting with AMB re Respondents' Brief; discuss arguments presented by Appellants, discuss				
		and weigh arguments in response, and discuss				
5/30/2012	Monfort	review rough outline of brief.	1.80	\$ 325.00	\$	585.00
5/30/2012	Poteet	Meeting with AMB re research related to authority cited by Appellant in their opening brief.	0.70	\$ 125.00	\$	87.50
		Conduct legal research re: test for facial challenges and authority cited by Appellants in their				
5/30/2012	Poteet	opening brief.	9.40	\$ 125.00	\$	1,175.00
		Conduct legal research on standards applied in California courts to facial vagueness				
5/31/2012	Barvir	challenges; outline and begin drafting Respondents' Brief.	1.10	\$ 225.00	\$	247.50
		Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; discuss	_			7
5/31/2012	Barvir	and discuss brief.	0.10	\$ 225.00	\$	22.50
		Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; discuss				
		discuss also structure of brief and				
5/31/2012	Barvir	content to include; discuss also	0.50	\$ 225.00	\$	112.50
		Conduct legal research on standards applied in California courts to facial vagueness				
5/31/2012	Barvir	challenges; outline and begin drafting Respondents' Brief.	3.10	\$ 225.00	\$	697.50
		Conduct legal research on standards applied in California courts to facial vagueness				
5/31/2012	Barvir	challenges; outline and begin drafting Respondents' Brief.	3.30	\$ 225.00	\$	742.50

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate	A	mount
		Meeting with AMB re Respondents' Brief; discuss preliminary research findings re				
		standards/tests applied in facial vagueness challenges; discuss also structure of brief and				
5/31/2012	Monfort	content to include; discuss also timeline for research, outlining, and rough draft.	0.50	\$ 325.00	\$	162.50
C /4 /2042		Draft Respondents' Brief; outline argument and begin drafting brief; conduct legal research as	2.20	A 225 00		547.50
6/1/2012	Barvir	necessary.	2.30	\$ 225.00	\$	517.50
		Receive email from RP re findings of legal research facial vagueness challenges and authority				
6/1/2012	Barvir	cited by Appellants; review and analyze memorandum of research findings and incorporate language into draft Respondents' Brief.	0.40	\$ 225.00	ċ	90.00
0/1/2012	Daivii	language into draft respondents brief.	0.40	\$ 225.00	Ş	90.00
		Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; brainstorm arguments to incorporate into brief;				
		discuss findings of updated legal research re standards governing facial vagueness challenges				
6/1/2012	Barvir	in California state courts; discuss outline for addressing facial vagueness standard in brief.	0.30	\$ 225.00	Ś	67.50
-, , -		Draft Respondents' Brief; outline argument and begin drafting brief; conduct legal research as		,	<u>'</u>	
6/1/2012	Barvir	necessary.	3.10	\$ 225.00	\$	697.50
6/1/2012	Monfort	Draft e-mails to potential Amici providing requested information re case and appeal.	0.70	\$ 325.00	\$	227.50
6/1/2012	Monfort	Continue legal research ISO appellee's opening brief.	1.30	\$ 325.00	\$	422.50
		Multiple meetings with and e-mails to and from CDM, SAB, and AMB re coordination of amicus				
		brief efforts; discuss also litigation strategy and topics to be focused on in appellee's				
6/1/2012	Monfort	opposition brief.	0.80	\$ 325.00	\$	260.00
i		Multiple meetings with RP re Respondents' Brief; discuss status of and findings of research;				
6/4/2012	Barvir	brainstorm application of research findings to case; brainstorm arguments to include in Brief.	0.60	\$ 225.00	\$	135.00
6/4/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	3.60	\$ 225.00	\$	810.00
		Draft Respondents' Brief; outline argument and begin drafting brief; conduct legal research as				
6/4/2012	Barvir	necessary.	2.20	\$ 225.00	\$	495.00
6/4/2012	Poteet	Conduct legal research re: authority cited in Appellant's opening brief re vagueness standards.	3.90	\$ 125.00	\$	487.50
- 4 - 4	_	Meeting with AMB re Respondent's brief and authority Appellants used to oppose vagueness		4		
6/4/2012	Poteet	challenge.	0.20	\$ 125.00	Ş	25.00
6/4/2042	5	Meeting with AMB re Respondent's brief and authority Appellants used to oppose vagueness	0.00	A 425 00		27.50
6/4/2012	Poteet	challenge.		\$ 125.00	\$	37.50
6/4/2012	Poteet	Conduct legal research re:authority cited in Appellant's opening brief.	1.50	\$ 125.00	\$	187.50
6/5/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	1.60	\$ 225.00	\$	360.00
6/5/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	3.60	\$ 225.00	\$	810.00
6/5/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Mosting with PMP to policy argument	0.50	\$ 225.00	\$	112.50
6/5/2012	Barvir	Meeting with RMP re policy argument	0.40	\$ 225.00	\$	90.00
0/3/2012	Daivii	Conduct legal research re: Policy argument	0.40	ÿ 223.00	γ	30.00
6/5/2012	Poteet		3.00	\$ 125.00	\$	375.00
		Draft: Policy argument asserting that		·		
6/5/2012	Poteet		2.90	\$ 125.00	\$	362.50
		Meeting with AMB re policy argument asserting that				
6/5/2012	Poteet		0.40	\$ 125.00	\$	50.00
6/5/2012	Poteet	Draft memo re Appellants' authority for vagueness challenges.	2.40	\$ 125.00	\$	300.00
6/6/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	3.10	\$ 225.00	\$	697.50
6/6/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	2.40	\$ 225.00	\$	540.00
6/6/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	4.90	\$ 225.00	\$	1,102.50
6/6/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	2.90	\$ 225.00	\$	652.50
	_	Meeting with AMB re policy argument		4		
6/6/2012	Poteet		0.50	\$ 125.00	Ş	62.50
s /s /s s s		Conduct legal research re: policy argument		4		
6/6/2012	Poteet	Marking with CDM to December 5 to 1 to	4.00	\$ 125.00	Ş	500.00
C /7 /2042	Damite.	Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; discuss status of drafting; discuss also research	0.00	ć 33F 00	ć	45.00
6/7/2012	Barvir	findings and shape of argument.		\$ 225.00		45.00
6/7/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	2.60	\$ 225.00	\$	585.00
6/7/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	1.80	\$ 225.00	\$	405.00
6/7/2012	Produ	Send e-mail to CBM and AMB with thought re	0.10	¢ 250.00	ċ	25.00
6/7/2012	Brady		0.10	\$ 250.00	Ş	25.00
		Shepardized Kolender v. Lawson, 461 U.S. (1983), non-California authority does not present a				
6/7/2012	Poteet	problem for using Kolender to shape the facial challenge analysis in Respondents' Brief.	1 00	\$ 125.00	¢	225.00
0/1/2012	i oteet	proment for using notetives to shape the facial changing analysis in nespondents, bilet.	1.00	∪0.00 ب	٧	223.00

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate	Δ	mount
Date	ППексереі	Conduct legal research re: Harrot v. County of Kings and strength of pursuing the "list"	Hours	Nate		inount
6/7/2012	Poteet	argument in Respondents' Brief.	1.40	\$ 125.00	\$	175.00
		Analyze California cases distinguishing Kolender v. Lawson, 461 U.S. 352 (1983). California				
C /7 /2012	Detect	authority does not present a problem for using Kolender to shape the facial challenge analysis	1.00	ć 12F 00	ċ	125.00
6/7/2012	Poteet	in Respondents' Brief. Receipt, review and analyze and revise Appellants' Amended Notice of Related Cases and	1.00	\$ 125.00	\$	125.00
6/15/2012	Nunez	Current Status Update.	0.50	\$ 125.00	\$	62.50
		·				
6/25/2012	Michel	Meet with CBM and AMB re litigation strategies on appeal; discuss amicus briefs ISO plaintiffs.	0.30	\$ 450.00	\$	135.00
6/25/2012	Monfort	E-mails to and from C Conte and S Helsley re	0.20	¢ 225.00	Ļ	65.00
6/25/2012	Monfort		0.20	\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
6/25/2012	Monfort	Meet with CDM and AMB re litigation strategies on appeal; discuss amicus briefs ISO plaintiffs.	0.30	\$ 325.00	\$	97.50
		Draft e-mail to C Conte and S Helsley re				
6/25/2012	Monfort		0.30	\$ 325.00	\$	97.50
		Talanhana conference with CDM D Kanal and AMD to submission of Amigus brief by law				
6/25/2012	Monfort	Telephone conference with CDM, D Kopel, and AMB re submission of Amicus brief by law enforcement agencies re ammunition usage and difficulty of enforcement; discuss also SOR.	0.30	\$ 325.00	Ś	97.50
6/26/2012	Brady	Meet with CBM re draft of Plainitff-Appellees' opening brief; follow-up re same.	0.20	\$ 250.00	\$	50.00
6/26/2012	Monfort	Meet with AMB re draft of Plainitff-Appellees' opening brief.		\$ 325.00	\$	32.50
		Analysis and review of opinion in Fox v FCC and draft attorney notes re same for use in				
7/10/2012	Monfort	Plaintiff/Appellees' opening brief.	0.70	\$ 325.00	\$	227.50
7/13/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.		\$ 225.00	\$	697.50
7/17/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.		\$ 225.00	\$	697.50
7/17/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	1.30	\$ 225.00	\$	292.50
7/40/2042	5	Conduct legal research re: Kolander v. Lawson and United States v. Salerno and the application	2.60	ć 425.00		225.00
7/18/2012	Barcenilla	of the principal laid out in U.S. v. Salerno.	2.60	\$ 125.00	\$	325.00
7/18/2012	Barcenilla	Meeting with AMB re research	0.40	\$ 125.00	ċ	50.00
7/10/2012	Darceillia	Meeting with TB re research assignment for Respondents' Brief; discuss issues on appeal,	0.40	Ş 123.00	٦	30.00
		including Appellants' argument that statutes are not facially vague; assign TB follow-up				
		research tasks re facial vagueness tests; brainstorm resources to consult and discuss possible				
7/18/2012	Barvir	arguments.	0.30	\$ 225.00	\$	67.50
		Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary; also review attorney's notes				
7/18/2012	Barvir	and previously-drafted outline to determine necessary follow-up research.	2.10	\$ 225.00	\$	472.50
7/40/2042	D : !!! -	Begin drafting a memorandum of the facial vagueness cases that discuss the application of the	2.60	ć 425.00	ć	225.00
7/19/2012	Barcenilla	Salerno principal and those cases which the court chose not to apply the Salerno principal.	2.60	\$ 125.00	\$	325.00
7/10/2012	Parconilla	Conduct legal research re: People v. Gory, People v. People v. Hazelton and In re Jorge M.,	2.00	\$ 125.00	ċ	250.00
7/19/2012	Barcenilla	cases cited to in Appellant's Opening Brief.	2.00	\$ 125.00	Ş	250.00
		Meeting with AMB re the argument that				
7/19/2012	Barcenilla		1.00	\$ 125.00	\$	125.00
		Conduct legal research re: Sabri v. United States, Washington v. Glucksberg, and Janklow v.				
7/19/2012	Barcenilla	Planned Parenthood and other cases that do not discuss the Salerno principal.	2 20	\$ 125.00	\$	275.00
7/19/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	3.80	\$ 225.00		855.00
7, 23, 2022	54.7	Meeting with TB re research assignment for Respondents' Brief; discuss issues on appeal,	- 5.55	Ψ 225.00	Ψ	000.00
		including Appellants' argument that				
7/19/2012	Barvir		0.60	\$ 225.00	\$	135.00
7/23/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	3.00	\$ 225.00		675.00
7/23/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	1.40	\$ 225.00	\$	315.00
		Receive, review, and analyze email from SAB re recent Second Amendment opinion and use of				
		Salerno facial test; read and analyze attached opinion and take attorney notes; determine				
7/22/2012	Damin	case's impact on argument in Respondents' Brief; receive and review multiple follow-up email	0.00	ć 22F 00	ċ	100.00
7/23/2012 7/23/2012	Barvir	re same from SAB, GSM, and CBM.		\$ 225.00 \$ 225.00	\$	180.00
7/23/2012	Barvir Brady	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Review Second Amendment opinion re Salerno and draft email to team.	1.50 0.80	\$ 225.00	\$ \$	337.50 200.00
1,23,2012	Diddy	Memo re a statute being void for vagueness under a "vague in all applications" test,	0.80	¥ 230.00	٧	200.00
		specifically add a section briefing Washington v. Glucksberg, and Sabri v. United States and				
7/24/2012	Barcenilla	Janklow v. Planned Parenthood.	2.50	\$ 125.00	\$	312.50
		Meeting with TB re Respondents' Brief; discuss status of research and brainstorm further				
7/24/2012	Barvir	avenues to research.	0.20	\$ 225.00	\$	45.00
-	-					

	Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate		Amount
Draft memore : facial challenges "treatisional" and "overbreadth" and constitutional vigueness challenges where there is no first amendment right implicated, a discussion of folioridor v. Lawson which the discent refers to holfman States. V. Flipadid and the suggestion that it be applied to cases where there is no first amendment or other "fundamental" inverset trioved. 250 \$ 125.00 \$ 312.50 \$	Date	типексерег	<u> </u>	Hours	Nate		amount
Draft memo re: facial challenges "traditional" and "overbreadth" and constitutional vaguamess challenges where there is no first amendment right implicated, a discussion of kindner's vagual to the dissent refers to Notifiann States. P. Ripidade and the suggestion that it be applied to cases where there is no first Amendment or other "fundamental" interest involved. 2,50 5,125,00 5, 312,50 Conduct legal research is entirely to Notifiann States. P. Ripidade and the suggestion that it be applications," test pre-Salerno, and a search of California Applietals Court cases that apply the test. 1, 197, 197, 197, 197, 197, 197, 197, 1	7/24/2012	Monfort		3.40	\$ 325.00	Ś	1.105.00
Control of Cases where the is no first amendment right implicated, a discussion of Kolender v. Lauson which the discent refer to forfinan fastes v. Plippide and the suggestion that the page that t	772.72012		accome, notes to summer	51.10	ψ 020.00	Υ	2)200.00
Control of Cases where the is no first amendment right implicated, a discussion of Kolender v. Lauson which the discent refer to forfinan fastes v. Plippide and the suggestion that the page that t			Draft memo re: facial challenges "traditional" and "overbreadth" and constitutional vagueness				
Lawson which the dissent refers to Hoffman Estates v. Flipside and the suggestion that it be applied accesse where there is no first Amendment or other "fundamental" interest involved. 2.50 \$125.00 \$ 312.50							
2,250 125.00 \$ 312.50							
Conduct legal research re: Hoffman Estates v. Fippide, the "Impermissibly vague in all of its application" test pre-Salermo, and a search of California Appellate Court cases that apply the lest.	7/25/2012	Barcenilla		2.50	\$ 125.00	Ś	312.50
applications* test pre-Salermo, and a search of California Appellate Court cases that apply the received by the pre-Salermo, and a search of California Appellate Court cases that apply the pre-Salermo applications* test and a case brief of People v. Truoung.	., ==, ===		••		7	-	
Add to the memor re vagueness challenges a discussion of Hoffman Estates v. Flipside and the							
Add to the memor e vagueness challenges a discussion of Hoffman Estates v. Flipside and the "impermissibly vague in all of its applications" test and a case brief of People v. Truoung. 1.80 \$125.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 180.00 \$1725/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents Brief; conduct Legal research as necessary. 1.80 \$225.00 \$ 765.00 \$180.00 \$1725/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct Legal research as necessary. 1.80 \$225.00 \$ 765.00 \$180.00 \$1725/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct Legal research as necessary. 1.80 \$225.00 \$ 765.00 \$180.00 \$1725/2012 \$180.00 \$	7/25/2012	Barcenilla		2.30	\$ 125.00	Ś	287.50
	, , , ,				,		
			Add to the memo re vagueness challenges a discussion of Hoffman Estates v. Flipside and the				
725/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Biref; conduct legal research as necessary. 0.88 \$25.00 \$ 405.00 \$ 725/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Biref; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.80 \$25.00 \$ 765.0	7/25/2012	Barcenilla		1.80	\$ 125.00	Ś	225.00
725/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.80 \$225.00 \$ 405.00							
Type Part Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 3.40 \$.255.00 \$ 765.00			,				
Draft memore: vagueness challenges, specifically add a case brief for Citters for Jobs v. County of Orange and Re-open Rambla, Inc. v. Board of Supervisors and a discussion section for each. 280 \$ 125.00 \$ 350.00				3.40		\$	
County of Orange and Re-open Rambla, Inc. v. Board of Supervisors and adiscussion section for each.	, , , ,	-			,		
Draft memore: vagueness challenges, determine the whether each case is civil or criminal, whether there was a facial challenge or a vagueness challenge, whether the Saleron test applied or the Hoffman test was applied, and whether the each test was applied to constitutionally protected rights. Analyze In re Jorge M., People v. Haarelon, People v. Townsend, In re Sheena K., and People ex red Gallo v. Acuna to determine if they were criminal cases, whether Hoffman Estates test was applied, and whether there was a constitutionally protected right at issue. 7/26/2012 Barcenilla Draft memor re: vagueness challenges, specifically adding a discussion of the Hoffman Estates test was applied, and whether there was a constitutionally protected right at issue. 1.80 \$125.00 \$ 225.00 Draft memor re: vagueness challenges, specifically adding a discussion of the Hoffman Estates test was applied, and whether there was a constitutionally protected right at issue. 2.70 \$125.00 \$ 337.50 Conduct legal research re: Village of Hoffman Estates v. Flipside, Baggett v. Bullitt, and Sanchez v. City of Modesto, to determine cases that have cited to them and cases that have districted in the protection of the Hoffman Estates v. Flipside, Baggett v. Bullitt, and Sanchez v. City of Modesto, to determine cases that have cited to them and cases that have districted in the protection of the Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 2.30 \$125.00 \$ 287.50 7/26/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 3.00 \$225.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00 Meeting with TB re Respondents' Brief; discuss status of research and findings; nail down facial vagueness a regument and direct several discret research tasks for follow up. 1.00 \$225.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00 Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; discuss status of research and protions of record to include in section of brief re vagueness of challenged laws. 2.70 \$225.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00 2.70 \$225.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00 2.70 \$225.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00 3.70	7/26/2012	Barcenilla		2.80	\$ 125.00	\$	350.00
Applied or the Hoffman test was applied, and whether the each test was applied to constitutionally protected rights. 1.20 \$ 125.00 \$ 150.00			Draft memo re: vagueness challenges, determine the whether each case is civil or criminal,				
Analyze In re Jorge M., People v. Hazelton, People v. Townsend, In re Sheena K., and People v. rel Gállo v. Acuna to determine if they were criminal cases, whether hoffman Estates test was applied, and whether there was a constitutionally protected right at its use. 7/26/2012 Barcenilla Analyze In re Jorge M., People v. Hazelton, People v. Townsend, In re Sheena K., and People v. rel Gállo v. Acuna to determine if they were criminal cases, whether hoffman Estates test was applied, and whether there was a constitutionally protected right at its use. 7/26/2012 Barcenilla Acuna to determine if they were criminal cases, whether hoffman Estates test was applied, and whether there was a constitutionally protected right at its use. 7/26/2012 Barcenilla Acuna to determine cases that have clied to them and cases and clied in section of brief respandents' Brief; cliscuss status of research complete research and findings; nail down fac			whether there was a facial challenge or a vagueness challenge, whether the Salerno test				
Analyze In re lorge M., People v. Hazelton, People v. Townsend, In re Sheena K., and People x rel Gallo v. Acuna to determine if they were criminal cases, whether Hoffman Estates test was applied, and whether there was a constitutionally protected right at issue. 7/26/2012 Barcenilla Dard memore: ugequeness challenges, specifically adding a discussion of the Hoffman Estates doctrine versus the Salerno Doctrine. Conduct legal research re: Village of Hoffman Estates v. Flipside, Baggett v. Bullitt, and Sanchez v. City of Modesto, to determine cases that have cited to them and cases that have distinguished them. 7/26/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 3.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 287.50 \$ 287.50 \$ 275.00 \$ 287.50 \$ 275.00 \$ 287.50 \$ 275.00 \$ 287.50 \$ 275.00 \$ 287.50 \$ 275.00 \$ 287.50			applied or the Hoffman test was applied, and whether the each test was applied to				
Analyze In re lorge M., People v. Hazelton, People v. Townsend, In re Sheena K., and People x rel Gallo v. Acuna to determine if they were criminal cases, whether Hoffman Estates test was applied, and whether there was a constitutionally protected right at issue. 7/26/2012 Barcenilla Dard memore: ugequeness challenges, specifically adding a discussion of the Hoffman Estates doctrine versus the Salerno Doctrine. Conduct legal research re: Village of Hoffman Estates v. Flipside, Baggett v. Bullitt, and Sanchez v. City of Modesto, to determine cases that have cited to them and cases that have distinguished them. 7/26/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 3.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 287.50 \$ 287.50 \$ 275.00 \$ 287.50 \$ 275.00 \$ 287.50 \$ 275.00 \$ 287.50 \$ 275.00 \$ 287.50 \$ 275.00 \$ 287.50	7/26/2012	Barcenilla		1.20	\$ 125.00	\$	150.00
rel Gallo x. Acuna to determine if they were criminal cases, whether Hoffman Estates test was applied, and whether there was a constitutionally protected right at issue. 1.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 225.00	, ,		71 0				
Process of the proc			Analyze In re Jorge M., People v. Hazelton, People v. Townsend, In re Sheena K., and People ex				
Draft memor ex vagueness challenges, specifically adding a discussion of the Hoffman Estates 2.70 \$ 125.00 \$ 337.50			rel Gallo v. Acuna to determine if they were criminal cases, whether Hoffman Estates test was				
Draft memor ex vagueness challenges, specifically adding a discussion of the Hoffman Estates 2.70 \$ 125.00 \$ 337.50	7/26/2012	Barcenilla	applied, and whether there was a constitutionally protected right at issue.	1.80	\$ 125.00	\$	225.00
April Apri							
Conduct legal research re: Village of Hoffman Estates v. Flipside, Baggett v. Bullitt, and Sanchez v. City of Modesto, to determine cases that have cited to them and cases that have distinguished them. 7/26/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/26/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/26/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/26/2012 Barvir Facility of the CDM's attack of the Modes of the	7/26/2012	Barcenilla		2.70	\$ 125.00	\$	337.50
7/26/2012 Barcenillal Barvir distinguished them. 2.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 287.50 7/26/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 675.00 7/26/2012 Barvir Meeting with TB re Respondents' Brief; discuss status of research and findings; nail down facial vagueness argument and direct several discreet research tasks for follow up. 1.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00 7/26/2012 Barvir Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; discuss status of drafting; discuss brainstorm arguments and portions of record to include in section of brief re vagueness of challenged laws. 0.70 \$ 225.00 \$ 157.50 7/26/2012 Brady Analyze materials from record to include in appeal defense with CBM and discuss. 0.70 \$ 225.00 \$ 157.50 7/26/2012 Brady Analyze materials from record to include in appeal defense with CBM and discuss. 0.70 \$ 225.00 \$ 157.50 7/26/2012 Brady Analyze materials from record to include in appeal defense with CBM and discuss. 0.70 \$ 225.00 \$ 157.50 7/26/2012 Brady Draft Respondents' Brief; discuss further research to be completed resemble and discuss. 0.70 \$ 225.00			Conduct legal research re: Village of Hoffman Estates v. Flipside, Baggett v. Bullitt, and		<u> </u>	•	
Partic Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 3.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 675.00			Sanchez v. City of Modesto, to determine cases that have cited to them and cases that have				
Partic Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 3.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 675.00	7/26/2012	Barcenilla	distinguished them.	2.30	\$ 125.00	\$	287.50
Meeting with TB re Respondents' Brief; discuss status of research and findings; nail down facial vagueness argument and direct several discreet research tasks for follow up. 1.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00 Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; discuss status of drafting; discuss brainstorm arguments and portions of record to include in section of brief re vagueness of challenged laws. 0.70 \$ 225.00 \$ 157.50 7/26/2012 Brady Analyze materials from record to include in appeal defense with CBM and discuss. 1.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 250.00 Review and revise current rough draft of Respondents' opening brief; mutiliple e-mails to AMB and discuss strategy with SAB; draft attorney notes re same. 2.80 \$ 325.00 \$ 910.00 7/27/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 3.70 \$ 225.00 \$ 832.50 Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief; discuss further research to be completed re facial challenges. 2.80 \$ 325.00 \$ 45.00 Analysis and review of record on appeal to determine all records that must be cited to and brought to the COA's attention; discuss with SAB and AMB; draft attorney notes re same. 2.60 \$ 325.00 \$ 845.00 Analysis and review of research compiled for AMB and determine proper usage and argument structure in Plaintiffs/Appellee's opening responsive brief. 2.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 715.00 Analyze the difference between the application of the Hoffman Estates doctrine in the Acuna case and in other case similar to Acuna where no constitutional conduct was implicated by the Ordinance. Add to memo re: facial challenges, a chart of the differences between the application of the Salerno test and the application of the Hoffman test, a discussion of the Village of Hoffman Research case althority cited by State re facial challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant Challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant Challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant Challenges; receive, re	7/26/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.			\$	675.00
Facial vagueness argument and direct several discreet research tasks for follow up. 1.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00	7/26/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	1.50	\$ 225.00	\$	337.50
Facial vagueness argument and direct several discreet research tasks for follow up. 1.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00							
Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; discuss status of drafting; discuss brainstorm arguments and portions of			Meeting with TB re Respondents' Brief; discuss status of research and findings; nail down				
Strainstorm arguments and portions of	7/26/2012	Barvir	facial vagueness argument and direct several discreet research tasks for follow up.	1.00	\$ 225.00	\$	225.00
7/26/2012 Barvir record to include in section of brief re vagueness of challenged laws. 0.70 \$ 225.00 \$ 157.50 7/26/2012 Brady Analyze materials from record to include in appeal defense with CBM and discuss. 1.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 250.00 7/26/2012 Monfort Review and revise current rough draft of Respondents' opening brief; multiple e-mails to AMB and discuss strategy with SAB; draft attorney notes re same. 2.80 \$ 325.00 \$ 910.00 7/27/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 3.70 \$ 225.00 \$ 832.50 7/27/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; discuss further research to be completed re facial challenges. 0.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 45.00 7/27/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; discuss further research to be completed re facial challenges. 0.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 45.00 7/27/2012 Monfort Brown of record on appeal to determine all records that must be cited to and brought to the COA's attention; discuss with SAB and AMB; draft attorney notes re same. 2.60 \$ 325.00 \$ 845.00 7/27/2012 Monfort Brown of research compiled for AMB and determine proper usage and argument structure in Plaintiffs/Appellee's opening responsive brief. 2.20 \$ 325.00 \$ 715.00 7/30/2012 Barcenilla Ordinance. 2.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 287.50 7/30/2012 Barcenilla Salerno test and the application of the Hoffman testates doctrine in the Acuna case and in other case similar to Acuna where no constitutional conduct was implicated by the ordinance. 2.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 287.50 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research re case authority cited by State re facial challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB. 0.40 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.00 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 247.50 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 247.50 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.00			Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; discuss status of drafting; discuss				
7/26/2012 Brady Analyze materials from record to include in appeal defense with CBM and discuss. Review and revise current rough draft of Respondents' opening brief; mutliple e-mails to AMB and discuss strategy with SAB; draft attorney notes re same. 7/26/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Analysis and review of record on appeal to determine all records that must be cited to and brought to the COA's attention; discuss with SAB and AMB; draft attorney notes re same. Analysis and review of record on appeal to determine all records that must be cited to and brought to the COA's attention; discuss with SAB and AMB; draft attorney notes re same. Analysis and review of research compiled for AMB and determine proper usage and argument structure in Plaintiffs/Appellee's opening responsive brief. Analyze the difference between the application of the Hoffman Estates doctrine in the Acuna case and in other case similar to Acuna where no constitutional conduct was implicated by the ordinance. Add to memo re: facial challenges, a chart of the differences between the application of the Salerno test and the application of the Hoffman test, a discussion of the Village of Hoffman Estates v. Flipside. Receive email from TB re findings of legal research re case authority cited by State re facial challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.00 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.00 Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village			; brainstorm arguments and portions of				
Review and revise current rough draft of Respondents' opening brief; mutliple e-mails to AMB 7/26/2012 Monfort and discuss strategy with SAB; draft attorney notes re same. 7/27/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/27/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; discuss further research to be completed re facial 7/27/2012 Barvir Challenges. 7/27/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; discuss further research to be completed re facial 7/27/2012 Barvir Challenges. 7/27/2012 Monfort Analysis and review of record on appeal to determine all records that must be cited to and brought to the COA's attention; discuss with SAB and AMB; draft attorney notes re same. 7/27/2012 Monfort Structure in Plaintiffs/Appellee's opening responsive brief. 7/27/2012 Monfort Structure in Plaintiffs/Appellee's opening responsive brief. 7/27/2012 Barcenilla Ordinance. 7/30/2012 Barcenilla Ordinance Or	7/26/2012	Barvir	record to include in section of brief re vagueness of challenged laws.	0.70	\$ 225.00	\$	157.50
7/26/2012 Monfort and discuss strategy with SAB, draft attorney notes re same. 7/27/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/27/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; discuss further research to be completed re facial challenges. 7/27/2012 Barvir Challenges. 7/27/2012 Barvir Challenges. 7/27/2012 Monfort Drought to the COA's attention; discuss with SAB and AMB; draft attorney notes re same. 7/27/2012 Monfort Drought to the COA's attention; discuss with SAB and AMB; draft attorney notes re same. 7/27/2012 Monfort Structure in Plaintiffs/Appellee's opening responsive brief. 7/27/2012 Monfort Structure in Plaintiffs/Appellee's opening responsive brief. 7/27/2012 Barcenilla Ordinance. 7/30/2012 Barcenilla Drought to Acuna where no constitutional conduct was implicated by the ordinance. 7/30/2012 Barcenilla Drought of the Hoffman test, a discussion of the Village of Hoffman Estates v. Flipside. 8/280 \$ 125.00 \$ 325.00 \$	7/26/2012	Brady	Analyze materials from record to include in appeal defense with CBM and discuss.	1.00	\$ 250.00	\$	250.00
7/27/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief; discuss further research to be completed re facial challenges. Analysis and review of record on appeal to determine all records that must be cited to and brought to the COA's attention; discuss with SAB and AMB; draft attorney notes re same. Analysis and review of research compiled for AMB and determine proper usage and argument structure in Plaintiffs/Appellee's opening responsive brief. Analyze the difference between the application of the Hoffman Estates doctrine in the Acuna case and in other case similar to Acuna where no constitutional conduct was implicated by the ordinance. Add to memo re: facial challenges, a chart of the differences between the application of the Salerno test and the application of the Hoffman test, a discussion of the Village of Hoffman Estates v. Flipside. Receive email from TB re findings of legal research re case authority cited by State re facial challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB. 7/30/2012 Barvir Case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB. David S 225.00 \$ 90.00 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 247.50 Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village			Review and revise current rough draft of Respondents' opening brief; mutliple e-mails to AMB				
Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief; discuss further research to be completed re facial challenges. Analysis and review of record on appeal to determine all records that must be cited to and brought to the COA's attention; discuss with SAB and AMB; draft attorney notes re same. Analysis and review of research compiled for AMB and determine proper usage and argument structure in Plaintiffs/Appellee's opening responsive brief. Analyze the difference between the application of the Hoffman Estates doctrine in the Acuna case and in other case similar to Acuna where no constitutional conduct was implicated by the ordinance. Add to memo re: facial challenges, a chart of the differences between the application of the Salerno test and the application of the Hoffman test, a discussion of the Village of Hoffman Estates v. Flipside. Receive email from TB re findings of legal research re case authority cited by State re facial challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB. 7/30/2012 Barvir case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB. Daft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Daft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.00 Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village	7/26/2012	Monfort		2.80	\$ 325.00	\$	910.00
7/27/2012 Barvir challenges. Analysis and review of record on appeal to determine all records that must be cited to and brought to the COA's attention; discuss with SAB and AMB; draft attorney notes re same. 7/27/2012 Monfort brought to the COA's attention; discuss with SAB and AMB; draft attorney notes re same. 7/27/2012 Monfort structure in Plaintiffs/Appellee's opening responsive brief. Analyze the difference between the application of the Hoffman Estates doctrine in the Acuna case and in other case similar to Acuna where no constitutional conduct was implicated by the ordinance. Add to memo re: facial challenges, a chart of the differences between the application of the Salerno test and the application of the Hoffman test, a discussion of the Village of Hoffman Estates v. Flipside. Receive email from TB re findings of legal research re case authority cited by State re facial challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village	7/27/2012	Barvir	,	3.70	\$ 225.00	\$	832.50
Analysis and review of record on appeal to determine all records that must be cited to and brought to the COA's attention; discuss with SAB and AMB; draft attorney notes re same. Analysis and review of research compiled for AMB and determine proper usage and argument structure in Plaintiffs/Appellee's opening responsive brief. Analyze the difference between the application of the Hoffman Estates doctrine in the Acuna case and in other case similar to Acuna where no constitutional conduct was implicated by the ordinance. Add to memo re: facial challenges, a chart of the differences between the application of the Salerno test and the application of the Hoffman test, a discussion of the Village of Hoffman Estates v. Flipside. Receive email from TB re findings of legal research re case authority cited by State re facial challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village			Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief; discuss further research to be completed re facial				
7/27/2012 Monfort brought to the COA's attention; discuss with SAB and AMB; draft attorney notes re same. Analysis and review of research compiled for AMB and determine proper usage and argument structure in Plaintiffs/Appellee's opening responsive brief. Analyze the difference between the application of the Hoffman Estates doctrine in the Acuna case and in other case similar to Acuna where no constitutional conduct was implicated by the ordinance. Add to memo re: facial challenges, a chart of the differences between the application of the Salerno test and the application of the Hoffman test, a discussion of the Village of Hoffman Estates v. Flipside. Receive email from TB re findings of legal research re case authority cited by State re facial challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant Case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB. Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village	7/27/2012	Barvir	challenges.	0.20	\$ 225.00	\$	45.00
7/27/2012 Monfort brought to the COA's attention; discuss with SAB and AMB; draft attorney notes re same. Analysis and review of research compiled for AMB and determine proper usage and argument structure in Plaintiffs/Appellee's opening responsive brief. Analyze the difference between the application of the Hoffman Estates doctrine in the Acuna case and in other case similar to Acuna where no constitutional conduct was implicated by the ordinance. Add to memo re: facial challenges, a chart of the differences between the application of the Salerno test and the application of the Hoffman test, a discussion of the Village of Hoffman Estates v. Flipside. Receive email from TB re findings of legal research re case authority cited by State re facial challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant Case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB. Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village							
Analysis and review of research compiled for AMB and determine proper usage and argument structure in Plaintiffs/Appellee's opening responsive brief. Analyze the difference between the application of the Hoffman Estates doctrine in the Acuna case and in other case similar to Acuna where no constitutional conduct was implicated by the ordinance. Add to memo re: facial challenges, a chart of the differences between the application of the Salerno test and the application of the Hoffman test, a discussion of the Village of Hoffman Estates v. Flipside. Receive email from TB re findings of legal research re case authority cited by State re facial challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.00 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 247.50 Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village			,				
7/27/2012 Monfort structure in Plaintiffs/Appellee's opening responsive brief. Analyze the difference between the application of the Hoffman Estates doctrine in the Acuna case and in other case similar to Acuna where no constitutional conduct was implicated by the 7/30/2012 Barcenilla ordinance. Add to memo re: facial challenges, a chart of the differences between the application of the Salerno test and the application of the Hoffman test, a discussion of the Village of Hoffman 8 Estates v. Flipside. Receive email from TB re findings of legal research re case authority cited by State re facial challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant 7/30/2012 Barvir case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	7/27/2012	Monfort		2.60	\$ 325.00	\$	845.00
Analyze the difference between the application of the Hoffman Estates doctrine in the Acuna case and in other case similar to Acuna where no constitutional conduct was implicated by the ordinance. Add to memo re: facial challenges, a chart of the differences between the application of the Salerno test and the application of the Hoffman test, a discussion of the Village of Hoffman 7/30/2012 Barcenilla Estates v. Flipside. Receive email from TB re findings of legal research re case authority cited by State re facial challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant 7/30/2012 Barvir case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB. Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village							
case and in other case similar to Acuna where no constitutional conduct was implicated by the 7/30/2012 Barcenilla ordinance. 2.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 287.50 Add to memo re: facial challenges, a chart of the differences between the application of the Salerno test and the application of the Hoffman test, a discussion of the Village of Hoffman 7/30/2012 Barcenilla Estates v. Flipside. 2.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 350.00 Receive email from TB re findings of legal research re case authority cited by State re facial challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant 7/30/2012 Barvir case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB. 0.40 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.00 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 247.50 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 405.00 Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village	7/27/2012	Monfort		2.20	\$ 325.00	\$	715.00
7/30/2012 Barcenilla ordinance. Add to memo re: facial challenges, a chart of the differences between the application of the Salerno test and the application of the Hoffman test, a discussion of the Village of Hoffman Festates v. Flipside. Receive email from TB re findings of legal research re case authority cited by State re facial challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant Case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB. Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village			·				
Add to memo re: facial challenges, a chart of the differences between the application of the Salerno test and the application of the Hoffman test, a discussion of the Village of Hoffman 7/30/2012 Barcenilla Estates v. Flipside. Receive email from TB re findings of legal research re case authority cited by State re facial challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant 7/30/2012 Barvir case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB. Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village			case and in other case similar to Acuna where no constitutional conduct was implicated by the				
Salerno test and the application of the Hoffman test, a discussion of the Village of Hoffman 7/30/2012 Barcenilla Estates v. Flipside. 2.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 350.00 Receive email from TB re findings of legal research re case authority cited by State re facial challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant 7/30/2012 Barvir case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB. 0.40 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.00 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 247.50 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 405.00 Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village	7/30/2012	Barcenilla		2.30	\$ 125.00	\$	287.50
7/30/2012BarcenillaEstates v. Flipside.2.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 350.00Receive email from TB re findings of legal research re case authority cited by State re facial challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant7/30/2012Barvircase law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB.0.40 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.007/30/2012BarvirDraft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.1.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.007/30/2012BarvirDraft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.1.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 247.507/30/2012BarvirDraft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.1.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 405.00Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village							
Receive email from TB re findings of legal research re case authority cited by State re facial challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant 7/30/2012 Barvir case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB. 0.40 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.00 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 247.50 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 405.00 Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village			Salerno test and the application of the Hoffman test, a discussion of the Village of Hoffman				
challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant 7/30/2012 Barvir case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB. 0.40 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.00 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 247.50 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 405.00 Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village	7/30/2012	Barcenilla	•	2.80	\$ 125.00	\$	350.00
7/30/2012Barvircase law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB.0.40\$ 225.00\$ 90.007/30/2012BarvirDraft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.1.00\$ 225.00\$ 225.007/30/2012BarvirDraft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.1.10\$ 225.00\$ 247.507/30/2012BarvirDraft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.1.80\$ 225.00\$ 405.00Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village			Receive email from TB re findings of legal research re case authority cited by State re facial				
7/30/2012BarvirDraft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.1.00\$ 225.00\$ 225.007/30/2012BarvirDraft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.1.10\$ 225.00\$ 247.507/30/2012BarvirDraft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.1.80\$ 225.00\$ 405.00Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village			challenges; receive, review, and analyze legal memorandum; pull, read, and analyze relevant				
7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 247.50 7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 405.00 Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village		Barvir	case law; take attorneys notes and send follow up email to TB.	0.40		\$	90.00
7/30/2012 Barvir Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary. 1.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 405.00 Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village		Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	1.00	\$ 225.00	\$	225.00
Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village	7/30/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	1.10	\$ 225.00	\$	247.50
	7/30/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	1.80	\$ 225.00	\$	405.00
7/31/2012 Barcenilla Hoffman Estates and provide a discussion of each. 2.60 \$ 125.00 \$ 325.00			Add to memo re: facial challenges, a case brief of Gatto v. County of Sonoma and Village	_			
	7/31/2012	Barcenilla	Hoffman Estates and provide a discussion of each.	2.60	\$ 125.00	\$	325.00

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate		Amount
	шесре	Conduct legal research re: California Supreme Court and California Appellate Court case law				
		that applies the Hoffman test, in a criminal context, where a constitutionally protected right is				
7/31/2012	Barcenilla	at issue.	1.40	\$ 125.00	Ś	175.00
7/31/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	4.50	\$ 225.00	Ś	1,012.50
, , ,		Analysis and review of current SOR section of Respondents' Opening Brief and advise AMB re		,		,
7/31/2012	Monfort	revisions.	1.20	\$ 325.00	\$	390.00
8/1/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	2.30		\$	517.50
8/1/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.		\$ 225.00	\$	585.00
-, ,		Draft and revise Respondents opening brief and continue review of record; discuss with AMB		,		
8/1/2012	Monfort	and advise.	2.20	\$ 325.00	\$	715.00
8/2/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	1.20	\$ 225.00	\$	270.00
8/2/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	2.40	\$ 225.00	\$	540.00
8/3/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	1.60	\$ 225.00	\$	360.00
8/3/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	1.10	\$ 225.00	\$	247.50
		Meeting with AMB re the Memo on the Salerno Standard, the holding in the Hotel & Motel				
		Ass'n of Oakland v. City of Oakland case, the rule in Hoffman Estates and distinguishing Hotel				
8/6/2012	Barcenilla	& Motel.	0.90	\$ 125.00	\$	112.50
8/6/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	2.00	\$ 225.00	Ś	450.00
0,0,=0==		Meeting with TB re Respondents' Brief; discuss findings of facial challenge research that Fifth		7	-	
		District Court of Appeal follows Ninth Circuit void in all applications rule; brainstorm				
		arguments to counter assertion that, to prevail on facial challenge, statue must be vague in all				
8/6/2012	Barvir	applications.	0.70	\$ 225.00	\$	157.50
8/6/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	1.70	\$ 225.00	\$	382.50
8/6/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	1.30	\$ 225.00	\$	292.50
0/0/2012	Darvii	Diate respondents biter, conduct regar research as necessary.	1.50	ÿ 223.00	Υ	232.30
8/7/2012	Barvir	Meeting with CBM re Respondents Brief; discuss status of drafting and arguments to include.	0.10	\$ 225.00	\$	22.50
8/7/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	2.60	\$ 225.00	\$	585.00
8/7/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	4.00	\$ 225.00	\$	900.00
0///2012	Darvii	Telephone conference with CBM re Respondents Brief; discuss status of drafting and	4.00	ÿ 223.00	٧	300.00
8/7/2012	Barvir	arguments to include.	0.10	\$ 225.00	\$	22.50
8/7/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	1.00	\$ 225.00	\$	225.00
8/7/2012	Monfort	Continue drafting, reviewing and revising Respondents' Opening brief.	2.40	\$ 325.00	\$	780.00
0/1/2012	WIGHTOTE	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary; draft section on recovering	2.40	ÿ 323.00	٧	700.00
8/8/2012	Barvir	costs for motion for preliminary injunction.	2.80	\$ 225.00	\$	630.00
8/8/2012	Barvir	Draft Respondents' Brief; conduct legal research as necessary.	3.40	\$ 225.00	\$	765.00
8/8/2012	Daivii	Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; discuss	3.40	\$ 223.00	ڔ	703.00
		conduct review and revision of section on standard applied to				
8/8/2012	Barvir	facial vagueness challenges.	1 60	¢ 22E 00	ċ	360.00
0/0/2012	Daivii	laciai vagueriess crialieriges.	1.00	\$ 225.00	Ą	300.00
8/8/2012	Monfort	Continue reviewing and revising Persondents' Opening Priof and most with AMR recame	2.40	\$ 225.00	ċ	780.00
8/9/2012	Barvir	Continue reviewing and revising Respondents' Opening Brief and meet with AMB re same. Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief per meeting with CBM.	3.40	\$ 325.00 \$ 225.00	\$ \$	765.00
0/9/2012	Daivii	Telephone conference and meeting with CBM and SAB re Respondents' Brief; discuss	3.40	\$ 225.00	Ą	703.00
		discuss				
0/0/2012	Donair	uiscuss	0.20	¢ 225 00	ċ	45.00
8/9/2012	Barvir	Devices we deaft and restrictive Decreased anti- Drief was received with CDM		\$ 225.00 \$ 225.00		45.00
8/9/2012	Barvir	Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief per meeting with CBM.	4.30		\$	967.50
8/9/2012	Brady	Analyze arguments to assert with CBM and AMB.	0.30	\$ 250.00	\$	75.00
0/0/2012	1 4 f t	Review additional research assembled by AMB ISO respondent's opening brief; review and	2.40	ć 225 00	<u>,</u>	700.00
8/9/2012	Monfort	revise current draft of brief and draft attorney notes re same.	2.40	\$ 325.00	\$	780.00
0/0/2012	1.4 ft	Meetings with SAB and AMB re litigaiton strategy on appeal and discuss revisions to and	0.60	ć 225 00	<u>,</u>	405.00
8/9/2012	Monfort	additional arguments to include in Respondents' Opening Brief.	0.60	\$ 325.00	\$	195.00
		Meeting with AMB re Parker Respondents brief;				
0/0/00:5				A 40= 05		c= =c
8/9/2012	Poteet		0.50	\$ 125.00	Ş	62.50
a /a /a - : -		Conduct legal research re: standard of review for trial courts decisions regarding the recovery		A		
8/9/2012	Poteet	of litigation-related costs; draft findings and submit to AMB for review.	1.40	\$ 125.00	Ş	175.00
		Analyze Sanchez v. City of Modesto (2006) 145 Cal.App.4th 660 and Hotel & Motel Ass'n of				
		Oakland v. City of Oakland (9th Cir. 2003) and draft analysis of the appropriate standard of				
		review for facial challenges and determine whether the Fifth Appellate District will apply the				
		Salerno standard outside of the 1st Amendment and abortion contexts; pull relevant language				
		from cases; summarize laws challenged in cases; draft analysis of Sanchez v. Modesto for				
8/9/2012	Poteet	incorporation into Respondents brief.	0.90	\$ 125.00	\$	112.50

Conducting in research re- applicable standard of ferwise for case alleging infringements of constitution rights, shependine authorities, determine whether any authority supports the proposition that the court would give greater deference the State in Parker (i.e., whether any facts support all series standard or leview for the status entablinged by Report State (i.e., whether any facts support all series standard or leview for the status entablinged by Report State (i.e., whether any facts support all series standard to lead to the status entabling and really six submit via Am analysis of the case for incorporation into Respondents State (i.e., whether any facts support and analysis of the case for incorporation into Respondents State (i.e., which is summary and analysis of the case for incorporation into Respondents State (i.e., which is summary and analysis of the case for incorporation into Respondents State (i.e., which is summary and analysis of the case for incorporation into Respondents State (i.e., which is summary and analysis of the case for incorporation into Respondents State (i.e., which is summary and analysis of the case for incorporation into Respondents State (i.e., which is summary and analysis of the case for incorporation into Respondents State (i.e., which is supported to the state (i.e., which is summary and analysis of the case (i.e., which is summary and analysis of the case (i.e., which is summary and analysis of the case (i.e., which is summary and analysis of the case (i.e., which is summary and analysis of the case (i.e., which is summary and analysis of the case (i.e., which is summary and analysis of the case (i.e., which is summary and analysis of the case (i.e., which is summary and analysis of the case (i.e., which is summary and analysis of the case (i.e., which is summary and analysis of the case (i.e., which is summary and analysis of the case (i.e., which is summary and analysis of the case (i.e., which is summary is summary and analysis of the case (i.e., which is summary	Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate		Amount
Constitutional rights, shepardize authorities, determine whether any authority supports the proposition that the court voting due greater deferance the State in Park ILe., whether any lacks support a lesser standard of review for the statue challenged by Respondents (1) Locate most recent blanding California authority, draft more or findings and analysis; submit to AMB 9, 200 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00	Date	ППексереі	·	Hours	Nate	•	aniount
Fig. 12 Foliable							
Fig. 12 Foliable			, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,				
Mary Potential							
Seminaria People February People							
Popple v. Heltzman (1984) of Call-thin 1894 and the statutor challenged in that case; draft 0.40 5.125.00 5.00.00	8/9/2012	Poteet		0.80	\$ 125.00	\$	100.00
Sym/2012 Poteet Summary and analysis of the case for incorporation into Respondents Brief. 0.40 \$125.00 \$ 50.00			People v. Heitzman (1994) 9 Cal.4th 189 and the statute challenged in that case; draft				
Dorit argument re the recovery of Hispatton related costs under the abuse of discretion and 1.10 5.125.00 5 137.50	8/9/2012	Poteet		0.40	\$ 125.00	\$	50.00
Seminaria Semi					,		
Review, revisor, ref draft, and restructure Respondents' Firef section re application of facial Review, revisor, red-draft, and restructure Respondents' Firef section re application of facial Review, revisor, red-draft, and restructure Respondents' Firef section re application of facial Review, revisor, red-draft, and restructure Respondents' Firef section re application of facial Review, revisor, red-draft, and restructure Respondents' Firef section re application of facial Review, revisor, red-draft, and restructure Respondents' Firef. Review, revisor, red-draft, and restructure Respondents' Firef. Review Review Respondents' Fir	8/9/2012	Poteet		1.10	\$ 125.00	\$	137.50
Study2012 Barvir	, ,		Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief section re application of facial		·		
Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief section re application of facial	8/10/2012	Barvir		1.00	\$ 225.00	\$	225.00
Sta0/2012 Barvir vagueness standard to facts per meeting with CBM. 2.00 \$225.00 \$ 480.00 \$ 10/2012 Barvir Review, review, red-fart, and restructure Respondents' Brief. 2.80 \$225.00 \$ 630.00 \$ 10/2012 Barvir Review, review, red-fart, and restructure Respondents' Brief. restructure portions of brief; conduct thorough review and revision of saction re application of facial vagueness standard to facts. 1.00 \$225.00 \$ 225.00		-			,		
Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief. 2.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 6.30.00	8/10/2012	Barvir	·	2.00	\$ 225.00	\$	450.00
Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; restructure portions of brief; conduct thorough review and revision of section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts. 1.00 \$225.00 \$ 225		Barvir	· ·				
8/10/2012 Monfort Draft and revise Respondents' opening brief, discuss with CDM. Meeting with AMB re Respondents' in ferrit restructure portions of brief; conduct thorough wheeling with AMB re restrict restriction of facial vagueness standard to facts. Conduct legal research re: re California authorities supporting the proposition that litigation-related costs are assessed for restandableses from the vantage point of the litigant at the lime the cost/expense was incurred; draft analysis and submit to AMB for review. Draft analysis of Hamons v. Altisma and cases cited by State in their opposition to the recovery of MPH related costs to support the proposition that Respondents from the vantage point of the litigant at the motion did, in fact, effect change the cores of the filitigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the cores of the filitigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the cores of the filitigation (e.e., expedited briefing/MSI) 8/10/2012 Poteet review schedule), making such costs recoverable. 8/10/2012 Poteet State of the filitigation of the proposition to the review schedule), making such costs recoverable. 8/10/2012 Poteet State of the filitigation of the proposition to the review schedule), making such costs recoverable. 8/10/2012 Poteet Meeting with AMB re appropriate standard recovery of litigation-related costs, effect on Parker litigation, deallines for Respondents Brief, statement of case for the brief, and appropriate standards for addressing vagueness challenge in Parker litigation. 8/10/2012 Barvir All States of the status of Respondents Brief, statement of case for the brief, and appropriate standards for addressing vagueness challenge in Parker litigation. 8/13/2012 Barvir Telephone conference with CBM re status of Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts. 8/13/2012 Barvir Meeting with Brief Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of Respondents' Brief, draft section							
8/10/2012 Monfort Draft and revise Respondents' opening brief, discuss with CDM. Meeting with AMB re Respondents' in ferrit restructure portions of brief; conduct thorough wheeling with AMB re restrict restriction of facial vagueness standard to facts. Conduct legal research re: re California authorities supporting the proposition that litigation-related costs are assessed for restandableses from the vantage point of the litigant at the lime the cost/expense was incurred; draft analysis and submit to AMB for review. Draft analysis of Hamons v. Altisma and cases cited by State in their opposition to the recovery of MPH related costs to support the proposition that Respondents from the vantage point of the litigant at the motion did, in fact, effect change the cores of the filitigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the cores of the filitigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the cores of the filitigation (e.e., expedited briefing/MSI) 8/10/2012 Poteet review schedule), making such costs recoverable. 8/10/2012 Poteet State of the filitigation of the proposition to the review schedule), making such costs recoverable. 8/10/2012 Poteet State of the filitigation of the proposition to the review schedule), making such costs recoverable. 8/10/2012 Poteet Meeting with AMB re appropriate standard recovery of litigation-related costs, effect on Parker litigation, deallines for Respondents Brief, statement of case for the brief, and appropriate standards for addressing vagueness challenge in Parker litigation. 8/10/2012 Barvir All States of the status of Respondents Brief, statement of case for the brief, and appropriate standards for addressing vagueness challenge in Parker litigation. 8/13/2012 Barvir Telephone conference with CBM re status of Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts. 8/13/2012 Barvir Meeting with Brief Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of Respondents' Brief, draft section			Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; restructure portions of brief; conduct thorough				
Meeting with AMB re Respondents' opening brief; discuss with CDM. 1.60 5 325.00 5 520.00	8/10/2012	Barvir		1.00	\$ 225.00	\$	225.00
Meeting with AMB re Respondents' Brief, restructure portions of brief; conduct thorough R/10/2012 Monifort review and revision of section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts. 1.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 325.00 Conduct legal research re: re California authorities supporting the proposition that litigation-related costs are assessed for reasonableness from the vantage point of the litigant at the time the cost/expense was incurred; draft analysis and curst many to take the time the cost/expense was incurred; draft analysis and curst many to the Mitorian motion for preliminary injunction was reasonably necessary to the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation (i.e., expedited briefing/MS) R/10/2012 Poteet Potent Potential Potentia		Monfort	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·				
Ref Potent Pote			, ,		·		
Ref Potent Pote			Meeting with AMB re Respondents' Brief; restructure portions of brief; conduct thorough				
Conduct legal research re: re California authorities supporting the proposition that litigation related costs are assessed for reasonableness from the vantage point of the litigant at the time the cost/pepense was incurred; draft analysis and submit to AMB for review. By10/2012 Poteet time the cost/pepense was incurred; draft analysis and submit to AMB for review. By10/2012 Poteet analysis of Hamons v. Altrama and cases cited by State in their opposition to the recovery of MIP related costs to support the proposition that Respondents motion for preliminary linjunction was reasonably necessary to the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation (i.e., expedited briefing/MSI review schedule), making such costs recoverable. By10/2012 Poteet Potent Sepandents briefs, summarize statute and arguments and applicability to Parker litigation; shepardize case. Meeting with AMB re appropriate standard recovery of litigation-related costs, effect on Parker litigation, leadlines for Respondents Brief, statement of case for the brief, and appropriate standards for addressing vagueness stallenge in Parker litigation. By10/2012 Poteet appropriate standards for addressing vagueness stallenge in Parker litigation. By10/2012 Barvir Telephone conference with CBM re status of Respondents' Brief. By13/2012 Barvir Telephone conference with CBM re status of Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts. By13/2012 Barvir Telephone conference with CBM restructure Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts; make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. By13/2012 Barvir Telephone conference with CBM rectard Respondents' Brief, discuss further facts and arguments to include. By13/2012 Barvir Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; discuss and assign further tasks to RP. By13/2012 Barvir Review, review, end-draft Respondents' Brief in Parker Appeal; search joint appendix for relev	8/10/2012	Monfort		1.00	\$ 325.00	\$	325.00
related costs are assessed for reasonableness from the vantage point of the litigation at the ### foots/depense was incurred (and submit to AMB for review. Draft analysis of Hamons v. Altsman and cases cited by State in their opposition to the recovery of MPI related costs to support the proposition that Respondents motion for preliminary injunction was reasonable) necessary to the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation (i.e., expedited briefing/MSI ### AMB re appropriate standard fecrovery of litigation-related costs, effect on Parker litigation, deadlines for Respondents Brief, statement of case for the brief, and ### Appropriate standards for addressing vagueness challenge in Parker litigation. ### Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief, escition re application of facial ### AMB reappropriate standard to facts. ### Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of ### facial vagueness standard to facts. ### Review, revise, re-draft and restructure Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of ### facial vagueness standard to facts. ### Review, revise, re-draft and restructure Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of ### facial vagueness stand			· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		,		
related costs are assessed for reasonableness from the vantage point of the litigation at the ### foots/depense was incurred (and submit to AMB for review. Draft analysis of Hamons v. Altsman and cases cited by State in their opposition to the recovery of MPI related costs to support the proposition that Respondents motion for preliminary injunction was reasonable) necessary to the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation (i.e., expedited briefing/MSI ### AMB re appropriate standard fecrovery of litigation-related costs, effect on Parker litigation, deadlines for Respondents Brief, statement of case for the brief, and ### Appropriate standards for addressing vagueness challenge in Parker litigation. ### Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief, escition re application of facial ### AMB reappropriate standard to facts. ### Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of ### facial vagueness standard to facts. ### Review, revise, re-draft and restructure Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of ### facial vagueness standard to facts. ### Review, revise, re-draft and restructure Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of ### facial vagueness stand			Conduct legal research re: re California authorities supporting the proposition that litigation-				
Draft analysis of Hamons v. Altsman and cases cited by State in their opposition to the recovery of MPI related costs to support the proposition that Respondents motion for preliminary injunction was reasonably necessary to the Itiligation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the Itiligation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the Itiligation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the Itiligation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the Itiligation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the Itiligation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect on Respondents Brief, statement of case for the brief, land Respondents Brief, statement of case for the brief, and appropriate standards for addressing vagueness challenge in Parker Itilgation. 8/10/2012 Poteet appropriate standards for addressing vagueness challenge in Parker Itilgation. 8/10/2012 Barvir appropriate standards for addressing vagueness challenge in Parker Itilgation. 8/13/2012 Barvir Telephone conference with CBM re status of Respondents' Brief, brief, and appropriate standards for addressing vagueness challenge in Parker Itilgation of facial vagueness standard to facts. 8/13/2012 Barvir Telephone conference with CBM re status of Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts; make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. 8/13/2012 Barvir facial vagueness standard to facts; make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. 8/13/2012 Barvir arguments to include. 8/13/2012 Barvir Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief; review and revise brief, discuss further facts and graments to include. 8/13/2012 Barvir Review, revise, and re-draft Respondents' Brief; per meetings and revisions with CBM. 8/13/2012 Barvir Review, revise, and re-draft Respondents' Opening Brief. 8/13/2012 Monfort Meeting wit							
recovery of MPI related costs to support the proposition that Respondents motion for preliminary injunction was reasonably necessary to the litigation (i.e., expedited briefing/MS) review schedule), making such costs recoverable. 8/10/2012 Poteet Draft analysis of Caraston v. City of Richmond (1985) 40 Cal. 3d 755 for incorporation into Respondents brief; summarize statute and arguments and applicability to Parker litigation; shepardize case. 8/10/2012 Poteet Shepardize case. Meeting with AMB re appropriate standard recovery of litigation-related costs, effect on Parker litigation, deadlines for Respondents Brief, statement of case for the brief, and appropriate part of the standard standard recovery of litigation-related costs, effect on Parker litigation, deadlines for Respondents Brief, statement of case for the brief, and appropriate part of the standards for addressing vagueness standard to facts. 8/10/2012 Barvir Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts. 8/13/2012 Barvir Telephone conference with CBM re status of Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts; make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. 8/13/2012 Barvir Augueness standard to facts; make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. 8/13/2012 Barvir Review, revise, and re-draft Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts; make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. 8/13/2012 Barvir Review, revise, and revise Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts; make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. 8/13/2012 Barvir Review, revise, and revise Brief, review and revise brief, discuss further facts and articles with the revisions to Respondents' Brief, discuss further facts and articles with the revisions to Respondents' Brief, discuss and assign further tasks to RP. 8/13/2012 Barvir Meeting	8/10/2012	Poteet	time the cost/expense was incurred; draft analysis and submit to AMB for review.	1.10	\$ 125.00	\$	137.50
preliminary injunction was reasonably necessary to the litigation and that withdrawal of the motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation (i.e., expedited briefing/MS) 8/10/2012 Poteet review schedule), making such costs recoverable. Draft analysis of Cranston v. City of Richmond (1985) 40 Cal. 3d 755 for incorporation into Respondents brief, summarize statute and arguments and applicability to Parker litigation; shepardize case. Meeting with AMB re appropriate standard recovery of litigation-related costs, effect on Parker litigation, deadlines for Respondents Brief, statement of case for the brief, and appropriate standards for addressing vagueness challenge in Parker litigation. 8/10/2012 Poteet appropriate standards for addressing vagueness challenge in Parker litigation. 8/12/2012 Barvir vagueness standard to facts. 8/13/2012 Barvir Telephone conference with CBM re status of Respondents' Brief, section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts. 8/13/2012 Barvir facial vagueness standard to facts; make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. 8/13/2012 Barvir facial vagueness standard to facts; make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. 8/13/2012 Barvir Agruments to include. 8/13/2012 Barvir Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief, review and revise brief, discuss further facts and arguments to include. 8/13/2012 Barvir Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief, review and revisions with CBM. 8/13/2012 Barvir Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief, discuss and assign further tasks to RP. 0.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 275					<u> </u>		
Motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation (i.e., expedited briefing/MS) S/10/2012 Poteet Poteet Potential Potentia			recovery of MPI related costs to support the proposition that Respondents motion for				
Poteet Preview schedule), making such costs recoverable. 0.50 \$ 125.00 \$ 62.50			preliminary injunction was reasonably necessary to the litigation and that withdrawal of the				
Draft analysis of Cranston v. City of Bichmond (1985) 40 Cal. 3d 755 for incorporation into Respondents brief; summarize statute and arguments and applicability to Parker litigation; shepardize case. 0.50 \$ 125.00 \$ 62.50			motion did, in fact, effect change the course of the litigation (i.e., expedited briefing/MSJ				
Respondents brief; summarize statute and arguments and applicability to Parker litigation; shepardize case. Meeting with AMB re appropriate standard recovery of litigation-related costs, effect on Parker litigation, deadlines for Respondents Brief, statement of case for the brief, and appropriate standards for addressing vagueness challenge in Parker litigation. Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts. Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief. Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief. Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief. Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts; make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief, discuss further facts and arguments to include. Review, revise, re-draft septondents' Brief; review and revise brief, discuss further facts and arguments to include. Review, revise, and re-draft Respondents' Brief per meetings and revisions with CBM. Review, revise, and re-draft Respondents' Brief per meetings and revisions with CBM. Review, revise, and re-draft Respondents' Opening Brief; review record and advise Review, revise, and re-draft Respondents' Opening Brief; review record and advise Review (revise and revising Respondents' Opening Brief. AMB re citation to appropriate authority. AMB re citation to appropriate authority. Reciept, review and analyze, revise multiple times Respondents Brief. AMB re citation to appropriate authority. Reciept, review and analyze, revise multiple times Respondents Brief. Reciept, review and analyze, revise multiple times Respondents Brief. Reciept, review and analyze, revise multiple times Respondents Brief. Review/Revise statement of case/facts for Respondents' Brief in Parker Appeal; search joint appendix for relevant factual materials; incorpor	8/10/2012	Poteet	review schedule), making such costs recoverable.	0.50	\$ 125.00	\$	62.50
Meeting with ABM re appropriate standard recovery of litigation-related costs, effect on Parker litigation, deadlines for Respondents Brief, statement of case for the brief, and appropriate standards for addressing vagueness challenge in Parker litigation. 0.60 \$125.00 \$ 75.00			Draft analysis of Cranston v. City of Richmond (1985) 40 Cal. 3d 755 for incorporation into				
Meeting with AMB re appropriate standard recovery of litigation-related costs, effect on Parker litigation, deadlines for Respondents Brief, statement of case for the brief, and appropriate standards for addressing vagueness challenge in Parker litigation. 8/12/2012 Barvir vagueness standard for addressing vagueness challenge in Parker litigation. 8/13/2012 Barvir vagueness standard to facts. 8/13/2012 Barvir Telephone conference with CBM re status of Respondents' Brief, craft section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts. Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts; make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. 8/13/2012 Barvir Telephone conference with CBM re status of Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts; make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. 8/13/2012 Barvir Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief, discuss further facts and arguments to include. 8/13/2012 Barvir Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; review and revise brief, discuss further facts and arguments to include. 8/13/2012 Barvir Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief; discuss and assign further tasks to RP. 8/13/2012 Barvir Review, revise, and re-draft Respondents' Opening Brief; review record and advise Continue drafting, editing, and revising Respondents' Opening Brief; review record and advise AMB re citation to appropriate authority. 8/13/2012 Monfort Meet with AMB re revisions to Respondents' Opening Brief. 8/13/2012 Nunez Multiple meetings with CBM and AMB re: filing deadline for Respondents Brief. 8/13/2012 Nunez Receipt, review and analyze, revise multiple times Respondents Brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet Brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet Brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet Potent Review/Revise statement of case/facts for Respondents' Brief in Parker Appeal, search joint appendix for relevant factual materials; incorporate into statement of case for Responden			Respondents brief; summarize statute and arguments and applicability to Parker litigation;				
Parker litigation, deadlines for Respondents Brief, statement of case for the brief, and appropriate standards for addressing vagueness challenge in Parker litigation. 0.60 \$ 125.00 \$ 75.00	8/10/2012	Poteet	shepardize case.	0.50	\$ 125.00	\$	62.50
Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts. Savia vagueness standard to facts, make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. Savia vagueness standard to facts, make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. Savia vagueness standard to facts, make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. Savia vagueness standard to facts, make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. Savia vagueness standard to facts, make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. Savia vagueness standard to facts, make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. Savia vagueness vagueness standard to facts, make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. Savia vagueness vagueness standard to facts, make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. Savia vagueness vagueness standard to facts, make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. Savia vagueness vagueness standard to facts, make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. Savia vagueness vagueness standard to facts, make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. Savia vagueness vagueness standard to facts, make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. Savia vagueness vagueness standard to facts, make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. Savia vagueness with CBM. Savia vagueness with CBM. Savia vagueness with CBM. Savia vagueness vagueness standard to facts, search political vagueness vagueness vagueness vagueness facts for Respondents Brief. Savia vagueness vague			Meeting with AMB re appropriate standard recovery of litigation-related costs, effect on				
Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts. 8/12/2012 Barvir Telephone conference with CBM re status of Respondents' Brief. Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Opening Brief. Review, revise, and re-draft Respondents' Prief per meetings with CBM. Review, revise, and re-draft Respondents' Opening Brief; review record and advise Review Revise with Respondents' Respondents' Opening Brief. Review Revise with AMB re revisions to Respondents' Opening Brief. Review Revise with AMB re revisions to Respondents' Opening Brief. Review Revise with AMB re revisions to Respondents' Opening Brief. Review Revise with AMB revisions to Respondents' Opening Brief. Review Revise with AMB revisions to Respondents' Opening Brief. Review Revise Respondents' Brief, review revise and revise brief in Parker Appeal, inc			Parker litigation, deadlines for Respondents Brief, statement of case for the brief, and				
8/13/2012 Barvir Vagueness standard to facts. Section Se	8/10/2012	Poteet	appropriate standards for addressing vagueness challenge in Parker litigation.	0.60	\$ 125.00	\$	75.00
Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts; make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts; make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; review and revise brief, discuss further facts and arguments to include. Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief; review and revise brief, discuss further facts and arguments to include. Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief; discuss and assign further tasks to RP. 0.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 292.50 \$ 21.5			Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief section re application of facial				
Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of facial vagueness standard to facts; make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; review and revise brief, discuss further facts and arguments to include. Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief; discuss and assign further tasks to RP. Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief; discuss and assign further tasks to RP. Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief; discuss and assign further tasks to RP. Continue drafting, editing, and re-draft Respondents' Opening Brief; review record and advise Mally re citation to appropriate authority. Monfort Meet with AMB re revisions to Respondents' Opening Brief. Multiple meetings with CBM and AMB re: filing deadline for Respondents Brief. Multiple meetings with CBM and AMB re: filing deadline for Respondents' Brief. Draft Statement of case/facts for Respondents brief in Parker Appeal; search joint appendix for relevant factual materials; incorporate into statement of case for Respondents Brief. Draft Statement of case/facts for Respondents brief in Parker Appeal; search joint appendix for relevant factual materials; incorporate into statement of case for Respondents Brief. Malayze/Draft summary of Cranston v. City of Richmond for argument section of Respondents brief. Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; review, revise and citations to record on appeal, incorporating edits by RP; review and revise brief as necessary to properly reflect reord; redraft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM. Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment	8/12/2012	Barvir	vagueness standard to facts.	5.40	\$ 225.00	\$	1,215.00
8/13/2012 Barvir facial vagueness standard to facts; make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; review and revise brief, discuss further facts and arguments to include. 8/13/2012 Barvir Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief; discuss and assign further tasks to RP. 8/13/2012 Barvir Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief; discuss and assign further tasks to RP. 8/13/2012 Barvir Review, revise, and re-draft Respondents' Brief per meetings and revisions with CBM. Continue drafting, editing, and revising Respondents' Opening Brief; review record and advise 8/13/2012 Monfort Meet with AMB re citation to appropriate authority. Molfort Meet with AMB re revisions to Respondents' Opening Brief. 8/13/2012 Nunez Multiple meetings with CBM and AMB re: filing deadline for Respondents Brief. Draft Statement of case/facts for Respondents brief in Parker Appeal; search joint appendix for relevant factual materials; incorporate into statement of case for Respondents Brief. 1.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 225.00 Analyze/Draft summary of Cranston v. City of Richmond for argument section of Respondents 8/13/2012 Poteet brief. Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; review, revise and citations to record on appeal, incorporating edits by RP; review and revise brief as necessary to properly reflect record; redraft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM. Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment	8/13/2012	Barvir	Telephone conference with CBM re status of Respondents' Brief.	0.10	\$ 225.00	\$	22.50
8/13/2012 Barvir facial vagueness standard to facts; make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM. Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; review and revise brief, discuss further facts and arguments to include. 8/13/2012 Barvir Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief; discuss and assign further tasks to RP. 8/13/2012 Barvir Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief; discuss and assign further tasks to RP. 8/13/2012 Barvir Review, revise, and re-draft Respondents' Brief per meetings and revisions with CBM. Continue drafting, editing, and revising Respondents' Opening Brief; review record and advise 8/13/2012 Monfort Meet with AMB re citation to appropriate authority. Molfort Meet with AMB re revisions to Respondents' Opening Brief. 8/13/2012 Nunez Multiple meetings with CBM and AMB re: filing deadline for Respondents Brief. Draft Statement of case/facts for Respondents brief in Parker Appeal; search joint appendix for relevant factual materials; incorporate into statement of case for Respondents Brief. 1.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 225.00 Analyze/Draft summary of Cranston v. City of Richmond for argument section of Respondents 8/13/2012 Poteet brief. Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; review, revise and citations to record on appeal, incorporating edits by RP; review and revise brief as necessary to properly reflect record; redraft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM. Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment							
Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; review and revise brief, discuss further facts and arguments to include. 1.30 \$ 225.00 \$ 292.50			Review, revise, re-draft, and restructure Respondents' Brief, draft section re application of				
8/13/2012 Barvir arguments to include. 8/13/2012 Barvir Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief; discuss and assign further tasks to RP. 8/13/2012 Barvir Review, revise, and re-draft Respondents' Brief per meetings and revisions with CBM. Continue drafting, editing, and revising Respondents' Opening Brief; review record and advise 8/13/2012 Monfort AMB re citation to appropriate authority. 3.40 \$ 325.00 \$ 1,105.00 8/13/2012 Monfort Meet with AMB re revisions to Respondents' Opening Brief. 9.90 \$ 325.00 \$ 1,105.00 9/13/2012 Nunez Multiple meetings with CBM and AMB re: filling deadline for Respondents Brief. 9/13/2012 Nunez Receipt, review and analyze, revise multiple times Respondents Brief. 9/13/2012 Poteet for relevant factual materials; incorporate into statement of case for Respondents Brief. 9/13/2012 Poteet brief. 9/13/2012 Poteet brief. 9/13/2012 Poteet Brief. 1.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 225.00 Analyze/Draft summary of Cranston v. City of Richmond for argument section of Respondents brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet Review/Revise statement of case/facts for Respondents' brief in Parker Appeal. 8/13/2012 Barvir draft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM. Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment 9/14/2012 Barvir Summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment	8/13/2012	Barvir	facial vagueness standard to facts; make other revisions as discussed in meetings with CBM.	3.50	\$ 225.00	\$	787.50
8/13/2012 Barvir Meeting with RP re Respondents' Brief; discuss and assign further tasks to RP. 0.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00 \$ 375.00 \$			Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; review and revise brief, discuss further facts and				
8/13/2012 Barvir Review, revise, and re-draft Respondents' Brief per meetings and revisions with CBM. 2.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 472.50 Continue drafting, editing, and revising Respondents' Opening Brief; review record and advise AMB re citation to appropriate authority. 3.40 \$ 325.00 \$ 1,105.00 AMB re with AMB re revisions to Respondents' Opening Brief. 0.90 \$ 325.00 \$ 292.50 8/13/2012 Nunez Multiple meetings with CBM and AMB re: filing deadline for Respondents Brief. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 8/13/2012 Nunez Receipt, review and analyze, revise multiple times Respondents' Brief. 1.50 \$ 125.00 \$ 187.50 Draft Statement of case/facts for Respondents brief in Parker Appeal; search joint appendix for relevant factual materials; incorporate into statement of case for Respondents Brief. 1.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 225.00 Analyze/Draft summary of Cranston v. City of Richmond for argument section of Respondents brief. 0.70 \$ 125.00 \$ 87.50 8/13/2012 Poteet brief. 0.70 \$ 125.00 \$ 87.50 8/13/2012 Poteet Review/Revise statement of case/facts for Respondents' brief in Parker Appeal. 0.70 \$ 125.00 \$ 87.50 8/13/2012 Barvir draft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM. 1.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 337.50 Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing. 0.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 225.00		Barvir	arguments to include.	1.30	-	\$	292.50
Continue drafting, editing, and revising Respondents' Opening Brief; review record and advise 8/13/2012 Monfort Meet with AMB re revisions to Respondents' Opening Brief. 8/13/2012 Nunez Multiple meetings with CBM and AMB re: filing deadline for Respondents Brief. 8/13/2012 Nunez Multiple meetings with CBM and AMB re: filing deadline for Respondents Brief. 8/13/2012 Nunez Receipt, review and analyze, revise multiple times Respondents' Brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet for relevant factual materials; incorporate into statement of case for Respondents Brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet for relevant factual materials; incorporate into statement of case for Respondents Brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet Review/Revise statement of case/facts for Respondents' brief in Parker Appeal. 8/13/2012 Poteet Review/Revise statement of case/facts for Respondents' brief in Parker Appeal. 8/13/2012 Poteet Review/Revise statement of case/facts for Respondents' brief in Parker Appeal. 8/13/2012 Barvir Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment 8/14/2012 Barvir Telephone conference with R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment	8/13/2012	Barvir		0.10	•	\$	22.50
8/13/2012 Monfort AMB re citation to appropriate authority. 8/13/2012 Monfort Meet with AMB re revisions to Respondents' Opening Brief. 8/13/2012 Nunez Multiple meetings with CBM and AMB re: filing deadline for Respondents Brief. 8/13/2012 Nunez Receipt, review and analyze, revise multiple times Respondents' Brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet for relevant factual materials; incorporate into statement of case for Respondents Brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet for relevant factual materials; incorporate into statement of case for Respondents Brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet Review/Revise statement of case/facts for Respondents' brief in Parker Appeal; search joint appendix 8/13/2012 Poteet for relevant factual materials; incorporate into statement of case for Respondents Brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet Brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet Review/Revise statement of case/facts for Respondents' brief in Parker Appeal. 8/13/2012 Poteet Review/Revise statement of case/facts for Respondents' brief in Parker Appeal. 8/13/2012 Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; review, revise and citations to record on appeal, incorporating edits by RP; review and revise brief as necessary to properly reflect record; redraft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM. Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing. Telephone conference with R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment	8/13/2012	Barvir		2.10	\$ 225.00	\$	472.50
8/13/2012 Monfort Meet with AMB re revisions to Respondents' Opening Brief. 8/13/2012 Nunez Multiple meetings with CBM and AMB re: filing deadline for Respondents Brief. 8/13/2012 Nunez Receipt, review and analyze, revise multiple times Respondents' Brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet Draft Statement of case/facts for Respondents brief in Parker Appeal; search joint appendix for relevant factual materials; incorporate into statement of case for Respondents Brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet Review/Revise statement of case/facts for Respondents' brief in Parker Appeal. 8/13/2012 Poteet Brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet Brief: review, revise and citations to record on appeal, incorporating edits by RP; review and revise brief as necessary to properly reflect record; redraft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM. 8/14/2012 Barvir Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing. 8/14/2012 Barvir Telephone conference with R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment			Continue drafting, editing, and revising Respondents' Opening Brief; review record and advise				
8/13/2012 Nunez Multiple meetings with CBM and AMB re: filing deadline for Respondents Brief. 0.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 37.50 8/13/2012 Nunez Receipt, review and analyze, revise multiple times Respondents' Brief. 1.50 \$ 125.00 \$ 187.50 Draft Statement of case/facts for Respondents brief in Parker Appeal; search joint appendix for relevant factual materials; incorporate into statement of case for Respondents Brief. 1.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 225.00 Analyze/Draft summary of Cranston v. City of Richmond for argument section of Respondents brief. 0.70 \$ 125.00 \$ 87.50 8/13/2012 Poteet Review/Revise statement of case/facts for Respondents' brief in Parker Appeal. 0.70 \$ 125.00 \$ 87.50 Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; review, revise and citations to record on appeal, incorporating edits by RP; review and revise brief as necessary to properly reflect record; redraft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM. 1.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 337.50 Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing. 0.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 22.50 Telephone conference with R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment							
8/13/2012 Nunez Receipt, review and analyze, revise multiple times Respondents' Brief. 1.50 \$ 125.00 \$ 187.50 Draft Statement of case/facts for Respondents brief in Parker Appeal; search joint appendix for relevant factual materials; incorporate into statement of case for Respondents Brief. 1.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 225.00 Analyze/Draft summary of Cranston v. City of Richmond for argument section of Respondents brief. 0.70 \$ 125.00 \$ 87.50 8/13/2012 Poteet Review/Revise statement of case/facts for Respondents' brief in Parker Appeal. 6.50 \$ 125.00 \$ 812.50 Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; review, revise and citations to record on appeal, incorporating edits by RP; review and revise brief as necessary to properly reflect record; redraft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM. 1.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 337.50 Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing. 0.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 22.50 Telephone conference with R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment							
Draft Statement of case/facts for Respondents brief in Parker Appeal; search joint appendix 8/13/2012 Poteet for relevant factual materials; incorporate into statement of case for Respondents Brief. Analyze/Draft summary of Cranston v. City of Richmond for argument section of Respondents 8/13/2012 Poteet brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet Review/Revise statement of case/facts for Respondents' brief in Parker Appeal. Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; review, revise and citations to record on appeal, incorporating edits by RP; review and revise brief as necessary to properly reflect record; re- 8/14/2012 Barvir draft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM. Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing. Telephone conference with R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment							
8/13/2012 Poteet for relevant factual materials; incorporate into statement of case for Respondents Brief. Analyze/Draft summary of Cranston v. City of Richmond for argument section of Respondents brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet Breview/Revise statement of case/facts for Respondents' brief in Parker Appeal. Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; review, revise and citations to record on appeal, incorporating edits by RP; review and revise brief as necessary to properly reflect record; re- 8/14/2012 Barvir draft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM. Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing. Telephone conference with R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment	8/13/2012	Nunez	Receipt, review and analyze, revise multiple times Respondents' Brief.	1.50	\$ 125.00	\$	187.50
8/13/2012 Poteet for relevant factual materials; incorporate into statement of case for Respondents Brief. Analyze/Draft summary of Cranston v. City of Richmond for argument section of Respondents brief. 8/13/2012 Poteet Breview/Revise statement of case/facts for Respondents' brief in Parker Appeal. Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; review, revise and citations to record on appeal, incorporating edits by RP; review and revise brief as necessary to properly reflect record; re- 8/14/2012 Barvir draft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM. Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing. Telephone conference with R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment							
Analyze/Draft summary of Cranston v. City of Richmond for argument section of Respondents 8/13/2012 Poteet brief. 0.70 \$ 125.00 \$ 87.50 8/13/2012 Poteet Review/Revise statement of case/facts for Respondents' brief in Parker Appeal. 6.50 \$ 125.00 \$ 812.50 Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; review, revise and citations to record on appeal, incorporating edits by RP; review and revise brief as necessary to properly reflect record; re- 8/14/2012 Barvir draft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM. 1.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 337.50 Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing. 0.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 22.50 Telephone conference with R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment							
8/13/2012 Poteet brief. 0.70 \$ 125.00 \$ 87.50 8/13/2012 Poteet Review/Revise statement of case/facts for Respondents' brief in Parker Appeal. 6.50 \$ 125.00 \$ 812.50 Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; review, revise and citations to record on appeal, incorporating edits by RP; review and revise brief as necessary to properly reflect record; redraft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM. 1.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 337.50 Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing. 0.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 22.50 Telephone conference with R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment	8/13/2012	Poteet		1.80	\$ 125.00	Ş	225.00
8/13/2012 Poteet Review/Revise statement of case/facts for Respondents' brief in Parker Appeal. 6.50 \$ 125.00 \$ 812.50 Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; review, revise and citations to record on appeal, incorporating edits by RP; review and revise brief as necessary to properly reflect record; redraft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM. 1.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 337.50 Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing. 0.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 22.50 Telephone conference with R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment		_					
Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; review, revise and citations to record on appeal, incorporating edits by RP; review and revise brief as necessary to properly reflect record; re- 8/14/2012 Barvir draft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM. 1.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 337.50 Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing. 0.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 22.50 Telephone conference with R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment						-	
incorporating edits by RP; review and revise brief as necessary to properly reflect record; re- 8/14/2012 Barvir draft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM. Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing. Telephone conference with R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment	8/13/2012	Poteet		6.50	\$ 125.00	Ş	812.50
8/14/2012 Barvir draft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM. 1.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 337.50 Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing. 0.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 22.50 Telephone conference with R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment							
Call and leave voicemail for R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of 8/14/2012 Barvir summary judgment hearing. Telephone conference with R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment	0.14 - 15 -			_	A ===		a
8/14/2012 Barvir summary judgment hearing. 0.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 22.50 Telephone conference with R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment	8/14/2012	Barvir		1.50	\$ 225.00	Ş	337.50
Telephone conference with R. Moody, opposing counsel, re access to Reporter's Transcript of summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment	l						
summary judgment hearing; receive and analyze email from R. Moody re summary judgment	8/14/2012	Barvir		0.10	\$ 225.00	\$	22.50
8/14/2012 Barvir transcript; send email to R. Moody confirming receipt. 0.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 45.00							
	8/14/2012	Barvir	transcript; send email to R. Moody confirming receipt.	0.20	\$ 225.00	\$	45.00

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate		Amount
		Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; review, revise and citations to record on appeal,		Nuve		
		incorporating edits by RP; review and revise brief as necessary to properly reflect record; re-				
8/14/2012	Barvir	draft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM.	2.10	\$ 225.00	\$	472.50
		Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; re-draft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM;				
8/14/2012	Barvir	draft also introduction section.	1.40	\$ 225.00	\$	315.00
		Review/revise Respondents' Brief with CBM; conduct in-depth review of first 40 pages of brief,				
		conducting line edits and macro edits; discuss also any facts and arguments still missing from				
8/14/2012	Barvir	brief.	1.40	\$ 225.00	\$	315.00
0/14/2012	Damin	Davies / Davies Descendental Drief, as dueft moderness as height an acceptance of height and acceptance with CDM	2.40	ć 22F 00	<u>,</u>	F40.00
8/14/2012	Barvir	Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; re-draft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM.	2.40	\$ 225.00	\$	540.00
9/14/2012	Parvir	Paviow/Pavica Pachandents' Priofy re-draft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CRM	2 10	\$ 225.00	ċ	607 50
8/14/2012	Barvir	Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; re-draft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM. Continue drafting and revising Respondents' opening brief; multiple meetings with AMB re	3.10	\$ 225.00	Ş	697.50
8/14/2012	Monfort	same.	4.60	\$ 325.00	\$	1,495.00
0/11/2012	Wiemere	Multiple meetings with AMB re revisions to Respondents' opening brief; discuss litigation	1.00	ψ 3 <u>2</u> 3.00	Υ	1, 155.00
8/14/2012	Monfort	strategies re same.	1.40	\$ 325.00	\$	455.00
8/14/2012	Nunez	Multiple meetings with AMB re: our deadline to file Respondents' Brief.	0.20	\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
8/14/2012	Nunez	Conduct research re:locating documents in joint appendix for cites in respondents' brief.	1.50	\$ 125.00	\$	187.50
		Continue Review/Revise of citations to Joint Appendix in Respondents opening brief; add				
8/14/2012	Poteet	additional citations and cross-references for previously cited materials.	1.90	\$ 125.00	\$	237.50
		Continue Review/Revise of citations to Joint Appendix in Respondents opening brief; add				
8/14/2012	Poteet	additional citations and cross-references for previously cited materials.	4.50	\$ 125.00	\$	562.50
0/44/2042	5	Continue Review/Revise of citations to Joint Appendix in Respondents opening brief; add	2.40	d 425.00		207.50
8/14/2012	Poteet	additional citations and cross-references for previously cited materials.	3.10	\$ 125.00	\$	387.50
8/14/2012	Dotoot	Continue Review/Revise of citations to Joint Appendix in Respondents opening brief; add additional citations and cross-references for previously cited materials.	2 20	¢ 125.00	Ļ	207.50
0/14/2012	Poteet	Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; re-draft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM;	2.30	\$ 125.00	\$	287.50
8/15/2012	Barvir	insert RP edits and citations to record and authority.	1 40	\$ 225.00	\$	315.00
0/15/2012	Darvii	Meeting with CDM and CBM re Respondents' Brief; discuss status of drafting and filing; also	1.40	ÿ 223.00	Υ	313.00
8/15/2012	Barvir	discuss edits and re-structuring necessary.	0.10	\$ 225.00	\$	22.50
		Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; re-draft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM;				
8/15/2012	Barvir	insert RP edits and citations to record and authority.	3.40	\$ 225.00	\$	765.00
		Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; re-draft multiple sections of brief per meetings with CBM;				
8/15/2012	Barvir	insert RP edits and citations to record and authority.	1.80	\$ 225.00	\$	405.00
		Meeting with CBM re Respondents' Brief; discuss drafting introduction and divide final tasks				
8/15/2012	Barvir	for completing brief.	0.20	\$ 225.00	\$	45.00
		Review/revise Respondents' Brief with CBM; conduct in-depth review of entire brief,				
0/45/2042		conducting line edits and macro edits; discuss also any facts and arguments still missing 3.9	2.00	4 225 00		077.50
8/15/2012	Barvir	from brief. Poulou/Poulos Despendents' Drief, vs. dreft, multiple sections of brief per final meeting and	3.90	\$ 225.00	\$	877.50
		Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; re-draft multiple sections of brief per final meeting and review with CBM; finalize brief; print, prepare, and route to CA for formatting, tables, and				
8/15/2012	Barvir	filing.	2 20	\$ 225.00	¢	495.00
0/13/2012	Daivii	illing.	2.20	7 223.00	٧	455.00
8/15/2012	Brady	Analyze Harrott and Kasler cases and draft attorney notes for inclusion in answering brief.	1.70	\$ 250.00	Ś	425.00
0, 10, 2012	2.447	Research, analyze and review decisions in Harrot and cited case law; determine merits of	21,70	Ψ 200.00	Ψ	125100
		inclusion in respondents' opening brief; draft attorney notes re same and discuss with AMB				
8/15/2012	Monfort	and SAB.	2.40	\$ 325.00	\$	780.00
		Read aloud review and revisions of Respondents' Opening Brief with AMB; follow up revisions				
8/15/2012	Monfort	and draft emails to AMB and SAB.	3.20	\$ 325.00	\$	1,040.00
8/15/2012	Monfort	Draft and revise introduction to Respondents' Opening brief.	2.40	\$ 325.00	\$	780.00
8/15/2012	Monfort	Draft and revise conclusion in support of respondents' opening brief.	1.30	\$ 325.00	\$	422.50
8/15/2012	Monfort	Continue reviewing, revising, and editing respondents' opening brief.	3.60	\$ 325.00	\$	1,170.00
		Research and draft footnotes and revise parenthetical citations re Respondents' Opening				
8/15/2012	Monfort	Brief.	1.80	\$ 325.00	Ş	585.00
0/15/2012	None	Receipt, review and analyze and start working on Table of Contents and Table of Authorities	1.00	ć 13F 00	<u>,</u>	200.00
8/15/2012	Nunez	for Respondents' Brief. Continue Review/Revise of citations to Joint Appendix in Respondents opening brief; add	1.60	\$ 125.00	Ş	200.00
0/15/2012	Dotoot	additional citations and cross-references for previously cited materials.	1 00	¢ 12E 00	ċ	227 50
8/15/2012	Poteet	Continue Review/Revise of citations to Joint Appendix in Respondents opening brief; add	1.90	\$ 125.00	Ş	237.50
8/15/2012	Poteet	additional citations and cross-references for previously cited materials.	5.80	\$ 125.00	¢	725.00
5/ 13/ 2012	· ottet	Review/Revise final draft of Respondents brief; correct any typos; draft additional language to	3.00	y 123.00	7	, 23.00
8/15/2012	Poteet	add persuasive effect.	5.50	\$ 125.00	Ś	687.50
, _3, _3, _3L		Conduct legal research re: additional California authority supporting a lower standard of	5.50	+ 120.00	7	337.330
		review for facial challenges to statutes intruding upon constitutionally protected conduct and				
8/15/2012	Poteet	imposing criminal liability for violations.	1.10	\$ 125.00	\$	137.50
		· · · · · ·			-	

Data	Timekaanar	Dossvintion	Ноли	Data		Amount
Date	Timekeeper	Description Conduct final review, revision, and proofread of Respondents' Brief; insert all changes to brief	Hours	Rate	,	Amount
		with CBM; conduct final review of formatting, tables, and citation; finalize and approve brief				
9/16/2012	Domir		1.60	¢ 225.00	Ļ	260.00
8/16/2012	Barvir	for filing.	1.60	\$ 225.00	Ş	360.00
8/16/2012	Barvir	Meeting with CA re Respondents' Brief; discuss timeline and final preparation for filing.	0.10	\$ 225.00	\$	22.50
8/10/2012	Dalvii	Review/Revise Respondents' Brief; incorporate edits suggested by S. Halbrook and SAB;	0.10	\$ 225.00	Ą	22.50
		conduct final drafting of sections per meetings with CBM and from emails from CDM; finalize				
9/16/2012	Panir	draft for filing.	2 20	¢ 22E 00	ċ	40E 00
8/16/2012	Barvir	Meeting with CA re Certificate of Interested Parties; discuss rules re Certificate and proper	2.20	\$ 225.00	Ş	495.00
		content of certificate; assign SAB and CA task of contacting business entity plaintiffs to				
		determine identities of non-parties with an interest and the nature of those interests; review				
9/16/2012	Domir	•	0.50	¢ 225.00	\$	112 50
8/16/2012	Barvir	and revise Certificate; discuss issue with CBM.		\$ 225.00 \$ 250.00	\$	112.50
8/16/2012	Brady	Review/Revise answering brief. Telephone conference with plaintiff R. Wright re details of business required to be disclosed	3.30	\$ 250.00	Ş	825.00
0/16/2012	Dun de .	·	0.20	ć 250.00	۲.	FO 00
8/16/2012	Brady	to California court of appeals.	0.20	•	\$	50.00
8/16/2012	Monfort	Final proofread of final draft of Respondents' opening brief prior to filing.	1.40	\$ 325.00	\$	455.00
8/16/2012	Monfort	Multiple rounds of proofreads and edits to Respondents' opening brief.	4.40	\$ 325.00	\$	1,430.00
8/16/2012	Nunez	Receipt, review and analyze and revise multiple times Respondents' Opening Brief.	3.00	\$ 125.00	\$	375.00
0/16/2012	None	Receipt, review and analyze, finalize and prepare court filing and all service copies of Receipt,	2.50	ć 13F 00	۲.	212.50
8/16/2012	Nunez	review and analyze and revise multiple times Respondents' Opening Brief.	2.50	\$ 125.00	\$	312.50
0/16/2012	None	Telephone calls to and from plaintiffs re:	0.70	ć 13F 00	۲.	07.50
8/16/2012	Nunez	M. History and the state of the COM COM and AMP or filling filling for	0.70	\$ 125.00	\$	87.50
0/46/2042		Multiple meetings throughout the day with CDM, CBM and AMB re: filing of Respondents'	0.00	d 425.00		400.00
8/16/2012	Nunez	Opening Brief.	0.80	\$ 125.00		100.00
8/16/2012	Nunez	Receipt, review and analyze and finalize Certificate of Interested Entities.	0.60	\$ 125.00	\$	75.00
0/46/2042	5	Revise/Review citations to Joint Appendix in Respondents opening brief; add citations to	0.70	d 425.00		07.50
8/16/2012	Poteet	material produced by Respondents in their request for judicial notice at trial.	0.70	\$ 125.00	\$	87.50
0/47/2042		5 11 16 2014 1440 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1 1	0.40	d 225 00		422.00
8/17/2012	Monfort	E-mails to and from CDM and AMB re amicus submissions and communications re same.		\$ 325.00	\$	130.00
8/21/2012	Monfort	Multiple meetings with CDM and AMB re amicus efforts.		\$ 325.00	\$	97.50
8/23/2012	Monfort	Follow up e-mails to confirmed Amici.	0.40	•	\$	130.00
8/24/2012	Monfort	Correspondence to and from opposing counsel re extensions to file Reply.	0.20	\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
0 /00 /00 0		Receipt, review and analyze Stipulation for Extension of Time to File Reply Brief, scan and		4		
8/29/2012	Nunez	forward to opposing counsel.	0.40	\$ 125.00	Ş	50.00
0 /00 /00 0		Send/receive email to/from CDM, CBM, Ross Moody and Peter Krause re: extension of time to		4		
8/29/2012	Nunez	file Reply Brief.		\$ 125.00	\$	37.50
9/5/2012	Michel	E-mails to and from CBM re amici filings.		\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
9/5/2012	Monfort	E-mails to and from CDM re amici filings.	0.20	\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
9/7/2012	Michel	Meeting with CBM re amicus brief prepared by S Halbrook.	0.50	\$ 450.00	\$	225.00
0 /= /00 / 0		Review research ISO opposition to State appeal and assemble materials and file for use in		4		
9/7/2012	Monfort	preparation of oral argument.	1.20	\$ 325.00	Ş	390.00
9/10/2012	Barvir	Receive and review multiple emails to/from CBM, S. Halbrook, and S. Helsley re amicus efforts.	0.20	\$ 225.00	Ş	45.00
0 / 1 0 / 2 0 1 0				4		
9/10/2012	Monfort	Additional e-mails to and from amicus parties and counsel re coordination of amicus filings.		\$ 325.00		162.50
9/12/2012	Barvir	Meeting with CBM, SAB, CA, SZ, and CM re: status update of Parker Appeal.	0.10	\$ 225.00		22.50
9/12/2012	Monfort	Meeting with SAB, AMB, CA, SZ, and CM re: status update of Parker Appeal.		\$ 325.00		32.50
9/12/2012	Nunez	Meeting with CBM, SAB, AMB, SZ, and CM re: status update of Parker Appeal.	0.10	\$ 125.00	\$	12.50
9/13/2012	Brady	Telephone conference with S. Halbrook, CBM, and AMB re amicus brief.	0.60	\$ 250.00	\$	150.00
		Conduct research re: called 5th Appellate District Clerk's Office for information regarding				
9/13/2012	Zajac	scheduling of oral argument once briefing is completed.	0.20	\$ 125.00	Ş	25.00
	_					
9/25/2012	Monfort	Legal research and analysis of recent vagueness case law for use in opposition to State appeal.	2.20	\$ 325.00	Ş	715.00
		Analyze and review State' Reply ISO appellants' brief; draft attorney notes re same and				
9/26/2012	Monfort	research cited authority.	4.40	\$ 325.00	Ş	1,430.00
		Conduct legal research re: reviewed case In re Guardianship of Ann S (cited in Parker Reply				
		brief) for CBM to determine whether case revolved around a challenge to a statute on				
9/26/2012	Zajac	vagueness grounds or on other constitutional grounds.	0.60	\$ 125.00	\$	75.00
		Draft correspondence to CBM briefing In re Guardianship Ann S (case cited in Parker reply				
9/26/2012	Zajac	brief), detailing the constitutional challenges raised in the case.	0.30	\$ 125.00	\$	37.50
9/27/2012	Zajac	Conduct research re: reviewed Appellant's Reply brief filed in Parker.	0.70	\$ 125.00	\$	87.50
		Conduct research re: digest/headnote search for cases discussing the standard of review for				
9/27/2012	Zajac	facial challenges to constitutionality of statutes.	0.70	\$ 125.00	\$	87.50

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate	1	Amount
		Conduct research re: reviewed secondary sources discussing interplay between facial				
0/20/2042	- .	challenges and fundamental rights outside the First Amendment context (e.g. Packenbusch's	0.70	ć 425.00		07.50
9/28/2012	Zajac	"Gang Loitering Ordinances Post-Morales: Has Vagueness Been Remedied?").	0.70	\$ 125.00	\$	87.50
		Conduct research re: read Chicago v Morales oral argument transcript for any discussion of				
9/28/2012	Zajac	Salerno / Kolender /mens rea requirements to be applied in facial challenges.	0.60	\$ 125.00	Ś	75.00
0/ = 0/ = 0 = =	,	Conduct research re: read Appellant's brief in Betancourt v Bloomberg for argument that court		7	т	
		should apply an "especially stringent" standard for vagueness because a fundamental right				
9/28/2012	Zajac	(right to travel) was implicated.	0.50	\$ 125.00	\$	62.50
		Conduct research re: read both Petitioner and Respondent's briefs in Arriaga v Gonzales for				
		discussion of void for vagueness standard to be applied to a statute that implicates a				
9/28/2012	Zajac	fundamental right (right to travel).	0.60	\$ 125.00	\$	75.00
		Conduct received you read Fuller v. Decatur (7th Circuit esca) that refused to apply Marales				
9/28/2012	7aiac	Conduct research re: read Fuller v Decatur (7th Circuit case) that refused to apply Morales standard to a school disciplinary rule because no fundamental right was triggered.	0.40	¢ 12E 00	ċ	50.00
9/20/2012	Zajac	Conduct research re: reviewed "Strategic Facial Challenges [85 B.U. L. Rev 1333] for discussion	0.40	\$ 125.00	Ş	30.00
9/28/2012	Zajac	of Salerno standard in regards to facial challenges and fundamental rights.	0.50	\$ 125.00	Ś	62.50
0/ = 0/ = 0 = =		Conduct research re: (Westlaw research) read and reviewed dissent in US v Rybicki for		7	т	
		argument for applying Chicago v Morales instead of Salerno standard in facial challenges				
9/28/2012	Zajac	outside the First Amendment context.	0.40	\$ 125.00	\$	50.00
		Receipt, review and analyze State's Reply Brief; draft attorney notes re State's analysis of				
10/1/2012	Barvir	applicable standard of review.	2.20	\$ 225.00	\$	495.00
40/4/2042	Dami'r	Meeting with SAB re review of State's Reply Brief; discuss SAB's initial comments; assign AMB	0.40	ć 225 00		22.50
10/1/2012	Barvir	task of sending email to amici attorneys re SAB and AMB comments re State's Reply.		\$ 225.00	\$	22.50
10/4/2012	Monfort	Draft status update e-mail to CDM re amicus efforts and litigation status. E-mails to and from D Jensen and J Micheal re amicus assistance; multiple telephone	0.20	\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
10/5/2012	Monfort	conferences with D Jensen and B Colodny re same.	0.40	\$ 325.00	\$	130.00
10/3/2012	William	Multiple e-mails to and from AMB and CA and e-mails to and from AMB re submission of	0.10	ψ 3 2 3.00	7	130.00
10/9/2012	Monfort	amicus briefs.	0.40	\$ 325.00	\$	130.00
		Meeting with CDM, GSM, and CA re status of filing all amicus briefs in support of respondents;			<u> </u>	
		discuss also follow-up with J. Eastman re why Constitutional Center for Jurisprudence was not				
10/10/2012	Barvir	included in R. Gardiner's LEAA amicus brief.	0.10	\$ 225.00	\$	22.50
40/45/2042		Research and analyze recent caselaw addressing facial vagueness challenges; draft attorney	2 40	A 225 00		700.00
10/15/2012	Monfort	notes re same and determine merits of submitting notice of supplemental authority.	2.40	\$ 325.00	\$	780.00
10/15/2012	Nunoz	Send/receive email to/from CDM, CBM and AMB re: Order from Court granting filing of Amicus Briefs and giving opposing counsel 30 days to file Answer to Amicus Briefs.	0.20	\$ 125.00	ċ	25.00
10/13/2012	Nullez	Receipt, review and analyze Order from the Court, calendar opposition date for Appellants to	0.20	Ş 123.00	ڔ	23.00
10/15/2012	Nunez	file Answer to Amicus Briefs.	0.10	\$ 125.00	\$	12.50
-, -, -	-	Analyze and review 1A / Due Process vagueness challenge in FL case prohibiting doctors from		,		
		inquiring about firearms ownership; research and review opening briefs to determine				
10/31/2012	Monfort	potential impact on and use in pending appeal.	2.20	\$ 325.00	\$	715.00
		Research and analyze recent decisions regarding due process vagueness analysis for potential				
		use in and impact on pending appeal; determine filing of notice of supplemental authority re		4		
11/2/2012	Monfort	same.	1.20	\$ 325.00	Ş	390.00
11/5/2012	Monfort	Analysis of opinion re fee awards in civil rights cases for potential use in appeal of denial of fee award by Superior Court; e-mails to and from GSM re same.	0.70	\$ 225.00	ċ	227 50
11/5/2012	MOINOL	Analysis and review of State's response to GOC/FFLG and LEAA amicus briefs in support of	0.70	\$ 325.00	Ş	227.50
		Respondents; draft attorney notes and discuss with AMB and research cited authority to				
		determine counter arguments at oral arguments and potential need for additional filings;				
11/8/2012	Monfort	advise CDM.	3.70	\$ 325.00	\$	1,202.50
		Further legal research of authority cited by Appellants' in brief addressing arguments raised by				
		Amici; research and shepardize additional cited authoirty; research also recent circuit court				
		cases re application of vagueness doctrine; draft attorney notes re same for use in preparing				
11/15/2012	Monfort	for oral argument.	3.40	\$ 325.00	\$	1,105.00
		Research, review and analyze recent case authority concerning facial vagueness challenges;				
42/40/2042	1.4 f t	shepardize and review cited and relied upon authority and compare and contrast with	2.40	ć 225.00		700.00
12/18/2012	iviontort	authority relied upon in Respondents' Brief. Receipt, review, analyze emails from and to CDM re: status of Appeal cases. Research all three	2.40	\$ 325.00	>	780.00
		appeals, telephone call to court clerk to check on oral argument status and provide CDM with				
12/18/2012	Nune ₇	status of appeals.	0.60	\$ 125.00	Ś	75.00
, 10, 2012		Analysis and review of recent vagueness authority for potential use at oral argument and	3.00	y 123.00	Υ	, 5.00
1/9/2013	Monfort	submission of supplemental authority.	0.70	\$ 325.00	\$	227.50
5/14/2013	Brady	Meeting with CDM, CBM, and AMB re strategy re whether to waive oral argument.	0.40	\$ 250.00	\$	100.00
	•					

Date	Timekeener	Description	Hours	Pata	,	Amount
Date 5/14/2013	Timekeeper Michel	Description Meeting with SAB, CBM, and AMB re strategy re	Hours 0.40	Rate \$ 450.00	\$	180.00
3/14/2013	Michel	Meeting with LMM re locating potential supplemental authority addressing vagueness to file	0.40	\$ 450.00	Ş	100.00
E /14/2012	Monfort	in Parker appeal.	0.20	¢ 22E 00	ċ	65.00
5/14/2013	WIGHTOIL	Meet with LMM to confirm research task to locate potential supplemental authority	0.20	\$ 325.00	۲	03.00
5/14/2013	Monfort	addressing vagueness to file in Parker appeal.	0.20	\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
3/14/2013	WIGHTOIL	addressing vagueness to me in raiker appear.	0.20	\$ 323.00	٧	03.00
5/15/2013	Brady	Receive and review and respond to correspondence re whether to seek oral argument.	0.40	\$ 250.00	Ġ	100.00
3/13/2013	Біййу	necesse and review and respond to correspondence to whether to seek ordinargument.	0.40	ÿ 230.00	7	100.00
5/15/2013	Monfort	Meeting with LMM to discuss results of research re supplementary authority for Parker.	0.20	\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
5/15/2013	Monfort	Meeting with CA re: contacting Court of Appeal re Notice of Oral Argument.	0.20	\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
0, 20, 2020		Receipt, review and analyze and research additionally on Court of Appeal rules of court		7	т	
		information re: timeframe for court to issue opinion on case if oral argument is declined				
5/15/2013	Nunez	and/or taken, provide information to CBM.	0.50	\$ 125.00	Ś	62.50
, , ,		Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: Notice of Oral Argument and time frame to submit		,		
5/15/2013	Nunez	Opinion on case if oral argument is waived and/or if oral argument is taken.	0.20	\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
5/15/2013	Nunez	Meeting with CBM re: contacting Court of Appeal re Notice of Oral Argument.		\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
		0 11				
		Analyze and review research assembled by LM re potential filings of supplemental authorities				
		in light of court request re same and option to waive oral argument; evaluate merits of				
5/19/2013	Monfort	pursuing or waiving oral argument and multiple e-mails to and from E Worley re same.	1.80	\$ 325.00	\$	585.00
5/20/2013	Michel	Meeting with CA re: filing Request for Oral Argument Notice.	0.20	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
5/20/2013	Nunez	Meeting with CDM re: filing Request for Oral Argument Notice.	0.20	\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
5/30/2013	Brady	Discuss strategy with CDM and CBM re oral arguments.	0.20	\$ 250.00	\$	50.00
5/30/2013	Michel	Discuss strategy with CBM and SAB re oral arguments.	0.20	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
		Telephone conference with Doug Jensen re oral arguments; discuss strategy with CDM and		<u> </u>		
5/30/2013	Monfort	SAB.	0.40	\$ 325.00	\$	130.00
		Send/receive email to/from CDM, CBM and AMB re: the setting of oral argument and				
6/20/2013	Nunez	attorneys calendar availability, check calendars and email CDM.	0.30	\$ 125.00	\$	37.50
		Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: rescheduling of Oral Argument do to scheduling				
6/21/2013	Nunez	conflict.	0.20	\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
6/21/2013	Nunez	Send/receive email to/from CDM re: rescheduling oral argument do to scheduling conflict.	0.20	\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
		Send/receive emails to/from CDM and AMB re: Respondents' Notice of Unavailability for Oral				
6/24/2013	Nunez	Argument.	0.30	\$ 125.00	\$	37.50
6/24/2013	Nunez	Draft Respondents' Notice of Unavailability for Oral Argument.	0.50	\$ 125.00	\$	62.50
		Multiple telephone calls to and from court clerk re: rescheduling of Oral Argument do to				
6/24/2013	Nunez	scheduling conflict.	0.30	\$ 125.00	\$	37.50
		Exchange emails with CA re Respondents Notice of Availability and dates of unavailability for				
6/25/2013	Michel	oral argument.		\$ 450.00		90.00
6/25/2013	Nunez	Receipt, review and analyze Respondents Notice of Availability.	0.40	\$ 125.00	\$	50.00
		Send/receive email to/from CDM re: Respondents Notice of Availability and dates of				
6/25/2013		unavailability.		\$ 125.00		25.00
6/26/2013	Barvir	Meeting with CA re finishing Notice of Unavailability.	0.10			22.50
6/26/2013	Michel	Discuss oral argument preparation with CBM and CA.	0.30		\$	135.00
6/26/2013	Monfort	Discuss oral argument preparation with CDM and CA; e-mails to and from CA.	0.30	\$ 325.00	\$	97.50
6/26/2013	Nunez	Meeting with CDM re: filing of Respondents' Notice of Unavailability.	0.20	\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
c /2 c /2 0 4 2			0.60	d 425.00		75.00
6/26/2013	Nunez	Receipt, review and analyze, revise multiple times Respondents' Notice of Unavailability.		\$ 125.00		75.00
6/26/2013	Nunez	Meeting with AMB re: finishing Notice of Unavailability.	0.10	\$ 125.00	\$	12.50
		Meeting with SAB and LMM re submitting notice of unavailability for oral argument; discuss				
6/27/2012	Domir	arguments and assign LMM task of revising notice; meeting with CBM to discuss same and to	0.20	¢ 225.00	Ļ	45.00
6/27/2013	Barvir	approve course of action. Send/receive multiple emails to opposing counsel and CBM re submission of notice of	0.20	\$ 225.00	Ş	45.00
		unavailability for oral argument and requesting statement of non-opposition to request for				
6/27/2012	Panir		0.10	¢ 22E 00	ċ	22 50
6/27/2013	Barvir	rescheduling. Review/revise draft of notice of unavailability for oral argument; route to CDM for revision	0.10	\$ 225.00	Ş	22.50
6/27/2012	Domir	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·	0.40	¢ 225 00	ć	00.00
6/27/2013 6/27/2013	Barvir Michel	and approval. Review and review notice of unavailability for oral argument.	0.40	\$ 225.00 \$ 450.00		90.00
0/2//2013	Michel	Multiple meetings with CDM, SAB, and AMB re preparation for hearing; discuss notice of	0.50	ب 450.00	ڔ	223.00
6/27/2012	Monfort		0.50	¢ 22E 00	ċ	162.50
6/27/2013	Monfort	unavailability of counsel and revise; e-mail opposing counsel.		\$ 325.00		162.50
6/27/2013	Nunez	Receipt, review and analyze and revise multiple times Notice of Unavailability. Sand/receive amail to from AMR revisions Notice of Unavailability.	0.70	•		87.50
6/27/2013	Nunez	Send/receive email to/from AMB re: finalizing Notice of Unavailability. Send/receive email to/from CBM and opposing counsel re: non-opposition to requests a new	0.20	\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
6/27/2012	Nunoz		0.20	¢ 12E 00	ċ	25.00
6/27/2013	Nunez	oral argument date. Meeting with CBM re notice of unavailability for oral argument and status of filing; send email	0.20	\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
6/28/2012	Barvir		0.10	\$ 225.00	ċ	22 50
6/28/2013	Barvir	to CA and CBM re same.	0.10	\$ 225.00	Ş	22.50

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate		Amount
		Send/receive multiple emails to/from CBM and SAB re notice of unavailability for oral				
6/28/2013	Barvir	argument and status of filing.	0.10	\$ 225.00	\$	22.50
		Analyze approach to oral argument with CBM, discussing strategy for rebutting DOJ arguments				
6/28/2013	Brady	and clarifying the heightened standard of review issue.	1.00	\$ 250.00	\$	250.00
	•	Multiple e-mails and meetings with AMB and SAB re oral argument notice of unavailability and				
6/28/2013	Monfort	preparation for hearing.	0.20	\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
		Begin reviewing appellate briefs in preparation for oral arguments on appeal; draft attorney				
6/28/2013	Monfort	notes re same.	1.40	\$ 325.00	\$	455.00
		Preparation for oral argument; analyze and review treatises, briefs, and record; draft attorney				
6/30/2013	Monfort	notes re same.	4.40	\$ 325.00	\$	1,430.00
		Receipt, review and analyze correspondence from Court of Appeal re issues to prepare for oral				
		argument; conduct initial research re scienter and common use standard in vagueness				
7/1/2013	Barvir	challenges.	0.40	\$ 225.00	\$	90.00
		Meeting with CBM re preparation for oral argument; assign AMB multiple research and				
7/1/2013	Barvir	drafting tasks to prepare for argument; discuss also conducting moot court.	0.30	\$ 225.00	\$	67.50
		Send/receive multiple emails to/from CBM re scienter and common use standard issues raised				
		by court of appeal to prepare for oral arguments; receive, review, and analyze various				
7/1/2013	Barvir	opinions re same issues and draft attorney notes to prepare arguments.	0.90	\$ 225.00	\$	202.50
7/1/2013	Brady	Meeting with JRD, CBM and CDM re further handling of Parker appellate argument.	0.40		\$	100.00
7/1/2013	Brady	Analyze arguments to prepare with CBM in light of court's oral argument order.	3.50	\$ 250.00	\$	875.00
		Conduct research re when a court may imply scienter into a law that does not expressly have a				
7/1/2013	Klapper	scienter requirement to begin with.	6.10	\$ 125.00	\$	762.50
7/1/2013	Michel	Review 06/27/13 Fifth Appellate District Ltr. re: Oral Argument on 07/10/13 @ 1:30pm.	0.20	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
7/1/2013	Michel	Meeting with JRD, CBM and SAB re further handling of Parker appellate argument.	0.40	\$ 450.00	\$	180.00
		Research and draft multiple e-mails to AMB and SAB re response to court inquiry regarding				
		inference of a scienter requirement and limiting the scope of the challenged provisions to				
7/1/2013	Monfort	certain generally recognized handgun cartridges.	2.20	\$ 325.00	\$	715.00
		Analyze and review case briefs, opinion, and lower court filings in preparation for oral				
7/1/2013	Monfort	arguments; draft attorney notes re same and analyze and review record.	6.30	\$ 325.00	\$	2,047.50
		Research for oral argument; prepare a brief summary of the holding for each case cited in the				
		Appellants' Opening Brief, Respondents' Brief, and Appellants' Reply Brief re the lower court's				
7/1/2013	Zajac	awarding costs associated with Respondents' motion for preliminary injunction.	2.80	\$ 125.00	\$	350.00
		Research for oral argument; prepare a brief summary of the holding for each case cited in the				
l		Appellants' Opening Brief, Respondents' Brief, and Appellants' Reply Brief re the standard of				
7/1/2013	Zajac	review.	1.10	\$ 125.00	\$	137.50
_ , , ,		Meeting with AMB re preparing for oral argument; discuss		4		
7/1/2013	Zajac		0.20	\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
- /2 /2 2 2		Meeting with CBM re oral argument preparation; discuss		4	_	.=
7/2/2013	Barvir	potential arguments per Court of Appeal's guidance.	0.20	\$ 225.00	\$	45.00
		Description of the section of the se				
7/2/2012		Receipt, review and analyze multiple email memoranda re CBM and SAB research re mens	0.00	A 225 00	_	67.50
7/2/2013	Barvir	rea/scienter and common usage issues in vagueness cases; prepare notes for oral argument.	0.30	\$ 225.00	\$	67.50
7/2/2012	Dami.	Preparation for oral argument; review all appellate briefs; pull all cases heavily relied on by	4.00	ć 225 00	ć	405.00
7/2/2013	Barvir	each party; begin reviewing cases and drafting attorneys notes re each. Preparation for oral argument; review all appellate briefs; pull all cases heavily relied on by	1.80	\$ 225.00	>	405.00
7/2/2012	Domir	each party; begin reviewing cases and drafting attorneys notes re each; draft case briefs re all	4.60	¢ 225.00	ċ	1 025 00
7/2/2013 7/2/2013	Barvir	relevant cases; meeting with SDZ re oral argument preparation. Analyze arguments to develop for oral arguments with CBM.	1.20	\$ 225.00 \$ 250.00	\$	1,035.00
7/2/2013	Brady	Analyze arguments to develop for oral arguments with CBM.	1.20	\$ 250.00	Ş	300.00
7/2/2013	Klapper	Conduct research re inferred mens rea requirement when a statute is silent as to scienter.	5.40	\$ 125.00	ċ	675.00
7/2/2013	кіарреі	Drafted memo re public welfare offenses, distinguishing between the various factors that	3.40	J 123.00	ڔ	073.00
		determine whether a statute is one regulating public welfare, and applying this analysis to the				
7/2/2013	Klapper	facts of Parker.	2.40	\$ 125.00	ċ	300.00
7/2/2013	кіарреі	Continue preparing for oral arguments; analyze, research and compare and contrast authority	2.40	J 123.00	ڔ	300.00
		cited by Court in inquiry re inference of scienter requirement and/or limiting the challenged				
		provisions to ammunition generally recognized as principally for use in a handgun and				
7/2/2012	Monfort		4.00	¢ 225 00	ċ	1 560 00
7/2/2013	Monfort	shepardize. Analyze, research and review opinions relied on and cited in briefing in preparation for oral	4.80	\$ 325.00	Ş	1,560.00
7/2/2012	Monfort		4.60	¢ 22E 00	ċ	1 /05 00
7/2/2013	MOHIOFE	arguments; multiple meetings with AMB re same. Send/receive email to/from AMB re: scheduling/calendaring Moot Court for preparation of	4.60	\$ 325.00	Ş	1,495.00
7/2/2012	Nuncz		0.20	¢ 12E 00	ć	25.00
7/2/2013	Nunez	Oral Argument. Research for oral argument; prepare a brief summary of the holding for each case cited in the	0.20	\$ 125.00	Ş	25.00
7/2/2012	Zajac		2.10	¢ 13F 00	Ċ	262.50
7/2/2013	Zajac	Appellants' Opening Brief re general principles for vagueness challenges.	2.10	\$ 125.00	Ş	262.50

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate		Amount
		Research for oral argument; prepare a brief summary of the holding for each case cited in the				
		Appellants' Opening Brief and Reply Brief re standards for general facial challenges to statutes				
7/2/2013	Zajac	and facial vagueness challenges.	2.30	\$ 125.00	\$	287.50
7/2/2012	- .	Research for oral argument; prepare a brief summary of the holding for each case cited in the	4 40	A 425 00		475.00
7/2/2013	Zajac	Respondents' Brief re the standards for general facial challenges to statutes.	1.40	\$ 125.00	\$	175.00
7/2/2012	Zajac	Meeting with AMB re preparing for oral argument; discuss	0.40	¢ 12E 00	ċ	EO 00
7/2/2013	Zajac	Receive email from CA re review research findings re	0.40	\$ 125.00	Ş	50.00
7/3/2013	Barvir	review estation in the control of th	0.10	\$ 225.00	Ś	22.50
.,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,,				7	т	
7/3/2013	Barvir	Receive multiple emails from CBM re oral argument preparation and makeup of panel.	0.10	\$ 225.00	\$	22.50
		Preparation for oral argument; review all appellate briefs; read and review all cases heavily				
7/3/2013	Barvir	relied on by parties; draft case briefs re each case.	3.90	\$ 225.00	\$	877.50
		Preparation for oral argument; send/receive multiple emails to CA re materials to pull and				
		place in study and argument binders; thoroughly review record and joint appendix to				
7/3/2013	Barvir	determine which materials to pull and place in binders.	3.70	\$ 225.00	Ş	832.50
7/3/2013	Produ	Analyze appellate record in order to prepare questions and tips for CBM in preparation for oral argument.	2 10	¢ 250.00	ċ	E2E 00
7/3/2013	Brady Brady	Review appellate record in order to prepare CBM for oral argument.	2.70	\$ 250.00 \$ 250.00	\$	525.00 675.00
7/3/2013	Бгасу	Exchange emails with CA, CBM, AMB, SAB and opposing counsel re court denying request to	2.70	ÿ 230.00	<u> </u>	073.00
7/3/2013	Michel	change oral argument date.	0.20	\$ 450.00	\$	90.00
, , , , , ,		Research and draft presentation and outline of oral arguments; draft and answer questions		,		
7/3/2013	Monfort	and potential hypotheticals.	5.70	\$ 325.00	\$	1,852.50
		Conduct research re Judicial Panel assigned to case for Oral Argument, save, print and forward				
7/3/2013	Nunez	to team Justices bios.	0.70	\$ 125.00	\$	87.50
7/3/2013	Nunez	Research re: locating, saving and gathering documents for Oral Argument Hearing Binders.	1.50	\$ 125.00	\$	187.50
7/2/2012		Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: court granting or denying request to change oral	0.20	d 425.00		25.00
7/3/2013	Nunez	argument date. Send/receive emails to/from CDM, CBM, AMB, SAB and opposing counsel re: court denying	0.20	\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
7/3/2013	Nunez	request to change oral argument date.	0.20	\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
7/3/2013	Nunez	Telephone calls to court clerk re: Judicial Panel assigned to case for Oral Argument.	0.20	\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
1,0,000		Send/receive email to/from re: documents/filings needed to prepare for the Moot Court and		7	т	
7/3/2013	Nunez	Oral Argument.	0.10	\$ 125.00	\$	12.50
		Send/receive email to/from opposing counsel and CBM re: attorney's name who will be				
7/3/2013	Nunez	arguing case.	0.20	\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
		Research for oral argument; prepare a brief summary of the holding for each case cited in the				
		Respondents' Brief re the heightened vagueness standard for statutes abutting upon				
= 10.10010		constitutionally protected conduct and the impropriety of applying a general facial test in a		4	_	
7/3/2013	Zajac	vagueness challenge. Research for oral argument; prepare a brief summary of the holding for each case cited in the	2.20	\$ 125.00	\$	275.00
		Respondents' Brief and Appellants' Reply Brief re the standards for a vagueness challenge to a				
7/3/2013	Zajac	statute lacking a scienter requirement.	1 40	\$ 125.00	Ġ	175.00
77372013	Lajac	Research for oral argument; prepare a brief summary of the holding for each case cited in the	1.10	ψ 123.00	Υ	175.00
		Respondents' Brief and Appellants' Reply Brief re evaluating the constitutionality of a statute				
7/3/2013	Zajac	under the "generality of cases" standard.	1.10	\$ 125.00	\$	137.50
		Research for oral argument; prepare a brief summary of the holding for each case cited in the				
		Respondents' Brief re evaluating the constitutionality of a statute under the "void in all				
7/3/2013	Zajac	applications" standard.	1.30	\$ 125.00	\$	162.50
		Research for oral argument; prepare a brief summary of the holding for each case cited in the				
7/2/2012	7-:	Appellants' Reply Brief re the standard applied in facial challenges to statutes alleged as	4.20	ć 425.00	<u>,</u>	450.00
7/3/2013	Zajac	violating the Second Amendment. Research for oral argument; prepare a brief summary of the holding for each case cited in the	1.20	\$ 125.00	\$	150.00
		Respondents' Brief and Appellants' Reply Brief re whether statutory language comparable to				
7/3/2013	Zajac	"principally for use" is unconstitutionally vague.	1 50	\$ 125.00	Ś	187.50
., 5, 2015	_0,00	Research for oral argument; prepare a brief summary of the holding for each case cited in the	1.50	y 123.00	7	107.50
		Appellants' Reply Brief re use of legislative history in vagueness challenges to statutory				
7/3/2013	Zajac	language.	0.90	\$ 125.00	\$	112.50
		Preparation for oral argument; review and revise case holdings and summaries; significantly				
7/4/2013	Barvir	shorten material for easier memorization.	3.80	\$ 225.00	\$	855.00
		Preparation for oral argument; review and revise case holdings and summaries; significantly				
7/4/2013	Barvir	shorten material for easier memorization.	1.40	\$ 225.00	\$	315.00

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate		Amount
		Multiple meetings with CBM re preparation for oral argument; discuss				
		discuss brainstorm potential arguments				
7/4/2013	Barvir	and rebuttals; discuss also	0.60	\$ 225.00	\$	135.00
		Preparation for oral argument; pull and read case authority heavily relied on in parties'				
7/4/2013	Barvir	briefing; draft case briefs of all relevant cases; provide arguments and rebuttals for each case.	2.90	\$ 225.00	\$	652.50
		Analyze appellate record in order to prepare questions and tips for CBM in preparation for				
7/4/2013	Brady	oral argument.	1.60	\$ 250.00	\$	400.00
		Preparation for oral argument; pull and read case authority heavily relied on in parties'				
7/5/2013	Barvir	briefing; draft case briefs of all relevant cases; provide arguments and rebuttals for each case.	3.40	\$ 225.00	\$	765.00
		Preparation for oral argument; pull and read case authority heavily relied on in parties'				
7/5/2013	Barvir	briefing; draft case briefs of all relevant cases; provide arguments and rebuttals for each case.	4.30	\$ 225.00	\$	967.50
7/5/2013	Barvir	Meeting with SDZ re oral argument preparation; assign task of reviewing several relevant cases and drafting case briefs for study purposes; multiple meetings with SDZ re status of task.	0.20	\$ 225.00	ċ	4E 00
7/3/2013	Daivii	cases and draiting case briefs for study purposes, multiple meetings with 3D2 re status or task.	0.20	\$ 225.00	Ş	45.00
		Preparation for oral argument; pull and read case authority heavily relied on in parties'				
7/5/2013	Barvir	briefing; draft case briefs of all relevant cases; provide arguments and rebuttals for each case.	3.00	\$ 225.00		675.00
7/5/2013 7/5/2013	Brady Monfort	Analyze arguments with CBM. Continue reviewing briefs and record; further preparation for oral argument.	4.40	\$ 250.00 \$ 325.00	\$	1,100.00 1,495.00
7/3/2013	Widilioit	Conduct research re any and all Legislative History on Penal Code Section 12031, locate,	4.00	\$ 323.00	۲	1,495.00
7/5/2013	Nunez	review and forward to CBM and Gun Team in multiple emails.	1.20	\$ 125.00	\$	150.00
		Preparation of Oral Argument binders. Finish locating documents, prepare index and create				
7/5/2013	Nunez	two sets of Appellate Binders with all Briefs and Motions for CBM and AMB.	6.30	\$ 125.00	\$	787.50
		Research for oral argument; prepare case brief for Tobe v. City of Santa Ana; read opinion and draft and prepare case brief outlining the facts, rule, analysis, conclusion, and reasons why the				
7/5/2013	Zajac	case supports a vagueness challenge.	1.50	\$ 125.00	\$	187.50
, ,	•	Meeting with AMB re preparation for oral argument; discuss				
		discuss				
7/5/2013	Zajac		0.30	\$ 125.00	\$	37.50
7/3/2013	Zajac		0.30	ŷ 123.00	٧	37.30
		Research for oral argument; prepare a brief summary of the holding for each case cited in the				
7/5/2012	7-1	Appellants' Reply Brief re use of legislative history, re directing verdicts on appeal, and	2.40	ć 425.00		262.50
7/5/2013	Zajac	application of the "void in all applications" test; submit to AMB for review. Research for oral argument; prepare case brief for Ladas v. California State Automobile	2.10	\$ 125.00	\$	262.50
		Association; read opinion and draft and prepare case brief outlining the facts, rule, analysis,				
		conclusion, and reasons why the case supports the trial court's awarding costs associated with				
7/5/2013	Zajac	the motion for preliminary injunction.	0.80	\$ 125.00	\$	100.00
		Research for oral argument; prepare case brief for Posters N Things v. United States; read opinion and draft and prepare case brief outlining the facts, rule, analysis, conclusion, and				
7/5/2013	Zajac	reasons why the case supports a vagueness challenge.	1.90	\$ 125.00	Ś	237.50
1,0,000		Research for oral argument; prepare a brief summary of the holding for each case cited in the		7	т	
		Respondents' Brief re legislative history and use of definable sources to determine what				
7/5/2013	Zajac	conduct a statute prohibits. Research for oral argument; prepare case brief for People v. Heitzman; read opinion and draft	0.90	\$ 125.00	\$	112.50
		and prepare case brief outlining the facts, rule, analysis, conclusion, and reasons why the case				
7/5/2013	Zajac	supports a vagueness challenge.	1.20	\$ 125.00	\$	150.00
, ,	•	Research for oral argument; prepare case brief for Washington v. Glucksberg; read majority				
		and concurring opinions and draft and prepare case brief outlining the facts, rule, analysis,				
7/5/2013	Zajac	conclusion, and reasons why the case supports a vagueness challenge.		\$ 125.00		225.00
7/6/2013 7/6/2013	Monfort Monfort	Research and draft documents for use at oral arguments. Preparation for oral arguments and moot court with AMB and SAB	4.30 5.30	\$ 325.00 \$ 325.00	\$	1,397.50 1,722.50
7,0,2018		Preparation for oral argument; draft, review, and revise chart of relevant case briefs; draft,		ψ 525.00	Ψ	2,722.00
7/7/2013	Barvir	review, and revise case holdings and summaries.	3.70	\$ 225.00	\$	832.50
7/7/2010		Preparation for oral argument; prepare for and participate in moot court of CBM with SDZ;	4.00	A 225.00		202.50
7/7/2013	Barvir	debrief and provide feedback to CBM after moot court. Preparation of arguments re problems with identifying cartridges' particular use, and create	1.30	\$ 225.00	\$	292.50
7/7/2013	Brady	corresponding table for reference by CBM at oral argument.	4.80	\$ 250.00	\$	1,200.00
7/7/2013	Brady	Preparation of questions to use in moot court of CBM.	2.10	\$ 250.00	\$	525.00
7/7/2013	Monfort	Continue preparing for and moot court with AMB and SZ.	4.70	\$ 325.00	\$	1,527.50
7/7/2012	Manuf	Additional research in support of mens rea issue noted by court and shepardize cited		A 225 25	ć	4 205 25
7/7/2013	Monfort	authority; draft attorney notes re same and analyze and incorporate into outline.	4.20	\$ 325.00	Ş	1,365.00

17/2013 2-jpic Preparation for oral argument, mont court 17/2014 17/2015 1	Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate		Amount
Hoffman Estates; read majority and concurring opinions and derift and prepare case brief coutlining the facts, rule, analysis, conclusion, and reasons why the case supports a vagueness of received for vagueness brief to ANBs. 122.50	7/7/2013		Preparation for oral argument; moot court.	1.70	\$ 125.00	\$	212.50
Confiture of the facts, rule, analysis, conclusion, and reasons why the case supports a vagueness 1,70 \$125.00 \$222.50			Research for oral argument; prepare case brief for Village of Hoffman Estates v. Flipside,				
17/2/2013 Zajac			Hoffman Estates; read majority and concurring opinions and draft and prepare case brief				
Preparation for most court; prepare or all argument questions reliating to the standard of review for vagueness chilenges, constrainting actions reliating to the standard of review for vagueness chilenges, constrainting action report and the property of the property o							
Fig. 2013 Sajac Constitutional rights implicated in this challenge. 1.80 \$125.00 \$ 225.00	7/7/2013	Zajac		1.70	\$ 125.00	\$	212.50
Trigonal							
Research for most count; review appellants' opening and reply brief, respondents' brief, and rid rid count; with so and a summaries, and is statutory authority to that; review and finalize binder of relevant record exempts; complet sudy notebooks; prepare for and attend most count of GRM with SD2 and sexerors; complet sudy notebooks; prepare for and attend most count of GRM with SD2 and sexerors; complet sudy notebooks; prepare for and attend most count of GRM with SD2 and summaries; draft statutory authority to that; review and finalize binder of relevant record exempts; complet sudy notebooks; prepare for and attend most count of GRM with SD2 and summaries; draft statutory authority to that; review and finalize binder of relevant record exempts; complet sudy notebooks; dozus arguments, preparation, and sissues to address with SAB and CBM.	7/7/2012	7-:		4.00	ć 425 00		225.00
Triange Preparation for oral argument, finalize chart of relevant case brides; finalize case holdings and summaries; draft statutory authority chart; review and finalize binder of relevant record excerpts; compile study notebooks; prepare for and attend most court of CRM with S02 and	////2013	Zajac		1.80	\$ 125.00	\$	225.00
Preparation for oral argument; finalize chart of relevant case briefs; finalize case holdings and summaries; drift statutory authority chart; review and finalize binder of relevant record excerpts; complet study notebooks; prepare for and attend most court of CRM with SD2 and 4.20 \$25.00 \$ 945.00 Preparation for oral arguments; preparation, and issues to address with SAB and CRM. Preparation for oral argument, finalize hard relevant case to ledings and summaries; drift statutory authority chart; review and finalize binder of relevant record excerpts; compile study notebooks; discuss arguments, preparation, and issues to address with SAB and CRM. Continue to review relevant materials from records and briefing and to prepare questions for moct court of CRM. Continue to review relevant materials from records and briefing and to prepare questions for moct court of CRM. Preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible concern to address at oral argument. Preparation of arguments preparation of any significant negative treatment in preparation of arguments to 77,0713. Review document re cases for oral arguments. Shepardize cases for any significant negative treatment in preparation of arguments to 77,0713. Review document re cases for oral arguments. Network of the Review Org/2013 Filed Reponderits Counted Nic. of Unavailability. 2.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 375.0	7/7/2012	7aiac		1 40	\$ 125.00	ċ	175.00
summaries, drink statutory authority chart; review and finalize binder of relevant record excerpts; complet study notebooks; prepare for an attend more court of CBM with SD2 and \$25.00 \$ 945.0	7/7/2013	Zajac	that court's written order for issues likely to be faised at ordi algument.	1.40	J 123.00	7	173.00
summaries, drink statutory authority chart; review and finalize binder of relevant record excerpts; complet study notebooks; prepare for an attend more court of CBM with SD2 and \$25.00 \$ 945.0			Preparation for oral argument; finalize chart of relevant case briefs; finalize case holdings and				
execrpts; compile study notebooks; prepare for and attend moot court of CBM with SQ2 and SBB, discuss arguments, preparation, and suses to address with SQB and CBM. 4,20 \$225.00 \$ 945.00							
Preparation for oral argument, finalize chart of relevant case briefs; finalize case holdings and summaries; draft statutory authority chart; review and finalize binder of relevant record excerpts; compile study notebooks; discuss arguments, preparation, and issues to address ### AURILIAN CONTINUES OF THE PROPERTY CONTINUES OF			excerpts; compile study notebooks; prepare for and attend moot court of CBM with SDZ and				
summaries; draft statutory authority chart; review and finalize binder of relevant record excepts; complete study notebooks; discuss arguments, preparation, and issues to address with SAB and CBM. Continue to review relevant materials from records and briefing and to prepare questions for moot court of CBM. Preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible concern to address at oral argument. Review document re cases for oral arguments. Shepardize cases for any significant negative restartment in preparation of arguments on 77/0/33. Review document re cases for oral arguments. Shepardize cases for any significant negative restartment in preparation of arguments on 77/0/33. Review document re cases for oral arguments. Shepardize cases for any significant negative restartment in preparation of arguments on 77/0/33. Review O/7/2/3 filed Respondents' Coursel Ntc. of Unavailability. 20.20 \$ 50000 \$ 300.00 \$ 30	7/8/2013	Barvir	SAB; discuss arguments, preparation, and issues to address with SAB and CBM.	4.20	\$ 225.00	\$	945.00
excerpts; compile study notebooks; discuss arguments, preparation, and issues to address 7/8/2013 Brady with SAB and CBM. Continue to review relevant materials from records and briefing and to prepare questions for more court of CBM. Preparation for oral arguments. Preparation for oral arguments. Preparation for oral arguments. Shepardite cases for any significant negative treatment in preparation of arguments. Shepardite cases for any significant negative treatment in preparation of arguments. Shepardite cases for any significant negative treatment in preparation of arguments. Shepardite cases for any significant negative treatment in preparation of arguments. Shepardite cases for any significant negative treatment in preparation of arguments. Shepardite cases for any significant negative treatment in preparation of arguments. Shepardite cases for any significant negative treatment in preparation of arguments. Shepardite cases for any significant negative treatment in preparation of arguments. Shepardite consent Nat. of Unavailability. 7/8/2013 Michel Review document for oral arguments. Shepardite cases for any significant negative treatment in preparation of arguments. Shepardite consent Nat. of Unavailability. Continue preparing for oral arguments and releasting and memoriting presentation, and shepardite control or all arguments. Shepardite memoriting presentation, and arguments. More treatment in preparation or all arguments. More treatments on the une preparation or all arguments. More treatments on the une preparation of preparation of additional oral Argument. More treatments on the une preparation of additional oral Argument. Suggested revisions to presentation and draft and revise questions and answers for oral arguments for binders. 7/8/2013 Nunez Preparation of additional Creates for AMB to review and decider or of which nones to keep, receive additional requests from AMB to locate new documents for binders. 8. 100 preparation for oral argument, review specific cartridge use table for CBMS use;			Preparation for oral argument; finalize chart of relevant case briefs; finalize case holdings and				
7/8/2013 Barvir with SAB and CBM. Continue to review relevant materials from records and briefing and to prepare questions for most court of CBM. Preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible concern to address at oral argument. Review document re cases for oral arguments. Sheparafize cases for any significant negative resumment. Review document re cases for oral arguments. Sheparafize cases for any significant negative resumment. Review document in preparation of arguments on 7/10/13. Review document in preparation of or all arguments and rehearsing and memoraling presentation; review documents for AMB or the day with CBM and AMB re: items/materials needed for preparation of arguments. Review documents for AMB to review and decide order of which ones to keep, receive additional requests from AMB to ocean who documents for finders. Research for oral argument; review pint appendix and provide citations to 5 Hesistey's deposition and declaration are well ocuments for finders are used in long guans on handurs; submit table for CBM's review. 7/8/2013 Zajac submit results to CBM. Research for oral argument; review pint appendix and provide citations to 5 Hesistey's deposition and declaration for all arguments are used in long guans on and guans are used in Review and analyze whether specific cartridges are used in long g							
Continue to review relevant materials from records and briefing and to prepare questions for most court of CBM.							
7/8/2013 Brady moot court of CBM. Preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible concern to address at oral argument. Preparation for oral arguments. Review document re-cases for oral arguments. Shepardize cases for any significant negative treatment in preparation of oral arguments. Shepardize cases for any significant negative treatment in preparation of a gruments on 77/0/13. Review 07/02/13 Filed Respondents' Counsel Ntc. of Unavailability. Note of Multiple meetings and conferences restrategy for oral argument. Notice of Continue preparation of oral arguments and rehearsing and memorating presentation, review Continue preparing for oral arguments and rehearsing and memorating presentation. Notice of Countinue preparing for oral arguments and rehearsing and memorating presentation. Notice of Countinue preparing for oral arguments and rehearsing and memorating presentation. Notice of Countinue preparation of oral Anglements. Notice of Countinue preparation of oral Anglements. Notice of Countinue preparation of Oral Arguments. Notice of Countinue preparation of Oral Arguments. Notice of Countinue preparation of Oral Argument. Notice of Countinue preparation of Oral Argument. Notice of Countinue preparation of Oral Argument. Preparation of Anglement. Preparation of Oral Argument. Notice of Countinue preparation of Oral Argument. Notice of Countinue preparation of Oral Argument. Notice of Countinue preparation of Oral Argument. Preparation of Oral argument. Preparation of Oral Argument. Notice of Countinue preparation of Oral Argument.	7/8/2013	Barvir		4.00	\$ 225.00	\$	900.00
Preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible concern to all programs and provided address at oral arguments. Supporting and provided address at oral arguments or oral arguments. Shepardite cases for any significant negative treatment in preparation of arguments on 7/10/13. Review 07/02/13 flield Respondents Counsel Ntc. of Unavailability. 0.02 \$450.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 0.00	= /0/2010				4		.=
7/8/2013 Rrady address at oral argument. 5.0 \$25.00 \$1,350.00	7/8/2013	Brady		1.80	\$ 250.00	Ş	450.00
Review document re cases for oral arguments. Shepardize cases for any significant negative 7/8/2013 Klapper treatment in preparation of arguments on 7/10/13. 3.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 375.00 \$ 7/8/2013 Michel Review 07/02/13 Pited Respondents' Counsel Ntc. of Unavailability. 0.20 \$ 450.00 \$ 90.00 \$ 7/8/2013 Michel Multiple meetings and conferences re strategy for oral argument. 3.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 1,350.00 \$ 7/8/2013 Michel Multiple meetings and conferences re strategy for oral argument. 3.00 \$ 325.00 \$ 1,397.50 \$ 1,397.50 \$ 1,397.50 Monfort Scalia and Garner resource and fine tune presentation. 4.30 \$ 325.00 \$ 1,397.50 \$ 1,897.50 Monfort Scalia and Garner resource and fine tune presentation. 4.30 \$ 325.00 \$ 1,397.50 \$ 1,897.50 Monfort revise questions and answers for oral arguments. 5.10 \$ 325.00 \$ 1,397.50 \$ 1,897.50 \$	7/0/2012	Dradu		F 40	¢ 250.00	Ļ	1 250 00
Table Tabl	7/8/2013	вгацу		5.40	\$ 250.00	Ş	1,350.00
7/8/2013 Michel Review 07/02/13 Filed Respondents' Counsel Nrc. of Unavailability. 0.20 \$ 450.00 \$ 9.00.0 7/8/2013 Michel Multiple meetings and conferences re strategy for oral argument. 3.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 1.350.00 Continue preparing for oral arguments and rehearsing and memorizing presentation; review Scalia and Garner resource and fine tune presentation. Montor Court with SAB, 52, and AMB; discuss suggested revisions to presentation and draft and revise questions and answers for oral arguments. 5.10 \$ 325.00 \$ 1.397.50 Monfort revise questions and answers for oral arguments. 5.10 \$ 325.00 \$ 1.657.50 Multiple meetings throughout the day with CBM and AMB re: items/materials needed for preparation of Oral Argument binders and materials needed for preparation of additional requests from AMB to locate new documents for binders. 5.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 62.50 Preparation of additional requests from AMB to locate new documents for binders. 5.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 625.00 Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and provide citations to S Heisley's deposition and declaration re whether specific cartridge use table for CBM's use; include whether specific cartridge use table for CBM's use; include whether specific cartridge use table for CBM's use; include whether specific cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's revise and descriptions of cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's revise and benefits of cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's revise and benefits of cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's revise and benefits of cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's revise and benefits of cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's revise and benefits of cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's revise and benefits of cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's revise and benefits of cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's revise and pursuant pursuant pursuant pursuant pursuant pursuant	7/8/2013	Klanner		3 00	\$ 125.00	¢	375.00
Michel Multiple meetings and conferences re strategy for oral argument. 3.00 \$ 450.00 \$ 1,350.00							
Continue preparing for oral arguments and rehearsing and memorizing presentation; review Scalia and Garner resource and fine tune presentation. Monofort Scalia and Garner resource and fine tune presentation. Monofort revise questions and answers for oral arguments. Monofort revise questions and answers for oral arguments. Multiple meetings throughout the day with CBM and AMB re: items/materials needed for preparation of Oral Argument. Preparation of Oral Argument. Preparation of additional Oral Argument binders and materials needed for hearing, research, pull and gather documents for AMB to review and decide order of which ones to keep, receive additional requests from AMB to locate new documents for binders. Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and provide citations to S Helsley's deposition and declaration re whether specific cartridges are used in long guns or handgurs; submit results to CBM. Preparation for oral argument; prepare specific cartridge use table for CBM's use; include whether specific cartridges are used in rifles, or in "cowboy action shooting"; submit table for CBM's review. Preparation for oral argument; revise specific cartridge use; include contains to CBM's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use; include custom to CBM's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use; include custom to CBraker's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use; include custom to CBraker's deposition of incusing; 25 ACP shoft form al long gun; submit revised table to CBM. Preparation for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to B Graham's deposition discussing; 25 ACP shoft form al long gun; submit revised table to CBM. Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to B Graham's deposition discussing; 25 ACP shoft form al long gun; submit revised table to CBM. Research for oral argument; review Westlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discus			• • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • • •		•		
Nonfort Scalla and Garmer resource and fine tune presentation. 4.30 \$.325.00 \$ 1,397.50	7,0,2020			- 5.00	ψ 150.00	Ψ	1,000.00
7/8/2013 Monfort revise questions and answers for oral arguments. Multiple meetings throughout the day with CBM and AMB re: items/materials needed for preparation of Oral Argument binders and materials needed for hearing, research, pull and gather documents for AMB to review and decide order of which ones to keep, receive additional requests from AMB to locate new documents for binders. 7/8/2013 Nunez additional requests from AMB to locate new documents for binders. Research for oral argument; review point appendix and provide citations to S Helsley'S deposition and declaration re whether specific cartridges are used in long guns or handguns; submit results to CBM. Preparation for oral argument; prepare specific cartridge use table for CBM's use; include whether specific cartridges are used in rifles, select-fire rifles, or in "cowboy action shooting"; submit table for CBM's review. Preparation for oral argument; revises specific cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use; include citation to C Parker's deposition discussing, 2.5 ACP shot from a long gun; submit revised table to CBM. Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to C Parker's deposition discussing, 2.5 ACP shot from a long gun; submit revised table to CBM. Research for oral argument; review Westlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing valuenes shall expert to compare, and control cBM. Preparation for oral argument; review Westlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing valueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks, coll	7/8/2013	Monfort		4.30	\$ 325.00	\$	1,397.50
Multiple meetings throughout the day with CBM and AMB re: items/materials needed for preparation of Oral Argument. Preparation of additional Oral Argument binders and materials needed for hearing, research, pull and gather documents for AMB to review and decide order of which ones to keep, receive additional requests from AMB to locate new documents for binders. Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and provide citations to S Hesley's deposition and edeclaration re whether specific cartridges are used in long guns or handguns; submit results to CBM. Preparation for oral argument; prepare specific cartridge use table for CBM's use; include whether specific cartridges are used in rifles, select-fire rifles, or in "cowboy action shooting"; submit table for CBM's review. Preparation for oral argument; revise specific cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use table to CBM. Preparation for oral argument; revise specific cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use; include citation to C Parker's deposition discussing, 25 ACP shot from a long gun; submit revised table to CBM. Preparation for oral argument; moot court and debrief. Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to B Graham's deposition testimony that, ultimately, whether a cartridge is used more often than not in a handgun is based on his intuition; provide quotation and citation to record to CBM. Research for oral argument; review Weistlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vaguenes challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in s			Moot court with SAB, SZ, and AMB; discuss suggested revisions to presentation and draft and				
Preparation of Oral Argument. 0.50 \$ 125.00 \$ 62.50 Preparation of additional Oral Argument binders and materials needed for hearing, research, pull and gather documents for AMB to review and decide order of which ones to keep, receive additional requests from AMB to locate new documents for binders. 8.00 \$ 125.00 \$ 625.00 Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and provide citations to 5 Helsley's deposition and declaration re whether specific cartridges are used in long guns or handguns; submit results to CBM. 1.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 162.50 Preparation for oral argument; prepare specific cartridge use table for CBM's use; include whether specific cartridges are used in rifles, select-fire rifles, or in "cowboy action shooting"; submit trevities to CBM's review. 1.70 \$ 125.00 \$ 212.50 Preparation for oral argument; review specific cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use; include ditation to C Parker's deposition discussing. 25 ACP shot from a long gun; submit revised table to CBM. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 7/8/2013 Zajac Preparation for oral argument; moot court and debrief. 2.50 \$ 125.00 \$ 312.50 Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to B Graham's deposition testimony that, ultimately, whether a cartridge is used more often than not in a handgun is based on his intuition; provide quotation and citation to record to CBM. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 Research for oral argument; review Westlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. 2.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 350.00 Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel pustices; route relevant cooks; review and analyze excepts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues wi	7/8/2013	Monfort	revise questions and answers for oral arguments.	5.10	\$ 325.00	\$	1,657.50
Preparation of additional Oral Argument binders and materials needed for hearing, research, pull and gather documents for AMB to review and decide order of which ones to keep, receive additional requests from AMB to locate new documents for binders. 7/8/2013 Zajac Submit results to CBM. 1.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 625.00 Preparation for oral argument; review joint appendix and provide citations to S Helsley's deposition and declaration re whether specific cartridges are used in long guns or handguns; submit results to CBM. 1.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 162.50 Preparation for oral argument; prepare specific cartridge use table for CBM's use; include whether specific cartridges are used in rifles, select-fire rifles, or in "cowboy action shooting"; submit table for CBM's review. 1.70 \$ 125.00 \$ 212.50 Preparation for oral argument; revise specific cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use; include citation to C Parker's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use; include citation to C Parker's deposition discussing, 25 ACP shot from a long gun; submit revised table to CBM. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 Preparation for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to B Graham's deposition fuscusing, 25 ACP shot from allong gun; submit revised table to CBM. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 312.50 Preparation for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to B Graham's deposition testimony that, ultimately, whether a cartridge is used more often than not in a handgun is based on his intuition; provide quotation and citation to record to CBM. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 Preparation for oral argument; review Westlaw Cling References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. 2.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 350.00 Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze excepts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to p			Multiple meetings throughout the day with CBM and AMB re: items/materials needed for				
pull and gather documents for AMB to review and decide order of which ones to keep, receive additional requests from AMB to locate new documents for binders. Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate pursuant to CBM's instructions; review joint appendix and locate citations to S Helsley's deposition and declaration re whether specific cartridges are used in long guns or handguns; submit results to CBM. Preparation for oral argument; prepare specific cartridge use table for CBM's use; include whether specific cartridges are used in rifles, select-fire rifles, or in "cowboy action shooting"; submit table for CBM's review. Preparation for oral argument; revise specific cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use; include citation to C Parker's deposition discussing. 25 ACP shot from a long gun; submit revised table to CBM. Preparation for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to C B Graham's deposition testimony that, ultimately, whether a cartridge is used more often than not in a handgun is based on his intuition; provide quotation and citation to record to CBM. Research for oral argument; review Staw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument. Preparation for oral argument; and issues with CBM and SAB. 4.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,080.00 Preparation for oral argument and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, roughly notebooks; review and analyze excepts of record for inclusion in oral argument. Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze a	7/8/2013	Nunez	preparation of Oral Argument.	0.50	\$ 125.00	\$	62.50
pull and gather documents for AMB to review and decide order of which ones to keep, receive additional requests from AMB to locate new documents for binders. Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate pursuant to CBM's instructions; review joint appendix and locate citations to S Helsley's deposition and declaration re whether specific cartridges are used in long guns or handguns; submit results to CBM. Preparation for oral argument; prepare specific cartridge use table for CBM's use; include whether specific cartridges are used in rifles, select-fire rifles, or in "cowboy action shooting"; submit table for CBM's review. Preparation for oral argument; revise specific cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use; include citation to C Parker's deposition discussing. 25 ACP shot from a long gun; submit revised table to CBM. Preparation for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to C B Graham's deposition testimony that, ultimately, whether a cartridge is used more often than not in a handgun is based on his intuition; provide quotation and citation to record to CBM. Research for oral argument; review Staw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument. Preparation for oral argument; and issues with CBM and SAB. 4.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,080.00 Preparation for oral argument and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, roughly notebooks; review and analyze excepts of record for inclusion in oral argument. Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze a							
7/8/2013 Nunez additional requests from AMB to locate new documents for binders. Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and provide citations to S Helsley's deposition and declaration re whether specific cartridges are used in long guns or handguns; submit results to CBM. Preparation for oral argument; prepare specific cartridge use table for CBM's use; include whether specific cartridges are used in riles, select-fire rifles, or in "cowboy action shooting"; submit table for CBM's review. Preparation for oral argument; revise specific cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use; include citation to C Parker's deposition discussing. 25 ACP shot from a long gun; submit revised table to CBM. Research for oral argument; moot court and debrief. Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to B Graham's deposition testimony that, ultimately, whether a cartridge is used more often than not in a handgun is based on his intuition; provide quotation and citation to record to CBM. Research for oral argument; review Westlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. Preparation for oral argument; review, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument. EMB and SAB. 7/9/2013 Barvir Travel to Fresno, CA, from Long Beach, CA, for oral argument. Compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. Location of the deposition of the provided provided and prepare to discuss at oral argument. Location of the provided provided and prepare to discuss at oral argument. Location of the provided provided and prepare to discuss at oral							
Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and provide citations to S Helsley's deposition and declaration re whether specific cartridges are used in long guns or handguns; submit results to CBM. Preparation for oral argument; prepare specific cartridge use table for CBM's use; include whether specific cartridges are used in rifles, select-fire rifles, or in "cowboy action shooting"; submit results to CBM. Preparation for oral argument; prepare specific cartridge use table for CBM's use; include whether specific cartridges are used in rifles, select-fire rifles, or in "cowboy action shooting"; submit table for CBM's review. Preparation for oral argument; revise specific cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use; include citation to C Parker's deposition discussing .25 ACP shot from a long gun; submit revised table to CBM. Preparation for oral argument; moot court and debrief. Research for oral argument; moot court and debrief. Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to B Graham's deposition testimony that, ultimately, whether a cartridge is used more often than not in a handgun is based on his intuition; provide quotation and citation to record to CBM. Research for oral argument; review Westlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast	7/0/2012			5 00	A 425.00		625.00
deposition and declaration re whether specific cartridges are used in long guns or handguns; submit results to CBM. Preparation for oral argument; prepare specific cartridge use table for CBM's use; include whether specific cartridges are used in rifles, select-fire rifles, or in "cowboy action shooting"; submit table for CBM's review. Preparation for oral argument; revise specific cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use; include citation to C Parker's deposition discussing .25 ACP shot from a long gun; submit revised table to CBM. Preparation for oral argument; revise you from a long gun; submit revised table to CBM. Research for oral argument; revise with from a long gun; submit revised table to CBM. Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to B Graham's deposition testimony that, ultimately, whether a cartridge is used more often than not in a handgun is based on his intuition; provide quotation and citation to record to CBM. Research for oral argument; review Westlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. Preparation for oral argument; review, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks for oral argument, discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. 4.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,080.00 Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible	7/8/2013	Nunez	•	5.00	\$ 125.00	Ş	625.00
Submit results to CBM. 1.30 \$ 125.00 \$ 162.50							
Preparation for oral argument; prepare specific cartridge use table for CBM's use; include whether specific cartridges are used in rifles, select-fire rifles, or in "cowboy action shooting"; submit table for CBM's review. Preparation for oral argument; revise specific cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use; include citation to C Parker's deposition discussing. 25 ACP shot from a long gun; submit revised table to CBM. Preparation for oral argument; moot court and debrief. Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to B Graham's deposition testimony that, ultimately, whether a cartridge is used more often than not in a handgun is based on his intuition; provide quotation and citation to record to CBM. Research for oral argument; review Westlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excepts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss, at oral argument. 1.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 337.50	7/8/2013	7aiac		1 30	\$ 125.00	¢	162 50
whether specific cartridges are used in rifles, select-fire rifles, or in "cowboy action shooting"; submit table for CBM's review. Preparation for oral argument; revise specific cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use; include citation to C Parker's deposition discussing. 25 ACP shot from a long gun; submit revised table to CBM. Nesearch for oral argument; moot court and debrief. Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to B Graham's deposition testimony that, ultimately, whether a cartridge is used more often than not in a handgun is based on his intuition; provide quotation and citation to record to CBM. Research for oral argument; review Westlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. 4.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,080.00 Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. 1.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 337.50 Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible	7/0/2013	Zajac		1.30	J 123.00	٧	102.30
7/8/2013 Zajac submit table for CBM's review. 1.70 \$ 125.00 \$ 212.50 Preparation for oral argument; revise specific cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use; include citation to C Parker's deposition discussing .25 ACP shot from a long gun; submit revised table to CBM. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 7/8/2013 Zajac Preparation for oral argument; moot court and debrief. 2.50 \$ 125.00 \$ 312.50 Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to B Graham's deposition testimony that, ultimately, whether a cartridge is used more often than not in a handgun is based on his intuition; provide quotation and citation to record to CBM. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 Research for oral argument; review Westlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. 2.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 350.00 Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. 4.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,080.00 7/9/2013 Barvir Travel to Fresno, CA, from Long Beach, CA, fror oral argument. 4.60 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,035.00 Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. 1.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 337.50							
Preparation for oral argument; revise specific cartridge use; include citation to C Parker's deposition discussing .25 ACP shot from a long gun; submit revised table to CBM. 7/8/2013 Zajac Preparation for oral argument; moot court and debrief. Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to B Graham's deposition testimony that, ultimately, whether a cartridge is used more often than not in a handgun is based on his intuition; provide quotation and citation to record to CBM. Research for oral argument; review Westlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible	7/8/2013	Zajac		1.70	\$ 125.00	\$	212.50
instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use; include citation to C Parker's deposition discussing .25 ACP shot from a long gun; submit revised table to CBM. 7/8/2013 Zajac Preparation for oral argument; moot court and debrief. Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to B Graham's deposition testimony that, ultimately, whether a cartridge is used more often than not in a handgun is based on his intuition; provide quotation and citation to record to CBM. Research for oral argument; review Westlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. A.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,080.00 \$ 7/9/2013 Barvir Travel to Fresno, CA, from Long Beach, CA, for oral argument. Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. 1.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 337.50 Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible	, , , , , ,	.,			,		
7/8/2013 Zajac deposition discussing .25 ACP shot from a long gun; submit revised table to CBM. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 7/8/2013 Zajac Preparation for oral argument; moot court and debrief. 2.50 \$ 125.00 \$ 312.50 Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to B Graham's deposition testimony that, ultimately, whether a cartridge is used more often than not in a handgun is based on his intuition; provide quotation and citation to record to CBM. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 Research for oral argument; review Westlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. 2.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 350.00 Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. 4.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,080.00 7/9/2013 Barvir Travel to Fresno, CA, from Long Beach, CA, for oral argument. 4.60 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,035.00 Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. 1.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 337.50			Preparation for oral argument; revise specific cartridge use table pursuant to CBM's				
Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to B Graham's deposition testimony that, ultimately, whether a cartridge is used more often than not in a handgun is based on his intuition; provide quotation and citation to record to CBM. Research for oral argument; review Westlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. 7/9/2013 Barvir Travel to Fresno, CA, from Long Beach, CA, for oral argument. Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible			instructions; revise language and descriptions of cartridge use; include citation to C Parker's				
Research for oral argument; review joint appendix and locate citation to B Graham's deposition testimony that, ultimately, whether a cartridge is used more often than not in a handgun is based on his intuition; provide quotation and citation to record to CBM. Research for oral argument; review Westlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. 7/9/2013 Barvir Travel to Fresno, CA, from Long Beach, CA, for oral argument. Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible			deposition discussing .25 ACP shot from a long gun; submit revised table to CBM.			\$	100.00
deposition testimony that, ultimately, whether a cartridge is used more often than not in a handgun is based on his intuition; provide quotation and citation to record to CBM. Research for oral argument; review Westlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. 7/9/2013 Barvir fravel to Fresno, CA, from Long Beach, CA, for oral argument. Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible	7/8/2013	Zajac	Preparation for oral argument; moot court and debrief.	2.50	\$ 125.00	\$	312.50
deposition testimony that, ultimately, whether a cartridge is used more often than not in a handgun is based on his intuition; provide quotation and citation to record to CBM. Research for oral argument; review Westlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. 7/9/2013 Barvir fravel to Fresno, CA, from Long Beach, CA, for oral argument. Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible			Describe for and an arrival to the second se				
7/8/2013 Zajac handgun is based on his intuition; provide quotation and citation to record to CBM. 0.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 100.00 Research for oral argument; review Westlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. 2.80 \$ 125.00 \$ 350.00 Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks 7/9/2013 Barvir for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. 4.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,080.00 7/9/2013 Barvir Travel to Fresno, CA, from Long Beach, CA, for oral argument. 4.60 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,035.00 Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. 1.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 337.50 Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible							
Research for oral argument; review Westlaw Citing References to cases decided by Judges D Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. A.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,080.00 7/9/2013 Barvir Travel to Fresno, CA, from Long Beach, CA, for oral argument. Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible	7/0/2012	7-:	, , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , , ,	0.00	ć 13F 00	<u>,</u>	100.00
Cornell, G Gomes, and S Kane discussing vagueness challenges; print relevant cases and highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks 7/9/2013 Barvir for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible	7/8/2013	Zajac		0.80	\$ 125.00	Ş	100.00
7/8/2013 Zajac highlight the court's vagueness analysis; submit cases to AMB. Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks 7/9/2013 Barvir for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. A.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,080.00 7/9/2013 Barvir Travel to Fresno, CA, from Long Beach, CA, for oral argument. Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible							
Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks 7/9/2013 Barvir for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. 4.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,080.00 7/9/2013 Barvir Travel to Fresno, CA, from Long Beach, CA, for oral argument. Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible	7/8/2013	7aiac		2 80	\$ 125.00	Ś	350.00
Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks 7/9/2013 Barvir for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. 4.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,080.00 7/9/2013 Barvir Travel to Fresno, CA, from Long Beach, CA, for oral argument. Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible	77072013	Zujuc	The man the court of vagaciness unarysis, submit cases to Aivib.	2.00	ÿ 123.00	7	330.00
Amendment opinions drafted by panel justices; route relevant opinions to CA for inclusion in study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks 7/9/2013 Barvir for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. 4.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,080.00 7/9/2013 Barvir Travel to Fresno, CA, from Long Beach, CA, for oral argument. Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible			Preparation for oral argument; receive, review, and analyze all vagueness and Second				
study notebooks; collaborate with CA to prepare study notebooks; review and analyze excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks 7/9/2013 Barvir for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. 4.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,080.00 7/9/2013 Barvir Travel to Fresno, CA, from Long Beach, CA, for oral argument. 4.60 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,035.00 Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, 7/9/2013 Barvir compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. 1.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 337.50 Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible							
excerpts of record for inclusion in oral argument materials; review record to prepare remarks 7/9/2013 Barvir for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB. 4.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,080.00 7/9/2013 Barvir Travel to Fresno, CA, from Long Beach, CA, for oral argument. Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible							
7/9/2013 Barvir Travel to Fresno, CA, from Long Beach, CA, for oral argument. 4.60 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,035.00 Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, 7/9/2013 Barvir compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. 1.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 337.50 Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible							
Preparation for oral argument; study and review all relevant cases with CBM; discuss, 7/9/2013 Barvir compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. 1.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 337.50 Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible	7/9/2013	Barvir	for oral argument; discuss arguments and issues with CBM and SAB.	4.80	\$ 225.00	\$	1,080.00
7/9/2013 Barvir compare, and contrast relevant cases and prepare to discuss at oral argument. 1.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 337.50 Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible	7/9/2013	Barvir		4.60	\$ 225.00	\$	1,035.00
Continue preparation for oral argument by reviewing record and flagging issues of possible				_			
	7/9/2013	Barvir		1.50	\$ 225.00	\$	337.50
7/9/2013 Brady concern to address at oral argument. 4.00 \$ 250.00 \$ 1,000.00							
	7/9/2013	Brady	concern to address at oral argument.	4.00	\$ 250.00	\$	1,000.00

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate	-	Amount
	•	Prepare binders and reference materials for oral arguments; draft final outline and prepare				
7/9/2013	Monfort	flashcards for memorization.	4.60	\$ 325.00	\$	1,495.00
7/9/2013	Monfort	Travel to Fresno CA for oral arguments with AMB.	4.80	\$ 325.00	\$	1,560.00
7/9/2013	Monfort	Review case authority with AMB and rehearse oral argument outline.	2.20	\$ 325.00	\$	715.00
		Send/receive email to/from throughout the day from AMB re: additional				
7/9/2013	Nunez	requirements/materials needed for travel and Oral Argument.	0.50	\$ 125.00	\$	62.50
		Preparation of additional Oral Argument binders and materials needed for hearing, research,				
		pull documents, gather documents from AMB, sort, organize, create indexes, copy, revise and				
7/9/2013	Nunez	finalize set of additional hearing binders for CBM and AMB.	4.50	\$ 125.00	\$	562.50
		Research for oral argument; research legislative history underlying SB 1342 emailed from CA				
		for any language suggesting a scienter requirement and whether the law would apply only to				
		cartridges that are generally recognized or commonly understood to be handgun ammunition;				
7/9/2013	Zajac	extract relevant documents and email results to CBM.	2.30	\$ 125.00	\$	287.50
		Research for oral argument; research Part I of legislative history underlying AB 962 emailed				
		from CA for any language suggesting a scienter requirement and whether the law would apply				
- /2 /2 2 2		only to cartridges that are generally recognized or commonly understood to be handgun		4		
7/9/2013	Zajac	ammunition	2.20	\$ 125.00	Ş	275.00
		Research for oral argument; research Part II of legislative history underlying AB 962 emailed				
		from CA for any language suggesting a scienter requirement and whether the law would apply				
7/0/2012	7-:	only to cartridges that are generally recognized or commonly understood to be handgun	4.00	ć 43E 00	<u>,</u>	225.00
7/9/2013	Zajac	ammunition.	1.80	\$ 125.00	\$	225.00
		Paccarch for anal argument: recearch logiciative history underlying AP 2202 amailed from CA				
		Research for oral argument; research legislative history underlying AB 2392 emailed from CA for any language suggesting a scienter requirement and whether the law would apply only to				
7/9/2013	7aiac	cartridges that are generally recognized or commonly understood to be handgun ammunition.	1 70	\$ 125.00	ċ	212 50
7/9/2013	Zajac	cartriages that are generally recognized or commonly understood to be handguit animum tion.	1.70	\$ 125.00	Ą	212.50
		Preparation for oral argument; review and memorize arguments with CBM; discuss relevant				
		cases with CBM; address any final issues that may be raised in oral argument; attend morning				
7/10/2013	Barvir	oral argument to prepare for appearance; travel to/from hotel and courthouse.	4 50	\$ 225.00	\$	1,012.50
7/10/2013	Barvir	Attend oral argument.	2.00	\$ 225.00	\$	450.00
7/10/2013	Barvir	Meeting with CBM and opposing counsel; discuss oral argument and next steps.	0.20	\$ 225.00	\$	45.00
7/10/2013	Barvir	Travel to Long Beach, CA, from Fresno, CA, after oral argument.	3.80	\$ 225.00	\$	855.00
1, 20, 2020		Final review and preparation for oral argument prior to hearing; attend argument by panel by		7	т	
7/10/2013	Monfort	to hearing and draft attorney notes re same.	4.10	\$ 325.00	\$	1,332.50
		,		·		·
7/10/2013	Monfort	Appearance at oral arguments for Respondents; meet with opposing counsel after hearing.	1.70	\$ 325.00	\$	552.50
7/10/2013	Monfort	Return travel from oral arguments.	4.30	\$ 325.00	\$	1,397.50
		Research for oral argument; research whether the State's failure to raise any evidentiary				
		objections in its appellate briefing waived any possible objection; email research results to				
7/10/2013	Zajac	CBM and AMB.	1.40	\$ 125.00	\$	175.00
		Analyze and review appellate briefings after oral arguments; determine whether to file				
		document with court addressing unsubstantiated claims made by opposing counsel during				
7/15/2013	Monfort	rebuttal at oral argument; discuss with co-counsel.	1.80	\$ 325.00	\$	585.00
7/19/2013	Nunez	Send/receive email to/from CBM and AMB re: requesting copy of oral argument transcripts.	0.30	\$ 125.00	\$	37.50
	_	Review briefs following oral arguments to determine need for follow up clarification with				
7/26/2013	Monfort	court re issues identified in correspondence to counsel; draft e-mail to CDM and AMB re same.		\$ 325.00		130.00
7/31/2013	Michel	Review 07/10/13 Oral Argument- Case No. F062490.	0.00	\$ 450.00	\$	-
44/6/2042	Daniel II	Send/receive email to/from Court of Appeal and CA re status of appeal; meetings with CBM,	4.00	ć 225 00	<u>,</u>	225.00
11/6/2013	Barvir	CDM, SAB, and CA re same; receive, review, and analyze opinion.	1.00	\$ 225.00	\$	225.00
		Analyza and ravious Annallata Oninian affirming judgement in fulls multiple correspondence to				
		Analyze and review Appellate Opinion affirming judgement in full; multiple correspondence to and from clients, experts, co-counsel, amici, and client members re same; multiple meetings				
		with CDM, AMB, and SAB re same and discuss implications of victory and potential impact on				
11/6/2013	Monfort	national litigation; correspondence with opposing counsel and governor's office.	4.40	\$ 325.00	ċ	1,430.00
11/0/2013	Monfort	Receipt, review and analyze Court of Appeal link to Opinion, download, print, save, forward to	4.40	\$ 323.00	Ą	1,430.00
		gun team, draft multiple emails search for all plaintiffs contact information and forward copy				
11/6/2013	Nunez	of opinion per CDM.	1.20	\$ 125.00	\$	150.00
11/6/2013	Nunez	Conduct research re finality of Opinion Court of Appeal/Supreme Court rules.	0.40		\$	50.00
11/7/2013	Nunez	Send/receive email to/from AMB re: Parker Appeal Timeline.	0.40	\$ 125.00	\$	12.50
11/1/2013	.101102	Meeting with MEL re and	0.10	y 123.00	7	12.50
		whether				
11/11/2013	Barvir		0.10	\$ 225.00	Ś	22.50
11/11/2013		Draft Notice of Resolution in F064510 Case, forward to AMB to start working on it.	0.10	\$ 125.00	\$	62.50
11/11/2013		Meeting with AMB to discuss case deadlines and rules.	0.30	\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
11, 11, 2013	.101102	eegterr with to disease east dedutified und rules.	0.20	7 123.00	7	23.00

Draft correspondence to opposing coursed re-new functions for fee appeal and proposed stipulation seeling further starts of fee appeal and stay of metant for appellate attorney's fees; conduct further research re-issues of remittiur and appellate fee procedure for use in drafting correspondence. Meeting with CMM re-incomplete fees and review fees and review fees fees in CA state courts, and continue drafting correspondence to opposing coursed re-turner stay in fee appeal and tribulence for filing motion for appellate fees. Becenit, review and analyze memorandum of research findings re-timeline for seeking appellate attorney's fees and review by appellate court, drift attorney's notes re-same, draft appellate attorney's fees and review by appellate court, drift attorney's notes re-same, draft appellate attorney's fees and review by appellate court, drift attorney's notes re-same, draft appellate attorney's fees and review by appellate court, drift attorney's notes re-same, draft appellate attorney's fees and review by appellate court, drift attorney's notes re-same, draft appellate attorney's fees and review by appellate court, drift attorney's notes re-same, draft appellate attorney's fees and review by appellate attorney's fees and feed and review and appellate attorney fees and review of appellate appellate attorney fees and feed and review and appellate attorney's fees and history of decision to seek fees and review of appellate appellate attorney fees and history of decision to seek fees and review and appellate attorney's fees and history of decision to seek fees and review and review of appellate appellate attorney fees and history of decision to seek fees and review attorney attorne	Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate		Amount
14/12/2013 Barvir Meeting with CBM re Conducting control resist attempts represented re Meeting with CBM re Conducting research re procedure for appellate fee motion. 0.30 \$225.00 \$180.00 Meeting with CBM re Conducting research re procedure for appellate removed removaling on the CBM research reference of Permitture and finality Meeting with CBM re Conducting research re procedure for appellate removed removaling research removed removaling research removed removal removal removal removaling research removal remova		,	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·				
1/11/2/2013 Barvir							
Meeting with CBM re		_					
Conduct follow-up legal research re issue of remittitur in CA state courts of appeal, appellate fees in CA state courts, and continue drafting correspondence to opposing coursel re further stay in fee appeal and trimine for filling motion for appellate fees. Co. 80 5.225.00 5.188.00	11/12/2013	Barvir	·	1.00	\$ 225.00	Ş	225.00
Conduct follow-up legal research reisuse of remittirur in CA state courts of appeal, appealiate fees in CA state courts, and continue drafting correspondence to opposing coursel re further stay in fee appeal and timeline for fling motion for appealiate fees. Receipt, review and analyze memorandum of research findings re timeline for seeding appellate attorney's fees and review by appellate court, draft attorney's notes re same, draft emili memorandum to CBM re same and providing advice 'route to CA for calendaring. 11/12/2013 Barvir Metility Wilk RGR re conducting research re procedure for appellate the motion. 11/13/2013 Barvir Metility Wilk RGR re conducting research re procedure for appellate fee motion. 11/13/2013 Barvir Metility Wilk RGR re conducting research re procedure for appellate fee motion. 11/13/2013 Barvir Process of the process of the conduction of merits appeal, and whether to file seleptable to in further stay of fee appeal. 11/13/2013 Municol Transport of the process of the conduction of merits appeal, and whether to file seleptable to in further stay of fee appeal. 11/13/2013 Municol Transport of the process of the minimum purpose of the process	11/12/2013	Barvir	Meeting with CBM re	0.20	\$ 225.00	¢	45.00
11/12/2013 Barvir	11/12/2013	Daivii	Conduct follow-up legal research re issue of remittitur in CA state courts of appeal, appellate	0.20	Ş 223.00	٧	43.00
Receipt review and analyze memorandum of research findings re timeline for seeking appellate attorneys' fees and review by appellate court drift attorney's notes re same; droft attorneys's notes re same; droft attorneys notes re same; and attorney notes re same; and whether to file stipulation to further stay of fee appeal. 1/13/2013 Nunez							
### appellate automory's fees and review by appellate court, draft attorney's notes re same, draft ### appellate from mornadium to EMB re same and providing advice route to Cafor calendaring. ### 0.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 180.00 ### 11/13/2013 Barvir Meeting with R6Kr e conducting research re procedure for appellate fee motion. Send/frece we email to/from opposing coursel; for its support to the feet page. Telephone calls to and from opposing coursel; for its support. Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: confirmation of issuance of Remittitur and finality of case for Appeal Case No.: F064510. Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: confirmation of issuance of Remittitur and finality of case for Appeal Case No.: F064510. Further analysis and review of appeallate continuation in further stay of fee appeal. Telephone calls to an afform court clerk re: confirmation of issuance of Remittitur and finality of case for Appeal Case No.: F064510. Further analysis and review of appeallate coming infirming judgment in full; research, analyze and review authority cited in opinion that wasn't cited in briefing, draft attorney notes re same, and review authority cited in opinion that wasn't cited in briefing, draft attorney notes re same, and review authority cited in opinion that wasn't cited in briefing, draft attorney notes re same, and review authority cited in opinion that wasn't cited in briefing, draft attorney notes re same, and review authority cited in opinion that wasn't cited in briefing, draft attorney notes re same, and review authority cited in opinion that wasn't cited in briefing, draft attorney notes re same, and review and review recent void for vagueness decision conflicting in part with affirmation of part and review and review recent void for vagueness decision conflicting in part with affirmation of part and review and review and review and review and review and review and review. Analyze and review and review and review and review. Analyze and review and review. Analyze a	11/12/2013	Barvir	stay in fee appeal and timeline for filing motion for appellate fees.	0.80	\$ 225.00	\$	180.00
### appellate automory's fees and review by appellate court, draft attorney's notes re same, draft ### appellate from mornadium to EMB re same and providing advice route to Cafor calendaring. ### 0.80 \$ 225.00 \$ 180.00 ### 11/13/2013 Barvir Meeting with R6Kr e conducting research re procedure for appellate fee motion. Send/frece we email to/from opposing coursel; for its support to the feet page. Telephone calls to and from opposing coursel; for its support to the feet page. Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: confirmation of issuance of Remittitur and finality of case for Appeal Case No.: F064510. Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: confirmation of issuance of Remittitur and finality of case for Appeal Case No.: F064510. Further analysis and review of appeallate coming infirming judgment in full; research, analyze and review authority cited in opinion that wasn't cited in briefing, draft attorney notes re and review authority cited in opinion that wasn't cited in briefing, draft attorney notes re and review authority cited in opinion that wasn't cited in briefing, draft attorney notes re and review authority cited in opinion that wasn't cited in briefing, draft attorney notes re and review authority cited in opinion that wasn't cited in briefing, draft attorney notes re and review authority cited in opinion that wasn't cited in briefing, draft attorney notes re and review authority cited in opinion that wasn't cited in briefing, draft attorney notes re and review authority cited in opinion that wasn't cited in briefing, draft attorney notes re and review authority cited in opinion that wasn't cited in briefing, draft attorney notes re and review attorney as and review attorney sees and review attorney sees and history of decision to seek fees prior to appeal.							
11/13/2013 Barvir							
1/11/2/2013 Barvir Meeting with BGK re conducting research re procedure for appellate fee motion. 0.20 \$225.00 \$ 45.00 \$ 525.00 \$	11/12/2012	Domin		0.00	¢ 225.00	ċ	100.00
					-		
11/13/2013 Barvir	11/12/2013	Daivii		0.20	ÿ 223.00	Υ	43.00
11/13/2013 Nunez	11/13/2013	Barvir		0.10	\$ 225.00	\$	22.50
Further analysis and review of appellate opinion affirming judgment in full; research, analyze and review authority cited in opinion that wasn't cited in briefing; draft attorney notes re same. 2.40 \$325.00 \$780.00			Telephone calls to and from court clerk re: confirmation of issuance of Remittitur and finality				
and review authority cited in opinion that wasn't cited in briefing; draft attorney notes re same. 2.40 \$ 325.00 \$ 780.00 Conduct research re motion for trial court attorney's fees and history of decision to seek fees prior to appeal. Exchange emails with CBM re Exchange emails with CBM re Exchange emails with CBM re Analyze and review recent void for vagueness decision conflicting in part with affirmation of judgment in Parker; draft e-mail to CDM and AMB re Analyze and review recent void for vagueness decision conflicting in part with affirmation of judgment in Parker; draft e-mail to CDM and AMB re Analyze and review recent void for vagueness decision conflicting in part with affirmation of judgment in Parker; draft e-mail to CDM and AMB re Analyze and review with AMB and CBM re litigation strategy re opposition to potential petition for review. Multiple meetings with AMB and CBM re litigation strategy re opposition to potential petition for review. Multiple meetings with AMB and CDM re litigation strategy re opposition to potential petition for review. Multiple meetings with AMB and CDM re litigation strategy re opposition to potential petition for review. Send/receive email to/from CA, CBM, SAB, CDM re receipt of state's petition for review; send/receive multiple emails to from CBM and SAB re upcoming deadlines and potential amic letters re review, meeting with SAB and CBM re same. 12/16/2013 Barvir 12/16/2013 Barvir Torit, review, revise Request for Extension to File Answer to Petition for Review; draft AMB declaration in support; meeting with CBM re same and discuss requesting non-opposition from opposing counsel draft letter to attorneys' service authorizing signature on AMB declaration before filing. Multiple meetings with AMB re impressions of State's Petition for Review; and review and review after AMB re impressions of State's Petition for Review. Amalyze and review and the mail to File Answer to Petition for Review. Amalyze and review and review and the mail to File Answer to Petitio	11/13/2013	Nunez		0.20	\$ 125.00	\$	25.00
11/15/2013 Monfort Same. Same. Conduct research re motion for trial court attorney's fees and history of decision to seek fees Conduct research re motion for trial court attorney's fees and history of decision to seek fees Part of the property of the prope							
Conduct research re motion for trial court attorney's fees and history of decision to seek fees prior to appeal. 12/5/2013 Michel Analyze and review recent void for vagueness decision conflicting in part with affirmation of judgment in Parker; draft e-mail to CDM and AMB re in Judgment in Parker; draft e-mail to CD	11/16/2012	Manfant		2.40	ć 225.00	Ļ	700.00
11/21/2013 Barvir	11/16/2013	Montort		2.40	\$ 325.00	\$	780.00
Exchange emails with CBM re 12/5/2013 Michel	11/21/2013	Barvir	,	0.20	\$ 225.00	Ś	45.00
Analyze and review recent void for vagueness decision conflicting in part with affirmation of judgment in Parker; draft e-mail to CDM and AMB reconstruction of judgment in Parker; draft e-mail to CDM and AMB reconstruction of judgment in Parker; draft e-mail to CDM and AMB reconstruction of judgment in Parker; draft e-mail to CDM and AMB reconstruction of judgment in Parker; draft e-mail to CDM and AMB reconstruction of judgment in Parker; draft e-mail to CDM and AMB reconstruction of judgment in Parker; draft e-mail to CDM and AMB reconstruction of judgment in Parker; draft e-mail to CDM and AMB reconstruction of judgment in Parker; draft e-mail to CDM and AMB reconstruction of provision of potential petition of provision. Multiple meetings with AMB and CBM re litigation strategy re opposition to potential petition of provision. Multiple meetings with AMB and CDM recipit of state's petition for review; send/receive multiple emails to from CBM and ASB re upcoming deadlines and potential amici letters re review; meeting with SAB and CBM re same. 12/16/2013 Monfort	11/21/2010	24.11.		0.20	Ψ 223.00	Υ	.5.00
Multiple meetings with CDM and AMB re 0.60 \$ 325.00 \$ 195.00	12/5/2013	Michel		0.10	\$ 450.00	\$	45.00
Multiple meetings with CDM and CBM re litigation strategy re opposition to potential petition for review. Multiple meetings with AMB and CBM re litigation strategy re opposition to potential petition for review. Multiple meetings with AMB and CBM re litigation strategy re opposition to potential petition for review. Multiple meetings with AMB and CDM re litigation strategy re opposition to potential petition for review. Send/receive email to/from CA, CBM, SAB, CDM re receipt of state's petition for review; send/receive email to/from CA, CBM, SAB, CDM re receipt of state's petition for review; send/receive email to/from CA, CBM, SAB, CDM re receipt of state's petition for review; send/receive email to/from CA, CBM, SAB, CDM re receipt of state's petition for review; send/receive email to/from CBM and SAB re upcoming deadlines and potential amic: letters re review; meeting with SAB and CBM re same. Analyze and review Parker Petition for Review; discuss with AMB and CDM review; declaration in support; meeting with CBM re same and discuss requesting non-opposition from opposing counse); draft letter to attorneys' service authorizing signature on AMB declaration before filing. Multiple meetings with AMB re discuss in AMB and Ross Moody re: request for extension of time to file Answer to Petition for Review. Meeting with AMB re impressions of State's Petition for Review; discuss potential arguments to include in response. Meeting with AMB re impressions of State's Petition for Review; discuss potential arguments to include in response. Meeting with AMB re impressions of State's Petition for Review; discuss potential arguments to include in response. Meeting with AMB re impressions of State's Petition for Review; discuss potential arguments to include in response. Meeting with AMB re impressions of State's Petition for Review; discuss potential arguments to include in response. Meeting with AMB re impressions of State's Petition for Review; discuss potential arguments to include in response. Meeting with			Analyze and review recent void for vagueness decision conflicting in part with affirmation of				
12/6/2013 Barvir For review. O.40 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.00	12/5/2013	Monfort		0.60	\$ 325.00	\$	195.00
Multiple meetings with AMB and CBM re litigation strategy re opposition to potential petition for review. Multiple meetings with AMB and CDM re litigation strategy re opposition to potential petition for review. Send/receive multiple emails to from CBM, SAB, CDM re receipt of state's petition for review; send/receive multiple emails to from CBM and SAB re upcoming deadlines and potential amici letters re review; meeting with SAB and CBM re same. 12/16/2013 Barvir letters re review; meeting with SAB and CBM re same. Analyze and review Parker Petition for Review; discuss with AMB and CDM Tart, review, revise Request for Extension to File Answer to Petition for Review; draft AMB declaration in support; meeting with CBM re same and discuss requesting non-opposition from opposing counsel; draft letter to attorneys' service authorizing signature on AMB declaration for filing. Multiple meetings with AMB re discuss 12/23/2013 Monfort Multiple meetings with AMB re discuss (discuss) Analyze and review filing. Multiple meetings with AMB re discuss (discuss) (discuss) Send/receive email to/from CBM, AMB and Ross Moody re: request for extension of time to file Answer to Petition for Review. (discuss) Send/receive email to/from CBM, AMB and Ross Moody re: request for extension of time to file Answer to Petition for Review; discuss potential arguments to include in response. (D.40 \$ 125.00 \$ 50.00 Meeting with AMB re impressions of State's Petition for Review; discuss potential arguments to include in response. Draft and send email to HV and LB re research case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. Analyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in fee request. Analyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in fee request. Analyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in fee request. Analyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in	12/5/2012	D i .		0.40	ć 225.00	<u>,</u>	00.00
12/6/2013 Michel for review. 0.40 \$ 450.00 \$ 180.00	12/6/2013	Barvir		0.40	\$ 225.00	\$	90.00
Multiple meetings with AMB and CDM re litigation strategy re opposition to potential petition for review. Send/receive email to/from CA, CBM, SAB, CDM re receipt of state's petition for review; send/receive multiple emails to from CBM and SAB re upcoming deadlines and potential amici letters re review; meeting with SAB and CBM re same. Analyze and review Parker Petition for Review; discuss with AMB and CDM e-mails received in the property of the property o	12/6/2013	Michel		0.40	\$ 450.00	\$	180.00
Send/receive multiple emails to from CA, CBM, SAB, CDM re receipt of state's petition for review; send/receive multiple emails to from CBM and SAB re upcoming deadlines and potential amicilletters re review; meeting with SAB and CBM re same. 0.50 \$ \$ 225.00 \$ 112.50	12/0/2013	WHEHE		0.10	ŷ 130.00	Υ	100.00
send/receive multiple emails to from CBM and SAB re upcoming deadlines and potential amici letters re review; meeting with SAB and CBM re same. Analyze and review Parker Petition for Review; discuss with AMB and CDM analyze and review Parker Petition for Review; discuss with AMB and CDM re-mails rg le-mails rg le-ma	12/6/2013	Monfort		0.40	\$ 325.00	\$	130.00
letters re review; meeting with SAB and CBM re same. 0.50 \$ 225.00 \$ 112.50			Send/receive email to/from CA, CBM, SAB, CDM re receipt of state's petition for review;				
Analyze and review Parker Petition for Review; discuss with AMB and CDM 2-mails re 1.90 \$ 325.00 \$ 617.50							
12/19/2013 Monfort Draft, review, revise Request for Extension to File Answer to Petition for Review; draft AMB declaration before filing. Multiple meetings with AMB re discuss 12/23/2013 Monfort Multiple meetings with AMB re discuss 12/23/2013 Nunez Create first draft of Request for Extension of Time to File Answer to Petition for Review. 12/23/2013 Nunez Create first draft of Request for Extension of Time to File Answer to Petition for Review. 12/23/2013 Brady Create first draft of Request for Extension of Time to File Answer to Petition for Review. 12/23/2013 Brady Draft, review, revise Request for Extension of Time to File Answer to Petition for Review. 12/23/2013 Nunez Create first draft of Request for Extension of Time to File Answer to Petition for Review. 12/30/2013 Brady Draft and send email to HV and LB re Presearch case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. 1/10/2017 Barvir Analyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in fee request. 1/13/2017 Barvir Analyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in fee request. Review and revise Stipulation for Extension to File Appeal approve final draft for filing and signature. No.40 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.00 Preparation of appellate fee motion and all associated documents; review billing exhibit, Create first draft of attorneys fees preparation of fee motion, discuss potential Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion, discuss potential Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion, discuss potential	12/16/2013	Barvir		0.50	\$ 225.00	\$	112.50
Draft, review, revise Request for Extension to File Answer to Petition for Review; draft AMB declaration in support; meeting with CBM re same and discuss requesting non-opposition from opposing counsel; draft letter to attorneys' service authorizing signature on AMB declaration before filing. 2.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 472.50 Multiple meetings with AMB re discuss [2/23/2013 Monfort	12/10/2012	Monfort		1 00	\$ 225.00	ċ	617 50
declaration in support; meeting with CBM re same and discuss requesting non-opposition from opposing counsel; draft letter to attorneys' service authorizing signature on AMB declaration before filling. 2.10 \$ 225.00 \$ 472.50 Multiple meetings with AMB re discuss ind draft correspondence to JAS (iscuss) 12/23/2013 Monfort Send/receive email to/from CBM, AMB and Ross Moody re: request for extension of time to file Answer to Petition for Review. 12/23/2013 Nunez Create first draft of Request for Extension of Time to File Answer to Petition for Review. 12/23/2013 Nunez Create first draft of Request for Extension of Time to File Answer to Petition for Review. Meeting with AMB re impressions of State's Petition for Review; discuss potential arguments to include in response. Meeting with MEL re upcoming deadlines and work to be completed re request for republication, motion for attorneys' fees, and memorandum of costs. Draft and send email to HV and LB re Tesearch case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. 1/10/2017 Barvir Analyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in fee request. Analyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in fee request. Analyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in fee request. Review and revise Stipulation for Extension to File Appellate Fee Motion; exchange emails with CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filing and signature. Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential	12/13/2013	WOMOTO		1.50	ŷ 323.00	٠,	017.30
declaration before filing. 2.10			•				
Multiple meetings with AMB re discuss 12/23/2013 Monfort Ind draft correspondence to JAS Send/receive email to/from CBM, AMB and Ross Moody re: request for extension of time to file Answer to Petition for Review. 12/23/2013 Nunez Create first draft of Request for Extension of Time to File Answer to Petition for Review. 12/23/2013 Nunez Create first draft of Request for Extension of Time to File Answer to Petition for Review. 12/23/2013 Brady Create first draft of Request for Extension of Time to File Answer to Petition for Review. Meeting with AMB re impressions of State's Petition for Review; discuss potential arguments to include in response. 12/23/2013 Brady Meeting with MEL re upcoming deadlines and work to be completed re request for republication, motion for attorneys' fees, and memorandum of costs. Draft and send email to HV and LB re Tesearch case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. 1/10/2017 Barvir Analyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in fee request. Analyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in fee request. Preparation of appellate fee motion and all associated documents; review billing exhibit, create first draft of attorneys fees breakdown spreadsheet exhibit. Review and revise Stipulation for Extension to File Appellate Fee Motion; exchange emails with CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filing and signature. Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential			from opposing counsel; draft letter to attorneys' service authorizing signature on AMB				
discuss 325.00 \$ 260.00 Send/receive email to/from CBM, AMB and Ross Moody re: request for extension of time to file Answer to Petition for Review. 0.40 \$ 125.00 \$ 50.00 12/23/2013 Nunez Create first draft of Request for Extension of Time to File Answer to Petition for Review. 0.40 \$ 125.00 \$ 50.00 Meeting with AMB re impressions of State's Petition for Review; discuss potential arguments to include in response. 0.10 \$ 250.00 \$ 25.00 Meeting with MEL re upcoming deadlines and work to be completed re request for republication, motion for attorneys' fees, and memorandum of costs. 0.40 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.00 Draft and send email to HV and LB re research case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. 0.40 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.00 1/12/2017 Barvir Analyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in fee request. 3.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 720.00 Preparation of appellate fee motion and all associated documents; review billing exhibit, create first draft of attorneys fees breakdown spreadsheet exhibit. 6.30 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,417.50 Review and revise Stipulation for Extension to File Appellate Fee Motion; exchange emails with CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filing and signature. 0.60 \$ 225.00 \$ 135.00 Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential	12/23/2013	Barvir		2.10	\$ 225.00	\$	472.50
12/23/2013 Monfort M							
Send/receive email to/from CBM, AMB and Ross Moody re: request for extension of time to file Answer to Petition for Review. 12/23/2013 Nunez Create first draft of Request for Extension of Time to File Answer to Petition for Review. Meeting with AMB re impressions of State's Petition for Review; discuss potential arguments to include in response. Neeting with MEL re upcoming deadlines and work to be completed re request for republication, motion for attorneys' fees, and memorandum of costs. Draft and send email to HV and LB re research case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. Analyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in fee request. Preparation of appellate fee motion and all associated documents; review billing exhibit, create first draft of attorneys fees breakdown spreadsheet exhibit. Review and revise Stipulation for Extension to File Appellate Fee Motion; exchange emails with CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filing and signature. Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential	12/22/2012	Manfant		0.00	ć 225.00	Ļ	200.00
file Answer to Petition for Review. Create first draft of Request for Extension of Time to File Answer to Petition for Review. Create first draft of Request for Extension of Time to File Answer to Petition for Review. Meeting with AMB re impressions of State's Petition for Review; discuss potential arguments to include in response. Meeting with MEL re upcoming deadlines and work to be completed re request for republication, motion for attorneys' fees, and memorandum of costs. Draft and send email to HV and LB re research case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. 1/10/2017 Barvir Analyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in fee request. Preparation of appellate fee motion and all associated documents; review billing exhibit, create first draft of attorneys fees breakdown spreadsheet exhibit. Review and revise Stipulation for Extension to File Appellate Fee Motion; exchange emails with CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filing and signature. Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential	12/23/2013	Montort		0.80	\$ 325.00	\$	260.00
12/23/2013 Nunez Create first draft of Request for Extension of Time to File Answer to Petition for Review. Meeting with AMB re impressions of State's Petition for Review; discuss potential arguments to include in response. Meeting with MEL re upcoming deadlines and work to be completed re request for republication, motion for attorneys' fees, and memorandum of costs. Draft and send email to HV and LB re research case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. O.40 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.00 Preparation of appellate fee motion and all associated documents; review billing exhibit, create first draft of attorneys fees breakdown spreadsheet exhibit. Review and revise Stipulation for Extension to File Appellate Fee Motion; exchange emails with CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filing and signature. Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential	12/23/2013	Nunez		0.40	\$ 125.00	Ś	50.00
Meeting with AMB re impressions of State's Petition for Review; discuss potential arguments to include in response. Meeting with MEL re upcoming deadlines and work to be completed re request for republication, motion for attorneys' fees, and memorandum of costs. Draft and send email to HV and LB re research case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. Draft and send email to HV and LB re research case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. Draft and send email to HV and LB re research case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. Draft and send email to HV and LB re research case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. Draft and send email to HV and LB re research case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. Draft and send email to HV and LB re research case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. Draft and send email to HV and LB re research case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. Draft and send email to HV and LB re republication, motion for extension in fee request. 3.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 720.00 Preparation of appellate fee motion and all associated documents; review billing exhibit, create first draft of attorneys fees breakdown spreadsheet exhibit. Review and revise Stipulation for Extension to File Appellate Fee Motion; exchange emails with CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filling and signature. Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential	, -, -						
to include in response. Meeting with MEL re upcoming deadlines and work to be completed re request for republication, motion for attorneys' fees, and memorandum of costs. Draft and send email to HV and LB re research case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. O.40 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.00 Preparation of appellate fee motion and all associated documents; review billing exhibit, create first draft of attorneys fees breakdown spreadsheet exhibit. Review and revise Stipulation for Extension to File Appellate Fee Motion; exchange emails with CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filing and signature. Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential	12/23/2013	Nunez	Create first draft of Request for Extension of Time to File Answer to Petition for Review.	0.40	\$ 125.00	\$	50.00
Meeting with MEL re upcoming deadlines and work to be completed re request for republication, motion for attorneys' fees, and memorandum of costs. Draft and send email to HV and LB re research case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. 0.40 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.00 research case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. 0.40 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.00 1/12/2017 Barvir Analyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in fee request. Preparation of appellate fee motion and all associated documents; review billing exhibit, create first draft of attorneys fees breakdown spreadsheet exhibit. Review and revise Stipulation for Extension to File Appellate Fee Motion; exchange emails with CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filing and signature. Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential			, ,				
republication, motion for attorneys' fees, and memorandum of costs. Draft and send email to HV and LB re research case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. 1/10/2017 Barvir Analyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in fee request. Preparation of appellate fee motion and all associated documents; review billing exhibit, create first draft of attorneys fees breakdown spreadsheet exhibit. Review and revise Stipulation for Extension to File Appellate Fee Motion; exchange emails with CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filing and signature. Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential	12/30/2013	Brady		0.10	\$ 250.00	\$	25.00
Draft and send email to HV and LB re research case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. 0.40 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.00 Analyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in fee request. Preparation of appellate fee motion and all associated documents; review billing exhibit, create first draft of attorneys fees breakdown spreadsheet exhibit. Review and revise Stipulation for Extension to File Appellate Fee Motion; exchange emails with CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filing and signature. Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential	1/0/2017	Domin		0.40	¢ 225.00	ċ	00.00
research case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and identify billing professionals. 1/10/2017 Barvir Analyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in fee request. Preparation of appellate fee motion and all associated documents; review billing exhibit, 1/13/2017 Barvir create first draft of attorneys fees breakdown spreadsheet exhibit. Review and revise Stipulation for Extension to File Appellate Fee Motion; exchange emails with CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filing and signature. Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential	1/9/2017	Barvir		0.40	\$ 225.00	>	90.00
1/10/2017Barviridentify billing professionals.0.40 \$ 225.00 \$ 90.001/12/2017BarvirAnalyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in fee request.3.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 720.00Preparation of appellate fee motion and all associated documents; review billing exhibit, create first draft of attorneys fees breakdown spreadsheet exhibit.6.30 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,417.50Review and revise Stipulation for Extension to File Appellate Fee Motion; exchange emails1/19/2017Barvirwith CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filing and signature.0.60 \$ 225.00 \$ 135.00Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential			State and Seria Citian to TV and ESTE				
1/12/2017 Barvir Analyze merits appeal billing; review TB, AMB, and CBM bills for inclusion in fee request. 3.20 \$ 225.00 \$ 720.00 Preparation of appellate fee motion and all associated documents; review billing exhibit, 1/13/2017 Barvir create first draft of attorneys fees breakdown spreadsheet exhibit. 6.30 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,417.50 Review and revise Stipulation for Extension to File Appellate Fee Motion; exchange emails 1/19/2017 Barvir with CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filing and signature. 0.60 \$ 225.00 \$ 135.00 Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential			research case history and timeline to determine date parameters of report and				
Preparation of appellate fee motion and all associated documents; review billing exhibit, 1/13/2017 Barvir create first draft of attorneys fees breakdown spreadsheet exhibit. 6.30 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,417.50 Review and revise Stipulation for Extension to File Appellate Fee Motion; exchange emails 1/19/2017 Barvir with CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filing and signature. 0.60 \$ 225.00 \$ 135.00 Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential	1/10/2017	Barvir		0.40	\$ 225.00	\$	90.00
Preparation of appellate fee motion and all associated documents; review billing exhibit, 1/13/2017 Barvir create first draft of attorneys fees breakdown spreadsheet exhibit. 6.30 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,417.50 Review and revise Stipulation for Extension to File Appellate Fee Motion; exchange emails 1/19/2017 Barvir with CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filing and signature. 0.60 \$ 225.00 \$ 135.00 Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential							
1/13/2017 Barvir create first draft of attorneys fees breakdown spreadsheet exhibit. 6.30 \$ 225.00 \$ 1,417.50 Review and revise Stipulation for Extension to File Appellate Fee Motion; exchange emails 1/19/2017 Barvir with CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filing and signature. 0.60 \$ 225.00 \$ 135.00 Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential	1/12/2017	Barvir		3.20	\$ 225.00	\$	720.00
Review and revise Stipulation for Extension to File Appellate Fee Motion; exchange emails 1/19/2017 Barvir with CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filing and signature. 0.60 \$ 225.00 \$ 135.00 Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential	4 /42 /2047			6.20	A 225 00		4 447 50
1/19/2017 Barvir with CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filing and signature. 0.60 \$ 225.00 \$ 135.00 Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential	1/13/2017	Rarvir	create first draft of attorneys fees breakdown spreadsheet exhibit.	6.30	\$ 225.00	Ş	1,417.50
1/19/2017 Barvir with CBM, MEL, LP, and opposing counsel re same; approve final draft for filing and signature. 0.60 \$ 225.00 \$ 135.00 Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential			Review and revise Stinulation for Extension to File Appellate Fee Motion: exchange emails				
Multiple meetings with team members re preparation of fee motion; discuss potential	1/19/2017	Barvir	•	0.60	\$ 225.00	\$	135.00
	,,,			2.00	,	r	100.00
	1/19/2017	Monfort		1.50	\$ 325.00	\$	487.50

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate	ļ	Amount
		Case Management; review case file, update calendar deadlines, prioritize upcoming tasks for				
1/23/2017	Barvir	appellate fee motion appeal; assign various drafting and research tasks to MEL and law clerks.	0.30	\$ 225.00	¢	67.50
1/23/2017	Daivii	Exchange emails with LP re preparation of Memorandum of Costs on Appeal; advise on	0.30	ÿ 223.00	7	07.50
1/23/2017	Barvir	completion of document.	0.20	\$ 225.00	\$	45.00
, ,		Conduct legal research re entitlement to ATtorney General's fees on appeal for use in				
1/23/2017	Barvir	preparing Motion for Attorneys's Fees on Appeal.	4.90	\$ 225.00	\$	1,102.50
1/23/2017	Monfort	Meetings with AMB re fee motion and bill of costs.	0.20	\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
		Begin drafting Motion for Attorneys' Fees on Appeal; conduct further legal research as				
1/24/2017	Barvir	needed.	6.60	\$ 225.00	\$	1,485.00
		Continue drafting Motion for Attorneys' Fees on Appeal; prepare sections on entitlement to				
1/25/2017	Barvir	fees; conduct research as necessary.	4.20	\$ 225.00	\$	945.00
1/25/2017	Monfort	Meet with AMB re fee appeal. Continue drafting Metion for Attornoys' Foos on Appeal, propage sections on ontitlement to	0.20	\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
1/26/2017	Barvir	Continue drafting Motion for Attorneys' Fees on Appeal; prepare sections on entitlement to	5 10	\$ 225.00	ċ	1 1/7 50
1/26/2017	Barvir	fees; conduct research as necessary. Analyze billing records for all attorneys and staff; determine which hours to include/exclude in	5.10	\$ 225.00	Ş	1,147.50
1/30/2017	Barvir	motion for appellate fees.	2 30	\$ 225.00	Ś	517.50
1/30/2017	Daivii	Meeting with MEL re checklist of tasks for filing fee motion declarations, research, and other	2.50	ÿ 223.00	Υ	317.50
1/30/2017	Barvir	documents; and drafting motion to substitute attorney general.	0.50	\$ 225.00	Ś	112.50
, , -	-	Continue analyzing billing records for all attorneys and staff; determine which hours to		,		
1/31/2017	Barvir	include/exclude in motion for appellate fees.	2.80	\$ 225.00	\$	630.00
		· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·		<u> </u>		
1/31/2017	Barvir	Continue drafting Motion for Attorneys's Fees on Appeal; conduct legal research as needed.	1.60	\$ 225.00	\$	360.00
2/1/2017	Barvir	Continue drafting Motion for Attorneys's Fees on Appeal; conduct legal research as needed.	2.90	\$ 225.00	\$	652.50
		Continue analyzing billing records for all attorneys and staff; determine which hours to				
2/1/2017	Barvir	include/exclude in motion for appellate fees.	1.60	\$ 225.00	\$	360.00
		Continue drafting Motion for Attorneys' Fees and accompanying documents; conduct legal				
2/2/2017	Barvir	research as needed.	3.20	\$ 225.00	\$	720.00
		Exchange emails with LP and CBM re deadline for state to file Motion to Tax Costs re plaintiffs'				
2/2/2017	Domin	Memorandum of Costs; review rules re same and direct LP whether to calendar appropriate	0.10	ć 22F 00	ċ	22.50
2/2/2017 2/7/2017	Barvir Barvir	deadlines. Meet with CBM, GWW, JAS, MDC, and MEL to discuss issues re fee recovery.	0.10	\$ 225.00 \$ 225.00	\$	22.50 22.50
2/7/2017	Monfort	Meet with AMB, GWW, JAS, MDC, and MEL to discuss issues refee recovery.	0.10	\$ 325.00	\$	32.50
2/9/2017	Barvir	Discuss declaration issues with CBM in support of fee motion.	0.20	\$ 225.00	\$	45.00
2/3/202/	50.7.	Meeting with JRD, CBM, and SAB; discuss	0.20	Ψ ======	Ψ	10.00
2/9/2017	Barvir		0.30	\$ 225.00	\$	67.50
2/9/2017	Monfort	Discuss declaration issues with AMB in support of fee motion.		\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
2/9/2017	Monfort	Meetings with AMB, SAB, and JRD re motion for recovery of appellate fees.	0.30	\$ 325.00	\$	97.50
		Draft Motion for Attorneys' Fees on Appeal and Points & Authorities in Support; conduct				
2/20/2017	Barvir	research as needed.	3.70	\$ 225.00	\$	832.50
		Send/receive email to/from LP and SAB re drafting correspondence to all plaintiffs re status of				
2/20/2017	Barvir	case and need to sign a declaration in support of fee motion.	0.20	\$ 225.00	\$	45.00
2/21/2017	Barvir	Review and revise Motion for Attorneys' Fees on Appeal; conduct legal research re same.	5.70	\$ 225.00	\$	1,282.50
2/24/2017	Domin	Exchange emails with LP, SAB, and CBM re communication to plaintiffs re status of case and	0.20	ć 22F 00	<u>,</u>	45.00
2/21/2017	Barvir	preparation of fee motion declarations.	0.20	\$ 225.00	Ş	45.00
2/21/2017	Barvir	Meet with CBM, SAB, JAS, GWW, MEL, BAM, and MDC to discuss issues re fee recovery.	0.10	\$ 225.00	ċ	22.50
2/21/2017	Daivii	Review and revise correspondence to plaintiffs re	0.10	\$ 223.00	۲	22.30
2/21/2017	Barvir	; route to LP for distribution to plaintiffs.	0.40	\$ 225.00	\$	90.00
2,21,201,	Barvii	Review declarations filed in support of trial court fee motion for use in motion for appellate	0.10	ψ LL 3.00	<u> </u>	30.00
2/21/2017	Monfort	fees; draft attorney notes re same.	0.60	\$ 325.00	\$	195.00
2/21/2017	Monfort	Multiple correspondence re fee motion; meet with AMB re same.	0.40	\$ 325.00	\$	130.00
2/21/2017	Monfort	Meet with SAB, JAS, AMB, GWW, MEL, BAM, and MDC to discuss issues re fee recovery.	0.10	\$ 325.00	\$	32.50
2/22/2017	Barvir	Meeting with RBV re appellate fee motion; assign various research tasks to RBV.	0.40	\$ 225.00	\$	90.00
		Continue second round of analysis of staff billing records; review to ensure proper reference				
2/22/2017	Barvir	number was assigned to each Timeslip.	1.60	\$ 225.00	\$	360.00
2/22/2017	Barvir	Meeting with MEL discussing declarations for retailers in support of fee motion.	0.20	\$ 225.00	\$	45.00
		Conduct legal research re fee motion standards and evidence in support of motion; pull Parker				
		trial fee denial, review reasons for denial (sufficiency of evidence of pecuniary interest),				
2/22/2017	Damin	review declarations of plaintiffs and determine what evidence needs to be included in	3.50	ć 225.00	<u>,</u>	FC3 FC
2/22/2017	Barvir	appellate fee motion to prevent denial of motion; prepare to discuss with CBM.	2.50	\$ 225.00	\	562.50

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate		Amount
	·····cicope	Continue and complete analysis of staff billing records; review for completeness and to				
2/22/2017	Barvir	provide reference numbers for each Timeslip in order to create	2.90	\$ 225.00	Ś	652.50
	20.1.	Review correspondence from plaintiffs and draft correspondence to AMB re motion for	2.50	Ψ 223.00	Υ	002.00
2/22/2017	Monfort	appellate fees.	0.10	\$ 325.00	\$	32.50
		Continue drafting Motion for Attorneys' Fees on Appeal and Points & Authorities in Support;	0.10	φ σ2σ.σσ	Υ	52.50
2/23/2017	Barvir	conduct research as needed.	3 40	\$ 225.00	\$	765.00
2/23/2017	Burtii	Begin drafting declarations of CDM, CBM, SAB, AMB, CN, and HV in support of motion for	3.10	ÿ 223.00	<u> </u>	703.00
2/23/2017	Barvir	appellate fees; review time records as necessary.	3 40	\$ 225.00	\$	765.00
2,20,2027	20.11.	appendite recoj retrett time recordo do necessarj.	51.10	Ψ 220.00	Υ	7 00.00
		Conduct research re Parker fee motion files to pull all declarations filed in support of trial fee				
2/23/2017	Barvir	motion and route to CBM for review and use in preparing plaintiff declarations.	0.30	\$ 225.00	Ś	67.50
2,20,2027	20.11.	Prepare for and participate in meeting with CBM re preparation of declarations in support of	0.00	Ψ 220.00	Υ	07.00
		Motion for Attorneys' Fees on Appeal; discuss evidence supporting "no pecuniary interest"				
2/23/2017	Barvir	factor; meeting with CBM and JRD to strategize re same.	0.70	\$ 225.00	\$	157.50
2/23/2017	Burtii	Multiple meetings with AMB and JRD re	0.70	ÿ 223.00	<u> </u>	137.30
		analyze and review all materials forwarded by AMB and draft attorney notes re same in				
2/23/2017	Monfort	advance of telephone conferences with plaintiffs.	2 30	\$ 325.00	\$	747.50
2/23/2017	WIOIIIOIT	Meet with CBM re declarations	2.50	ÿ 323.00	7	747.50
2/24/2017	Barvir	Weet with control decidations	0.20	\$ 225.00	\$	45.00
2/24/2017	Daivii	Meeting with CBM re status of Office of Office Offi	0.20	7 223.00	<u>ب</u>	43.00
2/24/2017	Barvir	appellate fee motion.	0.20	\$ 225.00	\$	45.00
2/24/2017	Daivii	Draft declarations of CDM, CBM, SAB, AMB, CN, and HV in support of motion for appellate	0.20	Ş 223.00	ڔ	43.00
2/24/2017	Barvir		7.50	¢ 22E 00	\$	1 607 50
2/24/2017	Dalvii	fees; review time records as necessary. Multiple correspondence to and from plaintiffs and meet with AMB re	7.50	\$ 225.00	Ş	1,687.50
2/24/2017	Monfort	Multiple correspondence to and from plaintins and meet with AMB re	0.70	¢ 22E 00	ċ	227 50
2/24/2017	MONION	Multiple telephone conferences with plaintiffs re	0.70	\$ 325.00	Ş	227.50
2/24/2017	Monfort	Multiple telephone conferences with plaintins re	0.60	¢ 225.00	Ļ	105.00
2/24/2017	Monfort	Most with AMD re	0.60	\$ 325.00	\$	195.00
2/24/2017	Monfort	Meet with AMB re appellate fee	0.20	¢ 225.00	Ļ	65.00
2/24/2017	Monfort	motion. Continue to draft AMB and CBM declarations; revise to include descriptions of hours and	0.20	\$ 325.00	Ş	65.00
2/27/2017	Domir	·	6.90	¢ 225.00	ċ	1 520 00
2/27/2017	Barvir	activities billed; revise spreadsheet of hours billed/written off.	0.80	\$ 225.00	\$	1,530.00
		Continue reviewing, drafting and revising plaintiff declarations; multiple correspondence and				
2/27/2017	Monfort		2.60	¢ 22E 00	ċ	94E 00
2/27/2017	MOINORE	telephone conferences with plaintiffs re Analyze revised billing entries for all billing professionals for whom fee recovery will be	2.00	\$ 325.00	\$	845.00
		sought; review to ensure that all bills are categorized under the correct billing				
2/20/2017	D i -	reference/project; review bills "written off" to determine whether any such slips should be	2.40	ć 225 00	<u>,</u>	607.50
2/28/2017	Barvir	moved to a recoverable reference.	3.10	\$ 225.00	>	697.50
2/20/2017	Damin	Meeting with CBM re status of	0.20	ć 22F 00	۸.	67.50
2/28/2017	Barvir	appellate fee motion.	0.30	\$ 225.00	>	67.50
2/20/2017	NA: -ll	AMARIAN IN CAR CRAM ANAR IAC MATI CHANG and MARCHA discussions of factors	0.40	ć 450.00	<u>,</u>	45.00
2/28/2017	Michei	Meet with SAB, CBM, AMB, JAS, MEL, GWW, and MDC to discuss issues re fee recovery.	0.10	\$ 450.00	Ş	45.00
2/20/2017	Manafaut	Adapt with CDA4 CAD ANAD IAC NATI CHANA and NADC to discuss issues as for management	0.10	ć 22F 00	۸.	22.50
2/28/2017	Monfort	Meet with CDM, SAB, AMB, JAS, MEL, GWW, and MDC to discuss issues re fee recovery.	0.10	\$ 325.00	\$	32.50
		Courses and area to and from Disintiffe up				
2/20/2017	N.A	Correspondence to and from Plaintiffs re	4.70	ć 225 00	<u>,</u>	552.50
2/28/2017	Monfort	telephone conference with R Giles; follow up meetings with AMB and SAB re same. Further telephone conferences and correspondence with plaintiffs re fee motion.		\$ 325.00	\$	552.50
2/28/2017	Monfort	1 1	0.70	\$ 325.00	\$	227.50
		Meeting with AK re appellate fee motion; assign AK tasks re				
2/4/2047	D i -	discuss	0.50	ć 225 00	<u>,</u>	442.50
3/1/2017	Barvir	; exchange emails with AK re same.	0.50	\$ 225.00	>	112.50
		Draft, review and revise declarations of R Giles, R Wright, and S Stonechipher OSO MSJ;				
2/4/2047		Multiple correspondence to and from AMB and plaintiffs re same; research and review	2.60	4 225 22		4 470 00
3/1/2017	Monfort	relevant local rules and trial court denial of attorneys fees.	3.60	\$ 325.00	\$	1,170.00
2/2/2017	Damile	Analyze update billing records; ensure all reference numbers were correctly entered and	2.60	ć 22F 00	<u> </u>	04.0.00
3/2/2017	Barvir	capture more billable time.	3.60	\$ 225.00	>	810.00
		Proofread and revise final draft of R Giles declaration; insert edits and revisions and forward		4	_	
3/2/2017	Monfort	to AMB for final review.	0.80	\$ 325.00	Ş	260.00
0 /0 /		Draft, review and revise Wright and Giles declarations; correspondence to and from plaintiffs	_	4	_	
3/2/2017	Monfort	re same; multiple meetings with AMB re revisiomns to same.	1.70	\$ 325.00	Ş	552.50
		Meeting with CBM re appellate fee motion; discuss argument re				_
3/3/2017	Barvir		0.10	\$ 225.00	\$	22.50
	_	Meeting with RBV re status of research and format of presentation; assign RBV discreet follow-				
3/3/2017	Barvir	up research task re pecuniary interest prong of section 1021.5 fee analysis.	0.20	\$ 225.00	\$	45.00

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate		Amount
		Exchange emails with CBM re appellate fee motion; review R.				
3/3/2017	Barvir	Giles requested edit and approve.	0.20	\$ 225.00	Ś	45.00
-, -, -	-			,		
		Analyze and develop litigation strategies in support of fee motion re arguments to counter				
3/3/2017	Monfort	disqualification of CRPA from recovering fees; meet with SAB and AMB re same.	0.40	\$ 325.00	\$	130.00
		Further correspondence to and from plaintiffs re evidentiary declarations ISO fee motion;			•	
		incorporate R Giles revisions to declaration and forward for signature; continue preparing				
3/3/2017	Monfort	remaining plaintiff declarations.	2.70	\$ 325.00	\$	877.50
		Draft. review, revise and proofread declarations for S Stonecipher, C Parker, and B Bauer in				
3/6/2017	Monfort	support of motion for attorneys fees; further correspondence to plaintiffs re same.	2.20	\$ 325.00	\$	715.00
		Multiple telephone conferences with plaintiffs C Parker and S Stonecipher; further				
		correspondence to and from S Stonecipher, C Parker, LP, and AMB re same; Meet with LP re				
3/6/2017	Monfort	same.	0.90	\$ 325.00	\$	292.50
		Begin working on CRPA declaration for R Travis ISO appellate fee motion; determine further				
3/6/2017	Monfort	strategies re same and discuss with AMB; further revisions to Baur declaration.	1.10	\$ 325.00	\$	357.50
3/6/2017	Monfort	Legal research ISO motion for attorneys fees re evidentiary rules; review local rules.	0.50	\$ 325.00	\$	162.50
		Meeting with JRD, AK, GWW, JAS, SAB, MEL, CDM, and CBM re upcoming motion for appellate				
3/7/2017	Barvir	attorneys' fees and declarations in support.	0.10	\$ 225.00	\$	22.50
		Meeting with JRD, AK, GWW, JAS, SAB, MEL, AMB, and CBM re upcoming motion for appellate				
3/7/2017	Michel	attorneys' fees and declarations in support.	0.10	\$ 450.00	\$	45.00
		Telephone conference with C Parker re				
3/7/2017	Monfort	declaration and draft correspondence to C Parker re; discuss with SAB and AMB.	0.70	\$ 325.00	\$	227.50
		Review and respond to correspondence from S Halbrook re status of statutes declared invalid				
		in litigation in light of Supreme Court dismissal of appeal; further correspondence re fee				
3/7/2017	Monfort	recovery issues and potential settlement.	0.30	\$ 325.00	\$	97.50
		Meeting with JRD, AK, GWW, JAS, SAB, MEL, CDM, and AMB re upcoming motion for appellate				
3/7/2017	Monfort	attorneys' fees and declarations in support.	0.10	\$ 325.00	\$	32.50
		Continue preparing remaining evidentiary declarations ISO fee motion and fine tuning				
3/7/2017	Monfort	language with plaintiffs; correspondence to and from R Wright and B Bauer re same.	0.70	\$ 325.00	\$	227.50
		Review correspondence from client and e-mail LP re same re evidence in support of fee				
3/8/2017	Monfort	motion.	0.10	\$ 325.00	Ş	32.50
2/42/2047			0.40	A 225 00	_	22.50
3/13/2017	Monfort	Review correspondence from plaintiff and draft response re declarations ISO of fee motion;	0.10	\$ 325.00	\$	32.50
		Continue property revising and gathering declarations in support of fee appeal, multiple				
		Continue preparing, revising, and gathering declarations in support of fee appeal; multiple				
2/14/2017	Monfort	correspondence and telephone conferences with AMB, LP. and plaintiffs re same; meet with AMB re declarations for CRPA and B Bauer; draft attorney notes re same.	1 00	¢ 225.00	Ļ	617.50
3/14/2017	Monfort	AMB re declarations for CRPA and B Bauer; draft attorney notes re same.	1.90	\$ 325.00	>	617.50
3/15/2017	Monfort	E-mails to and from S Dember and discuss	0.20	\$ 325.00	\$	65.00
3/13/2017	Monfort	E-mails to and from S Dember and discuss fee motion with AMB.	0.20	\$ 323.00	Ą	03.00
		Conduct final review of Timeslips time entries for use in support of Motion for Attorneys' Fees				
		on Appeal; review to ensure all billable time is captured and requested in fee motion and that				
		all slips are labeled with the appropriate task reference; route to LP to update Timeslips				
3/16/2017	Barvir	references and print final report for fee motion.	3.80	\$ 225.00	Ś	855.00
3/17/2017	Barvir	Draft Motion for Attorneys' Fees on Appeal; conduct legal research as needed.	8.20	\$ 225.00	\$	1,845.00
3/11/2017	Burtin	Prate modern for recommenda recommenda estado estado rescursor do necucar.	0.20	ÿ 223.00	Υ	1,015.00
3/20/2017	Barvir	Draft Motion for Attorneys' Fees on Appeal; conduct legal research re same as necessary.	1.60	\$ 225.00	\$	360.00
3/20/2017	20.1.	protection for recommendations of the second	2.00	Ψ 120.00	Υ	300.00
3/20/2017	Barvir	Draft Motion for Attorneys' Fees on Appeal; conduct legal research re same as necessary.	3.20	\$ 225.00	Ś	720.00
.,,		Review/revise Dember declaration in support of Motion for Attorneys' Fees on Appeal; review		7	-	
		CRPA Foundation donations to determine total retailer donations to foundation; update				
		declaration as needed; exchange emails with S. Dember re edits to declaration and send final				
3/21/2017	Barvir	draft to S. Dember for approval.	0.90	\$ 225.00	\$	202.50
, ,		Draft, review, and revise Motion for Attorneys' Fees on Appeal; conduct legal research as			•	
3/21/2017	Barvir	needed.	7.40	\$ 225.00	\$	1,665.00
		Meeting JRD, AK, CBM, JAS, SAB, MEL, and MDC to discuss upcoming motion for appellate			-	
3/21/2017	Barvir	attorneys' fees and declarations in support.	0.10	\$ 225.00	\$	22.50
		Meeting JRD, AK, JAS, SAB, MEL, MDC, and AMB to discuss upcoming motion for appellate			-	-
3/21/2017	Monfort	attorneys' fees and declarations in support.	0.10	\$ 325.00	\$	32.50
		Correspondence to and from client and SAB re meet with AMB re				
3/21/2017	Monfort		0.30	\$ 325.00	\$	97.50
3/21/2017	Monfort	Correspondence to and from SAB re	0.10	\$ 325.00	\$	32.50
3/21/2017	Monfort	Meet with AMB and e-mails to and from declarants ISO fee motion.	0.30	\$ 325.00	\$	97.50
· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·					_	

Date	Timekeeper	Description	Hours	Rate	Amount
		Review/revise Motion for Attorneys' Fees on Appeal; draft discreet sections of motion re			
		pecuniary interest of all plaintiffs; revise sections re lodestar multiplier; draft Statement of			
3/22/2017	Barvir	Facts.	11.40	\$ 225.00	\$ 2,565.00
		Review and revise HV and CN declarations in support of Motion for Attorneys Fees on Appeal;			
		route to CN and HV for review and signature; discuss edits to CBM, SAB, CDM, and AMB			
3/22/2017	Barvir	declarations with MEL to finalize for review and signature by all billing professionals.	1.10	\$ 225.00	\$ 247.50
		Meeting with HV re Motion for Attorneys' Fees on Appeal; discuss			
3/22/2017	Barvir		0.40	\$ 225.00	\$ 90.00
		Further correspondence and meetings with team members and plaintiffs re			
3/22/2017	Monfort	ee motion.	0.60	\$ 325.00	\$ 195.00
		Multiple correspondence to and from and telephone conferences with Able's Ammo re			
		multiple meetings and correspondence with AMB, MEL, and SAB			
		re fee motio; transfer evidence folders to MEL and			ļ
3/22/2017	Monfort	discuss.	1.20	\$ 325.00	\$ 390.00

	HOURS	AMOUNT			
TOTAL	1045.70	\$	237,677.50		

	NAME HOURS RATE	AMOUNT	
Barcenilla	40.70 \$ 125.00	\$	5,087.50
Barvir	449.50 \$ 225.00	\$	101,137.50
Brady	47.70 \$ 250.00	\$	11,925.00
Klapper	16.90 \$ 125.00	\$	2,112.50
Michel	10.50 \$ 450.00	\$	4,725.00
Monfort	263.20 \$ 325.00	\$	85,540.00
Nunez	74.30 \$ 125.00	\$	9,287.50
Poteet	80.40 \$ 125.00	\$	10,050.00
Zajac	62.50 \$ 125.00	\$	7,812.50
	1045.70	\$	237,677.50

1	PROOF OF SERVICE
2	STATE OF CALIFORNIA COUNTY OF FRESNO
4 5 6 7	I, Laura Palmerin, am employed in Long Beach, Los Angeles County, California. I am over the age of eighteen (18) years and am not a party to the within action. My business address is 180 East Ocean Boulevard, Suite 200, Long Beach, CA 90802. On March 27, 2017, I served the foregoing document(s) described as: DECLARATION OF HAYDEE VILLEGAS IN SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFFS' MOTION FOR ATTORNEYS' FEES ON APPEAL
8 9 10	on the interested parties in this action by placing [] the original [x] a true and correct copy thereof enclosed in a sealed envelope(s) addressed as follows:
11 12 13	George Waters Deputy Attorney General Deputy Attorney General Deputy Attorney General A55 Golden Gate Ave., Suite 11000 P.O. Box 944255 Sacramento, CA 94244-2550 Sacramento, CA 94244-2550
14151617	X (BY MAIL) As follows: I am "readily familiar" with the firm's practice of collection and processing correspondence for mailing. Under the practice it would be deposited with the U.S. Postal Service on that same day with postage thereon fully prepaid at Los Angeles, California, in the ordinary course of business. I am aware that on motion of the party served, service is presumed invalid if postal cancellation date is more than one day after date of deposit for mailing an affidavit. Executed on March 27, 2017, at Long Beach, California
18 19 20 21	(VIA OVERNIGHT MAIL) As follows: I am "readily familiar" with the firm's practice of collection and processing correspondence for overnight delivery by UPS/FED-EX. Under the practice it would be deposited with a facility regularly maintained by UPS/FED-EX for receipt on the same day in the ordinary course of business. Such envelope was sealed and placed for collection and delivery by UPS/FED-EX with delivery fees paid or provided for in accordance with ordinary business practices.
22	X (STATE) I declare under penalty of perjury under the laws of the State of California that the foregoing is true and correct.
232425	(FEDERAL) I declare that I am employed in the office of the member of the bar of this of this court at whose direction the service was made.
2526	LAURA PALMERIN
27	
28	

PROOF OF SERVICE