

**Exhibit A****Preliminary Injunction Motion**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Amount</b>
2/6/2019	Cheuvront	Draft MPI and researching statements, documents from City Council Members re where city gets its ammunition and firearms for law enforcement.	4.0	\$325.00	\$1,300.00
2/7/2019	Cheuvront	Draft Motion for Preliminary Injunction. Pull research from other actions that the L.A. City Council has taken.	4.0	\$325.00	\$1,300.00
2/9/2019	Cheuvront	Draft Motion for Preliminary Injunction sections on prior restraint and due process.	4.0	\$325.00	\$1,300.00
2/9/2019	Cheuvront	Draft Motion Preliminary Injunction sections on Vagueness, interference with contract, economic advantage, balance of the equities.	4.0	\$325.00	\$1,300.00
2/11/2019	Barvir	Draft Motion for Preliminary Injunction; review and revise TDC draft, reorganize draft, run analytics and begin revising section re likelihood of success on merits of First Amendment claims; conduct research as needed.	2.90	\$475.00	\$1,377.50
2/12/2019	Barvir	Continue to draft Motion for Preliminary Injunction; review and revise TDC draft, continue revising sections re likelihood of success on First Amendment Claims; conduct research as needed	4.80	\$475.00	\$2,280.00
2/13/2019	Cheuvront	Conduct research re City Council member statements for evidence on MPI and Complaint.	2.00	\$325.00	\$650.00
2/13/2019	Barvir	Continue to draft Motion for Preliminary Injunction; review and revise TDC draft, continue revising sections re likelihood of success on merits of First Amendment claims; conduct research as needed.	3.60	\$475.00	\$1,710.00
2/14/2019	Barvir	Draft Points and Authorities ISO Motion for Preliminary Injunction; conduct legal research re <b>REDACTED</b>	3.90	\$475.00	\$1,852.50
2/14/2019	Barvir	Draft Points and Authorities in Support of Motion for Preliminary Injunction; conduct legal research <b>REDACTED</b>	3.80	\$475.00	\$1,805.00
2/15/2019	Barvir	Draft Points and Authorities in Support of Motion for Preliminary Injunction; conduct legal research re <b>REDACTED</b>	5.30	\$475.00	\$2,517.50
2/19/2019	Israelitt	Draft cases summaries re compelled speech and freedom of assembly for AMB's use in drafting motion for preliminary injunction.	2.90	\$170.00	\$493.00
2/21/2019	Israelitt	Continue to draft cases summaries re compelled speech and freedom of assembly for motion for preliminary injunction.	4.90	\$170.00	\$833.00
2/21/2019	Barvir	Draft Points and Authorities in Support of Motion for Preliminary Injunction; draft introduction and statement of facts.	2.90	\$475.00	\$1,377.50
2/21/2019	Barvir	Continue drafting Points and Authorities in Support of Motion for Preliminary Injunction; draft sections re violation of First Amendment; conduct legal research as needed.	3.50	\$475.00	\$1,662.50
2/22/2019	Cheuvront	Conduct research re evidence for MPI and declaration for the MPI statements.	2.70	\$325.00	\$877.50
2/22/2019	Barvir	Draft Motion for Preliminary Injunction; conduct legal research as needed	2.60	\$475.00	\$1,235.00
2/25/2019	Barvir	Receive, review, and analyze notes <b>REDACTED</b> draft attorneys' notes <b>REDACTED</b> for preparing complaint and motion for preliminary injunction	1.10	\$475.00	\$522.50
2/25/2019	Barvir	Draft Memorandum of Points and Authorities ISO Motion for Preliminary Injunction ; conduct legal research as needed	4.90	\$475.00	\$2,327.50
2/26/2019	Barvir	Continue drafting Motion for Preliminary Injunction; conduct legal research as necessary.	3.80	\$475.00	\$1,805.00
3/6/2019	Frank	Research and draft content for equal protection section of Motion for preliminary injunction	6.50	\$350.00	\$2,275.00
3/7/2019	Frank	Conduct legal research re <b>REDACTED</b> of the motion for preliminary injunction; revised draft of that section	4.40	\$350.00	\$1,540.00
3/8/2019	Frank	Drafting for due process section of motion for preliminary injunction.	1.50	\$350.00	\$525.00

**Exhibit A****Preliminary Injunction Motion**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Amount</b>
3/11/2019	Frank	Draft content for motion for preliminary injunction regarding equal protection and due process claims.	2.60	\$350.00	\$ 910.00
3/11/2019	Frank	Conduct legal research re equal protection and due process claims.	3.20	\$350.00	\$1,120.00
3/11/2019	Barvir	Draft motion for preliminary injunction; draft sections re statement of facts, procedural history, and First Amendment claims.	6.30	\$ 475.00	\$2,992.50
3/12/2019	Frank	Conduct legal research re equal protection and due process case law for MPI.	4.80	\$ 350.00	\$1,680.00
3/12/2019	Frank	Draft content for equal protection and due process sections of MPI	1.60	\$350.00	\$560.00
3/12/2019	Barvir	Continue to draft motion for preliminary injunction; draft sections re First Amendment Claims	6.20	\$475.00	\$2,945.00
3/13/2019	Frank	Conduct legal research re equal protection and due process authorities for drafting of MPI content	4.40	\$350.00	\$420.00
3/13/2019	Barvir	Review and revise motion for preliminary injunction; revise sections re statement of facts and procedural history	4.80	\$475.00	\$2,280.00
3/14/2019	Frank	Draft content for equal protection and due process sections of MPI	1.20	\$350.00	\$420.00
3/14/2019	Barvir	Continue to revise motion for preliminary injunction; revise sections re statement of facts, procedural history, and First Amendment claims.	5.70	\$475.00	\$2,707.50
3/28/2019	Barvir	Review and revise draft Motion for Preliminary Injunction; conduct legal research re First Amendment rights to speech and association as needed	3.20	\$475.00	\$1,520.00
4/9/2019	Barvir	Continue to draft motion for preliminary injunction; conduct legal research as needed.	3.90	\$475.00	\$1,757.50
4/10/2019	Barvir	Draft memorandum of points and authorities in support of motion for preliminary injunction; conduct legal research re same.	3.70	\$475.00	\$1,757.50
4/11/2019	Barvir	Continue to draft memorandum of points and authorities in support of motion for preliminary injunction; conduct legal research re same	4.80	\$475.00	\$2,280.00
4/22/2019	Barvir	Telephone conference with E. Volokh re complaint and draft MPI; discuss other arguments to be made and structure of argument	0.20	\$475.00	\$95.00
4/22/2019	Barvir	Receive Shelton v. Tucker opinion and MMI case brief; read and analyze opinion; draft attorney's notes for use in preparing motion for preliminary injunction.	1.10	\$475.00	\$522.50
4/24/2019	Barvir	Continue to draft motion for preliminary injunction; conduct legal research as needed.	3.60	\$475.99	\$1,710.00
4/24/2019	Brady	Analyze issues re preliminary injunction with AMB.	0.20	\$475.00	\$95.00
4/25/2019	Barvir	Review/revise motion for preliminary injunction; draft section re 1A retaliation claim based on Riley's Farm order; draft other sections based on new research and comments made by Volokh and others re complaint draft	5.20	\$475.00	\$2,470.00
4/26/2019	Barvir	Review and revise motion for preliminary injunction; conduct legal research as needed	3.90	\$475.00	\$1,852.50
5/6/2019	Barvir	Continue to draft motion for preliminary injunction; conduct legal research re same	2.80	\$475.00	\$1,330.00
5/8/2019	Barvir	Continue to draft motion for preliminary injunction; conduct legal research re same	5.40	\$475.00	\$2,565.00
5/9/2019	Barvir	Continue to draft motion for preliminary injunction; conduct legal research re same	6.40	\$475.00	\$3,040.00
5/14/2019	Barvir	Continue to draft memorandum in support of motion for preliminary injunction; conduct legal research re same	5.10	\$475.00	\$2,422.50
5/17/2019	Barvir	Telephone conference with opposing counsel re meet and confer re motion to dismiss and potential motion for preliminary injunction	0.30	\$475.00	\$142.50
5/20/2019	Palmerin	Draft template for declaration of AMB in support of Plaintiffs' motion for preliminary injunction and send to TDC and AMB.	0.30	\$170.00	\$51.00
5/20/2019	Barvir	Exchange emails with opposing counsel re proposed briefing schedule re motion to dismiss and motion for preliminary injunction.	0.10	\$475.00	\$47.50

**Exhibit A****Preliminary Injunction Motion**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Amount</b>
5/20/2019	Barvir	Case Management; review all case deadlines and determine appropriate briefing schedule and hearing date to accommodate all upcoming deadlines; multiple meetings with TDC re same	1.80	\$475.00	\$855.00
5/20/2019	Barvir	Continue to draft memorandum in support of motion for preliminary injunction; conduct legal research re same.	6.50	\$475.00	\$3,087.50
5/21/2019	Khundkar	Conduct legal research on <b>REDACTED</b> for use in upcoming motion for preliminary injunction against City of Los Angeles	2.50	\$300.00	\$750.00
5/21/2019	Cheuvront	Conduct research re Los Angeles City boycott of Arizona businesses due to state's stance on immigration for use in Motion for Preliminary Injunction	0.40	\$325.00	\$130.00
5/21/2019	Barvir	Continue to draft memorandum in support of motion for preliminary injunction; conduct legal research re same	9.80	\$475.00	\$4,655.00
5/22/2019	Khundkar	Prepare and draft request for judicial notice for upcoming motion for preliminary injunction against City of Los Angeles	2.80	\$300.00	\$840.00
5/22/2019	Cheuvront	Draft AMB declaration for Motion for Preliminary Injunction and gather evidence, follow up on articles, pull information that is needed	3.70	\$325.00	\$1,202.50
5/22/2019	Frank	Review and revise segments of preliminary injunction	2.10	\$350.00	\$735.00
5/22/2019	Barvir	Send email to opposing counsel re proposed hearing date for motion to dismiss and motion for preliminary injunction	0.20	\$475.00	\$95.00
5/22/2019	Barvir	Continue to draft memorandum in support of motion for preliminary injunction; conduct legal research re same	4.40	\$475.00	\$2,090.00
5/22/2019	Barvir	Continue to draft memorandum in support of motion for preliminary injunction; conduct legal research re same	6.80	\$475.00	\$3,230.00
5/22/2019	Barvir	Send draft memorandum in support of motion for preliminary injunction to CDM for	0.10	\$475.00	\$47.50
5/23/2019	Palmerin	Draft template for declaration of TDC in support of Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction and send to TDC	0.20	\$170.00	\$34.00
5/23/2019	Palmerin	Review email from PYO re <b>REDACTED</b>	0.20	\$170.00	\$34.00
5/23/2019	Khundkar	Prepare and draft request for judicial notice for motion for preliminary injunction against City of Los Angeles. Compiled government studies and reports cited in our motion for preliminary injunction.	3.50	\$300.00	\$1,050.00
5/23/2019	Cheuvront	Draft final edits to AMB declaration for filing motion for preliminary injunction	1.00	\$325.00	\$325.00
5/23/2019	Cheuvront	Draft declaration for Doe Plaintiff from TDC for motion for preliminary injunction	1.20	\$325.00	\$390.00
5/23/2019	Barvir	Review/revise draft motion for preliminary injunction based on suggestions from E. Murphy and D. Thompson.	2.10	\$475.00	\$997.50
5/23/2019	Barvir	Review and revise Request for Judicial Notice; re-order list of documents to be judicially noticed; redraft arguments for why each category of documents is noticeable; update list of exhibits as needed and ensure all doc ids are correct	2.90	\$475.00	\$1,377.50
5/23/2019	Barvir	Review and revise TDC declaration in support of motion for preliminary injunction re Doe Plaintiff's standing; route to TDC for approval	0.70	\$475.00	\$332.50
5/24/2019	Palmerin	Review, proofread, and revise formatting of Plaintiffs' Notice of Motion for Preliminary Injunction, Declaration of AMB, Declaration of TDC, Request for Judicial Notice, and Proposed Order. Convert to PDF and save on my desktop for filing	1.10	\$170.00	\$187.00
5/24/2019	Palmerin	Conduct computer work re assemble exhibits 1-33 to be filed with Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction. Add exhibit tabs and compile into PDF documents of 10 MB or less and save on my desktop for filing	2.90	\$170.00	\$493.00
5/24/2019	Palmerin	Review and format Memorandum of Points and Authorities in Support of Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction, update table of contents, and add table of authorities. Convert to PDF and save on my desktop for filing	0.80	\$170.00	\$136.00

**Exhibit A****Preliminary Injunction Motion**

<b>Date</b>	<b>Timekeeper</b>	<b>Description</b>	<b>Hours</b>	<b>Rate</b>	<b>Amount</b>
5/24/2019	Khundkar	Check case citations and request for judicial notice citations for upcoming motion for preliminary injunction.	4.50	\$300.00	\$1,350.00
5/24/2019	Chevront	Draft paragraphs with new affidavit information for AMB declaration in support of MPI. Work with PYO to get those documents numbered and in system	0.40	\$325.00	\$130.00
5/24/2019	Chevront	Conduct research re looking for quotes in twitter feed for motion for preliminary injunction	0.20	\$325.00	\$65.00
5/24/2019	Chevront	Receipt, review and analyze articles from MMA to use for the motion for preliminary injunction with specific quotes. Reviewed and advised as to which ones to use	0.20	\$325.00	\$65.00
05/24/2019	Barvir	Review and revise AMB declaration in support of motion for preliminary injunction; re-draft entire declaration as needed to strengthen authentication of exhibits language	2.50	\$475.00	\$1,187.50
05/24/2019	Barvir	Conduct research re evidence in support of motion for preliminary injunction; review documents in IMANAGE, on LA City Clerk's website, and on the internet to pull correct copies of all necessary documentary evidence; conduct research to find further documentary support; save evidence in IMANAGE and provide copies to LP for attachment to AMB declaration or Request for Judicial Notice	1.60	\$475.00	\$760.00
5/24/2019	Barvir	Review/revise draft proposed order granting motion for preliminary injunction; route to LP for formatting and filing	0.40	\$475.00	\$190
5/24/2019	Barvir	Review/revise draft notice of motion and motion for preliminary injunction; route to LP for formatting and filing.	0.30	\$475.00	\$142.50
5/24/2019	Barvir	Review/revise memorandum in support of motion for preliminary injunction; incorporate all citations to legal authority and evidence; incorporate E. Murphy's final suggested edits; draft introduction section and re-draft section re compelled speech based on updated legal research; conduct final proofread of entire brief to check for logical flow of arguments, word choice, spelling, and grammar; route to LP for formatting and filing.	5.10	\$475.00	\$2,422.50
5/24/2019	Barvir	Conduct final review of motion for preliminary injunction memorandum in support; route final edits to LP for inclusion in brief; approve final draft for filing	0.40	\$475.00	\$190.00
5/28/2019	Palmerin	Prepare mandatory chambers copies of Plaintiffs' Notice of Motion for Preliminary Injunction, Memorandum of Points and Authorities, Declaration of AMB, Declaration of TDC, Request for Judicial Notice, and Proposed Order and place in Signal Outbox with bucksliip for delivery to Judge's chambers.	1.20	\$170.00	\$204.00
			249.5		\$103,555