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To: Shields, Morgan[MShields@nrahg.org]
From: Supernaugh, Lisa
Sent: 2018-01-10T22:07:37Z
Importance: Normal
Subject: FW: McKenna Contract
Received: 2018-01-10T22:07:37Z
NRA - McKenna Agreement - 2017 Extention - fully executed.pdf
McKenna Contract Addendum 2018.docx 

H i Morgan

To confirm, did you receive this back directly from Josh? Just wanted to check as I still have it in my

pending folder.

Thank you

Lisa

From: Shields, Morgan

Sent: Wednesday, December 20, 2017 2:54 PM

To: Supernaugh, Lisa <LSupernaugh@nrahq.org>
Subject: McKenna Contract

Lisa,
I had a call from Seth at McKenna yesterday saying that Josh requested that the current
McKenna contract (which is currently on a July 1, 2017 — June 30, 2018 term) should be
changed by increasing the payment terms from $20,000 to $25,000 for 2018. And that the
term should be changed to January through December, since the payment terms would
be for all of 2018. I have drafted the attached addendum with these changes.
Please let me know if there are any other changes Josh would like. I have attached the
current contract to this e-mail for easy reference.
Please also note that when the contract addendum is fully executed I will need a copy
since this is a fundraising consultant contract that has to be filed with the states.
Thanks, Lisa!
Best,
Morgan
Morgan Shields
Assistant General Counsel
National Rifle Association of America
11250 Waples Mill Road
Fairfax, Virginia 22030
Phone: (703) 267-1198

NOTICE: This e-mail transmittal is a confidential communication from the Office of the
General Counsel of the National Rifle Association of America and is intended only for the
use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed. This information may be
confidential, privileged or not subject to disclosure under applicable law or regulation. If
the recipient of this communication is not the intended recipient or the agent or employee
responsible for delivery of this communication to the intended recipient, you are hereby
notified that any use, dissemination, copying or distribution of this communication is
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To: Shields, Morgan[MShieldsnrahq.org] 
From: Supernaugh, Lisa 
Sent: 2018-01-10T22:07:37Z 
Importance: Normal 
Subject: FW: McKenna Contract 
Received: 2018-01--10T22:07:37Z 
NRA - McKenna Agreement - 2017 Extention - fully executed.pdf 
McKenna Contract Addendum 2018.docx  

Hi Morgan 

To confirm, did you receive this back directly from Josh? Just wanted to check as I still have it in my 

pending folder. 

Thank you 

Lisa 

From: Shields, Morgan 

Sent: Wednesday, December 20, 2017 2:54 PM 

To: Supernaugh, Lisa <LSupernaugh@nrahq.org> 

Subject: McKenna Contract 

Lisa, 
I had a call from Seth at McKenna yesterday saying that Josh requested that the current 
McKenna contract (which is currently on a July 1, 2017 - June 30, 2018 term) should be 
changed by increasing the payment terms from $20,000 to $25,000 for 2018. And that the 
term should be changed to January through December, since the payment terms would 
be for all of 2018. I have drafted the attached addendum with these changes. 
Please let me know if there are any other changes Josh would like. I have attached the 
current contract to this e-mail for easy reference. 
Please also note that when the contract addendum is fully executed I will need a copy 
since this is a fundraising consultant contract that has to be filed with the states. 
Thanks, Lisa! 
Best, 
Morgan 
Morgan Shields 
Assistant General Counsel 
National Rifle Association of America 
11250 Waples Mill Road 
Fairfax, Virginia 22030 
Phone: (703) 267-1198 
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strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please immediately
notify us by telephone at 703-267-1250 and delete the message. Thank you for your
cooperation.
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strictly prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please immediately 
notify us by telephone at 7O3267-125O and delete the message. Thank you for your 
cooperation. 
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