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NYSCEF DOC. NO. 1658 RECEI VED NYSCEF: 03/20/2023

EXHIBIT “11”



NYSCEF DOC. NO. 1658 RECEI VED NYSCEF:
To: McCulloch, Cole[CMcCulloch@nrahgq.org]
Cc: DeBergalis, Joe[JDeBergalis@nrahg.org]
From: Supernaugh, Lisa
Sent: 2017-09-06T11:16:08Z
Importance: Normal
Subject: Re: Invoice for photo shoot at the Carry Guard Convention
Received: 2017-09-06T11:16:10Z
I will handle

Sent from my iPhone

On Sep 6, 2017, at 5:54 AM, McCulloch, Cole <CMcCulloch(@nrahg.org> wrote:

Lisa and Joe
See this bill from Jim Powell. It's from carry guard. Who and how should this get paid?
Please let me know what to do.
Thx
Cole McCulloch
NRA Director of Competitive Shooting

304-712-6233
cmeculloch@nrahg.org
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03/ 20/ 2023

From: Jim Powell <jim@jphoto.com>

Sent: Wednesday, September 6, 2017 2:20:10 AM

To: McCulloch, Cole

Subject: Invoice for photo shoot at the Carry Guard Convention

Josh told me to send this to you. Let me know if you need more information.
Thanks, Jim

Jim Powell Advertising Photography
iphoto.com
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